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145: You Are My Wife Legally Anyway 

Chapter 145: Chapter 145: You Are My Wife Legally 
Anyway 

"Fuck you! I never signed that document. Duke, this is a marital fraud!" Belinda lost it. 
How did she become Duke's legal wife without any knowledge of it? She had no idea 
how it happened. 

"Don't get so mad. Leena likes you so much. You'll get along with my family. I am not 
sure whether you signed it or not. But the fingerprint is definitely yours." Duke quipped. 
He was seldom in the mood to joke like today. 'I wonder where she learned to swear like 
that?' he thought. 

Then Belinda flipped to the last page to check it. She spotted the mark on her finger 
during her bath. And the mark on the paper was in the same color. She was set up by 
Duke. He tired her out last night and then got her fingerprint when she passed out. 

"I will never recognize our marriage. It's just your wishful thinking. That's all." Belinda 
kept denying the validity of the document. "It doesn't matter if you recognize it or not. 
You are my wife legally anyway." Duke was quite good-humored today. He was able to 
handle Belinda's barbs well. 

"Duke, don't play with the law. I have lawyers as well. We have a legal team in YS 
Group." she said loudly. His calm demeanor irritated her. 

"Belinda, is it so embarrassing to marry me? Why do you fight it so badly?" Duke finally 
lost his temper. He was rich and influential, just like Edward. How could Belinda give 
him the cold shoulder? 

"Well... That's not what I mean. But I resent you doing this without my knowledge." 
Belinda began to shiver as she looked at his gloomy face. She shouldn't have forgotten 
that he could be awfully evil and cold when he got mad. 

"Belinda, do you know how many women want to marry me?" Duke's eyes grew cold, 
his face was dark with anger. 

"Duke, I don't care. I only know that I don't want to be your wife." Belinda was a 
chameleon when arguing. She could be gentle when the other person was gentle, and 
tough when the other person was tough. She would never yield to Duke. 



"Really? You don't want me? Then how come you slept with me last night?" Duke cast a 
cold glare at her, his lips curled into a teasing smile. 'Belinda, you really know how to hit 
me where it hurts. But I am not so easily beaten.' 

"Duke, you are shameless." Belinda stared at him angrily. Her bad temper was now 
obvious enough. 

"You should've known that I'm shameless." Duke calmed down when he saw Belinda 
was angry. He was a control freak, and liked everything going according to his plan. 
Now Belinda saw a living example of shamelessness. Duke was the most shameless 
jerk in the world. He was an animal. 

They squabbled, yet nothing changed. She was still to be Duke's wife. She would be 
burdened with family responsibilities. She wasn't a free woman anymore. 

In the airport, the broadcaster was announcing arrival and departure times. As time 
rolled by, Rain got more nervous. How long has it been since they stopped seeing each 
other? Four years? Or five? It felt like a hundred. 'How are you, Annie? Are you still so 
gorgeous that I can't even get near you?' He thought. 

"Are you nervous? And you said you didn't like her LOL. Aaron nudged Rain and 
smirked. He knew a little about Rain and Annie, but not the whole story. 

No way, I don't need to be nervous. Who says I like her? I don't. Rain was playing to the 
crowd. Aaron's quip snapped Rain out of his reverie. A lot of woman checking him out. 

Okay, since you don't like her, I'm going to court her. I heard that Annie of the C 
Financial Group is totally hot. Aaron joked. Let's see if you can keep your coolness 
Rain. Edward was right to send me along. Hopefully, what follows next won't let me 
down. Aaron thought. 

I can give you some advice if you want. Humph! Aaron was too green to get the truth 
out of him. That's why Rain was the Deputy CEO, and Aaron only a special assistant. 
Aaron lacked experience. 

I can get a girl myself. Rain knew Annie liked him, so he was sure that Aaron didn't have 
a chance. 

It's out of care and love. I just don't want to see you fail considering it will be your first 
time going after a girl. Rain said mischievously. He always liked joking around. That's 
the reason why woman loved him. As a Chinese saying goes, lady's always fall for bad 
boys. His bad boy smile had won many hearts. 

Don't worry about me. Save it for yourself. Maybe she already has someone. It's been a 
long time. 



Humph! Aaron cursed him. If Annie deserts you, we'll see who gets the last laugh. 

Chapter 146: Chapter 146: Love Whoever She Wants 

Rain's face changed on hearing Aaron's words. He might be right. Who would wait for 
someone forever? It was expected for Annie to fall in love with someone else. As the 
saying goes, 'Time will tell'. 

"She can love whoever she wants. It's her own choice, isn't it?" Rain pretended that he 
didn't care, but it was painful for him. 

"Hey, there they are." Aaron stopped talking as he saw employees of C Financial Group 
approaching them. He felt strange to discover that Annie was missing. 'Has she really 
met someone and decided to dump Rain?' Aaron couldn't help but wonder. 

"Nice to meet you! I'm Aaron Qiao, special assistant to the CEO of FX International 
Group. Welcome to S City." Observing Rain was distracted, Aaron stepped up and 
introduced himself. His boss was wise to anticipate this, that's probably why he had 
asked Aaron to accompany Rain. 

"Nice to meet you, too. I'm Ferk, CFO of C Financial Group. This is my personal 
assistant, Bev." 

"Where is Annie? Won't she be joining us today?" Rain asked broodingly. He had mixed 
feelings. He was nervous to see her, but when she didn't show up, he was scared. The 
turmoil within him had driven him to such a strong sense of loss that he forgot his 
manners. 

"Mr. Rain, glad to see you again. Miss Annie came here to see you yesterday. Haven't 
you met her yet?" As a senior employee of C Financial Group, Ferk knew Rain well. He 
wasn't upset about Rain's unseemliness. 

"What? She was here yesterday? How come I didn't see her?" A figure suddenly 
flashed through Rain's mind. Was Annie the woman he had seen in the bar last night? 
He shook his head. Impossible. Annie was too lively; she couldn't be that quiet and 
urbane beauty. He was sure that woman wasn't her, though he had just caught a 
glimpse of her. 

"Yes. She was planning to come with us, but then she changed her mind and came 
here before us." Ferk looked at Rain bemusedly. He wondered, 'didn't Annie contact 
Rain? She asked for Mr. Rain's address. Then why didn't they get in touch? If she 
couldn't find his address, she could have visited FX International Group.' 

Rain rubbed his forehead anxiously. 'She is new in this city. Where could she go? Was 
she kidnapped? Who would know that she's the daughter of C Financial Group's CEO in 
such a short time?' 



"Was the bodyguard with her?" That was the last hope. In the past few years, she liked 
Rain so much that she would have contacted him if nothing was wrong. But she hadn't. 
What did that mean? 

"No. Miss Annie said she wanted to be alone. She also said she would contact you as 
soon as she arrived. We thought everything would be fine, so we didn't send the 
bodyguard with her." Ferk also began to worry about her. Everybody knew that Annie 
was the heir of C Financial Group. If something happened to her in S City, her father 
would burn the city to the ground. "How could you let her go alone?" Rain ruefully 
punched the post beside him. His frustration was perceptible. 

"That's what Miss Annie is. There was nothing we could do about it, " Ferk explained in 
a low voice. Knowing Annie fancied this man, he respected Rain and didn't mind his 
yelling. 

"Mr. Rain, let's go to the office first, we'll talk about this later." Aaron was careful about 
ranks in clients' presence, so he called him Mr. Rain instead of Rain. 

Rain frowned at the clients. At the same time, he also blamed Annie for her naivety, and 
swore to punish her when he found her. "It seems we have to do so. You go with them. 
I'll ask Luke to help me find her." Without even looking at Ferk and the others, he 
hastened into a trot and left the hall of the airport, with an arrogant expression on his 
face. 

"I'm sorry, Mr. Ferk. Mr. Rain isn't usually like this. He is worried about Miss Annie, " 
Aaron apologized. 'Moments ago he pretended that he didn't care for her at all, but now 
that Annie is missing, he is really worried. Who will believe that he doesn't like her?' 

"That's OK, Mr. Aaron. We understand that he is worried." Actually, Ferk was not as 
worried as Rain. He had noticed that Annie had changed a lot in recent years. She was 
not as innocent and sweet as before. She had become a totally different person. He 
thought it had something to do with the fact that Mr. Rain had left her without saying 
goodbye years ago. 

Rain's posh sports car kept shifting lanes in the traffic. There was stiffness on his 
handsome face. The charming, tender eyes examined the road. The sensuous lips were 
tightly closed. The ear studs sparkled and shadowed as if to harmonize with his current 
state of mind, which was anxious and fretful. 

To him, Annie was still an innocent little girl, beautiful and always smiling. Perhaps he 
had forgotten that time changed many things. 

The car drew a sharp curve and parked in front of FX International Group's building. 
Rain walked in grimly. The female employees were accustomed to Rain's cheeky grins 
and flirtation; they had never seen him so disconcerted. They suspected something 
awful must have happened. 



Chapter 147: Chapter 147: Were Are The Clients 
You've Picked up 

Rain took the elevator straight to the 88th floor and entered Edward's office without 
knocking first. The sound of his abrupt entry shocked Edward, who was reading a file 
intently. Edward frowned and asked. "Why are you in such a hurry? Where are the 
clients you've picked up? You're supposed to be with them right now." Edward saw Rain 
was unaccompanied. He gave him a confused look. 

"I didn't pick them up. Where is Luke? Ask him to come over. I need a favor." demanded 
Rain. He walked towards the refrigerator, took out a bottle of water and drank like a fish. 
He spilled some water which trickled down his neck. He looked coquettish and unruly. 

"Why didn't you pick them up? What happened? Was their flight delayed? " asked 
Edward. He called Luke simultaneously. He wondered, "Rain is in such a hurry. 
Something must be wrong, or he would never charge at me like that." 

"The flight was on time. I met them, but not all of them." replied Rain. After drinking 
water, he finally calmed down. 

"What are you talking about?" asked Edward. 'What is Rain talking about? Did he pick 
them up or not? I can't understand him at all.' wondered Edward. 

"I met them. But Annie wasn't there." replied Rain. He took a seat on the sofa and 
waited for Luke. 

"You mean Annie didn't come?" asked Edward. 'That's the point! No wonder he is in 
such a rush. If I remember right, Annie is in love with Rain! Why did she give up this 
opportunity to see him?' thought Edward. 

"No, she came here in advance. She said she would contact me. But instead, she 
disappeared." replied Rain. He fixed his gaze on Edward, and it seemed that Rain was 
looking for an answer from him. 

"Now, What are you planning to do?" asked Edward. He smiled noncommittally and 
thought, 'Annie is a grown woman. She won't disappear for no reason. If she didn't 
contact anyone, there must be some reason. Perhaps something went wrong, or maybe 
Annie doesn't want to see us right now. There is no need to panic.' 

"Tell Luke to find out if something has happened in the underground community. I'm 
afraid she has been kidnapped, " said Rain. He knew very well that in order to protect 
Edward, Luke had forged many human relations and had a lot of people backing him. 
So it was sensible to ask him about this. 



"Do you think anyone in S City knows Annie? If she was kidnapped upon her arrival, 
there must be a mole in the C Financial Group. That would explain how her identity and 
schedule were revealed." said Edward. 

He looked at Rain as if he were an idiot and thought, 'It's a simple question. But he 
seems confused when it comes to Annie. If he doesn't fancy her, then why is he so 
worried?" 

"You're right. But why didn't she contact us?" asked Rain. He wasn't able to think clearly 
anymore. All he could do was to count on Edward. It seemed that Edward could solve 
any problem with ease. 

"I'm not Mr. Know-it-all. Besides, I don't know her well enough to understand how her 
mind works." replied Edward. He rolled his eyes and thought, 'Love can truly deprive 
you of your intelligence.' 

They heard a knock on the office door. It was Luke. He looked fierce in black. 

"Mr. Mu, what can I do for you?"asked Luke. He turned a blind eye to Rain. 

"Luke, can't you see me?" complained Rain. 'Am I that annoying? Why does he ignore 
me every time.' he thought. 

Luke rolled his eyes at Rain, and thought, 'I just don't get it. Why is he dressed so 
effeminately? He looks like a sissy.' 

"Are you done with the small talk?" asked Edward. He was baffled by their relationship. 
He thought, 'For some reason, Luke always gives Rain the cold shoulder. He keeps up 
a poker face all the time .' 

"He has pissed me off." murmured Rain. And he thought, 'He is icier than Duke. He only 
cares about his young boss.' 

Luke threw a cold glance at Rain and then turned to Edward. 

"Luke, tell your men to see if there's anything unusual going on in the underground 
community, especially keep an eye on something about a kidnapped woman." 
demanded Edward. He thought, 'If she isn't kidnapped, she must have her reasons for 
not showing up. In that case, there would be no need to look for her.' "Sure, Mr. Mu. I'll 
do it right away." replied Luke. He gave a meaningful look to Edward and walked out of 
the office. The only thing he needed to do was to follow orders from Edward. He never 
bothered to ask the reasons. 

"Edward, will we be able to find her?" asked Rain. Edward and Luke had just made the 
plan to solve the problem without asking for his opinion. He felt anxious. 



"Rain, is Annie still a teenager in your eyes? She is a grown woman. If she isn't 
kidnapped, it means she doesn't want to see you. Give her some space! She will show 
up when she wants. Calm down." explained Edward. 

He was aware that Rain was worried about her. But he knew, problems aren't solved by 
just worrying. 

Chapter 148: Chapter 148: Mrs. Mu What Are You 
Doing Here 

Daisy managed to finish her work before time, so she decided to leave the military base 
earlier than usual and take a night off. The dazzling red Ferrari sped through the military 
district towards the bustling downtown streets. A smile appeared on Daisy's face as she 
thought of Edward. 

He was the reason why Daisy left office before her assistant for the first time. She 
wondered whether Edward was still angry with her. Daisy rarely thought about anything 
unrelated to work. 

As the car slowly halted at the traffic signal, Daisy was surprised to see the same 
woman who was almost hit by her in the morning wandering on the road. 

Daisy seldom got involved in mundane matters, but this woman had caught her 
attention. It was a strange coincidence to come across a stranger twice on the same 
day. She was caught by that woman's elegance and serenity. 

A loud horn from the car behind Daisy's interrupted her contemplation. She forgot that 
she was in the middle of a busy road. Without more delay, she started the engine and 
headed towards the FX International Group. 

Daisy drew a lot of attention when she turned up in the lobby in her uniform. However, 
she was detained because no one recognized her as the CEO's wife. 

"Excuse me, may I know who you are looking for?" The receptionist looked at Daisy 
doubtfully, since when did the company began to collaborate with the military? 

"Hi, I need to see your CEO." Daisy frowned as the last time she was here with Justin, 
no one had stopped them. 

"Do you have an appointment?" The assistant asked. 

"No, I don't. But..." 



"Mrs. Mu, what are you doing here?" Luke was surprised to see Daisy in the lobby. "Hi 
Luke! Is Edward still upstairs?" Daisy sighed with relief when she saw Luke. Now she 
didn't need to give any reasons for going upstairs. 

"Mr. Mu is still in his office with Rain. Shall I take you upstairs?" Luke was just about to 
leave the office to carry out the task assigned by Edward. And he didn't expect to see 
Daisy here. 

"It's OK. I know the way to the office." Daisy smiled. 

"This is Mrs. Mu. You need to memorize her face distinctly and never hold her up 
again." Luke glanced at the receptionist and ordered. 

"Mrs. Mu. I'm sorry. Please forgive me for my ignorance." The receptionist profusely 
apologized to Daisy, though she wondered when the CEO married a female officer. "No 
big deal! Can I go upstairs now?" Daisy didn't mind as she knew it was the receptionist's 
duty to hold up strangers. 

"Sure Mrs. Mu. This way please." The receptionist quickly showed Daisy the way to the 
escalator and felt relieved that she had saved her job. If Mrs. Mu was displeased about 
what happened earlier, she would lose her job immediately. 

Daisy met Edward's secretary Anna as she walked onto the escalator. 

"Good afternoon, Mrs. Mu." Anna had seen Daisy in her uniform before, so she 
immediately recognized her. However, she wondered why Daisy came to the office at 
this time. 

"Anna, have you seen Edward in the office?" Every time Daisy visited FX International 
Group Anna escorted her to Edwards office that's why Daisy knew her quite well. 

"Yes, Mrs. Mu. Mr. Rain is also over there." Anna smiled gently at her. 'The uniform 
perfectly befitted Daisy. She was so distinctive.' Anna thought. 

"Thank you very much. Are they discussing work? Would it be OK for me to go inside?" 
Daisy didn't want to interrupt their work. "Never mind, they are just talking. Shall I take 
you in?" Anna rarely met wealthy women who showed her so much respect. Typically, 
they treated their assistants as slaves. 

"No need. Thanks." Daisy knocked on the door gently. But to her surprise, no one 
responded. 

At the other side, Edward also wondered why no one entered after knocking. Anna and 
Rain usually walked straight in after knocking. Who's that? 

Daisy sighed and knocked on the door a bit louder. 



Please come in, Edward frowned and looked at Rain doubtfully, wondering who would 
visit him this time. 

Daisy smiled when she heard his deep voice and then she open the door. 

Edward was leaning on his chair leisurely. But when he saw the olive green uniform, he 
instantly sat up straight and stared at Daisy with deep affection in his eyes. 

".... Daisy is that you?.. Rain was shock to see a female officer here. But as he gave her 
another look, he found the face familiar. Therefore, he wanted to make sure that the 
officer was in fact Daisy. 

Chapter 149: Chapter 149: Rain Dare You Touch Her 

"Yes, it's me. I hope I am not interrupting your work!" Daisy was accustomed to the 
surprised look people gave her when they saw her in uniform. Rain's exaggerated 
expression was normal for her now. "Wow! I didn't know that you are a female officer!" 
said Rain. He momentarily forgot about the disturbance that Annie had caused. He 
gazed at Daisy with admiration. She looked magnanimous in her uniform, he thought. 

When Edward saw Daisy appear in his office, he was very excited. But he stopped 
smiling and pretended to be busy with his work when he thought of her attitude towards 
him this afternoon. Still, he carefully listened to what she and Rain were talking about. 

"Sorry, I never mentioned my profession to you." Daisy apologized. She noticed that 
she had made many apologies for her identity recently. 

"That's all right. I am curious, can I know your military rank?" When Rain met Daisy and 
Kevin in the bar last time, they were wearing casual clothes. So no wonder Rain was 
very surprised when he realized that she was a female officer. 

"I am a Colonel." Daisy replied while secretly glancing at Edward, who wore a sullen 
look. 'Is he still angry with me? I have been in his office for a while now, but he hasn't 
even looked at me.' Daisy thought. 

"Miss Daisy, I heard there is a enigmatic young female officer in S City. Is that you? It is 
said that she is the only one who graduated from JC Military School overseas and she 
received many international medals. She was the kind of talent that JC Military School 
wanted to retain. But for some reason, she gave up the privilege and resolved to come 
back to S City. She worked hard all the way from a common soldier in S City to her 
current rank as a colonel. She has never accepted any interviews, so she has remained 
a legendary persona in many hearts. Are you the female officer admired by countless 
women in S City?" 



As soon as Daisy told him her military rank, Rain became more curious about her. His 
words also attracted Edward's attention. He raised his head and shifted his eyes from 
the files to Daisy. 

The most enigmatic young female officer? Why did he never hear about it? He had 
thought that after being with her for the past few months, he knew her well. It appeared 
that he still didn't know a lot about her. 

"Yes! I graduated from JC Military School. But I am not sure if I am the person you 
mentioned just now." Daisy didn't expect that so many people were curious about her, 
though she had tried to keep a low profile. It seemed that sometimes, it was difficult to 
hide. 

"Miss Daisy, you are too modest. You don't know how many people admire you. I want 
to shake hands with you. It's such a rare opportunity." While saying this, Rain quickly 
walked towards Daisy. At first, he was oblivious to such stories; he thought they were 
just rumors. But later when he constantly heard the female colleagues talking about the 
news, he began to take an interest in the female officer's story and kept an eye on the 
follow-ups. That was why he knew so much about it. 

"Rain, dare you touch her!" Edward looked at Rain and said coldly. Why did he always 
want to shake hands with Daisy? Edward wondered. 

Rain touched his nose and stopped in embarrassment. He regretted that he had 
forgotten about vicious Edward's presence in the office. He remembered that last time 
Edward also didn't let him shake hands with Daisy. And this time he also lost the chance 
because of Edward. Oh, was it such a big deal? He just wanted to shake hands with 
Daisy. Was it necessary for Edward to be so insecure? Rain thought. 

"Edward, it is just a handshake! Would that be okay?" Rain complained with a dejected 
expression on his face. 'He was so possessive about Daisy, but he still denied that he 
loves her. Will anyone believe him?' Rain would be the first one to disbelieve him. 

Daisy smiled gently. The mean Edward had finally opened his mouth. She had felt that 
he would continue to ignore her completely. "Rain, aren't you concerned about finding 
Annie anymore?" Edward didn't answer Rain's question directly. To tease him, Edward 
chose a matter that Rain was really concerned about. And about Daisy's sneer at him, 
he had noticed it. But he decided to ignore it. 

"You said it yourself she is not a little girl. If she wants to show up, she will. If she 
doesn't want to show up, it's useless for me to get worried. I am not inclined to ask for 
troubles." Rain raised his eyebrows and said. He set his heart at rest after Edward 
analyzed the situation for him. There was no news from Luke; maybe that was the best 
news. 



"If you're fine with it, why don't you go back to work?" Edward stared hard at Rain, 
indicating him to leave them alone. "Working hours are over now. Are you going to 
continue toiling me?" Rain knew what Edward said was a cue for him to leave. But he 
didn't want to follow his instructions. He intentionally became oblivious to Edward's hint, 
and this made him angry. He still bore the grudge against Edward for not giving him the 
opportunity to shake hands with Daisy. 

"Didn't you have plans to entertain the clients from C Financial Group? Or perhaps you 
don't want to have any relationship with Annie now?" Edward said with a cunning smile. 
'Rain, you're too naive to act against me. We are not on the same level.' Edward 
thought. 

"Aaron is there. Besides, Annie is not with them now. It's meaningless for me to be 
there." Rain replied. He seemed determined to stay. 'I won't go! I will stay here no 
matter what you say. I want to piss you off!" Rain thought. 

"What if Annie has contacted them? Are you sure you still want to stay here?" Edward 
said. He was so confident that he could win this time and Rain would back off. "Really?" 
Rain began to?waver in his decision on Edward's words. But he was not sure whether 
he could believe what Edward had said. He was a little resistant when he heard that 
Annie was coming. Rain had forced himself to forget about this matter. Now that he was 
sure Annie was here, he expected to see her as soon as possible. He was caught in 
complex emotions. He hesitated about Edward's suggestion. He was really perplexed. 

Chapter 150: Chapter 150: A Spot Check 

Daisy was quietly reading a magazine on the sofa. She acted casually, ignoring the man 
who had just chased Rain out the door. "Woman, do you think this damn magazine is 
better looking than me?" Edward finally gave up in this tug-of-war, yelling angrily at 
Daisy, who was cool as a cucumber. 

"Oh! Honey, you're done?" Smiling, Daisy looked up, acting surprised. You could tell 
that something was amiss, a hint of a smile, a cunning glint in the eye. Something... She 
would not lose against Edward in a game of patience. 

"Where did you get the idea that I was busy?" Edward stared at her, irritated. All he had 
been focusing on earlier was her. Why was she giving him the silent treatment and 
ignoring him? 

"I get the idea from watching you. And you've been ignoring me." Daisy occasionally 
would act like a pampered woman, and would tease Edward. After all such behavior 
would be unthinkable in the past. She had to make up for lost time. "Woman, you 
ignored me first. Now you're accusing me?" Edward was at Daisy's side in a flash. His 
hands pressed on the edge of the sofa, cornering her. His brooding eyes locked on 
hers. 



"Hm... I got off work early just to come here." Daisy began to lose her cool. She opened 
her palms and pushed against him, preventing him from closing in. 

"So? Does Colonel Ouyang know that she did something wrong? Is that why she's 
here? To apologize?" Edward couldn't be happier to hear that she took time off to see 
him. That meant that he really was someone special to her. 

"I'm not saying I did anything wrong. I'm just here to do a spot check, to make sure that 
you follow our agreement." Daisy teased him mercilessly. Although she came by to help 
him calm down, his complacency prompted her to dampen it down a little. Otherwise 
she would not live up to her colonel rank. 

"What did you find? Track down any clues with your keen senses?" Edward's lips were 
already touching her ear. A joking smile appeared on his handsome face. 

"Um... Can you get up first?" Daisy's heart raced. He always had to be so dramatic. It 
made her weak. 

"What? Now you're afraid? Huh? Keep taunting me!" Edward showed his sinister side. 
His lanky fingers swiped pass her soft lips, leaving her a flow of sensation. "Who... Who 
says I'm afraid? You're so close to me; aren't you hot?" She knew he didn't like to be too 
hot. She was hoping to distract him with that. 

"If things don't get hot between us, then there's something wrong. So if you're feeling 
hot, there's only one explanation..." Edward paused before naming it. He closely 
examined her nervous look. You could see him laughing if you stared into his eyes. 
"What's that?" Daisy was naturally inquisitive. But Daisy forgot for a second that 
curiosity killed the cat. 

"Does our beautiful Madam Colonel really want to know? We have a curious girl here." 
Edward was in high gear now, with explanations for every action he was about to take. 

"Not anymore. You get up!" Daisy was only confounded by Edward briefly. She blushed 
when she realized what he was getting at. 

Too late, he plopped down on the sofa, and pulled Daisy into his arms. His thin cold lips 
met Daisy's. Edward savored her sweetness with a bit of frustration.., she could taste 
the hint of punishment on her lips. 

Daisy didn't push him this time, she followed his lead. She kissed him with abandon. 
She loved him, so she was willing to let go of all of her pride. She loved him, so she 
refused to push him away from her heart.. She love him, and he is the only person to 
feel that. She loved him without complaints or regrets. She loved him more then herself. 

Edward didn't expect things to heat up this fast. He was only going to punished her a 
little bit, but now his heart softened. Though his actions were rough before, now they 



were gentle. His tongue reach past her lips and teeth, twirling with hers. In every touch 
there was his deep affection towards her. 

Edward, no longer satisfied with a kiss, move his lips down to her beautiful collarbone. 
He lingered there gently, lovingly. 

The kiss descended while their desire rose. She felt a coldness on her chest suddenly. 
Daisy woke up from mesmerising passion. She held the big hands on her breast and 
gently shook her head, her face was crimson. 

Frustrated, Edward kissed her again and lightly bit her lips, tightly holding her in his 
arms. It seems he underestimated her power over him. Her paused threatened to kill the 
mood. 

Daisy giggled, her smile pretty inticing. The coldness was gone. In this moment, all of 
her grace was blooming ardently for the man. All of her infinite love was only for him. 

 


