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The Pallarmus Tribe, though Aki said they were the weakest tribe in the Gigante Forest it was a force 
that was not something that could be underestimated. There were fifty beastmen in the tribe while the 
rest was a beast, around seven hundred of them. 
 
"If you want them to be your subordinates, you have to talk it out with the beastmen properly because 
the beasts could not speak. Only the beastmen could communicate with the beasts of their kind," Aki 
explained the strength of the tribe. 
 
"What about their leader's strength? How strong is it compared to the Dark Vulture I killed two days 
ago?" As they passed through the terrain, they continued the conversation. He was not going to be 
careless just because he could defeat five Dark Vultures and Aki. 
 
"The Chief of Pallarmus Tribe is a little bit stronger than the Dark Vulture but the rest should be weaker 
than the Dark Vulture," Aki replied. 
 
"If what you said is right, then there's nothing to worry about this Pallarmus Tribe," Tang Shoayang 
nodded. He could kill five Dark Vultures alone. A whole tribe that was weaker than a Dark Vulture should 
not possess a threat to him. 
 
As they continued their journey, he noticed that Ashley had been looking at him all this time. Maybe she 
had something she wanted to say. He turned toward her and asked, "What's up? Do you have 
something to say? Or do you know something about the Pallarmus Tribe?" 
 
"No, it's not about the Pallarmus Tribe, but about the four former knights of the Fotia Legion. Why did 
you suspect Sir Jacob as a part of the Revolution Army? I have been staying in the Ambrose Family and 
the Revolution Army but I never heard about him," Ashley wanted to know about this issue. She never 
heard about a remnant of the Fotia Legion in the Revolution Army. All of them were leaving along with 
Commander Alton and Vice Commander Allan. 
 
"It's a mere suspicion as I found that he made a lot of contradictions with his actions. First, Roan wanted 
to talk with me but that old man provoked me. He tried to instigate a fight between us which I followed 
his plan and kept provoking him. I was right about that, he wanted to fight, no, he wanted his friends to 
fight me. Second, why is he the only one not wanting to sign the contract and make the oath while his 
three best friends do? I suspect that he already has a contract with another force. Three, it's always 
better to be safe than sorry. That's it." 
 
Tang Shaoyang answered casually. In fact, he did not know as well. He asked Tristan to investigate his 
friend just to confirm Jacob's status. If he truly did not want to join the battlefield anymore and clear, 
then it would be fine. But if he was part of the Revolution Army, they had to get rid of them or his 
friends would do what they deemed fit for their friend. 
 
"You take the risk that the three knights would unite together against you only for a mere suspicion? 
You will lose two Epic followers for that suspicion, you know?" Ashley could not believe what she heard. 
 
"I will not, they have signed the contract and doubled it with the oath," Tang Shaoyang shrugged, "Can 
you imagine that they have been living together for years but when his three friends decided to follow a 
person, he pulled himself out? How can you not be suspicious? Anyway, there's no harm done." 
 



The group passed through the hills and the rough terrain, the giant tree's leaves became a canopy that 
protected them from the piercing sunlight. It was less than an hour's journey and Aki stopped suddenly. 
The rat beastmen then pointed forward, "We have arrived, the Pallarmus Tribe is ahead of us!" 
 
Tang Shaoyang walked forward and saw a wooden fence sparsely made. The gap was enough for a 
person to sneak into the village. He felt that the fence served no purpose but a barrier that indicated it 
was someone's territory, "What are we waiting then? Let's go!" 
 
Ten meters away from the entrance, he finally managed to see the resident of the village. The beastmen 
was three meters tall with a pair of longhorns on the head, and a face that was similar to a deer? He 
remembered the Deere, the deer beastmen in the third portal of the survival game, but this was a meter 
taller than the one he encountered before. 
 
"The one who leads the group is the Chief of the Pallarmus Tribe, Lauri," Aki whispered. 
 
Tang Shaoyang cast the [Basic Detection] on the beastmen who led a big group of beastmen and also 
the beasts. 
 
—————————— 
 
Name: Lauri 
 
Race: Black Impaler 
 
Affiliation: Pallarmus Tribe 
 
Rank: Chief 
 
Class: Grand Warrior 
 
Evolution: Epic 
 
Level: 870 
 
Skill??? 
 
—————————— 
 
"Who might you be and what's your purpose of visiting the Pallarmus Tribe?" Lauri asked as he scanned 
the group. His black eyes landed on Aki first before moving toward Tang Shaoyang. After scanning Tang 
Shaoyang, he looked at the Adolescent Dark Predator on the shoulder. The black cat was positioning 
itself to have a comfortable sleep. 
 
This was far from an ordinary group, Lauri could tell that by a single glance. However, there was 
something that disturbed the Chief. It was Aki's presence, an Elder of the Dark Tribe, "So you come 
again, Aki. My answer will remain the same, we will not join the Dark Tribe!" The Chief spoke in a 
harsher tone at Aki. 
 
"I am afraid you are wrong this time, Lauri. This time I came as my Master's servant," Aki bowed toward 
Tang Shaoyang, "He is now my Master. I am no longer an Elder of the Dark Tribe, but a servant to 
Emperor Tang." 



 
Tang Shaoyang noticed that Chief Lauri's eyes shook. The Black Impaler was surprised to hear that, 
especially from Aki himself. This caused Chief Lauri to look at the man again for the second time. 
 
"I come here with an offer for you, Chief Lauri. Join my empire and let's conquer the world together!" 


