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  The sub-commander looked out the door at this time, and when he saw Maybach, he 
stopped at the door, and immediately stood up straight. Coming? Or maybe the 
congressman is here. Guys, get your clothes sorted, and as soon as the big man 
arrives, maybe the media reporters will be there too!” The 

    crowd suddenly became excited, and one of them said quickly, “Quick, quick, quick. 
Clean up the pizza and fried chicken nuggets on the table, don’t let the media take 
pictures!” 

    The people inside were busy with excitement, and the co-pilot of the Maybach 
outside also got off at this time, a young man in a suit, after getting out of the car, he 
hurriedly walked towards In the rear, pull the rear door open. 

    Immediately afterwards, a middle-aged man with gray hair, a tall and straight body, 
and a grim face stepped out of the car. 

    When everyone in the police station saw him, they were dumbfounded. 

    One of them said terribly, “Holy????shit! It’s Mad Dog White!” 

    When everyone recognized the famous Mad Dog White, everyone suddenly became 
nervous. 

    The head of the branch immediately frowned and said, “What is this son of a b*tch 
Mad Dog White doing here?!” 

    “Yeah…” Jimmy Wayne was also a little puzzled, and couldn’t help but say, “This 
bastard is only for the richest one. Helping people, why did they come to us?” 

    The policeman who persuaded Jimmy Wayne to restrain himself in the future frowned 
and said, “Jimmy, Mad Dog White, isn’t that the lawyer hired by the Chinese woman 
inside ?” 

    Jimmy Wynn said. Wayne said contemptuously: “Just her? Can you hire Mad Dog 
White?! Someone who can hire Mad Dog White, at least ranks in the top 100 among the 
richest people in New York, what does it mean to be in the top 100 in New York? No 
100. The worth of more than 100 million US dollars, don’t even think about it! The stupid 
woman inside is also worthy of hiring Mad Dog White?” 

    Just after he finished speaking, the young man in a suit outside had pushed open the 
door of the police station. 



    The powerful James White stepped in, adjusted his tie with one hand, and said 
coldly, “Which one of you is in charge? I want to see my client, Ms. Elaine.” 

    As soon as these words came out, All the police at the scene took a deep breath! 

    Jimmy Wayne was dumbfounded. He never dreamed that the mad dog White, who 
had been on the line with the New York police countless times by himself, and who had 
beaten the New York police so helplessly, was really Elaine’s. The attorney… 

    At this moment, he was so frightened that his body was soaked in cold sweat, and his 
legs were almost paralyzed. 

    Mad Dog White’s fame, everyone in the New York police knows that he broke 
Elaine’s rib by himself. Once it falls into Mad Dog White’s hands, his future may be over! 

    Even if it doesn’t work well, you may face jail time! 

    The sub-director was also stunned at this time. He had already listened to the report 
of his subordinates before he came. The person who was arrested this time was just a 
Chinese tourist who went to the United States. He entered the United States on a tourist 
visa about a week ago. Such a person , how could it be possible to invite Mad Dog 
White? 

    However, he was not allowed to think too much, because the mad dog White was 
extremely aggressive, not to mention a little shrimp like him, even the chief of the New 
York City Police Department has always been passive in front of him. 

    So, the sub-director immediately stepped forward and said: “I am the person in 
charge here, let me introduce myself, my name is…” 

    Before the sub-director could say his name, James White said coldly: “I don’t If I need 
to know your name, I just need to see my client, right away!” 

    “Okay, okay…” The sub-director nodded quickly and said to his subordinates, “Quick, 
take lawyer White to see the suspect!” 

    The subordinate did not dare to delay, and immediately said, “Mr. White, please 
come here.” 

    James White walked to the interrogation room with his assistant. 
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    As soon as the police opened the door, James White immediately said to the two 
police officers in charge of the interrogation: “Two, the interrogation is over. From now 
on, I want to communicate with my client privately, please avoid it.” The two police 
officers in charge of the interrogation recognized James White at once. The     two 

    were too shocked to speak. The colleague who opened the door quickly said, “Come 
out quickly and let Mr. White talk to his client in private.” 

Then he nodded quickly, picked up the transcript and ran out the door. 

    James White said to the policeman next to him: “My client doesn’t understand 
American law, plus she doesn’t speak the language, and she hasn’t seen her lawyer, so 
if your transcript has any threatening or inducing elements, it’s better to invalidate it. 
Don’t let me catch anything, otherwise, I will definitely challenge it in court!” 

    Several people suddenly felt a little stressed. 

    To all the police, James White is like the most critical marking teacher behind an 
exam. Sometimes you think you have answered flawlessly, but in his hands, you can 
still find some small problems and then deny them. all your efforts. 

    Therefore, several people were also very nervous at this time, especially Elaine also 
broke a rib. When James White came, he immediately made this matter extremely 
passive. 

    Elaine also vaguely heard that this hard-spoken man should be the lawyer that his 
good son-in-law found for him. He suddenly felt that he had met a savior, so he cried 
out excitedly, and said loudly: “Help, lawyer, police officer. HE BEAT ME  and broke my 
ribs!” When the 

    two Chinese police officers heard this, they immediately broke out in a cold sweat. 

    In order to cater to a top Chinese family like the Fei family, James White has long 
learned fluent Chinese. 

    So when he heard this, his expression immediately became extremely angry, and he 
roared coldly: “You hurt my client, which itself is a serious violation of the law and the 
police’s law enforcement regulations, but even so, you guys  didn’t send my client to the 
doctor in time, and instead continued to harshly interrogate my severely injured client 
here. This is simply inhumane! I want to check your law enforcement recorder at the 
time, and immediately report to your The superior unit will sue!” 

    All the police officers at the scene panicked. 

    The fact that the suspect was injured was not easy to explain. After all, Elaine did not 
attack the police, nor did he make huge profits to resist the law. Jimmy Wayne had 



already subdued her at that time, but he deliberately crushed her ribs after subduing 
her. This is obviously subjective and intentional. No matter how you wash it, you can’t 
wash it clean. 

    Jimmy Wayne was outside the door at this time, and he was trembling with panic 
when he heard James White’s high-pitched questioning inside. 

    The little policeman has a serious disparity in the status of the big lawyer, not to 
mention that he himself has made mistakes first. 

    At this time, he was completely indifferent and didn’t know what to do. 

    The sub-director did not dare to make a big deal of the matter at this time, and 
hurriedly said: “Mr. White, this lady was injured mainly because of some friction in the 
process of law enforcement, and our people checked her injury and thought that there 
was nothing serious. , just need to take some medicine later…” 

    James White asked coldly: “Any of you have the qualifications to practice medicine? 
Including you, the distinguished director!” 

    “This…” The sub-director is embarrassed “We are all policemen, we are not qualified 
to practice medicine…” 

    James White said sharply: “Without the qualifications to practice medicine, why do 
you think my client’s injury is not serious?! Are your eyes all medical CT grades?” What 
if my client has internal bleeding or ruptured internal organs? Can you take 
responsibility for this?!” 

    All the police officers looked at each other, not knowing how to answer. 

    At this time, James White continued: “You violently enforce the law, despise the law, 
and despise life, you have simply refreshed my understanding of the New York police!” 

    After speaking, he changed his words and said more sternly: “Because my client is a 
Yellow people, so I ask you to show your previous cases of dealing with other suspects 
who were injured. If you find that you are only targeting my client and have not taken 
medical treatment, then I have reason to suspect that you are suspected of targeting 
people of color. Racism!” 
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“F*ck…” 



    At this time, the sub-director was already rushing past ten thousand grass and mud 
horses. 

    “What the hell is this situation, how can this mad dog White raise the level of racial 
discrimination in just two sentences?!” 

    In the United States, the police are most afraid of the word “racial discrimination”. . 

    Once you reach the level of these four words, things will immediately rise to the most 
serious level. 

    Not to mention that the police officer involved will be expelled from the police force, 
and even his own sub-chief may be severely punished. 

    If mass incidents are triggered again, then I can only take the blame and resign. 

    So he quickly explained to James White: “Mr. White, this matter has nothing to do 
with racial discrimination. The most important reason is because the facts of this case 
are really serious, and my subordinates are eager to investigate the whole situation.  

 You need to know the ins and outs of this incident, and catch the mastermind as soon 
as possible…” 

    He said with a mournful smile: “You also know that as long as you catch the 
mastermind as soon as possible, you will be able to clear your client from suspicion as 
soon as possible. After all, we I also believe…” 

    James White reached out a hand to interrupt him, and said coldly: “It is your duty to 
investigate the real black hand of the incident, and to clear my client of suspicion is It’s 
my job, so you don’t need to advertise yourself, and now I’m talking about racial 
discrimination, so don’t divert the topic here.” 

    James White’s volume increased a little and continued: ” What I need to know is how 
many of the cases you’ve done over the past three years are suspects who were 
arrested and injured;” 

    “Secondly, I need to know these suspects who were arrested and injured Among the 
people, how many were sent to the doctor in time, and how many were not sent to the 
doctor in time like my client: “ 

    “Finally, I need to know how many of the people who were sent to the doctor in time 
were white people? How many people of color were there? And of those people who 
were not sent to the doctor in time, how many people were white people. How many 
people of color are there? You must give me this data as soon as possible, otherwise, I 
will immediately protest to the city police station and inform the congressmen who are 
most concerned about racial discrimination!” 



    “God damn… “The branch chief only felt that his liver was shaking. 

    “Sure enough, it’s Mad Dog White! There’s no reason he can’t find it…” 

    He was a division chief in the entire New York police system. 

    Because in the whole of New York, there are only one or two hundred bureaus of 
different sizes, and he is only one or two percent of them. 

    But James White is different. 

    James White is one of the top criminal lawyers in New York, bar none. 

    It’s the whole pyramid of criminal lawyers in New York. 
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    Therefore, in front of James White, this small airport sub-director is no match at all. 

    Just when the sub-chief had no idea what to do, a police officer ran over and said 
breathlessly: “Chief, there is news from the city police department, people from cnn and 
the New York Times will come to interview later, The city bureau chief will also come!” 
The 

    head of the sub-director was buzzing, and James White sneered: “I was thinking just 
now, should I inform some of my friends in the media field and expose this matter well? 
, but since you have informed the media, it would be better, and let the media reporters 
come to expose how you violated the law, violated humanity, and racially discriminated!” 

    In fact, James White was appointed, not only In order to clear Elaine of the crime, 
there is still a very important task, which is to control this matter as much as possible, 
and the influence, especially, try not to let Elaine’s name and Elaine’s image appear on 
any American media. 

    This is what charlie meant. 

    After all, she Elaine is not only Elaine, she is also charlie’s mother-in-law. Even if this 
matter is resolved in the end, charlie does not want others to know that his mother-in-
law was involved in such a ridiculous scam. 

    On the one hand, he really doesn’t really want to lose this person; 



    on the other hand, in case this matter becomes a big one, Elaine is famous at the 
international level, and as her son-in-law, maybe he will be dug up by someone with a 
heart. . 

    Therefore, charlie’s request is to solve it in a low-key manner, and not to make too 
much action. 

    The reason why James White said that is to attack instead of defend. 

    A person like him knows that he can never let his opponent know his true demands. 

    Once his opponent knows that he does not want this matter to be exposed, then the 
opponent will definitely use this matter to test his bottom line. 

    So instead of doing this, it is better to counterattack and defend, and take the 
initiative to ask for this matter to be exposed. 

    James White’s method really worked, when the sub-director heard this, he hurriedly 
pleaded: “Mr. White, don’t be angry, there must be some misunderstanding in this 
matter, we will do our best to solve it, otherwise what do you think, We will first arrange 
your client to go to the hospital for treatment. As for the interrogation and transcripts, we 
will put it aside for a while to ensure your client’s life safety, physical health and mental 
health.” 

    James White sneered: “This way Isn’t it a bit inappropriate? So the media is full of 
expectations, so they won’t let them see the client? I hope that people in the United 
States can report through the media and see my client’s rib being broken by you! 

    ” The director said with a sad face: “Mr. White, you can’t say that, our people have 
never hit your client…” 

    James White asked: “Then how did my client’s rib break? If you don’t want this It’s 
not impossible for things to make a big deal in front of the media, but you must promise 
me a few conditions!” The 

    branch director said with sincerity: “Mr. White, please say it!” 

    James White said coldly: “First of all, you must immediately provide a multi-angle 
bodyguard video. I want to participate in the bodyguard video of every policeman on the 
scene!” 

    “No problem, no problem!” promised to come down. 

    Once the matter becomes a big one, the contents of the recorder will not only be 
handed over to James White, but may even be exposed by TV stations. 



    Therefore, in this case, how dare he refuse James White’s request. 

    James White continued: “In addition, the data I just asked you to show, that is, the 
cases you have handled in the same situation in recent years, you must give it to my 
assistant before ten o’clock tonight!” 

    “Okay…” Although the sub-director was reluctant, he could only grit his teeth and 
agree at this time. 

    He is very aware of the strength of James White, who is dealing with high society 
every day and is very familiar with those media tycoons. 

    Once he wants to make a fuss about racial discrimination, there is no way to escape 
this matter, and whether those cases are given or not will not affect the hat of racial 
discrimination. 

    So for now, he can only stabilize James White first, as long as he promises not to 
announce it to the media for the time being, then there is still a way to mediate this 
matter. 

    James White looked at Elaine at this time, and said in Chinese very respectfully: “Ms. 
Elaine, I’m sorry, I’m late, and you have been wronged!” 

 


