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Fei Kexin didn’t expect the old man to remember him, so she quickly said respectfully, 
“Mr. An, how have you been recently?” 

The old man nodded and said to Fei Kexin, “Miss Toffee’s clothes, I have been doing 
well recently.” 

Fei Kexin said hurriedly: “Mr. An, don’t say that, how can I be a junior like me!” 

Asher on the side also nodded politely to Fei Kexin and said, “Hello, Miss Fei!” 

Fei Kexin responded respectfully: “Hello, Mr. An!” 

Asher asked with concern: “Miss Fei, I would like to ask, where is my good brother Li 
Yalin buried now? If it is convenient, please give me an address, I want to go to 
worship.” 

Before Fei Kexin could speak, Li Yalin, who was wearing a mask and sunglasses, 
suddenly said, “Asher! Your brother Li isn’t dead yet!” 

When Li Yalin said this, Asher and An Qishan around him were stunned! 

Both of them could hear that this was Li Yalin’s voice. 

However, neither of them could believe that the person in front of them would be Li 
Yalin. 

After all, in the gym that day, the dead men beat the top players of the An family into a 
beehive. Even if they didn’t see Li Yalin’s body with their own eyes, they knew that Li 
Yalin, who was the first to bear the brunt, could not survive. 

And charlie, who rescued them that day, also said that Li Yalin was dead, and immortals 
could not be saved. 

So, how can they believe that Li Yalin can appear in front of them alive at this time. 

Li Yalin saw the An family’s father and son staring at him with wide-eyed eyes and 
speechless. Impatiently, he tore off his mask and sunglasses, and blurted out, “It’s me! 
I’m not dead!” 

“F*ck!” Asher blurted out in horror, “I’m not f*cking dreaming…you…how did you 
survive?!” 

An Qishan on the side couldn’t help but sigh: “Yarin, is it really you?” 



Li Yalin nodded and said respectfully, “Uncle An, it’s really me!” 

Asher came back to his senses, stepped forward and patted Li Yalin’s face, shook his 
shoulders, and asked in disbelief and excitement, “Old Li…what’s the matter? What the 
hell! I’m running out of brains!” 

Li Yalin sighed deeply and said with emotion: “This is because the child has no mother, 
and it’s a long story…” 

At this time, An Qishan stepped forward with great satisfaction, embraced Asher, and 
said repeatedly: “Yarin, no matter what, you can stand here alive, my old bones are 
really gratified!” 

Asher was also very excited, hugged Li Yalin tightly, and choked: “Old Li, it’s great that 
you are alive… Brother, I’m really so happy…” 

Li Yalin couldn’t help but red eyes and sighed: “Asher, the moment the elevator door 
opened and countless bullets passed through my body, I knew that I was dead. At that 
time, I was only worried about my wife and me. My daughter, I was also worried about 
your family, and thought that you would also encounter unforeseen events, but I am 
very happy to hear that you are all alive!” 

The old man An Qishan sighed and said quickly: “Yalin, Miss Fei, this is not the place to 
talk, let’s go in and talk! Go in and talk!” 

Asher also came back to his senses, and quickly said excitedly: “Yes, yes! Let’s go in 
and talk! Old Li, I want to have a drunken break with you at noon!” 

An Qishan looked at Fei Kexin again and invited: “If Miss Fei doesn’t dislike it, let’s stay 
together for a light meal at noon!” 

Fei Kexin knew that the An family must have a lot of questions to ask themselves and Li 
Yalin, and that he had to observe Li Yalin’s answers and performance to prevent him 
from saying the wrong thing or revealing key information to the An family. 

So, she cupped her hands and said, “Thank you, Mr. An, the younger generation would 
be more respectful than obedient!” 
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An Qishan and Asher quickly invited them into the Anbang Building, and took the 
elevator to the top floor from the top of the building. As soon as they got out of the 
elevator, An Qishan took Li Yalin straight to the conference room. 

Now, the young and old of the An family are waiting in the reception room. According to 
the old man’s intention, they plan to thank Fei Kexin in person. 



An Qishan pushed open the door of the guest room, and the young and old of the An 
family who were sitting inside stood up one after another, but what they did not expect 
was that it was not Fei Kexin who came in behind the old man, but Li Yalin, who had a 
good relationship with the An family. ! 

Seeing Li Yalin at this moment, the An family instantly exploded. 

Everyone couldn’t believe their eyes. 

Because they all firmly believed that Li Yalin was dead and was implicated by the An 
family. 

Therefore, when Li Yalin suddenly appeared in front of him, every An family member 
present seemed to have lost their ability to think. 

The old lady of the An family stepped forward in disbelief and asked the old man, 
“Qishan…this…is this really Yalin? Or am I dreaming, or my Insane?” 

“It’s Yalin!” An Qishan said excitedly: “It’s really Yalin! He’s not dead! Miss Fei brought 
him back!” 

Only then did everyone see Fei Kexin who came in behind. 

The old lady was surprised and delighted, looked at Fei Kexin, and asked, “Miss Fei… 
can you tell us what is going on? At the time of the incident, the benefactor didn’t say 
that Yalin had been rescued. Aren’t you coming back?” 

Fei Kexin said truthfully: “At that time, the benefactor found that Inspector Li’s brain was 
not dead yet, but because of his severe physical injuries, he felt that Inspector Li could 
not be saved, but he couldn’t bear Inspector Li to die in vain, so he thought Save 
Detective Li’s brain first, and then find a way to save him…” 

The An family was dumbfounded, and no one could understand what was the use of 
protecting his brain when Li Yalin was basically completely disabled at the time. 

Fei Kexin said again at this time: “It just so happened that the Fei family invested in a 
human body freezing center, so my father-in-law ordered me to bring Detective Li to 
freeze it first, so during this time, Detective Li has been in the Fei family’s house all the 
time. The frozen center is frozen.” 

Asher exclaimed: “Is it that the scientific community has not yet been able to prove 
whether it is effective or not?” 

“Yes.” Fei Kexin nodded and said, “My grandfather thought at the time that this might be 
a way to leave the problem to the future to solve, so he invested in this freezing center.” 



Asher blurted out: “But this technology has never been reliable! Over the years, people 
have been frozen one after another, but no one has been successfully thawed. Not only 
has Lao Li thawed, but he is still alive and well. How did this happen? ?” 

Fei Kexin explained: “It’s the benefactor, he returned to New York today and gave me 
an elixir, and asked me to thaw Inspector Li and feed him the elixir. After Detective Li 
took the medicine pill, all the damage to his body was recovered…” 

Asher looked shocked, turned to look at Li Yalin, and blurted out: “Old Li, you… Have 
your injuries really recovered?” 

Li Yalin nodded and said solemnly: “Not only did he recover, but he was completely 
recovered as before, even without scars, just like he had never been injured…” 

“This…how is this possible…” Asher felt that the worldview had been subverted, and 
blurted out: “Isn’t this a fairy technique and magic?” 

Li Yalin shook his head and said, “It’s not magic, it’s not magic, it’s really an elixir.” 

Speaking, Li Yalin reminded him: “Don’t forget, when you told me about Huichundan, I 
didn’t believe it at all.” 

“Yes!” Asher suddenly came back to his senses and blurted out: “Huichundan not only 
can be used for all kinds of diseases, but it can also make people younger by 10 or 20 
years old. It sounds really incredible, only people who have seen its effects with their 
own eyes. , just know how amazing this thing is…” 

As he said that, he quickly looked at Li Yalin and said seriously: “This medicine pill you 
took is even more amazing! It can actually bring back the dead and restore all the 
injuries to your body…this…this It’s just a miracle!” 

At this time, the old lady asked Fei Kexin a little excitedly: “Miss Fei, you said that your 
benefactor has come to New York. I wonder if you can convey a request on my behalf. 
The three generations of the An family are very grateful for his life-saving grace, so I 
hope to have A chance to thank him in person!” 

 


