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Just when Fitz drove back to the Thorn’s old
house, and Banks ( Butler )

set off for the airport overnight, the Thorn’s
old house at this time

had become a sea of ​ ​ joy.

The brothers and sisters of the Thorne Family
have been cultivated to

be exceptionally united under the guidance of
their father since they were young.

In fact, regardless of whether brothers and
sisters are close relatives,

in the final analysis, in most families with
children,

it is difficult for the relationship between

children to be absolutely intimate.

Especially when the children are all grown-ups,

and after their respective families start their
own businesses,



the big family with brothers and sisters is
naturally less important than

the small family with wives and children.

Therefore, in real life and in the TV news, we
can often see that brothers and sisters turn
their

faces because of the fight for family property,

or quarrel and even fight because of parental
issues.

Moreover, this is not only true of the poor, but
even more so for the rich.

However, the brothers and sisters of the

Thorne Family are really twisted into a rope.

Deana had an accident, and her brothers and
sisters put aside everything

in their hands, regardless of all costs, just to
find her and her daughter.

Now that their wives finally return safely, these
brothers and sisters are naturally extremely
happy!



The eldest sister Allie had asked the chef to
cook a new table,

and she was waiting for her sister and niece to
come, and the family had a

good celebration.

But when their wives came back, Allie couldn’t
even bother

for a meal, and she hugged her safe sister, and
suddenly burst into tears.

The family gathered around the mother and
daughter and asked questions.

The questions were also very concentrated.

They just wanted to know who took them away
after they had a car accident in the tunnel.
Where did he go after he was taken away?

And they must have been seriously injured in
the car accident,

so who on earth was healed the injury?

Deana faced the problems of his family and lied
against his will:



“Actually, Zara and I still don’t know who saved
us.

After a car accident, we were almost
unconscious when we woke up.

We are already lying in a ward, and we can’t see
anything related to

the name of the hospital in the ward.

The doctors who came to treat us also wore
masks and couldn’t

recognize who it was.”

Dalton hurriedly asked her: “Then have you
remembered the surrounding environment, for
example,
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