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That eye is brimming with discouragement.

His sensational and amazing air and his remarkable and honorable personality
nearly made one sink into insensibility with a solitary look.

At the point when he peered down, maybe everybody was just about as low as

residue before him.

The tall shadow of the man slowly enveloped Jessie.

Outrage and outrage transformed into outrage, consuming inch by inch in her
chest.

She gritted her teeth and stayed up with power, slapping the man.

The man’s 1.9 meters tall body just made a slight stride back before her palm fell

vacant.

He scoffed. “You need to play? You tracked down some unacceptable individual!”

As he talked, he got a check between his long fingers, given it to her, and
extricated his fingers.

The check daintily brushed past her face and fell into her uncovered arms.

The man snatched the dark suit by the side, fixed his long legs, and strutted off.

“Bastard-” Jessie was hysterical.

However, Alex’s back had already disappeared from the door of the suite. . .

When she returned home, the sky was already bright. Jessie did not know how she

managed to persevere and return home.



Her entire body seemed to be in pain, but it also seemed like she had already
become numb to the pain. As a result, she could not feel the pain anymore.

From afar, she saw Mike’s car parked at the gate. They seemed to be throwing
something out of the house.

She quickened her pace and ran over. She saw that the things they threw out were

all hers.

Linda and Mike separated her clothes and threw them out again. Even her
undergarments were exposed.

Jessie’s house was a civilian house in the suburbs. The neighbors were all around
her. At this moment, those who liked to watch the show were all watching the

show from not far away.

“What are you guys doing?” Jessie shouted in embarrassment and hurriedly bent
down to pick up the clothes and books on the ground.

Mike’s face turned cold when he saw her. He did not say anything and continued
to throw her luggage outside.

“What are we doing?” Linda threw a set of red undergarments and underwear on

Jessie’s head again and sneered, “You are shameless. You are divorced and you
are still staying at our house. What can we do? We can only suffer losses and be

the porters. We will throw away your things!”

“This is your house?” Jessie did not even bother to pick up the things and stood
up with her eyes wide open. She pointed at the house and shouted, “Look clearly!
This house is mine. I bought it with my own money! My name is on the property

deed alone! I bought it before I married your son!”

If she hadn’t seen it with her own eyes, she wouldn’t have believed it. Mike was

worth hundreds of millions now, and he wanted a divorce. But he was so ruthless
that he even wanted to take away her home.



“Your house? If not for you taking my son’s money. . . You think you can afford
this house by yourself?” Linda shouted louder than her.

She turned the wheelchair around and ran to the door to lie to the crowd. She
started to make a scene, “Look, everyone. She is an ungrateful person! You must
learn to be smart. You must not marry a heartless person like in our family. This
lowly person. . . She has provoked my son at such a young age, and she is still
trying to seduce others. It was because she seducing other men everywhere, Her
health was already bad. She had not given birth to a child for our family in seven
years, and now my son is going to get a divorce. She still wants to split our house,
she’s shameless. . . “

Jessie did not expect her to be so good at making up stories. She was so angry that
her lungs were about to explode, “It was clearly your son who cheated first. He
was with another woman in front of me. You even framed me. Do you want to be
shameless?”

“We framed you?” Linda usually even had to order Jessie to pour a glass of water.
At this moment, the wheelchair was very convenient for her to use. She
immediately turned the wheelchair in front of Jessie.

Without waiting for her reaction, Linda forcefully pulled Jessie’s collar. She
shouted even louder, “Neighbors, quickly look at this woman’s neck. She must
have had a relationship with another man. She didn’t come back last night, and my
son didn’t even see her face. She must be fooling around outside. They’ve been
married for a few years. My son was busy, and she saw that I was paralyzed. I was
useless, so she tried to torture me every day. She often doesn’t go home at night.
When she came back, she had a disgusting smell all over her body. I used to think
that this is, after all, a scandal in our family. I can’t tell outsiders. I was angry, but
I didn’t dare to say anything.” Linda’s voice was loud and soft. She acted very
happily.

Jessie’s neck was indeed full of red stains and bruises.

When she left the hotel earlier, her soul was in a daze and she did not notice these
things at all.



At this moment, it was already too late for her to cover it up even if she wanted to.

The people by the side also saw it, and began to criticize her non-stop.

“I can’t tell. She looks quite proper. I didn’t think that she would be such a
person.”

“This is a dog that bites but doesn’t bark. She looks pure on the surface, but deep
down, she’s a slut.”

“She’s not satisfied with having such a handsome superstar, hubby. She even went
out to seduce other men.”

“Celebrities are all very busy. There was a person called Rolland on the news a
while ago. She also cheated on her celebrity, hubby, behind her back.”

. . .

Linda was proud and resentful.

When Jessie bent down just now, the purple marks on her neck were very clear
and Linda used this excuse to scold her. She did not think that this lowly woman
really had a relationship with another man!

Thinking about how many times she cheated in the past seven years, her son’s
head became a cuckold, she gritted her teeth even more hatefully.

But luckily, she was able to drive this woman away very soon. She wanted to
make this woman unable to get a single cent!

Mike also saw the thing on Jessie’s neck. His face was very dark. He looked at her
with sharp eyes like a knife. He walked over and threw a divorce certificate at

Jessie’s feet.
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