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1. You’re so Shameless!
After coming out of Fia’s room, Alex was about to go to Felix’s room when his
phone rang.

He took out his phone from his suit pocket.

When he saw the number, his handsome face became colder and he hung up the
phone.

A fewminutes later, his phone rang again.

His gloomy face focused on the phone screen, but he didn’t answer.

This time, the phone didn’t ring.

It only rang for the third time before it hung up.

Alex was in an even worse mood. He did not enter the children’s room again. He
strode towards the study at the end of the corridor.

He lit a cigarette by the window, held it in one hand, and picked up his phone
with the other.

He stared at the screen for a fewminutes, but the caller did not call again.

He put the cigarette in his mouth and took a few deep breaths.

In a ball of light blue smoke, he unlocked his phone and dialed back the missed
call.

As soon as the call connected, he coldly said: “What is it?”

Jessie could hear the impatience in his tone and carefully asked, “Sorry, I woke
you up so late, didn’t I? Are you with Felix and Fia? Can I talk to them on the
phone?”

“You kept calling me when you knew it would be noisy?”

Jessie heard the coldness in his words and felt even more apologetic in her heart.

Her jacket was stained with blood. When she was in the hospital, she took it off
and put it in her bag. At this moment, she was only wearing a sky-blue dress. Her
arms and half of her calves were exposed. After a few hours of cold wind, her
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body was stiff. Her voice was so cold that it trembled slightly,”… Fia also went to
sleep, right? Sorry. I didn’t notice it was so late. Then I’ll go tomorrow.”

“Do you think that they are all five-year-old children who are childish and easy to
coax? You didn’t do what you promised and now you want to make a phone call to
comfort them so that they forget about this matter and still make up with you?”

Hearing his malicious accusations, Jessie felt that her crime could not be forgiven,
“I really wanted to come and find them. I went out in the morning. But -”

She swallowed the word ‘car accident’ when it was about to come out of her
mouth. For some reason, she felt that it was a bit hard to tell Alex about her
ex-husband, and she herself did

not know why.

“You really don’t need to take the matter of a five-year-old child to heart,
because in Miss Jessie’s eyes, anything is more important than them!”

Jessie could not take it anymore as she was continuously attacked and mocked
by him. She was a little annoyed and said, “I really did not do it on purpose!”

“What is it?”

“Eh?” Jessie asked. He changed the topic too quickly and Jessie could not keep
up with him.

“You are not going to explain?”

“I… ”

Alex waited silently for nearly a minute and sneered. “I understand. Recently, as
a father, I have not done my duty. I let them disturb Miss Jessie’s life. Actually,
you do not need to feel troubled. They are only two five-year-old children. Even if
you directly say that you have never taken them seriously, they are just two
five-year-old children. Their memory is very bad. At most, they will be sad for a
while. It’ll be fine after some time.”

Jessie finally could not bear it anymore. “I may have really disturbed Boss Alex’s
rest. So I can understand why you are scolding me now. But I really had
something to do before, so I did not rush over. What right do you have to say that
I did not take the children seriously?”

She paused for a moment, then took a deep breath and said: “I know that if I say
this, you might think it’s absurd. Actually, even I think it’s absurd. I really care
about Felix and Fia. To me, they are like very important family. I really…”

Tears started to flow out of her eyes. She hung up the phone directly.

The sound of the car coming from afar made her turn her head.



An old man dressed in a dark blue mountain suit walked out of the car. He looked
hale and his face was kind. “Little girl, who are you looking for?”

Rudolf saw that his precious grandson and granddaughter were not in a good
mood today. They did not have much to eat for dinner. Rudolf especially went
out to buy them a Mu Si cake that they liked in the middle of the night.

Rudolf went to the front door of his house and saw Jessie. He didn’t recognize
Jessie and thought that she was looking for a nanny or driver in his house. He
specially came over to ask and prepare to help.

Jessie did not expect to meet someone. She quickly wiped the tears from the
corners of her eyes. “Sorry, I walked the wrong way.”

She turned around and left in a hurry.

Rudolf carried the cake into the house and muttered to his wife, “Young people
nowadays have a really bad sense of direction. There are even people who got
lost and came to our place.

Restall took the box from his hand, “Are you seeing things?”

There was only one old house in Laurent family within a few miles of this area. If
there was a car parked in the wrong place, it was possible. But how could a
person walk in the wrong direction?

“I’m not mistaken. There’s a young lady at the entrance of our courtyard. She’s
wearing a thin skirt and it’s freezing cold.”

Alex came out of the study and smoked a few cigarettes. He heard Rudolf’s last
sentence.

He suddenly remembered a woman saying, I am here to find Felix and Fia.

He pondered for a few seconds. He suddenly strode past Rudolf and Restall,
picked up the car keys on the cabinet, and disappeared into the night sky outside.

“Could it be that the girl is looking for him?” Rudolf stared at the door.

“Really?” Restall said and also followed outside.

“In the middle of the night, where are you going?” Rudolf caught her.

Restall was excited. “I’m going to see what kind of girl she is.”

“She has long gone far away. How could you possibly catch up to her?”



Restall then kept her legs and grabbed Rudolf to ask again and again, “Is she
really a girl? How old is she? What does she look like? Was she fat or thin? Was
her skin white? Is her eyes big or not?”

Wasn’t this making things difficult for Rudolf? He only gave her a glance. He
wouldn’t pay attention to these things!

Another car was speeding over from behind. Jessie was wearing a white coat with
blood on her body

It was too cold.

Furthermore, it was night now and there was no one around. If she put it on, she
would scare someone.

She had just put on her clothes and the car that she thought would pass by,
suddenly stopped not far in front of her.

The door of the passenger seat was pushed open from the inside. The man on the
driver’s seat had a gloomy expression and his tone was not any better. “Get in the
car!”

Jessie saw him and thought of his repeated accusations. She withdrew her gaze
from him and turned her head to continue walking forward.

Alex became even angrier.

She broke the promise and made them wait for her for an entire morning for
nothing. She did not even have any explaination. She even hung up on him first.
He put down his pride and chased after her, but she still ignored him!

“Are you coming up?” His thick eyebrows twisted into a line, and his cold voice
couldn’t help but rise.

Jessie was indeed angry because of what he said on the phone just now, but now
that he chased after her, her resentment had mostly dissipated.

Hearing his shout, she stopped her footsteps, paused for a moment, and walked
back to the car.

Just as she entered, the man wrapped his arms around her waist and pressed her
against the back of the passenger seat.

“What are you doing?” Too sudden, Jessie could not help but scream in fear.

Jessie and Alex were very close. The tip of Jessie’s nose almost touched Alex’s
nose. His breathing was very heavy, and his dark black eyes were very cold.



She could not withstand his gaze and could not help but bite her lips, feeling
wronged. Tears flowed out of her eyes again.

“You lied to us, and you still have the nerve to cry?” Once she cried, Alex’s heart
was in chaos, but his tone was still frightening.

“I already said that I did not do it on purpose…” Jessie swallowed back her tears
and pushed him with her hand.

When she let go a little, Alex saw the blood on Jessie’s clothes. His ink eyes
immediately narrowed dangerously, and his tone revealed nervousness. “What’s
with the blood on your

clothes?”

Jessie’s phone suddenly rang. It was Linda. “Jes, Mike woke up and wants to see
you. Can you come over now?”

On the way to the hospital, the two of them did not speak.

When they reached the hospital, Jessie knew that Alex must have heard Jessie’s
call just now. Before getting off the car, she turned around and honestly told him
everything, “There

was an accident this morning. Mike was seriously injured in his leg to save me,
and he is still in the ICU..”

After Jessie went into the hospital for a long time, Alex’s car was still parked at
the entrance o f the hospital.

The window was open and he smoked one cigarette after another.

When the cigarette box was empty, he took out his phone and dialed a number.
“Check, what i

s Mike doing?”

Alex did not believe that after Mike had just dumped Jessie, who had nothing to
do with her identity and background, in just one or two months, Mike would turn
his head back to a woman who still had nothing.

After staying in the hospital for the middle of the night and going to the
kindergarten an hour earlier in the morning, Jessie looked a little haggard.

In the morning, there were many people taking care of the children. After Driver
Bart brought the two children out of the car, they did not see her.



Felix walked in front of Fia. He was wearing a western school uniform with his
hands in his pockets. He pursed his lips and the teacher at the door greeted him,
but he did not want to speak either.

Fia was wearing Harrow‘s school uniform skirt. Below were white cotton socks
and black leather shoes. She has bangs and her hair was tied in a high ponytail.
She walked at the back with her heads down and her steps were full of energy.

Jessie saw them and could not help but split the crowd. She quickly chased after
them and anxiously said, “Fia! Felix!”

Fia almost turned around at the same time and revealed an excited smile on her
face.

But that smile was forced back by her for a second. She snorted and turned her
head away from Jessie.

“Fia, Felix, I want to talk to you for a while, okay?” Jessie chased over and wanted
to pull Fia’s little hand.

Another white and tender hand reached over and pulled Fia behind him. Felix
looked at her and his small face showed a very polite expression, “Aunt Jessie,
we are going to class.”

Since the first time they met, Felix had never used such an expression to treat
her like an outsider.

Jessie’s hand suddenly froze awkwardly in the air.

Driver Bart smiled and wanted to talk to Jessie.

Fia did not look at Jessie and threw a small temper at Bart. “Uncle Bart, why
aren’t you sending us in? We are all going to be late!”
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1. In the Future She Should come with Alex
Driver Bart nodded and smiled apologetically at Jessie. He then brought Fia and
the others in.

Driver Bart and the other two walked a few steps before Fia suddenly turned her
head back and stared at Jessie and shouted loudly, “Auntie Miranda came to my
house again today. She i s more gentle than you and I especially like her. In the
future, she will come with Dad to accompany us to the parent-child meeting!”
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Until they all disappeared into the crowd, Jessie still stood stiffly at the school
gate with a face as pale as snow.

Jessie’s mind was still clearly echoing Fia’s word and bright cry just now. Her
heart seemed t o be wrapped in layers of cotton, getting tighter and heavy, not
allowing her to breathe.

After entering the school, Felix could not help but turn around and look outside
the campus door.

When Felix turned around, he saw Fia also looking out from time to time.

Felix couldn’t help but scoff at Fia. “Isn’t Auntie Miranda more gentle than Aunt
Jeje? Then why are you still looking back at Aunt Jeje?”

Fia retracted her gaze and raised her chin. “What about you? Felix, didn’t you say
you were going to class and refused to speak to Aunt Jeje?”

Driver Bart saw that Felix and Fia clearly regretted what they just said. He smiled
and suggested, “Aunt Jeje is still standing there. Why don’t we go to the school
gate again?”

“No!”

Fia and Felix almost said at the same time!

Driver Bart was silent.

On this day, Jessie was in a trance when she went to work. Jessie saw at the
school gate that Felix and Fia, these two clingy kids, did not want to see her again.
She actually felt like she was hated by her own children and felt sad and painful.

This kind of feeling was really strange.

But no matter how deep the relationship between Jessie and the two little kid
was, If it was not hers, then it would never be hers. She advised herself to
pretend that she had never met them and forget about Felix and Fia.

But when Jessie thought about the happiness that Felix and Fia had when they
stuck to her, the happy time that she and the two children spent after work these
few days, these scenes kept replaying in her mind. But when she decided to
forget, she could not help but feel a throbbing pain in her heart.

At night, there was a gathering in the department. The department manager said
that the company’s CEO, Director Yosua, would be there and the manager asked
everyone to dress up and attend.

Jessie had just gotten off work when she received a call from Linda. She said that
Mike was not willing to take medicine or eat, so she asked her to make a trip



Last night, Mike’s pain after the anesthesia took effect. He climbed up to the
window and made a big fuss. It was only after Jessie went over that he stopped.

Jessie saw that there was still time and quickly rushed to the hospital.

When Jessie reached the door of the ward, she heard a noise from inside.

Linda was persuading bitterly, “Mike, don’t smash it…”

“Didn’t you hear the doctor say that my leg is going to be crippled? I am going to
be a cripple soon! A cripple who can’t even stand stably!” Mike roared loudly, and
another loud sound of heavy objects being smashed to the ground rang out.

Jessie’s heart sank to the bottom when she heard his words.

Jessie froze at the door for a while, then she pushed open the door and went in.

Seeing her, Mike’s face suddenly became panick, “Jessie, did you hear
everything?”

Jessie frowned, “Did the doctor say that?”

Linda looked like she was about to cry. “Mike just had another check-up in the
afternoon. The doctor said the chance of recovery is less than half.”

CO

“You go out!” Mike yelled and interrupted Linda.

Linda covered her mouth and ran out.

Mike walked over and his eyes were red. He looked at Jessie and smiled coldly,
“You also know now. I will be a cripple from now on, even if I want to make it up
to you. I don’t even have the right to ask you to forgive me. You won’t forgive me
when I’m good. Now, you don’t have to worry about me anymore. You can leave. I
won’t bother you anymore.”

Jessie glanced at Mike and bent down to pick up the things on the ground and
put them back where they were.

Before she left, Jessie turned around and looked at Mike. “Calm down and rest
well. I still have some matters to attend to. I will come back to see you later.”

After leaving the hospital, Jessie went home to change her clothes.

Jian Suyun heard the door ring and ran out from the kitchen. “Coming back, Felix,
Fia, two mischievous little ghosts…”



Jouvita saw Jessie who was alone and her smile froze at the corner of her mouth.
“Felix and

Fia did not come again?”

These few days after Jessie picked up Fia and Felix, she would bring them home
for dinner.

Jessie had only told her mother that she knew Felix and Fia at the place where
she worked. Their family were busy with work and Jessie liked them very much.
Felix and Fia also liked t o stick to her.

Felix and Fia, one was smart and sensible and the other was lively and cute. When
Jouvita was with them, even her mood became very cheerful. During this period
of time, Jouvita had never had a headache.

Yesterday Jessie said that she was busy with work and came back late after work,
so she did not pick up the child.

Jouvita thought that Felix and Fia would definitely come and she even specially
made the Coke chicken wings that Felix and Fia liked to eat. Jouvita did not see
them and could not help but feel disappointed.

Jessie thought of Felix and Fia and her mood became even more depressed. She
forced a smile and said, “Mom, Felix and Fia’s family will be accompanying them
recently. They should not be coming for a while. I am sorry that I have dinner
tonight and cannot accompany you to eat.”

“Felix and Fia can’t come for a while?” Jouvita had been looking forward to
seeing them. Hearing Jessie say this, she felt even more disappointed. However,
Felix and Fia were still other people’s children. No matter howmuch she liked
them, she could not always see Felix and Fia. Thinking about this, she thought it
through again.

“En, Mom, I changed my clothes and went out.”

“Go, come back early!”

Jessie’s department had dinner in Hill Hotel.

There were two big bags of food and seven or eight tables of banquets.

All the ladies present were requested by the department manager to drink with
Director Yosua.

Because of the video of the dinner performance last time, Director Yosua had a
very deep memory of Jessie. He warmly greeted her about her work and life
situation. Jessie was

flattered and unknowingly accompanied him to drink a few glasses of wine.



Jessie finally saw Director Yosua being toasted by another person. She went out
of the room t o find the bathroom with a red face.

Jessie’s footsteps were a little unsteady.When she turned around, she bumped
into a person.

A few Coke wings rolled on Jessie’s long gray dress and then fell to the ground.

The young waiter’s face turned pale from fear and quickly bowed to Jessie to
apologize.

“I ran over myself. You don’t have to worry about that. It’s my fault.” Jessie felt
bad seeing the waiter like this.

“How do you do things? In the private room in Dynasty, they were anxiously
waiting for this dish. It’s not like you don’t know. Don’t you know to be careful?
You don’t want to do it anymore, do you?” A man who looked like a hotel
manager rushed over and reprimanded the waiter.

“I’m sorry!”

Jessie saw the manager and the waiter behaving like this and quickly explained,
“It has nothing to do with him. I accidentally bumped into him.”

The principle of the service industry had always been that the customer was God,
not to mention a place as particular as Hill Hotel. When the hotel manager saw
Jessie, he put on a friendly smile and said, “It’s not hot, right?”

“I’m fine.”

When the manager saw the chicken wing sauce on Jessie’s skirt, he also offered
to provide a room for her for free and let her take a shower. He promised to wash
her skirt before giving it back to her in an hour.

Jessie saw that the skirt was not really dirty and waved her hand to reject.

Only then did the hotel manager look at the waiter beside her. “There is a guest
at the east hall who also ordered this dish. You go to the kitchen and say that it is
my intention. Send that dish to Boss Alex first!”

It was easy to deal with other guests, but no one could afford to neglect Laurent
family. Furthermore, Alex was a shareholder of the hotel. If the dishes were
served late, it would affect Alex’s mood, and he could not be the manager of the
hotel.

Jessie had already walked a few steps away. When she heard Boss Alex’s name,
her footsteps subconsciously paused.

Jessie was slightly tipsy, and she could not help but step back and stop in front of
the hotel manager. “Which Boss Alex?”



“President Alex of Mumen Group.” The hotel manager politely answered and
looked at a purple-red room door at the end of the corridor. “I heard that they
are talking about the engagement. The Laurent family has come. There are also
family members of the female side That Coke chicken wing was ordered by Boss
Alex’s son and daughter.”

As the hotel manager spoke, the purple-red door was pushed open. Another
waiter ran out and saw the hotel manager asking anxiously, “Manager, where is
the Coke chicken wing that Boss Alex ordered? The two little kids are rushing to
eat Coke chicken wings!”

“Right away!” The hotel manager replied, turned around and rushed him again.

The waiter returned to the private room. When the door was closed, Jessie
looked up and saw Alex.

Jessie could not help but move closer to the room.

In the open door, Alex was wearing an exquisite black suit and a snow-white shirt.
He held a glass of wine between his fingers and played with it. It was as if he was
listening to someone talking. The usual cold and thin lips had a faint smile, and he
looked very relaxed and at ease.

Jessie had never seen Alex’s expression like that since she knew him.

While Jessie was in a daze, Fia’s familiar crisp voice came out. “I’m hungry. I really
want to eat Coke chicken wings.”

Immediately after, a woman who looked familiar smiled, “Fia must be hungry,
right? Why don’t you drink some soup to fill your stomach first? I’ll scoop it up for
you.”

“Thank you, Auntie Miranda!”

“Fia, you can’t call Auntie Miranda, as ‘auntie’ anymore. It’s time to change the
way you address her…”

At this moment, the waiter walked over from Jessie’s side and carried the Coke
chicken

sin. Along with the footsteps, Jessie did not hear the rest of the words

Jessie slowly turned around and walked into the bathroom again.

It was just a few short steps, but it seemed to consume a lot of Jessie’s strength.

— I have nothing to do with them, and I have no interest in them. If you really
want to talk about a woman who had sex with me, it would only be you, Jessie.



– Jessie, if you are prepared to marry again, shouldn’t I be the first candidate?

Jessie looked up at her face, which was as white as a ghost in the mirror, and
suddenly felt that it was a little ridiculous. ,

Jessie returned to the banquet hall and her colleague Lily called out to her,
“Jessie, the phone in your bag keeps ringing. Quickly take a look. There might be
something urgent.”

“Okay, thank you!” Jessie returned to her seat and took out her phone to see two
missed calls.

They were Linda and Mike’s numbers.

Jessie did not want to reply Linda and Mike’s calls. Just as she was about to put
her phone into her bag, another call came in.

The person who called was Alex.

Jessie looked at the screen and turned the volume to the minimum. She quietly
watched the phone vibrate all over the place.

Jessie counted the time in her heart. After nine seconds, the phone stopped
ringing.

After that, Alex tactfully did not call again.

Alex was a man who was used to high positions. There had only been people
begging for his share, so how could he have the patience to wait for others? After
a phone call, Alex waited for only nine seconds.
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1. I Want to See You!
Alex stared at the black screen of his phone and frowned.

He got up, pushed open the door of the room, and looked outside.

The long corridor outside was empty.

“Felix, go and call your dad back. Why is he standing there so tall? He blocked the
light!” Restall saw her son standing at the door of the private room, deep in
thought. Because of the blind date, Restall was dissatisfied with him, so she
asked her grandson to call him.
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Sometimes, one really had to believe in fate. For example, Miranda admired Alex
for a long time. The elders of the two families also created countless
opportunities for them in the open and in the dark. But in the end, Miranda and
Alex did not have fate.

WhenMiranda and Alex met previously, he did not even send her off. Instead, he
let her take a taxi home. Miranda was very sad.

After Restall knew about this matter, she felt guilty and asked her to go to the
teahouse that Alex’s little uncle owns to drink tea. Restall did not think that it
would turn into a beautiful matter. Miranda met Alex’s little uncle’s son, Alfred
Laurent. The two of them fell in love at first sight and in a few days, the two
families brought up the engagement date.

Today was the engagement banquet organized for them. As the matchmaker for
the two of them, Restall was also invited to witness this happy moment for the
two of them.

Restall was happy for the two young people, but when she saw that her younger
cousin, who different about ten years old, was about to get married, Restall
hated her own son, who was still single, and did not live up to her expectations.
She did not like Alex.

Felix obediently slid down from the high chair and jogged to the door. “Dad.”

“Grandma told you not to stand here. She said you blocked the light like this.”

The father and son returned to their seats. Felix continued to eat the chicken
wings in his bowl.

Fia saw him increase his speed and could not help but bite harder.

Restall saw that Fia’s small face was filled with sauce and used a tissue to gently
wipe her face, “You still treat yourself as a three year old child.”

Alfred’s mother, who was next to her, laughed. “Time passes really quickly. Felix
and Fia are almost six years old in the blink of an eye.”

“Not really. A few years have passed in the blink of an eye. If Alex does not hurry
to find a girlfriend, he will still be a bachelor when his son and daughter are
married.” Restall could

not help but complain and sigh again.

old bachelor Alex looked up and saw that his mother was talking. He continued to
give the two children chicken wings.

Seeing his unchanging attitude, Restall sighed even more heavily. “It seems that
if I count on him, I might as well count on my grandson and granddaughter. I don’t



wish to have any daughter-in-law either. I just hope to have a
granddaughter-in-law or grandson-in-law.”

Alfred and Miranda’s mother quickly advised, “Alex is an outstanding man. I don’t
know howmany girls want to marry him. Sooner or later, he will bring you a
suitable daughter-in-law.”

The marriage of his son was originally Rudolf’s concern. Hearing his wife mention
it, Rudolf could not eat anymore..

Fia was full and she could not eat the chicken wings that her father brought. She
stared at it for a few seconds and then put the chicken wings into Restall’s bowl.
“Grandma, it is for you t o eat.”

Restall hugged her in relief. “My granddaughter is very considerate. You can’t be
like your father in the future. The first thing you should do when you grow up is
to bring me a grandson -in-law, understand?”

Alex: “…”

After the dinner, Director Yosua had something else to do and left. The
department manager and some other active colleagues organized a karaoke
performance.

Jessie had just entered the banquet hall and drank a lot of wine. She felt
increasingly dizzy and did not go with them. She stumbled and took a taxi home.

After passing by a hospital, she suddenly remembered that she had promised
Mike that she would go to the hospital to accompany him, so she asked the driver
to change the route to the hospital.

Jessie arrived at the door of the ward. Her stomach was churning, and he quickly
ran to the

bathroom

She was drunk, and everything in front of her was spinning.

She held onto the wall and barely found the bathroom door. She pushed it open
and walked i

1.
She didn’t see the squat pit. It seemed that she had found the wrong place.

cer

She held onto the wall and turned around to leave. However, she heard a familiar
voice from inside.



“Don’t worry, I won’t treat you badly after I remarry.”

This voice belonged to Mike.

Shouldn’t he be in the ward?

Why was he here?

She could not help but lower her footsteps as she leaned against the wall and
leaned further i

“Friends don’t talk about this, but if you come to me now, will she find out?”

This was the voice of Mike’s attending physician because Jessie had been
accompanying him in the ward for the past two days. Jessie remembered the
doctor’s voice.

“Don’t worry. Even if she comes, she will only go to the ward to find me. She will
not come here. Do you have cigarettes? Give me one.”

The sound of a lighter lighting a cigarette could be heard from inside. Mike held
the cigarette i n his mouth and continued, “Pretending to be sick is also a hard
job. The moment she comes, I have to lie on the hospital bed and do nothing.”

“If you did not use the trick of suffering, Based on the damage you have done to
her in the past, she will not remarry with you. You should be satisfied.”

Mike smiled. “Jessie, that woman, was born with no brain. She was very gullible.
She proposed to remarry only because she could be of great value now. This kind
of stupid woman, it was okay to play and sleep with her. It was too boring to live
with her for the rest of my life.”

Before he could finish his words, the office door was knocked open.

Facing Jessie’s red face, Mike’s smile froze on his face.

Seeing that it was really him, Jessie laughed coldly. Then, she turned around and
staggered

away.

“Jessie!” Mike threw the cigarette away and quickly ran out.

Jessie rushed into the elevator, but Mike held her wrist tightly.

“Jessie, listen to my explanation!”



Jessie suddenly shook off his hand and stared at his legs that were standing on
the ground safe and sound. She sneered, “What else is there to explain? Mike,
you are really despicable!”

Mike rudely picked her up from the waist. “I will not let you go!”

Jessie was struggling when the elevator door opened. Mike suddenly froze.

Jessie felt that something was wrong. She almost subconsciously turned her
head to look.

In the middle of the elevator stood a man in an exquisite black suit. He wore a
white shirt

with a dark blue patterned tie and held a phone in his hand. He seemed to be
about to dial but when he saw the two of them, his hand that was holding the
phone dropped down.

His deep eyes were very light, and his expression was cold. When he stared at the
two of them, it was as if he was looking at two strangers who he did not know at
all.

Mike held Jessie’s hands and slowly retracted them. He looked at Alex silently in
the elevator.

Jessie did not think that she would meet Alex like this.

Wasn’t he getting engaged in Hill Hotel?Why did he come to the hospital again?

Jessie’s head, which was already dizzy from alcohol and anger, seemed to be
about to explode.

Alex put the phone into the pocket of his suit and walked out.

Jessie’s heart started to beat wildly for some reason.

Alex walked out of the elevator and slowed down in front of Mike. He just wiped
his body and walked past Mike to the corridor of the hospital.

When he walked over, the side of the suit almost touched Jessie’s hair. The man’s
body was lightly brushed by the cool Aura mixed with faint tobacco.

Jessie looked in the direction where he walked again, but there was no one
there.

It was as if he had never appeared before.

…



Jessie finally realized that she was still being held by Mike. She could no longer
suppress the volcanic rage in her chest. She raised her hand and was about to hit
him in the face.

Before her hand touched him, there was a sudden sharp pain in her neck and
dizziness in front of her eyes. She wanted to maintain her consciousness, but she
could not. Her eyelids were as heavy as a mountain. Finally, she softly closed her
eyes.

When she regained consciousness again, Jessie heard the beast-like heavy
breathing beside her ears.

Just as she moved, a dull pain immediately came from her neck.

And her body also felt very strange.

It was similar to the omen before she had a high fever last time.

Suddenly, she felt as if there was a snake swimming around her body. She was so
frightened that she forcefully opened her eyes.

When she saw Mike’s face clearly on her body, her brain exploded with a bang.

She raised her hand and pushed him.

Her hands were soft.

“What are you doing? Let go of me!” She screamed in fear, and her throat felt like
it was stuffed with sand. It was so hoarse that she couldn’t even scream.

Mike’s face became hideous. “Stop screaming. It’s useless for you to do this. You
ate the medicine that I specially made. If you don’t have sex with a man, you’re
dead. I’m doing this t o save you. Do you understand? Jessie, you give birth to a
child for me. Didn’t you always want to give me a child? Now I will let you have
your wish!”

“You are not a human!”

“You can scold me however you want. Let me tell you, Jessie, I want to remarry
with you!”

As they were fighting, Jessie’s fingers touched the humidifier on the bedside
table.

She stretched out her arm and grabbed the handle of the humidifier. She
violently smashed it towards Mike’s head.

A loud sound was heard.



Blood flowed down fromMike’s forehead.

Mike stopped moving. He stared at her. Finally, he powerlessly fell on her body.

Jessie panted and pushed him away. She was still in shock as she snatched the
door and fled.

She escaped from the hospital and took a taxi. She was still trembling.

“Where are you going?” The driver asked.

Jessie felt hot sweat dripping down her back. Her blood vessels looked like they
were aboutt o burst.

“Drive forward.” She answered in a hoarse voice.

The taxi drove forward.

She felt more and more uncomfortable.

Her brain felt like it was going to explode.

She wanted to shout to vent her anger, but she held it in with all her might. She
took out her phone with trembling hands, and her mind was already in a mess.
She couldn’t think of anything else, so she directly dialed the number.

Alex did not answer the phone.

She could not help but call in a low voice. “Answer the phone! Please answer the
phone!”

As if he had heard her pleading, Alex finally answered. His tone was as cold as ice
in winter.”

Speak!”

“I want to see you!” Jessie did not dare to hesitate for even a second. Without
any hesitation, she said the most direct and direct thought in her heart.

Alex fell into silence.

Jessie bit her lower lip tightly. Her heart was hanging down to her throat. Her
fingers, which were tightly holding the phone, almost sank into the flesh of her
palm.

Just as she was about to give up, the man’s emotionless voice finally sounded
again, “The top floor of the Tianji Residence’s east seat, come here yourself!”
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1. 4 Call Me by My Name!
The Tianji Residence was close, so Alex did not return to Mountain and River
Residence. After answering Jessie’s call, he finished smoking his cigarette by the
window. He pressed the cigarette butt and put it out in the ashtray. He took his
robe and went to the bathroom to take a shower.

Jessie went to the door and pressed the doorbell. She waited anxiously.

She was wearing a thin white long-sleeved shirt and a long gray dress. She was
still very hot. She could not help but unbutton her shirt and fan the wind with her
hands.

A thin layer of sweat flowed down her delicate collarbone.

Alex wore a nightgown and opened the door. What he saw was Jessie’s little face
flushed red. Her collar was slightly open, and he could vaguely see her
snow-white skin.

Alex remembered the scene he had just seen in the hospital. His slightly moving
eyes turned cold again. “Did you drink?”

She did not speak. Her slightly narrowed almond eyes looked straight at him.

From his short, wet hair to his high nose bridge, finally landing on his cold, thin
lips.

She couldn’t help but take a step forward and approach him. The bag and coat
fell to the ground at the same time.

Two snow-white little hands grabbed the front of his robe and stood on tiptoes,
taking the

initiative to kiss his lips.

Alex grabbed her hands and pushed her away a few times.

Jessie tilted her head and fell into his chest. From time to time, she would rub
her head against Alex’s chest.

Jessie’s long hair would stroke Alex’s chin from time to time, like a cute little
dog.
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Jessie raised her head in Alex’s arms and looked at his face with infatuation. Her
beautiful watery eyes were unblinking and her eyes were misty. Her red lips
slightly hooked and she revealed a silly smile to him.

He stared at her closely. A few seconds later, a cold light shot out from his dark
eyes.

He suddenly pinched her white and delicate chin and asked sternly, “What have
you eaten?”

“I don’t know.” Jessie risked her life to crawl into his arms again. Her soft voice
was choked with sobs, “I feel so uncomfortable.”

Alex’s willpower almost collapsed when Jessie hung on Alex like this.

Alex lifted Jessie horizontally and strode into the bathroom.

After throwing Jessie into the bathtub, Alex took the shower head and pressed
the switch

The water was cold.

Jessie choked heavily and wanted to climb out of the bathtub, but Alex pressed
her back with a big hand.

She kept struggling, and the robe on his body was also wet.

Alex threw away the shower head and went to pull the belt of the bathrobe.

Jessie crawled out of nowhere and fell on Alex’s chest.

Alex lifted Jessie up. Alex frowned and his dark eyes burned with flames. He
stared at her and said, “Jessie, don’t regret it.”

Jessie kissed his lips again.

Her actions undoubtedly aroused Alex’s desire and seemed to respond to his
words.

“Look at me!” Alex forcefully ordered Jessie to look at him.

Jessie felt very uncomfortable. Half in a daze, she faced the man’s dark, deep
eyes.

He looked at her clean pupils and asked in a low and hoarse voice, “Tell me, who
am I?”

Jessie’s chin was pinched by him until it hurt. She frowned and protested.



“Answer me!”

Her long eyelashes trembled. After a long while, she finally opened her mouth
and said with great effort, “You are Laurent.”

“What’s my name?” His handsome face was cruel.

“Alex”

Alex’s black eyes tightened, lifting her up and pressing her against the wall. He
had been suppressing his desire for too long, causing him to lose all reason,
without a trace of gentleness.

Alex and Jessie went from the bathroom to the bed in the bedroom and had sex.
Alex stared a t Jessie’s sweaty face and ordered, “Beg me!”

Jessie absentmindedly followed his request and whispered. Alex was so satisfied
that he panted, “Continue, call my name!”

was SO

“… Alex”

Jessie only felt her mind go blank. Her whole body was light and powerless, as if
she could fly at any time.

For an entire night, the two of them were like crazy beasts, continuously having
sex.

Jessie was exhausted and her entire body seemed to have been hollowed out.

Finally, after Alex left her body, Jessie thought that it was all over, but he once
again had sex with her.

“Enough! Don’t… I can’t do it anymore!” She weakly cried and begged for mercy.

Looking into her tearful eyes, Alex felt a wave of anger surging in his chest. His
handsome face that had a deep outline emitted a cold air. It was so gloomy that it
was scary. Alex sneered, “What is it? You just had a relationship with me and now
you don’t recognize me?”

His rude words made Jessie feel embarrassed and angry. She turned her face and
bit her lips.

Alex did not care about her anymore. He suddenly hugged her and lowered his
head to bite her slender shoulder.

The place where he bit was the scar that had just healed last time.



Jessie was in so much pain that she almost fainted.

Alex had sex with her again without any pity and got off the bed to enter the
bathroom.

Jessie held her aching shoulder and rolled off the bed with trembling legs. She
got up and went to his closet to get a clothe. After putting it on, she endured the
pain all over her body and ran out of the apartment in a panic.

After leaving the Tianji Residence, thinking about what had happened that night,
her tears fell once again

Hot tears rolled out and instantly turned cold when it met the cold wind.

Jessie raised her hand to wipe away her tears. When she saw the sleeves of the
men’s clothing, she started to despise and hate herself even more.

Jessie knew that Alex and Miranda were already engaged. Even if Jessie died last
night, she should not have gone to find Alex.

After passing by a pharmacy, she paused for a moment and walked in.

Alex smoked two cigarettes in a row in the bathroom. The more he smoked, the
more irritated he became. He put on the bath and walked out.

There was no one in the room anymore.

His expression was even colder. He took his phone and dialed Rick’s number. His
face was like an asura. “Stop Mike from doing anything in the industry!” When
Jessie returned to CnX Apartment, Jouvita was not home.

Jouvita went out to buy groceries at this time of the day. Jessie took her clothes
and went to take a shower.

After the bath, Jouvita had not returned yet.

Thinking of Mike’s deformed face yesterday, Jessie felt uneasy in her heart.

After running away from the hospital last night, would Mike come here?

She quickly took out her phone and dialed her mother’s number.

“Sorry, the number you have dialed has been turned off. Please call later.”

Jessie could not help but become more and more worried. Just as she was about
to call Mike, the doorbell rang.

Thinking that Jouvita’s phone had no electricity and was automatically turned off
and forgot t o bring the key, Jessie hufriedly ran over.



“Long time no see!” Hannah stood at the door and greeted with a fake smile.

“Why are you here?” Jessie’s heart suddenly skipped a beat when she saw that it
was her.

The two of them were competitors from different companies in the same
industry, and they usually did not interact with each other.

Why would Hannah find her home?

“Cut the crap. I will give you an hour. You will get out of R City immediately!”
Hannah proudly went straight to the point.

Jessie sneered, “Are you telling a joke? Why should I leave R City? Why should I?”

Hannah pushed her away and walked into the living room in her high heels. She
looked around and then paced back and forth. She took out a cheque and threw it
on Jessie’s face,” This house and the house that was taken away from the suburbs.
Two million is more than

enough for you. Take this two million and scram. The further away you get, the
better. Don’t take another step into R City for the rest of your life!”

She looked at Jessie again. “Do you want to know why I chased you away? It was
because you and Mike were so entangled that my sister’s uterus was broken. She
was also sued to jail because she was trying to kill you. Our family has lost all face
in R City. Even so…My sister still wants to marry Mike, but nowMike only wants
to remarry you. Do you know that my sister wants to kill you with her own hands?
So you have to get out of here! Only if you get out of this city will my sister not
really become the murderer!”

Yura actually loved Mike so deeply, which made Jessie a little surprised. She
thought that a woman like Yura was the same as Mike, they were both absolute
believers of profit and fame.

Jessie was stunned for a few seconds and coldly said, “Go and find him for the
sins that Mike has committed. I have nothing to do with that man now and will
not remarry with him. I have a job and a home in R City now and I will not leave.”
“You will leave.” Hannah smiled coldly and crossed her arms before her chest. She
took a

step forward and walked in front of Jessie. “Just based on the fact that there is a
person in our hands now, she is a crazy woman!”

In a split second, Jessie’s mind seemed to have exploded with a bang. She
suddenly grabbed her arm tightly and urgently asked, “You guys took my mom
away, right? Was it?What did you do to her? Where is she?”



Hannah bent her head and pointed at Jessie’s tightly gripping hands and scoffed,
“If you really care about the life and death of that madman, You better be more
polite to me.”

Jessie’s chest rose and fell intensely as she stared at her. Her teeth were about
to be crushed but she still slowly let go of her.

Hannah sneered, “At least you have a conscience towards that madman!”

Hannah’s palm landed on Jessie’s face.

Five finger marks quickly appeared on Jessie’s fair face.

She fiercely stared at Hannah and her two hands tightly clenched as if fire was
about to spurt out from her eyes.

“This first palm strike is because you made me lose face at the Mumen Group’s
banquet last time.” After Hannah finished speaking, she raised her hand again,
“And the second palm strike after that.”

The second palm strike landed.

The corner of Jessie’s mouth was bleeding.

“It was for my sister. This is what you and Mike owe her for the rest of their lives.
They deserve to hit you!”

After two consecutive slaps, half of Jessie’s face swelled up.

Not only was Hannah addicted, she also wanted to slap Jessie for the third time.
Just as Hannah raised her hand, Jessie reached out and firmly grabbed it.

The force was so strong that it almost broke the bones of her wrist.

“Let go!” Hannah felt pain. She gritted her teeth and shouted, “If you don’t let
me go now, I call my family and tell them to kill that crazy mother of yours!”

“Okay, you hit! You hit me now! If something happens to my mother, Didn’t you
want to chase me away because you are afraid that your sister will become a
murderer? I will let your family kill my mother now. Make your family the
murderer!” Jessie pressed forward step by step, her eyes cold and ruthless. Her
entire body was filled with surging killing intent.

Hannah was frightened by this kind of her and took a few steps back. She finally
calmed down, “You only have one hour. If you haven’t left the R City in one hour,
The first one to die was that crazy mother of yours! Do you know how scared she
is in a black room by herself?



Perhaps we don’t even need to do anything, she would be scared to death
herself.”

1. Fia Looked at Her Seriously
Because of Yura’s crazy stubbornness and vengeful heart, her family wished
that Jessie could disappear from R City in a minute.

Time was pressing and Jessie only had time to pack up the necessary luggage
Hannah had been monitoring her as she took a taxi to the airport,

Along the way, Jessie placed a large backpack to security guard’s place at Felix
and Fia’s school and instructed them to pass it to the two children,

There were Phone Watchs inside, a set of Page dolls that the two children liked.
There were also clothes and hats that they had left at home and she had also
bought for them

Fia’s Phone Watch seemed to have broken and Jessie bought another piece.
Originally she went to the kindergarten door to wait and wanted to personally
give it to her but in the end she did not manage to give it to her. No matter what,
she owed that child. Although this could not make up for anything, but if she did
not give it to her, Jessie kept feeling sad and anxious í n her heart

Before boarding the plane, Jessie called Sally. “Sal, I am going back to my
hometown.”

“You are taking your annual leave?Why is it so sudden?”

“No.” Jessie pursed her dry lips, “I might not come to R City again.”

“Why?!” Sally had just woken up not long ago. When she heard her words, she
immediately sat up straight from the bed, “You have a good job. Why did you not
come to R City again? Wait a minute, isn’t it Mike again? He was the one who
threatened you, right? He was afraid that you would expose his scandal here,
right?”

Jessie looked at Hannah who was staring at her not far away, “Sally, actually I
have always felt that you are still suitable to be a painter. But no matter what
you do, I will still support you as always. Don’t you like eating lobsters? In the
future when you have time to come to my hometown, I will treat you to a meal.”

She paused and looked at the blue sky outside the departure hall. “I decided to
leave by myself, it has nothing to do with anyone.”

Even if her mother was in the hands of the Yura’s family, they only wanted to
force her to leave. They would not really do anything to her mother. Jessiewas
clear about this point It was not because Hannah was staring at her that she
could not call the police. Instead, in the ten plus minutes that she was packing
her luggage, Jéssie thought of all the things that had happened during this
period of time. She suddenly felt that she could actually leave R City



Work? She worked very hard, but in the end, she was only a low-class waiter.
Because of Alex’s help at the banquet that day, she was able to gain the favor of
the company.

Marriage? Mike? Her heart had long since turned to ashes.

Felix, Fia? Indeed, as long as she thought of never seeing them again, she would
still feel empty in her heart. It was as if she had lost the most important thing in
her life, but they had met by chance. No matter how deep her attachment was,
she would pass by them sooner or later.

As for Alex…

Thinking of him, Jessie felt that there was nothing wrong with leaving R City.

Jessie’s hometown was in a small town called Nanchuan in Hai City.

It was thousands of miles away from the capital city, R City.

About an hour after arriving home, Jessie finally saw her mother.

Although she suffered some fright, it was good that she was safe and sound.

That night, after Jessie sent a WeChat message to Sally, she took off the R City’s
phone card from her phone and held it in her palm for a few minutes.

She put it back on but before it turned on, she took it off again. Without any
hesitation, she got up and ran to the back door in one go and threw the card into
the lotus pond not far away.

Ever since they met Jessie at the school gate that morning, the first thing Felix
and Fia did every day when they went to school was to find a circle in the
hundreds of meters around the school gate. It was only when the school bell rang
again and again that they rushed into the classroom.

During class, Fia’s head drooped. She did not listen to a single word of what the
teacher said.

The teacher was already used to Fia being like this. This young lady from the
Laurent family had always been the teacher’s most troublesome student. But Fia
had a good family background, and she was still young. The teachers did not dare
to really punish her. Usually, they would call her parents many times. So as long
as she did not cause too much trouble in the classroom, the teachers might as
well pretend that they did not see her.

What surprised the teachers was that Felix was obviously not in good spirits
either. It wasn’t because he didn’t finish his homework and couldn’t answer the
questions. He was a genius with high intelligence and the teacher had specially
tested him. Now, he was already familiar with the fourth grade’s curriculum.



Sooner or later, he would jump ranks again and again. The content of the
kindergarten’s curriculum was very simple for him.

However, other than doing his homework as usual and answering the questions
as usual, he also answered them. Other times, Felix was just like his sister,
completely out of his state of mind.

Sometimes, when Teacher Mirna asked him to tidy up everyone’s homework, he
would have n o reaction even after she called him a few times.

Teacher Mirna looked for him to have a heart-to-heart talk. “Felix, do you have
something on your mind recently?”

Felix pursed his lips, his small face full of melancholy. “Teacher, have you ever
felt empty?”

“Empty?”

“Yes, as if I lost something very important. My heart is empty.”

“Felix, what did you lose? Do you want us to help you find it?”

“We can’t find it.”

TeacherMirna nodded. “I see. Felix, don’t be sad. If you can’t find it, I will buy you
another one.

“This thing can’t be bought.”

“Felix, what did you lose?”

“A woman, a woman who lies.”

Teacher Mirna suddenly felt very confused. In the English class, Fia brazenly lied
on the table and slept.

The young English Teacher Hendrick walked over and knocked on her table.

She took a look.

Then she changed directions and slept again.

Teacher Hendrick knocked on the table again.

She raised her head and her eyes narrowed into a slit before closing again.,

Teacher Hendrick.could not bear it anymore and pulled her up, “Fia, you translate
the text.What do you mean by yes?”



Fia drooped her head, “I don’t know.”

Teacher Hendrick was very persistent. “Take a good look. Look at what’s on both
sides of my

nose.”

Fia narrowed her eyes and looked at him seriously for a while, “It is old age
spots.”

“You stay behind after school! You are not allowed to go back until it is dark!”

At lunch, with Kenny in the lead, a group of classmates gathered together to
discuss the delicious food and snacks their respective mothers had cooked.

Fia was originally in a bad mood, but when she heard this, she lost’her appetite
even more.

Putting down the chopsticks, she walked out of the classroom and went to the
sports field to

look at the sky with her hands in her pockets.

The blue sky and white clouds that she had always thought to be pretty were all
very ugly.

I’m so annoying. I’m annoyed by everything I see.

Kenny finished his meal and hid in a corner of the field to eat his candy.

His face was full of sugar when he ate.

A bee came out of nowhere and pounced on his face.

Kenny could not chase it away. When he saw Fia, who was the closest to him, he
ran over and pulled her. “Fia, there are bees on my face. Help me.”

He had not finished the word yet, but he received a slap on his face instead.

Fia really did not want to beat him up, but he had to bring his face in front of her.
She had to give him a slap.

Kenny’s chubby face instantly turned red.

He cried loudly.

Teacher Mirna rushed over. When she saw that it was the two of them, she felt a
headache.” What’s wrong with the two of you?”



“Fia hit me!”

“Who hit you? Didn’t you ask me to help you beat the bees?”

“You hit me. Teacher Mirna, look at my swollen face.”

Fia rolled her eyes, “Coward!”

“Who are you calling a coward?”

“I’ll scold whoever answers me!”

“Fia!” Teacher Mirna was very angry, “Call Aunt Jessie over after school to come
over!”

Fia was like an angry little lion as she stared at her and shouted, “Don’t mention
her to me!”

“Fia!”

“I can invite the parents to the school, but you’re not allowed to mention her to
me!” Fia turned around and ran.

Teacher Mirna was speechless.

What had happened to these two children of Laurent family during this period of
time? Teacher Mirna felt very tired.

After school, Fia stayed in the classroom until the sky turned dark.

Felix also accompanied her until the sky turned dark.

Driver Bart only came in to pick them up after getting permission from the
English teacher.

The two little fellows walked out dejectedly.

After passing the security room, the security guard who had helped Jessie store
things, happened to be on shift at this time. When he saw them, he ran out of the
security room with his backpack. “Young Master Felix, Young Miss Fia, there is a
package for you here. It was left behind by Miss Jessie who came to pick you up
earlier.”

When they heard Miss Jessie’s name, Felix and Fia both stopped in their tracks
and ran over together. Both of their small faces were shining.

When they opened the backpack, they saw something familiar inside and the toys
that Jessie had promised to buy for them. For some reason, for a moment, the
two little fellows suddenly wanted to hug these things and cry.



Felix opened the Phone Watch on his wrist, “I’ll call her now and ask her to come
and pick us

up.”

Fia smiled and nodded heavily.

“The number you have dialed is an empty number.” Hearing the voice from the
other end over and over again, the two little fellows were both stunned.

Alex had been on a business trip in London for the past few days.

It took him three days to finish the original one-week plan with his team. He left
the rest of the work to Rick, who had come with him. He booked a flight back to R
City at night.

The next morning, he arrived. The driver who came to pick him up sent him back
toMountain and River Residence according to the usual rules.

He had been working overtime all day, but he had not slept well on the plane.
Alex’s temple could not help swelling and hurting.

He closed his eyes and leaned on the back of the chair. His voice was obviously
tired. “Driver, go to Tianji Residence.”

When the car arrived at Tianji Residence and entered the deserted apartment,
Alex could not help but feel that his heart was just like this apartment. It was
empty.

This was a very strange feeling.

In the past 32 years, there had never been a situation like this.

In fact, he didn’t want to admit that shortening the travel time was all because of
a certain concern and longing that had never disappeared even though it was
very light in his heart.

Even though he was so busy that he only slept for less than five hours a day, he
still couldn’t

hold it in. From time to time, he would think of a woman, a woman who didn’t
know what was good for her, but was also a heartless woman.

That woman took the initiative to meet him and seduce him. He slept with her as
she wished and he was willing to fall into her trap. But then? There was no news
from her.

Not only was this detestable woman skilled, but she was also especially dishonest.
She actually liked to do things half-assed from beginning to end!
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