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"Er..." In a daze, conmobei wakes up slowly because he feels dragged.

"If I kill you myself, I will avenge my mother. Ha ha ha." Shen Shimo didn't expect
that things were going so smoothly. He laughed wildly.

"Aren't you good at it? Actually a brick fainted? Ha ha ha, waste! Rubbish The silent
laughter is almost transformed and unrestrained.

Kangmobei tried to open his eyes. For some reason, they were all covered with scarlet,
but he could barely see where there was light and black shadow.

He saw the woman in the red dress, curling up against the edge of the roof. He could
even see her shivering with fear.

"Big brother What are you going to do? " Asked the woman in a trembling voice.

He turned his head fiercely and stared at the woman with cannibal eyes: "you can't
run!"

After that, Shen Shimei threw down his conmobei, took three and two steps to the
woman, and grabbed her with one hand.

"Ah!" At the foot of the sudden suspension, and even turn back is not the bottom of the
road, the woman scared pale, screamed.

Kangmobei tried to shake his head. From time to time, there were bursts of heat in the
back of his brain. He knew that it should be the heat brought by blood.

"Don't be so stupid in the next life. You believe men's words, hehe." Shen Shimo drags
a woman's neckline. She is already half suspended in the air. As soon as she lets go,
she will fall in the form of free fall.

No way! Conmobei crept over quietly. When he was less than one meter away from
Shen Shimei, he suddenly stood up and threw Shen Shimei to one side!

"Ah!" A woman's neckline suddenly loosened and her whole body tilted back in an
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instant.

Conmobei's ears were hurt by the scream. When he looked back sharply, he saw that
the woman was falling. He quickly stood up and flew to the woman. One hand was
empty, and then he quickly stretched out his left hand!

Women's subconscious hand, trying to fall on the eve of all life-saving! Conmber's left
hand was caught by her in an instant!

"Hiss!" Conmobei's left hand suddenly bears a huge weight, the upper half of his arm
bumps into the concrete wall on the edge of the roof, but no matter how painful it is,
he can't let go!

Shen Shimo then reflected that he had been hit by kangmobei for several meters. He
stood up with a sneer and was ready to send them to fall freely at the same time. When
he entered the small door of the roof, a flash of white light flashed across the flashlight.

"Commo North!" Mousse sprinted up the stairs from Baimi, shouting the name of
conmobei at the same time.

No! Shen Shimo takes a look at kangmobei, which is less than two meters away from
him. He also takes a look at the small rooftop door five meters away. Finally, with a
heavy sigh, he resolutely escapes to the dark.

Hearing the cry of Musi Li, Kang Mobei was excited. The excitement turned into the
strength of grasping the woman's arm and tugging her, but he could not pull her up
again.

When mousse left for the rooftop, he was surprised to see that Commodore was lying
on the edge of the concrete wall, and there was a woman in red floating in the wind

Kangmobei knew that he was dreaming. Even in the dream, everything in front of him
was spinning.

The feeling of dizziness leads to a desire to vomit. Kangmo Beiqiang can't help but
vomit. He wakes up from his dream and sits up to vomit.

When he woke up so suddenly, mousse was startled. He hurriedly handed over the
towel and basin, and called the nurse to clean up. After that, komobi was finally more
comfortable.

"The doctor said you had a concussion. You have to be hospitalized for observation
these days." Mousse patted conmobeir on the shoulder. He had many questions in his
mind, but now, conmobeir's situation is the most important.



"What about Shen Shimo? Did you catch him? " Kangmo Beiping asked in a voice for
the first time after recovering the discomfort in his throat.

Musi Li was surprised: "silent? How could he be in the capital? "

"Oh," said conmber, knowing the conclusion immediately, "you mean, he ran away,
right?"

Seeing that Musi Li was so surprised to hear Shen Shimo's name, it shows that Musi Li
didn't even see Shen Shimo's people.

"I, I will save you. How can I have time to look around? You are so..." Musi thought
of the adventure just now. For a moment, I didn't know where to start. "How can you
be on the roof? Who is that woman? Is it really silence? "

"Ah, I don't know. I'm dizzy..." Conmobei can feel the dizziness of the whirl of the sky
whether he opens or closes his eyes.

"Then you have a rest. I'll deal with it..." Mu Sili was embarrassed. "You promised to
go back to nianxi tonight. This The doctor told you to stay in hospital for observation.
We can't go for the time being. "

"I'll call her later and say that I met my former business partner. I'll stay here for two
days. Don't let her know, or she will be worried."

"OK, I see." Musi is still secretly glad that he found out early, otherwise

"You say you, fortunately, I went to find you after I took a bath, and then I found that
you were not in the guest room. I went to the security room to catch the monitor and
saw that you were on the roof, so I took people there. You say if I don't find out! Have
you been hanging on it all night? " Moussili couldn't help criticizing.Kangmo North
heard the sound, but also secretly happy up, fortunately, fortunately, Musi left.

In addition, his heart is warm when he is cared by his friends.

"I brought you here just to take care of each other," said conmbe with a smile. "Thank
you."

“……” Language plug in the throat, Musi reluctantly waved his hand, left the ward,
"you good rest."

Moussili sat alone outside the ward, thinking about the words of conmobei.



So that woman may be Shen Shimo's assistant? To harm conmber?

In the surveillance, her appearance outside the north gate of Como was clearly
photographed.

"Comrade, did you report it?"

Between Musi and Sisuo, a policeman in uniform came to musi and asked with a polite
smile.

"No, the hotel should have called the police." Moussili said, raising his eyes.

The policeman nodded: "Oh, well, just now the doctor saw that the woman was just
suffering from skin injury. She didn't say what her name was when she asked. Look..."

"Mr. police, she's a criminal suspect. Grab it. She almost killed my friend." Mousse
left the cold voice.

"Well, now that you report it, we'll do it." After that, the policeman left mousse.

Mousse was confused and suddenly thought of something, so before the police took
the woman away, she went into the woman's ward and stared at her coldly and said:

"now tell me the truth, I can bail you. If you don't say anything, don't blame me for
being impolite."

"Whining I don't know anything... "

"Then tell me what you know!" Muse couldn't do without her, she snapped.

"Good! OK, I said! I said it all Women are in a hurry.
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