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"Ah, she's out shopping for lunch. You wait. I'll call her." Mu Sili trembles with his
hands because of excitement. This excitement is not much weaker than knowing that
Qin ruoqing is pregnant. He is still at a loss in the clouds about Qin ruoqing's
pregnancy.

Kangmo heard the sound and frowned.

He didn't know how long he had been sleeping, and he didn't even remember anything,
or what dreams he had.

It's just that I woke up suddenly just now. I was really awakened by the dream.

In his dream, he saw Bai nianxi and saw that she was in danger. Then he woke up from
deep sleep because of fright.

"Are you sure she went shopping? Don't lie to me The voice of conmber is more
serious and cold than ever.

This sound makes Mu Sili feel guilty. He looks up at Kang Liqing. Kang Liqing has
already moved to one side and said gently: "she just went out three minutes ago. She's
OK. Don't be excited, Mobei."

In the silence, time seems to have stopped.

Shen Shimo is sitting on the sofa with two men standing on both sides. In front of him
is Liang Chengren, the former president of Qianqiu group.

"I don't welcome you at home, before I call the police..."

"Ha ha, I'm not here to talk to you," Shen Shimo said to Liang Chengren in a more
gloomy tone and eyes with a strange smile. "I'm such a desperado, and I don't care
whether I'm welcome or not?"

Liang Chengren is forced by the pressure of coercion. Liang Chengren sits in silence
with a cold face.
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"However, I think you are miserable," Shen Shimo stood up with a smile and began to
pace himself. "You could have been your president for thousands of years. As a result,
you were kicked away like a stray dog. Aren't you angry?"

"It's my business. It's none of your business." Liang Chengren's face is dark, and he is
stabbed in the spine. How can he be in a good mood.

"Oh, since you and I are so poor, we'd better cooperate."

"Even if I'm down now, I'm not down to cooperating with a wanted criminal like you!
I advise you to leave before I call the police, or I will be impolite. " Liang Chengren is
still cautious and hard to draw the line.

Seeing that his good words were hard to listen to, Shen Shimo gave a scornful smile
and raised his hand to his subordinates.

He was ordered to go in and out of his house as freely. Soon after he went upstairs,
Liang Minghao, Liang Chengren's only son, was dragged down with a loud and rude
voice.

"Who are you! Why... "

"Pa" of crisp ring, in Liang Minghao's face blow open, his discontent and clamour also
because of this is a slap fan back.

"When I talk to you politely, I advise you not to drink or eat!" Shen Shimo suddenly
put away his smile, dark face came to Liang Minghao's face, and continued to frighten
him.

My son was slapped in front of him? Liang Chengren felt the great humiliation in his
heart. At the same time, his fear of Shen Shimo also came.

"I ask you to have something to say, don't do it..." Liang Chengren loves his son so
much that he softens his voice and leaves everything behind.

"That's about the same." Shen Shimo is satisfied with his present reaction.

Liang Minghao's anger exploded in his chest, but he saw that the man in front of him
was clearly an outlaw. He didn't dare to make mistakes. He could only sit on the
ground and look up at his father from time to time, hoping that his father could turn the
situation around.

The sound of "Dong Dong Dong" smashing at the door was unexpected, because if
there was no accident outside the door, it must be one of my subordinates who came



with the protagonist.

Sure enough, Bai nianxi, who was in a coma, was dragged to the center of the living
room by four strong men and threw it at Liang Chengren's feet.

Seeing that Bai nianxi was caught in his own home, still in a coma and bound state,
Liang Chengren was almost scared out of his wits.

"What the hell are you doing?" Liang Chengren growled and questioned.

Shen Shimo pulls Liang Minghao up and holds him up by two of his men. Then he
looks at Liang Chengren with a smile: "you are driven out of Qianqiu group and lose
your career like a stray dog. Shouldn't you hate Bai nianxi? I'll give you a chance to
take revenge. As long as you use this knife and poke it into her heart, I'll leave
immediately. "

"You are crazy! Are you crazy! You told me to kill! You're sick, aren't you? " Liang
Chengren scolded angrily.

When silent a fist, mercilessly waved in Liang Minghao's abdomen.

"Eh!" The pain made Liang Minghao howl.

"I'll give you a chance to revenge. Why don't you want it?" Silent face, with a smile
completely inconsistent with the angry tone, "since you don't want it, let your son
carry the price."

Waving the next second, rain like kicks and punches, mercilessly fell on Liang
Minghao.

"Dad, help! Help me! Stop fighting! " Liang Minghao was called by the ghost who
beat the ground.

"Stop it! Stop it! " Frightened, Liang Chengren rushed to protect his son with his old
body, but his fists and kicks didn't stop.Unless he accepts Shen Shimo's offer.

"Stop it! I promise you! I'll do it! I'll do whatever you ask me to do! Please!
Wuwuwu... " Liang Chengren cried in despair.

"Stop." The development of the plot follows Shen Shimo's script. He expresses his
satisfaction with a smile and raises his hand to call off his boxing followers.

"Woo woo Dad, are you ok? " Liang Ming Hao sobbed bitterly, looking up and down
at his father's body with his eyes full of concern and pain.



Liang Chengren's face was gray and he shook his head in pain.

Shen Shimo handed over the knife with cold light and looked down at Liang Chengren
sitting on the ground: "let's do it. Otherwise, it's not easy to do it when Bai nianxi
wakes up."

Bai nianxi heard the noise and crying around her. She was conscious all the time and
understood why she was weak all over -

after being dragged into the car, she was only given a small amount of anesthetics.
After the anesthetics, she was conscious but unable to move. She was afraid that it was
because she was given muscle relaxants.

Silent voice, in her mind continued to explode, Liang Chengren forced to agree, is a
long time shocked her.

Reason told her to wake up and control her body, but the effect of muscle relaxants
was still working.

She could even hear footsteps approaching her ears It's over Mo Bei

Even though his head was covered with white gauze, his expression did not look like
he had just undergone brain surgery.

"Take down the door!"

At the moment, he is standing at the door of Liang Chengren's house. Under the rapid
assembly of 20 hands, he decisively carries out his orders and fiercely strikes the door
of Liang Chengren's house with his own body.
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