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Looking at the father and son are a pair of dead don't say attitude, Bai nianxi finally
give up.

Forget it, everything is like this. Lolo is also kind-hearted. She'd better prepare the
works for the competition.

In order to prepare for the competition with Jenny, Bai nianxi didn't go to the company
these days. Besides staying in the studio, he went out to look for inspiration.

The scenery along the river is very good. Bai nianxi came here early in the morning
with his drawing board and tools. He found a shady place, set up his easel and began
to copy the scenery.

Bai nianxi came here in the early morning. In the early morning, there were not many
people here, and the environment was quiet.

When the wind blows, it brings a cool. Bai nianxi immerses himself in his paintings.
He doesn't realize that there is someone standing behind him.

When Bai nianxi arrived at a painting place, the people behind him suddenly said in a
voice: "I think you should not deal with it like this here."

It's an old man's voice. Putonghua is not very standard, but it can be heard clearly.

Bai nianxi was startled. He turned around and saw behind him a little old man of grade
70 or 80. His face was full of furrows, and his eyebrows and beard were gray.

Looking at his appearance alone, the old man has both the stern face of the East and
the deep outline of the West.

It seems familiar, like I've seen it somewhere.



Without waiting for Bai nianxi to respond, the old man said to himself, "what you're
dealing with here is not right. I think..."

When the old man finished speaking, Bai nianxi outlined the picture in his mind and
found that it was true. If he did as the old man said, the whole picture would be more
vivid and elegant!

The attitude towards the elderly is also awed. The elderly are experts!

In accordance with the guidance of the old man, Bai nianxi wrote, stroke by stroke,
very seriously.

The old man stood behind Bai nianxi and nodded his head. The child really had talent,
high understanding and good skills. He was a rare talent.

Bai nianxi continued to paint, and soon a picture had been drawn.

Turning around, I wanted to ask for the old man's advice again, but I found that the old
man who was standing behind me did not know when he had disappeared. After
looking around with his eyes, I still didn't see anyone.

The sun has gradually risen, and the air has gradually become a little hot and dry. Bai
nianxi put away the drawing board. Today's sketching is over. It's time to go back.

All of a sudden, the hand phone rings, connect, is some dull voice of conmobei.

"Where is it?"

"I'm outside sketching for inspiration. What's the matter?"

"Come back, now."

Bai nianxi is puzzled. He hangs up and is about to go back.

Suddenly a cry for help came from behind.

"Help - help - someone fell into the water -"

it was a child's voice.

Thinking that it was a child playing with water by the river, he accidentally fell in. Bai
nianxi rushed over.

But I found that what was fluttering in the river was not a child, but the old man just



now!

There are two seven or five-year-old children by the river. They keep calling. When
they see an adult coming, they are finally relieved.

Children may be OK, but such an adult, Bai nianxi is not sure whether he can save
people. Without thinking much, he plunges into the river.

Swimming to the old man's side, the old man is about to lose consciousness. He looks
at Bai nianxi vaguely and faints.

Bai nianxi made great efforts to drag the old man onto the bank. After a few breaths,
he laid the old man flat on the bank and began CPR with his hands crossed.

After a while, the old man spat out a mouthful of water. Bai nianxi was relieved.

Many people have gathered by the river. Some enthusiastically dial 120, and others
come forward to help. The old man should be OK.

Think of Kang Mo North just that phone call, Bai nianxi stood up, turned to go home.

Just like an episode, Bai nianxi acted as if it was not her who saved people just now.

Looking at the white read Xi a wet appear in front of, Kang Mo North strong pressure
heart of anger, "how to do this?"

Bai nianxi didn't speak. His eyes fell on several people, and his face was full of
consternation.

Bai family, actually found here!

"What are you doing here?" After a brief shock and consternation, Bai nianxi spoke
coldly.

Ye Chunmei snorted, a little discontented, "how come you don't welcome us like this?
Don't forget, we are a family. "

"Family?" Bai nianxi gave a sneer.

They deserve a family?

She lost her mother when she was three years old. Not long after her mother left, less
than three months later, her father asked for another wife to be her stepmother.



Ye Chunmei is her stepmother.

After ye Chunmei came home, Bai nianxi didn't have a good day. A year later, ye
Chunmei gave birth to a younger brother.Bai family people prefer boys to girls. After
Bai Yu was born, she was used to by her family. She put out her clothes and opened
her mouth. However, as a young woman, she began to take on all the housework in
silence.

Her father works outside to make money. Ye Chunmei gambles at home every day and
loses money. She still remembers that one year, ye Chunmei lost all her tuition, which
made her almost unable to go to school!

The hardships she suffered in those years in Bai's family make her feel sad even now.
What qualifications do they have to tell her that they are a family!

"Have you ever thought of me as your family?" When he said this, Bai nianxi's voice
was cold and his heart was cold.

Bai Jianguo angrily stood up from his chair, took out the old feudal parents'
momentum, pointed to Bai nianxi and said, "you have no conscience! Eat my white
family's, use my white family's, still can say so shameless words now! "

Kangmobei's face turned black. He was in the company, but suddenly he got a call
from the security guard saying that someone was making trouble here. The
troublemaker claimed to be Bai nianxi's family. He just came here.

In the information given by Secretary Xing, it was mentioned that Bai nianxi had a bad
relationship with the Bai family.

But now it seems that it is not only bad, but also bad?

"What does grandfather mean? Want me to pay back what I owe the Bai family for so
many years? "

Bai nianxi put on a smile of disdain, "but I remember that five years ago, I gave you
200000 yuan. At the cost of clarifying our relationship, you promised never to come to
me again."

"Just 200000, just want to buy out our blood relationship?" Bai Jianguo lost his hands
behind him, and his greedy face was very hateful. "Don't forget, the kindness of birth
and breeding is greater than heaven. You owe us the Bai family. How can you pay it
back?"
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