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Chapter 2239 Jun Lin Wrilfill!

He was not afraid of the Chu family, and he was all about Japan, and Ye Qingtian, the god of war in the
summer, was not afraid of Mark.

Now that a small Xu family wants to overwhelm Mark, it is undoubtedly wishful thinking.

“What an arrogant child!” “I don’t know how high the sky is?” “I don’t even care about my Xu family?”
Boom ~ Just as Mark’s words fell, there was an angry voice. .

Everyone followed the prestige and saw outside the The Twinfill. I don’t know when, there were already a
few luxury cars.

A large number of people got out of the car. They stood aside respectfully, like courtiers, welcoming the
arrival of the emperor.

Finally, surrounded by everyone, an old man appeared in everyone’s eyes like this.

I saw this man in a gray-green old-fashioned military uniform with gray hair. It seemed that he was almost
an ancient age, but he was still strong in his spirits.

Once this person appeared, everyone felt that a huge aura radiated from the old man.

This kind of murderous aura can only be possessed if you have truly experienced the baptism of blood and
fire.

Of course, in addition to the murderous aura on this person, what is more striking is the three gold stars on
his shoulders.

“This is…”

“The title of an admiral?” At the moment when they saw the three gold stars, many people in the room
gasped in shock.

Ericson and others were even more shocked, almost bursting into their eyes.

How many generals can there be in a country?

It is estimated that in Noirfork, it is difficult to produce one in ten years.

People like this, who is not a powerful figure standing on top of power and power.



It is the governor of Noirfork, in front of the general, you must respectfully shout the general.

Everyone present did not expect that Mr. Chu’s wedding banquet today would have led to such a giant.

Ferguson Wu, who was not far away, changed his expression immediately when he saw this old man appear.

“This old man, could it be…

“Old man of the Xu family, Xu Junlin?”

“Ferguson Wu frowned and said, and then suddenly smiled. The smile was full of wanton and sorrow.
“Haha~” “This good show is really getting lively.

“Even the old man from the Xu family is here.”

“Mr. Chu, Mr. Chu, this time, how can you make a comeback?”

“When you die, your forces will all be wiped out!”

“When the time comes, I Ferguson Wu will take the opportunity to integrate the strengths of all parties, and
at the same time take advantage of the power of Lu and Xu. This land in the east of the Yangtze River is
what Ferguson Wu has in my bag.

After seeing the visit of the old man from the Xu family, Ferguson Wu’s previous tremors and worries
disappeared immediately. He returned to his former pride again. At the same time, with the arrival of Xu
Junlin, the crowds on both sides immediately dispersed like a tide. Go, take the initiative to give Elder Xu a
way out. Soon, under the protection of his subordinates, Xu Junlin drove straight in and came to Mark. Xu
He beside him was still kneeling on the ground. He saw the old man. After coming, I was overjoyed, like a
desperate person, I saw the straw. “Father, you are finally here!

“This bastard just killed my descendants of the Xu family. He broke my knees and forced me to kneel down,
completely not putting our Xu family in his eyes.

“Father, you must kill him, call the shots for your son, and avenge Shaohua~” Xu He spoke sadly, his
majestic face was full of viciousness. He kept begging Xu Junlin to kill him. Mark, pacify The Twinfill and
avenge him. “Well, Xiaohe, don’t worry, this fairness will be recovered for you for your father!

Xu Junlin said in a deep voice. Then, the muddy old eyes slowly swept past, and finally fell on Mark in front
of him. Huh~ At that moment, the cold wind suddenly started, and endless ripples in the cloud lake.

At the same time, with the advent of Xu Junlin, the crowds on both sides immediately dispersed like a tide,
and took the initiative to make a way out for Mr. Xu.

Soon, under the protection of his subordinates, Xu Junlin drove straight in and came to Mark.

Xu He beside him was still kneeling on the ground.

After seeing the coming of the old man, he was immediately overjoyed. Like a desperate person, he saw the
straw.



“Father, you are finally here!” “This bastard kills my descendants of the Xu family. He broke my knees and
forced me to kneel down. He didn’t put our Xu family in his eyes at all.”

“Father, you must kill. Let him be the master, and take revenge for Shaohua~” Xu He spoke sadly, his
magnificent face full of viciousness.

He kept begging Xu Junlin, killed Mark, flattened The Twinfill, and avenged him.

“Well, Xiaohe, don’t worry, this fairness will be recovered for your father!” Xu Junlin said in a deep voice.

Then, the muddy old eyes slowly swept across, and finally fell on Mark in front of him.

Phew~ At that moment, the cold wind suddenly started, and endless ripples of the Trivan Lake.

Chapter 2240

“You are Jiang Dong, Mr. Chu?” “My grandson, you killed?” “You did all of this?” Your Excellency
HaiDollar, Xu Junlin’s deep voice echoed.

In the gloomy words, there is endless chill and aura.

Like a tiger that eats humans, licking its fangs.

Ericson and others were so scared that their faces were pale at this time, and there was unconscious panic in
their hearts.

Although Ericson and others are also considered pampered and respected on weekdays.

However, with their little power, how do they compare with Xu Junlin!

This person in front of him is the founder of the country.

The majesty and aura exuding from Xu Junlin alone is not comparable to that of Ericson and others.

At the moment when he saw Xu Junlin’s arrival, the Noirfork people behind him felt endless despair.

“This catastrophe, I am afraid that I will really have to go through it~” Ericson and others sighed with fear in
their hearts.

Chen Ao even shook his head.

Xu Junlin came to Wrilfill. This time, Mr. Chu was afraid that it would be more fortunate.

However, just when everyone was in panic and despair because of the coming of the Xu family.

Mark was still calm.

Facing Xu Junlin’s question, Mark chuckled, “I, Mark, killed countless people, how do I know which one is
your grandson.”



What?

Hearing Mark’s answer, Ericson and others were almost scared to pee.

“Mr. Chu, speak carefully~” Lei Lao San and the others persuaded him from the side with fear.

I wondered what Mr. Chu was doing.

This Xu Junlin is not Xu He, this is the hero of the country, the founder of the country.

The whole country honored him as a guest.

Could it be that they personally can offend disrespect?

Sure enough, as soon as Mark’s words fell, Xu Junlin’s eyebrows sank immediately, and he shouted sharply.

“Presumptuous!” “You junior, dare to speak to me like this?” “Do you know who I am Xu Junlin?” “Even
the governor of Noirfork is here, and I definitely dare not treat me so disrespectfully.”

You yellow-mouthed boy, who gave you the courage!” Mark’s words made Xu Junlin furious immediately.

An arrogant voice, with cold eyes.

The tiger’s eyes widened, and he shouted angrily at Mark.

For many years, since he Xu Junlin was given the title of admiration, no one, like Mark, has been so
disrespectful to him.

Now that a junior was openly provoked, Xu Junlin was naturally furious.

“I think it’s you who are presumptuous!” “What kind of thing do you dare to tell me here?” “If you know
right from wrong, I, Mark, wouldn’t mind serving you as a guest.”

“But a pity, it’s just one after all. It’s an old dog who doesn’t know right or wrong,” Mark was not afraid of
Xu Junlin’s anger.

Instead, he sneered, his eyebrows were cold, and he called Xu Junlin an old dog, slapped him in public, and
didn’t give Xu Junlin any face at all.

“F*ck!” “Mr. Chu, what are you doing?” “He is the old man of the Xu family, the important minister of the
country.”

“You will be dead if you are like this~” Ericson and others were already completely scared, and they wailed
in their hearts.

Chen Ao closed his eyes even more desperately.
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