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Phew~ Outside, there was a cold wind.

The cold wind of overcast test, like the roar of the devil, echoed the world.

In the underground fortress, Sato had clearly noticed something strange.

Outside, something must have happened.

Otherwise, why did the guards he sent out to investigate the situation be like nothing but
news?

“Commander, what…what to do?” “Or I…

Shall we go out to see the situation?

“In this underground fortress, the remaining four guards were also a little panicked. After
all, this is too weird. The people sent out have fallen into the sea, and all the people
outside can’t be contacted. People here have to be panicked. I have to be curious. What
happened outside? “Well, let’s go and see.

“You four, go out together.”

“It’s good to be a caregiver.”

Sato’s eyebrows were condensed, and he ordered again. The four people, even if they
were more frightened, had to bite the bullet and agreed. However, when the four of them
were about to leave together, Sato called them again. Wait a minute, I will go out with
you.

“I want to see what is going on outside?”

“Sato’s words are harsh, but his heart is naturally very scared. He was a little uneasy
today, but now that this happened again, the fear in his heart is naturally more intense.
Therefore, Sato felt that instead of staying here alone, he In the underground fortress, it
would be better to go out with them and find out. If there is a thief invading, it is better to
direct the scene and deal with it personally. It is better than being a headless fly and



being bored here like now. “Commander, the situation outside is unknown, you still don’t
want to go out, it’s better to stay here temporarily.

“Otherwise, I am worried that you will be in danger.”

“Several subordinates, but they all discouraged. Sato shook his hand, pretending to be
calm and said: “What are you afraid of, my first division is the Japanese king’s card
teacher, so there are real thieves to kill me.”

There are more than 8,000 people in my first division. Could it be that a few rogue
thieves can’t stop them?

“Go, let me go out, find out!”

When the words fell, Sato immediately led the subordinates behind him out of this
deep-diving, war fortress. Outside, the dark night was deep. In the gloomy sky, there
was no starlight. There was nothing in the eye. Darkness as thick as iron. There are only
a few street lamps around, shining faintly. “Yamamoto?

“Okada?”

“What about people?”

“Come here~” After going out, Sato and the others didn’t even see the slightest figure.
This Nuoda camp was like an empty camp.

Only the rustling cold wind was blowing like a ghost.

Just when Sato and the others were in a panic, suddenly someone next to him called:
“Commander, there is a fire ahead?” “Perhaps, everyone has gone there?” Sure enough,
Sato Jun looked at his hand. , I saw the flames, swaying in the depths of the dark night.

Vaguely, a few figures can still be seen.

Sato and the others were relieved and hurried forward.

However, the farther you go, the more Sato and others feel that something is wrong.

“It’s weird, what a big smell?” “Moreover, the ground is also very humid. Could it have
rained just now?” Among the five people, someone said in doubt.

The mud and puddles on their feet only made them feel that it seemed to have rained
here just now.
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While talking, someone yelled and slipped and fell directly to the ground. The whole
person just squatted in the puddle behind him.

In the dark night, the splashing water stains fell on the whole body.

Sato and others were about to help, but when they saw the water stains on that person,
Sato and others trembled, their old eyes suddenly widened!

“Commander, what’s the matter?” “Didn’t I just fall and fall? How do you look like a
ghost?” The fallen man was still laughing.

While talking and laughing, he got up from the ground while lowering his head to pat the
dirt on his body.

However, as soon as this person bowed his head, the whole person was immediately
confused.

Because, he found that he did not know when, his body, his hands, and clothes were all
red liquid.

Moreover, there is a strong smell that haunts this world.

“This…this is…”

“Blood!!!” “Why…how could it happen?” “Why…how could there be so much blood on
me?” This person was terrified and yelled. In the words, there is fear and even more
doubts.

However, in a panic, this person seemed to realize something, and immediately took out
the phone, leaning on the faint light of the phone screen, and shining on the ground.

I saw, the muddy road under my feet, where is the rain, but blood!

Yes, it’s all red blood.

It’s like a trickle, flowing for kilometers.

What is blood flowing into a river?

This is a river of blood!

Boom~ At that time, the man was completely scared to urinate, and his whole body was
almost lost. In the end, the soles of his feet softened and he squatted on the ground
again, his face pale, and he didn’t dare to say a word.

As for Sato and the others, naturally they had already seen this scene, and their hearts
were even more horrified, with stormy waves and madness swept through them.



“Come, come!” “Yamamoto?” “Okada?” …..

“Come on!” “Protect this commander!” “A bunch of trash, where’s the people?” Sato
seemed to be mad. After realizing that blood was flowing under his feet, he shouted in
horror.

However, no one responded.

Only the cold wind swept constantly.

Until, a long time later, a cold and majestic voice quietly sounded in the depths of the
dark night.

“You are, the commander-in-chief of the First Division, Sato?” The voice was low and
heavy, and it sounded abruptly under the silent night.

After hearing the sound, Sato and others trembled, then turned their heads to look at the
source of the sound.

I saw a deep figure standing in front of the extinguished flames, holding hands.

In the light of the fire, the figure appeared illusory and rugged, just like a ghost that walks
at night, a ghost that kills life.

Looking from a distance, it makes people creepy!

“You…”

“Who are you?” “How dare… dare to trespass into a military powerhouse?” “Come on,
kill him for me, kill him!” “Shoot him on the spot~” Sato yelled in panic and hysterically,
like he saw a life-killing ghost.

However, the figure didn’t panic because of this, but walked towards him, step by step
towards Sato, the faint voice continued to echo.

“You don’t need to shout any more, they won’t be able to hear it anymore.”

“Because, in this camp, there are only a few of you who are still alive.”

The faint laughter, with a deep sense of enthusiasm.

In the swaying flame, that figure walked with his hand held in hand.

It wasn’t until this time that Sato and others saw that behind this figure, there were
corpses all over the field.

” “who are you?



“Unexpectedly… how dare you trespass into military power?

“Come on, kill him for me, kill him!”

“Shoot him on the spot~” Sato yelled in panic and screamed hysterically. In that way, it
was like seeing a life-killing ghost. However, the figure did not panic because of this, and
instead walked towards him. , Approaching towards Sato step by step, the faint voice
continued to reverberate. “No need to shout, shout again, they can’t hear it anymore.

“Because, in this camp, there are only a few of you who are still alive.

A faint laughter, with a bone-thinning fortitude. In the swaying flame, the figure walked
with his hand held. It was only then that Sato and the others saw that behind this figure,
there were corpses all over the field.

” “who are you?

“Unexpectedly… how dare you trespass into a military powerhouse?”

“Come on, kill him for me, kill him!”

“Shoot him on the spot~” Sato yelled in panic and screamed hysterically. In that way, it
was like seeing a life-killing ghost. However, the figure did not panic because of this, and
instead walked towards him. , Approaching towards Sato step by step, the faint voice
continued to reverberate. “No need to shout, shout again, they can’t hear it anymore.

“Because, in this camp, there are only a few of you who are still alive.

A faint laughter, with a bone-thinning fortitude. In the swaying flame, the figure walked
with his hand held. It was only then that Sato and the others saw that behind this figure,
there were corpses all over the field.
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