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Hearing this, Ye Ximei’s face immediately paled.

He knew that this matter could not be kept secret.

Sure enough, everyone in Qinglong didn’t care about Mark’s mother’s obstruction, but explained everything
together.

The matter naturally started with the fact that the Martial God Temple sent Lu Hua and others to Noirfork to
visit Mark’s widow, and then Lu Hua coveted Helen Qiu’s beauty, wishing to bring it into her arms while
achieving the goal of occupying Mark’s foundation.

Later, the God of War appeared in time to help Helen Qiu and the others resolve the crisis, and sent Lu Hua
to the Martial Arts Court for trial.

At that time, both Helen Qiu and Ericson Li and others thought that the crisis was over and everything ended
here.

However, only later did Helen Qiu and the others discover that everything was just their wishful thinking.

It turned out that after Lu Hua was brought to the Martial Arts Court by Lu’s family and surrendered, Lu
Hua’s clansmen finally got on the line of the King of Fighters Mo Gucheng through various trades and
multiple relationships.

In addition, there were a lot of people who didn’t want to see Mark in the Martial God Temple.

The only person who appreciates Mark is the God of War.

Perhaps, Grandmaster Haotian is also considered one.

However, Tang Hao has always been simple and simple. In addition to practicing every day, he is playing
with his hammer.

The matter of martial arts world, Vast Sky Grandmaster basically ignored.

However, even if he paid attention to it, Tang Hao was afraid he would not pay too much for a fallen person.

In the final analysis, Tang Hao and Mark are just one-on-one, and they can’t talk about friendship at all, they
can only be said to be appreciation.

After Mark’s fall, this appreciation naturally disappeared.



From this perspective, among the high-level martial arts circles, the only one who has a deep friendship with
Mark and has more contact with is the God of War.

And the god of war is noble, and Lu Hua is just a small person in his eyes after all.

The God of War naturally didn’t have the energy to ask about the trial of an ant. He just said hello to the
martial arts court and severely punished Lu Hua, and then he didn’t care about it anymore.

In this case, it is undoubtedly easy for the Lu family to pass the line of the King of Fighters to protect Lu
Hua.

In the end, the martial arts court only gave Lu Hua a punishment similar to that of self-playing thirty boards.

Therefore, Lu Hua was lucky to be the first and only person to walk out of the martial arts court alive for so
many years.

However, this experience did not teach the Lu family a lesson, but became even more unscrupulous.

“Half a year ago, Lu Hua began to use various means to deal with Noirfork and the Mufan Group.”

“Of course, this time Lu Hua didn’t dare to use such direct and rude means like last time.”

“However, there are some methods, although they do not kill, they are more terrifying than killing, and even
more uncomfortable~”

“During that time, first an executive of the Mufan Group fell from a building strangely or died
unexpectedly.”

“Then, it was the bosses of downstream companies loyal to the Mufan Group, as well as the leading bosses
in various cities~”

“This Lu Hua wants to use this to pressure Sister Qiu, forcing Sister Qiu to voluntarily hand over control of
the Mufan Group.”

“But Mufan Group was created by you, the instructor of Chu, and it is your half-life blood and foundation.
Sister Qiu will naturally not give up willingly.”

“So, in order to prevent Lu Hua from using the Lu family’s martial arts power in the next step to attack the
close relatives of the Chu instructors, I immediately took my aunt from Fenghai to Wrilfill.”

“I and Ziyang were guarding them day and night, and even asked Commander Lu to send a squad of soldiers
to station on Yunding Mountain.”
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“However, Lu Hua’s methods did not stop there~”

“Instead, he became more frantic.”

“Psychologically, physically…”



“Insidious, mean, dirty, disgusting~”

“It can be said to be extremely versatile.”

“The intention is to crush us psychologically and physically…”

“There are many methods that we can’t defend against.”

“Until one time, just after leaving the villa, the car that sister Qiu and Auntie were riding in had a serious car
accident~”

“If it weren’t for the crisis, Auntie had guarded Sister Qiu, and now the aunt is lying on the hospital bed.”

“Even so, sister Qiu still left a scar that is difficult to heal on her forehead~”

Even though these things have been experienced once, Denren Ye now tells them again, the whole person is
still trembling with anger, and her beautiful eyes are all red because of anger.

Sometimes, she can’t imagine why there are such despicable and shameless people in the world.

To achieve the goal, do whatever it takes.

Even wives and children don’t let go.

He didn’t dare to do anything before he was alive, but he did evil after the death of others.

Denren Ye was still talking, but Mark turned her head and took off the hat on Helen Qiu’s head.

Sure enough, the scars several centimeters long on Helen Qiu’s delicate forehead were so dazzling.

Mark couldn’t imagine how painful Helen Qiu was at that time.

His face must be full of blood.

Looking at the scar on her forehead, Mark clenched his palm.

He didn’t realize until now that Helen Qiu, who rarely wears a hat, was wearing a hat when he saw him.

It turned out to be to cover this scar.

He stretched out his hand and stroked the scar that was shocking with pity.

No one knows how far the anger in his heart has been burning at this moment.

“Go on.”

After a brief silence, Mark turned around, and his cold eyes fell on Denren Ye again.

Denren Ye nodded and continued speaking.



“At that time, I realized that Wrilfill was no longer safe.”

“Therefore, Ziyang and Mingbo were asked to send sister Qiu to Noirfork Military Region overnight.”

“At the same time, preventing leakage of their whereabouts also allows them to cut off all contact with the
outside world.”

“After all, we are well aware of the terrifying power of martial arts.”

“If the Lu family is allowed to know the whereabouts of Sister Qiu and their whereabouts, I am afraid that
thousands of people will guard it, and accidents will inevitably occur.”

Denren Ye’s words are definitely not a false statement.

It is by no means impossible for a powerful warrior to take the head of the general from among the Wanjun.

Hearing this, everything is explained.

No wonder the mothers and their phones couldn’t get through.

No wonder, even Ericson Li and the others didn’t know Mu Cheng and the others’ whereabouts.

After all, for confidential work, the fewer people who know, the lower the risk of leakage.

“It was the same night, we couldn’t swallow this breath, and decided to take the initiative to attack and kill
Na Lu Hua, to avenge Sister Qiu and the others.”

“But I didn’t expect that before we left Wrilfill, we would meet the powerful Lu family lurking nearby.”

“In the end, we were also hit hard.”

“Da Zhuang’s right leg was broken, almost disabled.”

“Taishan’s two fingers were cut off by the Lu family, and it will be difficult to recover for life.”

“If it weren’t for Commander Lu and they arrived in time, I’m afraid we would not see you, Instructor Chu
today~”
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