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Obviously, no one thought that Wei Luo had hidden so many hole cards.

“It seems that Young Master Wei’s coming to Gritsberg this time is extremely well
prepared!”

Everyone in the Xu family whispered secretly, and then turned their heads, following
Wei Luo’s gaze to look forward.

One second~

Two seconds~

…

A full ten seconds passed, and the world in front was still empty, without any figure
appearing.

“Ok?”

“what happened?”

“No one there?”

“Isn’t there any accident again?”

Seeing this, the faces of Xu Wenqing and others turned black at the time.

After all, Wei Luo’s previous methods against Mark failed. They were really afraid that
something went wrong with Wei Luo’s final trump card.

“Master Wei, do you really still have anyone?”

Worried, Xu Wenqing walked over and asked Wei Luo in a low voice, with worry in his
eyes.

After all, the Xu family has now expelled Xu Lei from the family.



It can be said that they have completely torn their faces with Mark.

Now the entire Xu family has been tied to a warship with Wei Luo, and every one is
prosperous, and every one is damaged.

If Wei Luo can’t handle Mark, can you imagine how miserable their fate will be?

Therefore, the Xu family naturally cared about whether Wei Luo had a hole card.

Huh~

At the moment when Xu Wenqing’s words fell, outside the room, there was a sudden
wind.

The rustling cold wind, like the devil’s low roar, swept across the world in an instant.

In Xujia Manor, thousands of fallen leaves are flying, and the sky is full of dust.

“This this…”

“What’s going on here?”

The sudden change caused everyone in the hall to tremble in horror.

“Second uncle, look at it~”

“what is that!”

“Is it a figure?”

In the hall, a person suddenly screamed.

Swipe~

Everyone’s eyes were looking.

Sure enough, I don’t know when, in the wind and sand in the sky, a dark shadow
appeared quietly.

It was the figure of an old man, his gray hair wagging in the wind.

Grey robe, hunting noises.

At the moment this person appeared, everyone just felt that a huge oppression was
oncoming.

Even Tong Shan, Mark and others are also feeling the pressure.



“So powerful!”

“Wei Family, there are such strong people?”

Denren Ye’s eyes were dignified, and she whispered.

Tongshan and Qingtan became nervous unconsciously.

However, some people are happy and some are worried.

After feeling the mighty power of the incoming person, Xu Wenqing and others’ previous
worries immediately disappeared, and they were replaced by joy.

“Haha~”

“As expected of Master Wei!”

“Just playing, he has such a momentum, this person must be a very strong master.”

“The Wei family deserves to be the veteran giant that has dominated Zhonghai for a
century.”

“This kind of background, my Xu family can’t match it?”

“With such a powerful person helping punches, that bastard is dead!”

“The gods can’t save him~”

The Xu family suddenly boiled.

Xu Wenqing and others are even more excited.

That kind of feeling is like waiting for the hero who turned the tide in a desperate time.

“Xiao Luo, tell me, who is it who doesn’t know whether to live or die, dare to move you?”

An indifferent voice came from a few meters away.

Although the distance is not close, but the sound is strong and thick, full of air, like a
muffled thunder in the ears of everyone.

Even the voice is so powerful, everyone is undoubtedly more in awe of this person.

“Old Kong, sorry.”

“I didn’t want to trouble you.”



“But I can’t help it. The few strong men I have brought are all compromised.”

“In desperation, I can only ask you to come out of the mountain.”

Wei Luo’s words were somewhat guilty and apologetic.

After all, Kong Lao is respected in the Wei family.

It was his grandfather, Wei Patriarch, who was in awe of Kong Lao.

It stands to reason that Wei Luo is not qualified to mobilize such strong men.

However, this trip to Yenching was arduous and important.

Therefore, the Wei family made an exception to let Kong Lao accompany him, secretly
sheltering Wei Luo to be safe.

Now that Wei Luo asked him to take action, he naturally had to say something nice to
hold him high.

Chapter 3015

“Ok.”

“Xiao Luo, you don’t have to say more if you have extra words.”

“Just tell me, who dares to provoke you?”

“I will solve the rest for you.”

Facing Wei Luo’s words, the old man just hummed and said in a deep voice.

In the majestic words, there is inexplicable majesty and self-confidence.

“Haha~”

“Great!”

“With Mr. Kong’s words, Wei Luo feels relieved.”

Wei Luo haha ​ ​ laughed, and his handsome face was full of pride and recklessness.

In his opinion, as long as Kong Lao is willing to make a move, Ye Fanding will have no
chance again.

You know, Kong Lao is the old president of the Vietnam Sea Budo Association.



Although Wei Luo didn’t know the martial arts and didn’t understand the martial arts
world, just from this name, it was enough to see the importance of Kong Lao in the
martial arts world.

A respectable martial arts expert, could it be that he couldn’t cure a gangster who came
out of a poor country?

However, just when Wei Luo was about to tell Lao Kong who provoke him, Mark’s faint
words sounded quietly in the hall: “Don’t ask him, I want to provoke him.”

Mark’s voice was not loud, but it fell in the ears of everyone, but it was almost ten
thousand tons.

“I go!”

“This stinky boy is crazy and boundless?”

“Even if I stood up by myself!”

“He doesn’t put people in his eyes?”

“It’s so arrogant!”

For a time, there was a full house noise.

Everyone in the Xu family also booed, and they were shocked by Mark’s arrogance.

“Bastard, you don’t have to be crazy.”

“Your death date is here!”

“Lao Kong is the number one expert in the martial arts in Vietnam, and he is highly
respected.”

“He can slap you to death with one slap.”

“Wait a minute, how do I see you die?”

Wei Luo was also annoyed by Mark’s arrogance, turned his head and said to Mark
viciously.

At this time, the old man had also walked into the hall.

Because the crowd blocked him, he couldn’t see Mark’s face.

However, when he heard Mark’s words, the old man’s expression immediately became
gloomy.



“well.”

“For so many years, you are the second person who dared to speak to me in such a
tone.”

“The last one is dead.”

“It seems that you want to die too!”

The old man’s brows and eyes were gloomy, and the ice-cold aura was bursting out of
his body.

The tables and chairs in front of him were all shattered by this tremor.

In this way, the gray-robed old man stepped forward with endless chill.

In front of him, the crowd spread out like a tide.

Until, revealed the handsome figure of the young man.

Seeing Mark, he sat so quietly.

With his back to the old man, Mark didn’t seem to have turned his head to look at him
from beginning to end.

Just sitting there alone, drinking tea at the table.

The behavior of the young man in front of him undoubtedly angered the old man even
more.

Sometimes, more irritating than some offensive words, is to ignore.

“You junior, don’t you get up quickly and die?”

The gray-robed old man seemed to be really angry, and he burst out like thunder.

Then, his soles slammed on the ground, and his guts rushed up from his legs, and then
all gathered on his palms.

In the next moment, the old man raised his arms, and his huge slap brought the hunting
wind into the back of Mark’s head.

How powerful is the palm of the old man?

Almost no one doubted that if this palm were to fall, Mark’s head would inevitably be
smashed into a pit.



“Dragon Lord, be careful!”

Tongshan and the others didn’t expect that this old man would make a direct shot
because of a disagreement.

In shock, Tongshan and Qingtan immediately rushed out, loyal to the emperor and
protect the lord.

“Go away!”

The old man yelled and patted his backhand. Remember the website of this site,.
Xluochen. Com, easy to read next time, or enter “” on Baidu to enter this site
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