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Even the photography crew who had been shooting the fighting scene earlier turned 
their camera to Elise’s writing. 

The next second, her writing appeared on the screen. Everyone now knew why the host 
couldn’t say anything. 

 

Elise’s writing was utterly magnificent. 

All the descriptive words they could think of were inadequate to express how wonderful 
her writing was. 

Beautiful? This was far too brief. 

Every word glistened like a diamond? This appeared to be an exaggeration. 

Grandeur? Such a word seemed like a no-no too. 

It was a simple classic poem, but her writing transported everyone back in time, and the 
person creating it was right in front of them. 

The audience was so engrossed in Elise’s exquisite writing that they were at a loss for 
words. It was only a few minutes later that they regained their composure and 
expressed their admiration. 

However, when the camera moved closer to her writing, it was revealed that she signed 
off with ‘QH.’ 

Cody was initially astounded by her talent, but when he saw these two alphabets, he 
was overjoyed. 

He knew Elise’s writing was far superior to Tiana’s, but imposing herself as QH was a 
grave mistake. 

“Elise Sinclair!” He took it upon himself to act for justice and reprimanded harshly, “You 
are such an imposter! How dare you sign off with QH’s name?!” 

“Who said she is an imposter?” Lorenzo’s captivating voice rang out, capturing 
everyone’s attention. 



Stunned, Cody turned around, only to see Lorenzo standing on the other side, a 
microphone in his hand. 

Lorenzo’s authoritative aura suppressed him once more, and he felt fearful in his heart. 

After casting a resentful glance at Cody, Lorenzo turned to face Elise, who was standing 
on stage. “Young girl, I’ve reminded you many times that you need to sign off with your 
seal,” he said gently. 

“Sorry, I forgot about it,” Elise said, sticking out her tongue. 

“Where’s the seal I customized for you?” 

“I forgot to bring it with me,” she answered with a shrug. 

That left Lorenzo speechless. He had anticipated this as well, because Elise was 
always uninterested in such things. 

He sighed and walked toward the stage, stopping in front of her. 

Then, he took out a small box and handed it to her. 

In the box was a transparent seal carved from jade. It was small and exquisite, and it 
would instantly catch one’s eye. 

Elise was surprised to see it. “It’s a nice piece of jade!” 

After all, she was still a young lady who smiled at cute and beautiful things. 

“Wow. I didn’t know that you now know how to study jade now after six years!” Lorenzo 
joked. 

“Well, someone taught me, so of course I have to learn it well.” 

She recalled the time when she learned about stone gambling from Alexander, and they 
were so excited that they both stayed up for the entire night. 

Fortunately for Elise, she was able to pick up a few skills. Her aptitude for learning was 
commendable. 

“Keep this new seal that I customized for you. The previous one was made of gold and 
isn’t nearly as valuable as this one. I spent a lot of money on this, so you better keep it 
well!” Lorenzo reminded her. 

Though he didn’t expect her to bring it everywhere with her, he hoped she would use it 
someday. 



“I shall oblige, then.” 

She happily took the seal and stamped it on the spot where she had previously signed 
off. 

The seal’s red ink was imprinted on the paper. It said ‘Elise Sinclair’ and the alphabets 
‘QH’ was below her name, although these two alphabets were much smaller. 

Seeing that, Lorenzo nodded in relief, before taking over the microphone from the host 
and turned to face the audience. In a serious tone, he announced, “Everyone, there 
have previously been many rumors about QH’s identity, and I had no choice but to keep 
it hidden due to her age. Now that she’s made a name for herself, I’m proud to reveal 
that QH’s real name is Elise Sinclair!” 

Everyone below the stage exclaimed in surprise. 

Even the photographer couldn’t help but stick his head out to take a look. 

Nobody would have guessed that the Calligraphy Association, which played a 
significant role in Cittadel’s cultural aspect, was founded by a young lady who was 
underage a few years ago! 

Normal underage students would be still trapped in the classroom, struggling with their 
studies or entering into relationships. 

But Elise was unique. She became a composer, wrote her own music and lyrics, and 
even founded the Calligraphy Association! Heaven absolutely bestowed her abilities. 

Some astute viewers immediately suspected something was wrong after her identity 
was revealed. 

Didn’t Tiana say she was QH’s apprentice? Why didn’t she recognize QH earlier? 

And she even addressed QH as ‘Mr’. 

So, does it mean that she had no idea QH is actually a woman? 

Tiana, unlike everyone else, felt her legs wobble when QH’s identity was revealed. She 
would have fallen to the ground if she hadn’t supported herself by the railings behind 
her. 

Elise is QH? How is this possible, though? 

No! I must be dreaming. This isn’t true at all! 



She wrapped her arms around herself tightly and clenched her fists. Her nails were 
digging into her skin, but she felt no pain. 

It was unbearable for her to imagine Elise mocking her behind her back when she saw 
her artwork that she had published online. 

And all of the calligraphy artworks Tiana went to great lengths to acquire could have 
been Elise’s ruse! 

It seemed that Elise had planned for Tiana to engage in copying calligraphy script to the 
point of no return. 

Such an evil plan of hers! Tiana thought. 

After a long while, Elise finally realized Tiana’s hatred-filled gaze. 

It’s time to deal with her, Elise decided. 

“Tiana Hill.” Elise looked at the other woman solemnly. “Since you said you are my 
student, you should now go through the apprenticeship ritual. I don’t have much of a 
request; just kneel and bow to me will do.” 

Hearing that, Tiana clenched her fists even more tightly. 

How dare she ask me to kneel in front of the entire country? She is such a b*tch! 

However, Tiana was well aware that failing to do so would be equivalent to telling 
everyone that she was not QH’s apprentice at all, and all her bold and confident words 
earlier would become an irony that would work against her. 

With that in mind, she gritted her teeth and decided to take a step back for her own 
good. 

This time, she made up her mind to compromise. 

Then she miserably took a deep breath and approached Elise, thereafter kneeling down 
in front of the latter. 

The entire scene was deafeningly quiet. 

And Tiana’s face was burning, as if she had just been slapped hard. 

After a while, she mustered her courage to say, “Miss Sinclair, your apprentice is here 
to greet you!” 

How humiliating this was for her! 



Tiana swore in her heart that she would pay Elise twice as much humiliation in the 
future. 

“Hello, my dear apprentice,” Elise light-heartedly responded. However, her face 
suddenly became emotionless and in a cold voice, she continued, “Since you said 
you’re my apprentice, today, in front of everyone, I hereby expel you and forbid you 
from ever returning! It is beyond me to have such an dishonest apprentice who would 
simply defame anyone!” 

That instant, Tiana was stunned to the core. There was no reaction from her, and it was 
as if she had been struck by lightning. 

Elise wasn’t trying to help her to get out of the embarrassment at all! Instead, she was 
pushing her all the way to the bottom of the pit of shame! 

Tiana’s calligrapher image, which she had worked hard to maintain over the years, was 
now completely destroyed. 

Seeing how the situation unfolded, the astute Cody was concerned that Tiana’s case 
might implicate him. As a result, he dashed to the stage and vowed to cut all ties with 
Tiana. “I took you in because of your talent, but you cheated and took advantage of me! 
Miss Sinclair is right. You are no longer my apprentice from now on! I am severing all 
ties with you!” 
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Andy couldn’t help but scoff at that. “He dissociates himself rather quickly, doesn’t he?” 

However, Lorenzo was perplexed by something. “How did you obtain the S-Class 
badge?” 

 

“I picked it up from the roadside,” Tiana answered grudgingly, her head lowered. 

“Even at this point of time, you still refuse to admit your wrongdoings,” Elise responded 
resentfully while shaking her head. 

Elise had given Tiana a chance to repent. Since the latter did not cherish such a 
chance, Elise was not going to relent either. 

As soon as Elise finished speaking, she turned and looked around the audience, trying 
to find Julius. She then gave him a light nod, indicating that he could begin his work. 



With that, he took his phone and sent a message out. 

The screen dimmed in seconds and then lit up again after a flash. 

However, it did not show the live broadcast of the contest as it should have. Instead, a 
video was playing. 

The male and female leads in the video were none other than Tiana and Sebastian. 

At the same time, the audio was broadcasted through the speakers. 

“I brought the badge that you asked for,” Sebastian exclaimed as he handed the badge 
to Tiana. 

“Thank you, Sebastian. I will return it to you after I’ve used it,” Tiana replied in a sincere 
manner. 

“That’s not urgent. Take your time,” Sebastian responded shyly as he ruffled his hair. 

Then, the scene changed to Tiana’s hostel. 

Outside the hostel, Sebastian was blocking Tiana’s path. “Give me back the badge.” 

Tiana, on the other hand, simply replied, “You want me to return the gift that you’ve 
given me? Don’t you feel embarrassed?” 

Hence, Sebastian had no choice but to return empty-handed. 

The video stopped here. 

The truth had now been revealed. Tiana borrowed the badge but refused to return it. 

“Wow, I never expected Mayweather Polytechnic’s campus belle, as well as one of its 
elite, to do something like this!” 

“Isn’t she just making use of him? I would never have guessed she was such a 
materialistic person based on her innocent appearance!” 

“It’s so rude of her to not return something she borrowed! I suppose she had made up 
her mind to impersonate QH.” 

Even with her head bowed, Tiana could feel the disdainful stares directed at her from 
her surroundings. 

She tried to breathe normally to calm herself down. 



But in the end, the gossip around her was too much for her to bear and she ran down 
the stage in a mess. 

All of the reporters in the center swarmed her, forcing her to flee outside. However, 
outside the venue was already crowded with reporters who had heard about her 
wrongdoings and were waiting for her. In short, her path was blocked by all of them. 

“Miss Hill, are you really not QH’s apprentice? So all of the calligraphy works you posted 
online were copied?” 

“Could you tell us about your relationship with the man in the video, Miss Hill?” 

“Copying is a big taboo in the Calligraphy Association. What prompted you to take such 
a risk? Please explain, Miss Hill!” 

Tiana was surrounded by reporters and had nowhere to escape at all. Being forced to 
the corner, she squatted down with her arms wrapped around her head and yelled 
angrily, “I don’t know! Stop bothering me!” 

Lorenzo shook his head upon seeing that. Then, he took the microphone and 
announced, “On behalf of the Calligraphy Association, I now disqualify Tiana Hill from 
this contest and expel her from the association. The association will never accept her 
again!” 

Elise then took her place as one of the judges, thereafter rating the remaining 
contestants. 

The end result was that contestant number 12, Abby Mellor, rated the highest. 

And she happened to be the lady Elise met in the washroom. 

After the results were announced, Elise personally handed Abby the champion trophy 
and said, “Congratulations. You have a lot of talent. Your skills will undoubtedly improve 
with regular practice.” 

“Thank you, QH.” Abby was utterly excited. Before the reporters began taking pictures, 
she grabbed Elise’s arm and said, “I’ve always admired you, QH. Can I learn from you?” 

Hearing that, Elise spent a few moments hesitating. 

Abby had never learned under a master before. She had no formal training and as a 
result, her writing had a distinct style that set her apart from the other contestants. 

Elise was sure that Abby knew this too. 



Most likely, Abby was now publicly requesting to be Elise’s apprentice so that she could 
tell her stepmother, who was difficult to deal with. 

In the end, Elise decided to help Abby on this. 

Furthermore, her writing would reflect how a person was. Abby’s writing was polished 
and full of her distinguished personality, so her personality wouldn’t be too far off either. 

“Okay. I’ll take you in,” Elise agreed. 

Abby then bowed to Elise in front of all the reporters, officially becoming Elise’s 
apprentice. 

After the contest ended, Elise was dragged to the corner by Andy and Lorenzo. 

“Don’t even think about sneaking away! Whatever happens, you must remain in the 
association for at least two weeks in order for us to catch up!” Lorenzo clutched her 
sleeve as he spoke, as if he was afraid she would flee. 

“That’s right! Young girl—sorry, Miss Sinclair, the S-Class Archive was prepared 
specifically for you, and there are currently only a few art pieces inside. How 
inappropriate is that? You must produce at least seven or eight more works so that it 
does not appear so empty!” Andy supported Lorenzo. 

“What nonsense is this?” Though Elise was at a loss for words, she found them 
amusing and joked, “You’d best let go of me, Lorenzo, or I’m going to call the cops 
now!” 

“Then do it,” Lorenzo said calmly. “Even if they are here, nobody will leave until I have 
your promise.” 

“Sir, it isn’t very appropriate for you to talk in such a manner to Miss Sinclair, no?” Cody 
appeared out of nowhere and interrupted them. 

That ruined their happy atmosphere. All three of them simultaneously rolled their eyes 
at Cody’s words. 

Andy then looked at the other man. He suddenly thought of something and he asked, 
“Cody, I vividly recall asking someone to deliver Miss Sinclair’s works to the Archive. 
Why did you stop it? Are my instructions as vice president now being ignored by you?” 

“Tiana had me under her spell at the time! Besides, I had no idea it was Miss Sinclair’s 
work as I had not opened it!” Cody explained with a frown on his face. 

“You rejected Andy’s recommended art pieces before even looking at them. This clearly 
demonstrates that you are unable to appreciate excellent works of art. You are not 



welcome at the headquarters. Please relocate to the nearest branch of the association 
after today,” Lorenzo said unequivocally. 

Cody’s mouth widened and he wished for mercy when he heard that. However, when he 
saw Lorenzo’s expression, which appeared to be about to devour him, Cody quickly 
said, “Thank you very much, sir. I will definitely follow your instructions. I’ll go back and 
pack my belongings now.” 

Lorenzo grunted indifferently and did not even spare Cody a glance. 

After Cody left, Abby plucked up her courage to approach Elise and thank her. “Thank 
you for not turning me down earlier, Miss Sinclair.” 

Abby, as Elise had predicted, had her own reasons for making the request. 

“Don’t do that again. I don’t like being made use of.” Elise made her stand clearly. 

“There won’t be a second time. I believe I will be able to stay in the house after this,” 
Abby responded confidently. 
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At this moment, Alexander walked toward them. He naturally wrapped his arm around 
Elise’s waist and stood beside her when he arrived. 

“Mr. Forbes and Mr. Nixon, the contest has ended for quite some time. Why are you 
both refusing to let my wife go? “Alexander inquired, jokingly. 

 

“Your wife?” 

When Lorenzo heard that, he immediately released his grip on Elise’s arm and pushed 
his spectacles forward, examining Alexander from head to toe as if he were a threat. 

He looks decent, with a satisfactory height as well. His figure seems alright too, and he 
doesn’t appear stupid. 

Well, I guess he can be considered worthy of Elise. 

Alexander detected disdain in Lorenzo’s gaze and pitifully asked, “Sir, do I look that 
bad?” 



“That depends on who you’re comparing yourself to,” Lorenzo said, beating around the 
bush to express his displeasure. 

Alexander took a deep breath and lightly pinched Elise’s shoulder. Looking at her, he 
then murmured, “Mr. Forbes is implying that you have poor taste in men. I’m different 
because I chose you as my wife, which has made me the luckiest man on the planet.” 

The initially awkward situation was improved by Alexander’s seemingly joking words. 

Lorenzo was stunned for a moment, but he quickly recovered and nodded. This guy has 
excellent emotional intelligence, he reasoned. 

“If the both of you don’t mind, I need to take my wife back now. She is expecting and 
can’t be too tired,” Alexander smilingly continued. 

“Huh?” Elise was taken aback upon hearing that. 

Lorenzo and Andy, on the other hand, were stunned and stood frozen in place. 

“What?!” Lorenzo was the first to regain his senses and he right away looked at Elise’s 
stomach before scolding Alexander, “How dare you?! She has not even graduated from 
college yet!” 

Just as Elise wanted to explain that she wasn’t expecting, Alexander grabbed her and 
made the first move, “Sir, I couldn’t help myself. My wife is simply too stunning. I’m 
afraid she’ll dislike me for bothering her too much, so I can only have a child to distract 
my attention.” 

“Men are indeed selfish!” Lorenzo scoffed and continued, “Don’t think I don’t know that 
you’re just trying to use the child to keep Elise by your side!” 

As if he suddenly thought of something, he immediately went on in an agitated tone, 
“Elise, you have to promise me one thing—regardless of whether it’s a son or a 
daughter, you must let your child learn calligraphy from me!” 

Lorenzo simply had to be the master of a genius at least once in his lifetime! 

“Sir, you’re acting too quickly—” Andy said grudgingly. 

“It’s none of your business. Get out of my way.” Lorenzo now only had the child of a 
genius in his eyes. 

“I promise you that on behalf of Ellie,” Alexander replied cheerfully. “Under your 
tutelage, my child will undoubtedly make a name for himself.” 

“But of course!” Lorenzo smiled happily until his wrinkles appeared. 



“We’ll leave now, then?” 

“Go ahead.” 

Lorenzo straightforwardly let them go, his expression now friendly. 

Elise and Alexander then turned around and made their way back. Just after a few 
steps, Elise asked softly, “Am I expecting? Why didn’t I know about it?” 

He shushed her with a gesture and said, “They wouldn’t have let you go if I hadn’t said 
so!” 

It turned out that both Lorenzo and Andy had been tricked by Alexander. 

Learning that, Elise couldn’t control herself and laughed, but she immediately tried to 
keep her voice down. 

She then guiltily turned around, only to see Lorenzo and Andy smiling widely. 

That made her laugh again, and the couple both left the contest venue. 

—— 

… 

Meanwhile, Mica and Sebastian were shopping around the Food Street near the 
universities after they reconciled. 

They entered a branded men’s clothing store, where Sebastian went into the fitting 
room to try on some clothes while Mica waited outside. 

Coincidentally, the television in the store was playing the videos depicting the two 
scenes in which Tiana and Sebastian met. 

Mica was taken aback, so she rose to her feet and stared intently at the screen. She 
saw in her eyes all of Sebastian’s excitement and shyness when he was talking to 
Tiana. 

He had this expression on him when he first asked for Mica’s number. 

But after that, she had never seen such an expression from him anymore. 

Mica now knew he could still have such an expression, just not for her. 

Even the badge served as a tool for him to fawn over Tiana. 



At this instant, Sebastian walked out of the fitting room. With the expensive branded 
clothes on, he exuded a different sense of elegance. 

“Mica, what do you think about this suit I chose?” he asked. He even began to imitate 
those elegant and wealthy students with his actions. 

But after a long while, he did not get Mica’s response. 

As a result, he followed her gaze to find out what she was looking at. After a few 
seconds, he was completely stunned. 

Terrified, he grabbed Mica’s elbow and began to explain, “It’s not what it is, Mica. Tiana 
duped me as well. As you know, not many men can stand up to her beauty—” 

Mica’s sensitive heart was agitated by the word “beauty”. 

“You take me for granted because I’m not as beautiful as she is? So I’m just a tool for 
you to please Tiana?” Her tears began to fall, but she couldn’t be bothered. 

“You have to believe me! Didn’t we just talk it out earlier? What happened between 
Tiana and me is history, Mica. The person I truly love is you. Tiana only looks good on 
the surface. She’s entirely different from you!” 

“We’re indeed different.” Mica pushed his hand away, feeling disappointed. “If Tiana 
were to come back to you, you would ditch me without hesitation, am I right?” 

Mica knew it was because she was unattractive. 

Sebastian, however, was taken aback. Indeed, he had chosen Tiana over Mica 
previously. 

But it was different now. He adored Mica, and having Mica in his life improved his 
overall quality of life. He couldn’t bear to leave her now! 

His brief moment of hesitation was a great blow to Mica. 

She turned around, ready to flee, before all her tears came falling down. 

Seeing that, Sebastian was totally at a loss of what to do. He immediately grabbed her, 
turned her around, and kissed her. 

His kiss was gentle and warm. 

It was only until their breaths became heavier that he let go of her. 

“Do you believe I am sincere now?” he asked in between pants. 



Mica’s mind at this moment was blank. Dazed, she nodded. “Yes.” 

“Promise me not to mention Tiana or the badge ever again. We’ll just talk about our own 
relationship, can we?” Sebastian asked as he gently held her face in his palms, as if 
pleading with her. 

“Okay,” Mica agreed. 

Sebastian was her first love and the person who gave her her first kiss. She could 
forgive him for anything. 

He then contentedly pulled her into his embrace and hugged her tightly before exhaling 
a long, deep breath. 

It wasn’t easy to return to frugality after experiencing the extravagant lifestyle. Since 
Mica was the one allowed him to experience the life of the wealthy, he decided to be 
responsible to her this time. 

After all, who will want to be with you apart from me? he thought. 

—— 

… 

Elise returned to the hostel a few days later. 

When Mica saw her, she straightaway apologized, “I am sorry, Elise. I saw the live 
broadcast and knew that Tiana got the badge because of me. I apologize for almost 
jeopardizing your reputation.” 

“That’s not a big deal. The most important thing is to see what kind of person he is 
through this incident,” Elise responded nicely. 

But Mica started responding evasively and did not answer. 

That gave Elise a bad feeling, and she furrowed her brows. “Why are you remaining 
silent? Haven’t you broken up with him?” 
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“Sebastian has apologized to me. Tiana was the one who duped him into doing so!” 
Mica spoke with her back to Elise, as if she was talking to herself. 



“You’re far too trusting, Mica. Since he can do it once, he’ll continue doing it in the 
future. Such a man is unworthy of you.” Elise was a little displeased and continued her 
analysis, “From what I see, Sebastian appears to have other motives. Did he recently 
request anything else from you?” 

 

“Certainly not!” Mica was becoming irritated as well. “We’re both students; what else 
can we do for dating besides eat and shop together? What can he get from me since 
I’m just a commoner?” 

“You must be cautious of him. Things aren’t that simple between Tiana and him. I’ll 
show you the entire video later and you’ll understand what I mean after that.” Elise 
sighed. 

However, Mica was resistant to that. “That’s not necessary. All that happened in the 
past. We’ve already agreed not to bring up the subject again.” 

“Doesn’t it bother you if he was truly attracted to another woman?” Elise had no idea 
what Mica was thinking. 

“I trust him,” Mica answered decisively. 

And so, Elise couldn’t say anything else other than to warn Mica one last time. “You can 
make your own decision, but keep in mind that everyone’s love is valuable. Don’t give 
Sebastian your all until you’re certain that he truly loves you.” 

“You still want me to break up with him, right?” Mica bit her lower lip and asked 
aggrievedly. She stood firm and continued, “But, Elise, are you aware that not everyone 
is like you, with many people admiring and courting you? I worked hard to obtain this 
relationship, and I am pleased with it. Why are you treating it so negatively?” 

“What makes you think this way? I simply don’t want you to be cheated,” Elise stated, 
her brows furrowed. 

“Do you think I’m that stupid?” Mica felt her nose itch and her eyes became red. “Yes, I 
am a moron. I am the most naïve person on the planet to believe that we are good 
friends who respect each other! Please don’t be bothered by my problems from now on. 
Even if he’s lying to me, I’m willing to put up with it!” 

Mica dashed out of the room as soon as she finished her words, leaving Elise all alone. 

Looking at her bed which was neat and tidy even though she hadn’t been here for a 
long time, Elise felt sadness tingling in her heart. 



Perhaps she was too harsh in her words, not taking into account Mica’s personality or 
whether the latter could handle it. 

Now, Elise could only wait until a later date to apologize to Mica, if there was still a 
chance to do so. 

—— 

… 

Meanwhile, Elliot was mindlessly strolling through the bay behind the universities, 
sighing the entire time. 

This was the umpteenth time he had been rejected by Stephanie, and he still didn’t 
know what was wrong. 

He continued walking but after taking a turn, he heard a lady sobbing from somewhere 
in front of him. 

He took two steps forward and noticed a woman sitting on the stairs below. 

“She’s sobbing pitifully, as if her heart has been broken as well. We share the same 
misfortune!” 

Elliot felt as if he could feel her. Thus, he took out the only packet of tissue from his 
sling bag and approached the lady, ready to hand it to her. 

“Don’t cry. Swollen eyes aren’t pretty at all.” 

The lady raised her head when she heard his voice. 

And when their gazes met, they were both taken aback. 

“Mica?” He raised his brows and continued, “Didn’t you just publicly display your 
relationship on social media this morning? How come you fell out of love now?” 

To that, Mica simply snorted and said, “Who said that? You’re the one falling out of love, 
not me!” 

“How did you find out?” Elliot had no idea Mica’s words were just a random remark. 

After all, he had indeed fallen out of love. Even his father was getting emotional by the 
constant rejections he faced. 

However, Mica simply wiped her tears and turned her face away from him. 



“Well, since we’re both sad, I’ll let you off the hook.” Elliot then squatted down beside 
her and asked, “Why are you crying here?” 

‘I don’t want to talk about it.” Mica turned her face even further away from him. 

“Forget it, then.” He kept the tissue back to his bag and grabbed Mica’s arm, thereafter 
pulling her up. “Let’s go. It’s so boring to sit here alone with all those mosquitoes. I’ll 
take you somewhere fun to play.” 

“I don’t want to! I don’t want to meet anyone!” Feeling upset, Mica just wanted to be left 
alone. 

“Why are you so obstinate? I recall being very upset when I first received zero marks on 
my papers. However, as I gained more experience, I began to frequently play video 
games when I was upset, and I realized that it wasn’t such a big deal after all. 
Everything will be fine once you’ve vented your frustrations. Come on.” He was 
adamant. 

He had wanted to ask Sheldon along, but Sheldon was now putting in the effort to 
study, and Elliot did not want to force him. That was why he came to the bay area. 

Finally, he met someone who could accompany him; of course he wouldn’t let her go. 

“I don’t want to go!” Mica’s arms were pulled by Elliot but her legs remained motionless. 
“I’m stupid and I have no idea how to play video games! Everyone else will make fun of 
me!” 

“Who would dare to mock you with me around? Don’t be concerned. I’ll show you how 
to play.” Elliot then used more force to pull her up the stairs. 

“I really can’t! 

“Come on. We’re just having fun, not competing! It is the process that is important. If 
you can’t play later, just stand by my side and cheer for me! Let’s go!” 

Clearly, the extroverted Elliot triumphed over the introverted Mica. 

With that, she was then dragged to the video games center by him. 

—— 

… 

After the quarrel with Mica, Elise did not want to stay in the hostel as well. Hence, she 
called Alexander to pick her up. 



Just after she raised her head up after fastening the seat belt, she saw him staring 
astutely at her. 

“Why are you looking at me like this?” she asked, while smiling awkwardly. 

“You seem to be unhappy, Mrs. Griffith,” he teased. 

“I am indeed a little upset.” She exhaled a sigh and went on, “I had a little squabble with 
my roommate.” 

After she finished her words, she turned around and asked solemnly, “Alexander, tell 
me honestly—am I a busybody?” 

“Who dares to call my wife a busybody?” He pretended to be angry at that. 

“Be serious.” Elise gave him a grim look and said, “It’s a taboo to destroy people’s 
relationships but just now, I was asking Mica to break up with Sebastian. It doesn’t 
seem right for me to do that.” 

“Hmm.” After a brief moment of thought, Alexander raised his hand and stroked her 
head. “What you said is correct, but everything must be grounded in reality. I believe 
you will not ask her to end the relationship without a valid reason, so there’s nothing 
wrong with it. You did your part as a friend and it’s up to her whether she takes your 
advice. You don’t have to be upset or feel guilty about her choice.” 

“I truly regard her as a friend.” Elise’s gaze softened and a look of disappointment 
flashed across her face. 

Alexander continued to comfortingly stroke her hair and he diverted the subject of the 
conversation. “Smith Co. acquired a few emerald mines in Salt Stone City recently. Do 
you want to join me to have a look?” 
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Chapter 707 You Get Nothing Out of Knowing Me 

“Alright, alright.” Elise turned her head in his direction and mischievously asked, “So, am 
I going with Kenneth Bailey? Should I go with Alexander Griffith? Or, should I go with 
Kenneth as Mrs. Griffith?” 

After hearing that, Alexander let a laugh slip. “I will use whichever identity you want me 
to. It is up to you.” 

 



“I don’t want to,” she replied while turning away. “Should you go to Smith Co. as 
Alexander, I will feel bad for getting your years of cover busted if people were to find out 
that Kenneth and Alexander are the same person. On the other hand, I am sure your 
mother will cause a commotion and chew me out for cheating on you if someone were 
to photograph you as Kenneth. It would be better if you went by yourself. It’s your fault 
for faking your identity.” 

Alexander then faked disappointment as he sighed. “I have no choice but to take a 
closer look at the Peculiar Jadeite myself, then.” 

Her ears immediately perked up at that. Peculiar Jadeite? Is he talking about the place 
the radiation originated from? 

“I want to go!” Elise exclaimed, only to realize then that she had fallen into Alexander’s 
trap again. She grabbed his necktie and pulled him close to her. “Trying to trick your 
own wife, Mr. Griffith? That is not so nice, is it?” 

As if surrendering, Alexander raised his hands beside his face, but he still had a 
fearless smile on. “How can you call a husband-and-wife thing a ‘trick’? It is but the 
secret to keeping the relationship fresh, no?” 

“Keeping it fresh, huh?” Her desire to win against him had been aroused then. “Fine. 
Let’s see who can find more Peculiar Jadeite when we get to Salt Stone City.” 

“Are you sure you want to compete with your own master?” he asked with a pitiful look 
on his face. 

“Don’t you know that students often surpass their teachers?” Elise then released his 
necktie and pushed him back to the seat. Dusting off her palms, she challenged, “Just 
wait till we get to Salt Stone City. I will make sure I become your master instead.” 

… 

Mr. Howard invited Elise over to further discuss the company before her trip to Salt 
Stone City. 

Along with Winona, the women headed straight to a cafe right after they got out of the 
car. 

Just as they were in the middle of crossing the road, they could see a commotion 
starting at the square in front of the cafe. 

A bald man was blocking a beautiful woman at the entrance of the cafe. Seeing the 
glass bottle in his hand, no one around dared to step forward. 



The man suddenly roared, “Women like you are all sluts! We will see how you can still 
seduce another man if I were to destroy your face!” 

As soon as he said that, he opened the cap of the bottle, and positioned the bottle as if 
he was going to throw its content at her with both hands. 

“Watch out!” Elise subconsciously ran over and shoved at the man from behind. 

Caught unguarded, the man stumbled forward, and the glass bottle broke when it fell on 
the ground. The cemented area of the ground instantly turned black when the 
transparent liquid touched it. 

Some of the liquid had unexpectedly gotten on the man’s arm, making him pull back 
before he hugged it against his chest. He then started moaning in pain while he rolled 
around. 

It only took a second before what used to be a perfectly fine arm turned into a bloody 
mess. 

Seemed like it was sulphuric acid that was in the bottle. 

Elise didn’t even dare to imagine what would have happened if the man had 
successfully done what he intended to do. Disfigurement would have been the least of 
the beautiful lady’s concern. An acid attack could have led to death. 

Isn’t this too vicious? 

“Miss.” Elise looked at the woman, only to freeze when she realized how abnormally 
calm the woman was as she stood there. “Please call the police,” she said again. 

“Alright,” the woman replied with a nod as she took her phone out. 

As soon as the man on the ground heard this, he struggled to get himself off the floor 
before he scampered away. 

Elise was just about to chase after him when the other woman immediately followed 
after him and with a kick, sent the man lying flat on the ground. She brutally stepped on 
him again when he tried to get up. 

Her movements were so fluid that Elise could tell at a glance that she was trained in 
martial arts. However, Elise couldn’t help but be amazed by how mismatched the 
woman’s actions were with her elegant appearance. 

When the police finally arrived, Elise acted as a witness and went with the woman to the 
police station to give the police statement. 



By the time Elise had signed the necessary documents, she left the building, where she 
saw the woman waiting for her ride by the entrance. 

Elise swiftly made her way over to her and started a conversation, “You know kung fu?” 

“I took up boxing for a bit when I was an artist,” she answered without beating around 
the bush. 

Hearing that, Elise mused, “How dedicated to your job. I am sure it was a masterpiece. 
Can you tell me the name of the production you were in? I could learn a thing or two 
from it when I have the time.” 

“It is an outdated movie from 10 years ago. It doesn’t matter if you don’t watch it.” 

Even though the woman had a smile on her face the whole time she spoke, Elise could 
feel the sadness from her demeanor. 

“What about we exchange phone numbers?” Elise passed her phone to her. 

“No need for that.” The woman’s tone was gradually getting colder. “I am not an actress 
anymore. You get nothing out of knowing me.” 

However, Elise kept insisting, “But I want you to be my friend.” 

The woman turned to glance at her and as they looked into each other’s eyes, she 
whipped out her phone and sent a friend request over. 

Her ride happened to arrive right after that. 

“I will be taking my leave. See you, if we ever get the chance.” The woman indifferently 
threw out her goodbye before she got into the car and left. 

Elise then took out her phone and as she looked at the account name of the friend 
request sent, she let out an amused smile. “Hennessy Zea… Interesting,” she mumbled. 

Winona directly brought the car in front of Elise. After she came to a stop, she said to 
Elise, “Come on, Elise.” 

With a nod, Elise entered the backseat of the car. 

They soon came to a stop again when they arrived at a red light at a crossroad. 

Winona suddenly started gossiping. “Elise, did you know that the woman from earlier 
was Hennessy Zea? She was an international movie star back in the day!” 



“Is that so?” Elise wasn’t too surprised to hear this. She could tell from Hennessy’s vibe 
alone that the woman wasn’t a regular person. 

“Mhm!” Winona gave a solemn nod. “I used to love her movies. It’s a pity that it was 
revealed she committed adultery and tax evasion when she was at the top of her 
career. She never made an appearance on screen anymore after that. Her ex-husband 
is still a famous actor now, but his acting is pretty mediocre. I wonder why he is still 
famous after all this time…” 

Elise lightly nodded after hearing her words. “The entertainment industry is a rabbit 
hole. It is not easy to know what is right or wrong just from appearances alone.” 

“You’re right. I still think Hennessy is her old, charismatic self when I saw her earlier. It 
doesn’t make sense to me, though. She doesn’t seem like the type to—” 

Winona suddenly went quiet as she spoke, her eyes blankly staring to her left. 

It took half a minute for Elise to realize that something was wrong. She lifted her gaze 
and saw that the traffic light had turned green, but Winona still didn’t start driving. 

Sitting in the backseat, Elise was about to alert Winona when she saw something 
clearly from the corner of her eyes—a young man and a voluptuous woman were 
passionately kissing each other in the eye-catching red convertible on the west-to-east 
road on their left. 

Elise and Winona were not close to the red car, but due to the streetlights and the angle 
the man and woman were in, they could make out the man’s face when the couple 
detached from each other to banter flirtatiously. 

There was no one other than Craig who would do something like this. 

Other than the fact that this was more extreme than last time, it was a sight all too 
familiar to Winona. 

It was obvious that he had never paid attention to things regarding Winona. Because if 
he did, he would have noticed that the MPV that was parked at the junction was the one 
she had been driving everyday for the past few months. 

A few minutes went by before the light turned red again and just like that, the red 
convertible was gone in a flash. 

That satisfied and frivolous look of Craig’s face was somehow deeply imprinted on 
Winona’s mind. 
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Chapter 708 Jack Was the One Who Framed Me 

The silence that ensued felt very long. 

Time seemed to pass in a blur before Winona finally came back to her senses. Still, she 
put on an unperturbed expression as though nothing had happened while she calmly 
sent Elise back home. 

 

The two women who knew each other well didn’t say a word throughout the journey. 

However, Elise couldn’t hold herself back any longer after she got out of the car. 
Walking to the car window, she said softly to Winona, “Be careful on your way back. 
You can call me anytime if there is something.” 

It was probably because of what Mica had to go through that Elise didn’t dare intervene 
directly. 

“I’m alright,” Winona said with a bitter smile. She swiftly changed the topic by adding, “I 
might have to take a leave for tomorrow, though.” 

“It’s fine. I’ll be heading to Salt Stone City anyway. You can take a rest for as long as 
you need to, and you will still be paid your salary,” Elise stated with a chuckle. 

“Thank you, Elise.” 

Winona knew that this was Elise’s way of consoling her after what she had also seen. 

Still, she felt too weak to continue forcing a smile. 

After an unnatural smile appeared on her pursed lips, she made a U-turn and drove off. 

Elise only stood there by the roadside, an uneasy feeling in her chest as she watched 
the headlights of the car slowly being engulfed by the dark of the night. 

—— 

… 

Winona had only been driving for a while before she decided to give Craig a call. 

“Hello, Winona? What is the matter?” His voice only came from the other end of the call 
when it was about to reach the voicemail. 



She could tell from his unstable breathing that he must have just done some vigorous 
activity. 

“I want to see you,” she stated coldly. “Tonight, in fact. I will be waiting for you at home.” 

“Huh? Is this an emergency? I promised my bros I would stay up with them the whole 
night. I can’t just leav—” he started to give her an excuse, only for her to cut him off mid-
sentence. 

“I will be waiting for you at home no matter how late it gets.” 

She immediately hung up after she said that. 

That was when she finally couldn’t hold her emotions in anymore, and tears started 
falling down her cheeks. 

Her tears had already dried up by the time she reached home. 

After Winona went inside, she didn’t even turn on the lights before she blankly sat on 
the sofa without moving a muscle. 

It was until the wee hours of the next morning when the sound of the house door being 
unlocked came from outside. 

Craig pushed the door open and came in while yawning, and as he turned on the lights 
of the living room, he jumped in surprise when he saw Winona sitting there. 

“Winona?” His startled expression swiftly recovered into a concerned one. “What are 
you doing here? Why aren’t you sleeping in the bedroom? It is all my fault. I couldn’t 
leave because they kept holding onto me.” 

He sat beside her as he spoke and just as he was about to reach out to hug her, she 
quickly evaded him. “Don’t touch me,” she hissed. 

Despite that, Craig shamelessly continued to try to inch closer to her. “Okay, okay. I am 
sorry, Winona. It is my fault. Don’t get angry, alright?” 

“Did you not hear me when I said not to touch me?!” She suddenly roared as she 
jumped up from the sofa, shocking him in the process. 

“What is wrong, Winona? Are you okay?” 

“Don’t look at me with those eyes.” On top of not sleeping the whole night, Winona was 
hit by a sudden dizziness when she abruptly stood up. With her hand holding her head, 
she turned the other way and growled, “You are dirty.” 



Hearing that, Craig tugged on the jacket he had on and sniffed. He smelled like he had 
soaked himself in alcohol and smoke. “Oh, my bad! I will go take a shower, and then I 
will go to bed with you for a good night’s rest.” 

“There’s no need!” Winona stopped him. “There are things that won’t be clean no matter 
how many times you wash them. Tell me—how long have you been doing this?” 

“What do you mean by ‘how long’?” Craig continued to play the part of a loving 
boyfriend. “Don’t do this, Winona. It hurts me to see you like this.” 

She was starting to feel nauseous with every word he spouted. “Just stop. Let’s break 
up. I have packed up all your stuff and left them at the front door. You can leave my 
home after you take them with you. Let’s end this peacefully for old time’s sake.” 

“What? You want to break up with me? But I don’t want that!” Disappointed, Craig 
started putting on a pitiful act as his face fell. “I know that I shouldn’t go out and have 
fun with my friends because I have no income now. I might look like I am not serious 
about my work, but I only wanted to get my excess energy out of my system so I don’t 
burden you with my emotions. Regardless, I love you. I will not allow us to break up. 
You will know that I am not a hopeless case by the time I get back on track again.” 

Same meaning, different words. Winona had heard these no less than 10 times now. 

She would always end up with hot tears in her eyes whenever Craig spewed his 
nonsense in the past. Their quarrels would come to a resolution with her wiping away 
her tears as she envisioned the beautiful future awaiting them. Today, however, his 
words felt extra piercing on her eardrums. 

With her face drained of its color, she scoffed as she turned back and looked at him with 
eyes full of disdain. “You make it sound like I am the one who is putting pressure on 
you. Does this mean that I was the one who forced you to go to that rich woman? That I 
was the one who grabbed you by the head and pressed your lips against hers? Or that I 
pointed a gun at you and made you get into her bed with her?!” 

Craig immediately felt like he had been struck by thunder. “H-How did you know?” 

Without waiting for her answer, he blurted out, “It was Jack Griffith, wasn’t it? Was he 
the one who told you these? How could you believe his words, Winona? It is not like you 
don’t know how he got me blacklisted in the industry. That man must have had ulterior 
motives for telling you these lies. You can’t—” 

“Enough!” She didn’t give him the chance to finish his words. “It was not Mr. Jack. It was 
me. I saw you with my own eyes just now! I saw you driving that woman’s luxury car, 
and you even kissed her without a care on the street. You disgust me, Craig Baker!” 

Craig fell silent when he couldn’t find another word to say. 



However, the rich woman was only someone he wanted to be with for the moment. 
Winona, on the other hand, was his gateway to endless opportunities in the future. He 
couldn’t possibly let go of this coattail he had been riding on. 

A loud thud could be heard when he dropped on his knees to the floor. “I admit it was 
my fault. I won’t do this anymore. I don’t even know why I did it. They were the ones 
who came to me first. I had no choice… I… Right… I am sure it was Jack Griffith who 
got those people to frame me. He is trying to ruin me. You have to help me, Winona!” 

Looking at how unashamed Craig was behaving, Winona suddenly started wondering if 
she had been blind in the past. That was the only plausible reason she could have fallen 
for such a man. 

She coldly stared into the air, and not a trace of sympathy could be found on her face or 
her voice when she spoke again. “It doesn’t matter if anyone is helping or compromising 
with you. You have to be responsible for your own choices. I will pretend I didn’t see you 
today. There is nothing more between us from now onward. Leave the house key. You 
can go after that.” 

The expression on Craig’s face froze and his jaw dropped, seemingly in disbelief. 
“Winona Jennings, are you really going to be so ruthless to me?” 

She didn’t give him a reply. 

Silence was the best answer. 

Craig was still a man no matter what. He couldn’t possibly cry and whine like a woman 
would. He finally put down the key and with his luggage in tow, he left Winona’s place. 

Winona passed out as soon as he had stepped out the door. 

—— 

… 

Elise gave Winona a call before she got on the plane, only for it to go unanswered. 

Alexander, who was beside Elise, reminded her, “Let’s go. It is time for us to board.” 

“Coming!” 

Still worried about her manager, Elise quickly sent Jack a message via WhatsApp. 

‘Winona found out about Craig. I can’t get through her phone. I am worried that 
something happened to her. Please head to her house and make sure that she is 
alright.’ 



 


