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Chapter 1563

Wenren Tianyi and Wenren Tianqing inside the door didn’t even know that they had been spied on all
the secrets in the meeting room before.

They even had joking expressions on their faces, as if all the actions and thoughts of the sisters were
controlled by them.

Soon, everyone saw Wenren Qingqing and Wenren Qingxin turn back.

The two brothers Wenren Tianyi showed such a look on their faces and looked at them with a smile.

“Why? Don’t you want to understand the situation? Why did you come back so soon? Did you find out
some earth-shattering secret, so you can’t wait to report back as soon as possible?” Wen Ren Tianyi
said strangely.

But Wen Ren Tianqing immediately turned the two of them, “I don’t think it is necessary. I guess I went
out and made a round of calls. I didn’t understand any substantive content, so I came back dingyly?”

A trace of anger flashed across Wen Renqin’s face, just about to speak, but was held by her sister.

In terms of calmness, Wenrenqingqing still has a more general view of the overall situation, and is
relatively calm——

In addition to facing the puppy ratio.

Wen Renqingqing really wanted to play with this bad old man. She frowned first, and then she was a
little bit hesitant. “We did find out a big and very fake secret, and I don’t know if it should be said.”

Wen Renqin rolls his eyes straight aside, and it is inappropriate to talk about it in his heart.

Wen Ren Tianqing laughed directly, this little girl is still forcibly trying to save her.

He smiled and said, “But it doesn’t matter, I want to hear what the secret is that even you find so
absurd?”

Wen Renqing gave a smile, “Since it is the elder who said so, then I will say it, let everyone listen to it,
and judge whether it is true or false, and everyone will make a judgment in their hearts.”

She pretended to be surprised and said: “I just made a phone call and heard that the two elders made
some rebellious remarks at the Yuntian auction house.”

“Elder Wenren Tianyi keeps saying that the two of them are going to seize power in Xianghualixue and
want to be the sect master. The current sect master is not worthy.”

After speaking, she looked at Wenren Tianyi jokingly.

Wenren Tianyi’s face suddenly paled when he heard this!



His heart even jumped fiercely, with the illusion of jumping out of his chest!

Wenren Tianqing was even more embarrassed.

His body couldn’t help but tremble, as if the shameful secret in the deepest part of his heart was
revealed to the sun in an instant, for people to laugh at.

Wen Ren Tianyi and the two looked at each other faintly, their eyes filled with disbelief!

impossible!

How could this little Nizi know the conversation with Wiliam in the living room back then!

Only Wiliam and the two of them were present at the time!

These words were made to solicit Wiliam and let Wiliam see the situation clearly!

Even before speaking out, the two of them specially inspected the surrounding area of ​ ​ the
meeting room and confirmed that no one else was eavesdropping!

This is also the most important reason why they dare to say these words so blatantly!

Now I was told that I was so affectionate about it!

Where is the mistake!

Still Wenren Tianyi was relatively calm, and he quickly recovered his expression after a brief
consternation.
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Also immediately thought of the greatest possibility!

Wiliam told them both!

is not that right!

Isn’t this the situation Wen Ren Tianyi has been envisioning just now?

The twin sisters had such a good relationship with Wiliam, they would definitely call to ask Wiliam as
soon as possible.

Wiliam must have told them.

Thinking of this, Wen Ren Tianyi’s nervous heart just now gradually calmed down.

If Wiliam told them, it would be more stable, indicating that everything was under his control.



Thinking of this, Wen Ren Tianyi used his eyes to signal that the flustered Wen Ren Tianqing also
smelled steadily, and then looked at the people around him.

The people around, don’t mention how wonderful their faces are.

Those who understand, naturally understand.

Wenren Tiange’s face instantly turned ugly.

He watched Wen Ren Tianyi deeply and observed every trace of Wen Ren Tianyi’s expression changes.

The two brothers Wen Ren Tianyi want to seek the idea of ​ ​ usurping the throne, and Wen Ren
Tianyi as the enemy, will they not even notice it?

It’s just that the two brothers and Wenren Tiange kept silent in their hearts, and no one went to pierce
this layer of window paper.

On the one hand, the two brothers Wenren Tianyi felt that the time was not ripe, and it was
inappropriate for them to confront Wenren Tiange head-on.

On the other hand, Wenren Tiange has a softer personality, always thinking about brotherhood, and is
not willing to cruelly separate brotherhood.

Now, this secret was confided by Wenren, and Wenren Tiange had mixed feelings in his heart.

Has this day finally arrived!

The people of Wenren Tiange group are filled with righteous indignation, and they look furious.

Where it is placed, in any period, seeking to usurp the throne is a violent thing.

Shuzi dare!

The people of Wenren Tianyi’s faction were panicked one by one.

Like Wenren Tianyi just now, they felt nervous and at a loss as to what the secret was being made
public.

The scene became very awkward.

Only Wenrenqing loves the two sisters, watching a good show heartily.

At this time, Wen Ren Tianyi laughed, and his tone became cold, “This secret is indeed absurd, and
even makes people feel funny! I would like to know, where did you know such ridiculous claims, Wen
Ren Qingqing!” “

Wen Renqinqing frowned slightly, as if he didn’t want to say it, a little stubborn.

Wen Renqing couldn’t help but give his own sister a slight compliment.

Good acting!



“You said it.” Wen Ren Tianqing apparently reacted after a brief panic, and was almost caught in a
routine.

“Qing Qing, speak it out.” Wenren Tiange’s face was as sinking as water, and no one knew what he was
thinking.

Wen Renqing hesitated for a while before whispering, ” Wiliam told me.”

The voice is low and inaudible.

Wen Ren Tianyi smiled triumphantly, obviously he heard it.

And many people with high martial arts have heard it.

Wenren Tianyi even pretended to be inaudible, saying: “Who are you talking about? I can’t hear you
speak louder.”

” Wiliam! Wiliam! Wiliam! Now you are satisfied!” Wen Renqin looked annoyed into anger, his face
flushed slightly because of excessive force.

Wen Renqin applauded again.

Sister is great!

continue!

Push hard!

The people at the scene were astonished.

The air seemed to freeze.

After a brief astonishment, a frantic laughter rang out.

It is Wenren Tianqing.

Wenren Tianqing seemed to want to step on Wenren Qingqing under his feet, and even took a step to
face Wenren Qingqing.

” Wiliam! Tell me, that kid actually told you these absurd things?”

“You believed what he said? Isn’t this more absurd than the secret itself!”
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