
THE POWER OF THE FIRST DAUGHTER, DOCTOR 
AND CONCUBINE DOMINATES THE WORLD 

 

Chapter 16 Qi disease 

After Xie Zhiwei woke up, Bai Ling was beside him, chattering about what 
happened in Chunhui Hall yesterday, "I heard that the old lady fell ill as soon 
as the old man left, and for some reason, she didn't call a doctor." 

Xie Zhi smiled, if he invited a doctor, wouldn't he be mad by the old man? 

The old lady dare not!𝐟𝐫𝗲𝙚ｗ𝚎𝐛𝙣𝐨𝙫𝘦𝗹.c૦m 

Although the dowry has not been brought back yet, it will be soon! 

After freshening up, Xie Zhiwei went to Fuyun Courtyard. Mrs. Yuan had 
already returned from the hearing hall, and she was sitting in the open room 
drinking tea. After two cups of tea, she was still in a daze. 

Seeing Xie Zhiwei coming, Yuan Shi hurriedly got up, "Mei Mei, you are here. 
Early this morning, just after Mao o'clock, your second aunt sent someone to 
invite your mother, saying that she was the middle-aged son of the family in 
the future, and asked her to come with her. ,How is this going?" 

"I heard that the old lady's health has been bad. The middle class at home 
should be the mother's burden. The second aunt can't take care of it by 
herself. In the future, the mother should pay more attention to the middle 
class, so as not to let the middle class go. People say that the mother should 
be the shopkeeper." 

Ms. Yuan was stunned, the conscience of heaven and earth, it wasn't that she 
didn't care, but the old lady didn't let her interfere at all. Those people outside, 
who didn't know the ins and outs, arranged her like this. 

Seeing that Yuan's heart was moved, Xie Zhiwei hit the iron while the iron was 
hot, "Grandpa also said yesterday that this family will eventually be handed 
over to the long house in the future, and the second aunt is helping now, so 
we can't keep bothering the second aunt. However, in this way , I will work **** 
my mother in the future." 
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"Where!" Yuan Shi hurriedly waved her hand, "When I married in that day, I 
also knew that I was going to come in to be a housekeeper. I also learned 
how to be a housekeeper, so I am not as skilled as your second aunt. I am 
afraid of making mistakes and making people laugh." 

In the two years since Yuan Shi first entered the door, she made many jokes. 
She still suspects that her husband didn't want to stay in the beautiful capital, 
but went to the frontier because he was angry with her. 

"My mother is not familiar with all the circumstances of the family, so she is 
afraid of making mistakes. In a family like ours, whether it is a festival, a big or 
small birthday, or an annual ceremony outside, there are always rules to 
follow. Act according to the old rules, even if you can't be considerate 
everywhere, you will never make mistakes. If there is something my mother 
doesn't understand, there are still those women in charge. If they dare not be 
conscientious, mother can dismiss them at will." 

When Yuan Shi heard this, it was as if she had a bright light. She had already 
had her mother-in-law around her tell her that her daughter went to Chunhui 
Hall last night, and Xiao Shi sent someone to invite her to deal with it early this 
morning. Feed. 

Sure enough, it was Cui's daughter. She was so smart and full of heart. She 
couldn't bear it. Now that she has the support of this daughter, she will have 
the confidence in the future. 

Yuan breathed a sigh of relief, thinking that Xie Zhiwei was helping her in this 
way for his brother's sake, and said, "Your brother recovered from his illness, 
and he didn't have a fever again last night." 

Xie Zhiwei just came over from her younger brother, who was still asleep. She 
took his pulse and it was fine. She prescribed another prescription and 
reduced the dosage. 

Xie Zhiwei gave Zi Mo a wink, and Zi Mo handed the box of prostitution deeds 
she got from the old lady to Nanny Yu. 

"Mother, last night, when I went to pay my respects to my grandmother, I 
came here on purpose. I asked Zi Mo to pick out the contract of prostitution of 
Lianniang and Qiuhen. After a while, Nanny Tian will let the matchmaker 
come and take them away! " 



Sure enough, Yuan felt that the wives had guessed correctly. This reward was 
obtained by Xie Zhiwei for the eldest house. Otherwise, the old lady could be 
so good and even give up the long house's identity? 

Nurse Tian hugged the box and was so happy that she didn't know what to do. 
She wiped away her tears, "Ma'am, the eldest girl has grown up, and we will 
get better together in the future." 

God knows, after the wife came in, the servants she brought with her were 
found by the old lady for various reasons, some of them were dismissed, 
some were sold, and now there are only a few servants left to serve her. 

In the fifth young master's house, there is no room for people to stay at all, 
and people are replaced every three days, otherwise such a dangerous thing 
would not have happened this time. 

"Now the deed of prostitution is in our hands. Mother chooses those who can 
be used, and those who don't, and send them away. Even if some people are 
bought from outside to train them, it will be better than before." 

As soon as Xie Zhiwei spoke, the house was quiet, except for those who 
devoted themselves to serving Yuan Shi, everyone who squeezed in from 
other courtyards lowered their heads. 

Fuyun Courtyard has always been like a sieve. In the past, when Xie Yuanbai 
was at home, he asked for water several times a night. 

Now, the deeds of these people are all in the hands of Yuan Shi. Last night, 
there was a contest in Chunhui Hall. Now the whole family knows it. Everyone 
can see that the Xie family is about to change. 

The eldest girl is not a raccoon slave, she is clearly a tiger. 

The Yuan family is not useless, the Xie family has been in the hands of the old 
lady for more than 20 years. I have to be careful to back down, step by step, 
step by step. 

"Mother knows, after dinner, mother will ask someone to call the 
matchmaker." Yuan Shi glanced at the yard, some people can't stay, 
especially the people around Wu Geer, they have to change themselves no 
matter what. Otherwise, even Mei Mei can't sleep, will she dislike her as a 
mother who is too useless? 



After breakfast, Yuan Shi asked someone to go to her storeroom to fetch a set 
of ruby ??hair masks, and replaced the white jade bead flower on Xie Zhiwei's 
head with a ruby ??bead flower. Immediately, she was dressed in red, lotus, 
hibiscus, and gold. The satin skirt with makeup and the rose-scented cloud 
gauze skirt complement each other, adding a very bright beauty to her already 
bright face. 

As soon as the hour passed, Xie Zhihui was waiting in front of the door of the 
instrument. Xiao was worried and waited with her. 

Xie Zhihui became impatient with her looking over and over again, "Mother, 
my daughter just accompanied the elder sister into the palace. As long as 
there is no mistake in etiquette, nothing else matters." 

"You child, how do you talk? You finally got this opportunity to enter the 
palace. You must let the empress treat you differently, so that you will be 
better in the future." 

"Mother's words are wrong. I am the first daughter of the Xie family. As long 
as I don't make mistakes, no one dares to look down on me!" Xie Zhihui said 
solemnly. 

Ms. Xiao was so choked that she couldn't even speak. It was her own fault. In 
a fit of anger, she said, "You wait here alone. Mother has something else to 
do, so let's go first." 

She was afraid that if she stayed here for a while, she would be **** off. 

Just as Xiao turned around the screen wall and saw Xie Zhiwei walking 
towards her, she suppressed her anger just now. After Xie Zhiwei saluted her, 
she took a deep look at Xie Zhiwei's attire. It was as bright as the sun, and 
she couldn't help feeling jealous . 

The long room is really rich! 

But right now is not the time to worry about these things, Xiao ordered, "Sister 
Wei, your second sister will trouble you when you enter the palace. You are 
more sensible than her, so take care of her in everything." 

Xie Zhi smiled and said, "Second Aunt, you are too polite, they are all sisters 
from the same family, close relatives, why bother to see outsiders." 



"Big sister, you are here, let's go."f𝔯ℯe𝓌ℯ𝐛𝒏𝐨ѵel.c𝚘𝐦 
The two sisters got into the carriage. Although Xie Zhihui had a big heart, she 
was unavoidably nervous. On the way to the imperial city, she held Xie 
Zhiwei's hand, "Big sister, Mother Qiu told me a lot yesterday, but, in case I 
So nervous that you forgot what to do?" 

"Don't be afraid!" Xie Zhiwei was a concubine in her previous life, later 
became a princess, and later became a queen. She is most familiar with the 
etiquette in the palace. "If you forget, you can do what you see me do." 

"Big sister, how do you know the etiquette in the palace?" Xie Zhihui tilted her 
head, she had a round face, skin like snow, bright eyes and vermilion lips, like 
light clouds covering the moon. 

"Did you forget Mother Qiu?" Xie Zhiwei nodded his second sister's nose 
funny. She is a heartless second sister. She never looks at people with 
worldly eyes. She values ??feelings and rules, and she has her own way own 
style of conduct. 

In her previous life, she was in Lenggong. At that time, the second sister and 
her husband's family returned to Xie's house. She didn't know how to go to 
Lenggong to see her. The cloak is thin and strong, but full of energy, and said, 
"Big sister, none of our sisters have ever met a lover. We have accumulated a 
lot of virtue in this life, and we must marry a good man in the next life. The Xie 
family does not blame you, we We are a family, on Huangquan Road, we are 
still a family." 

Xie Zhiwei put his arms around his younger sister, looked at her, as if he saw 
the stubborn person in his previous life, his eyes felt a little sore for a moment. 

"Aunt Qiu is the dowry of the eldest aunt. She used to be an aunt in the 
palace, and she knows the etiquette in the palace best. I forgot, how stupid!" 

"How stupid are you, you just read too much and forgot everything else." 

While speaking, Xie Zhihui also forgot to be nervous. 

The car passed the state bridge and went to Panlou Street. The bustling 
crowd heard various familiar voices. Xie Zhiwei opened the curtain and looked 
out. On the streets on both sides, the southernmost end was an eagle shop, 
followed by jewelry stores, cloth shops, etc. Shops, spice shops and 
pharmacies, in front of the Panlou gate, chrysanthemums are used to tie up a 



colorful building, which is like flowers and birds, lifelike, full of fragrance, and 
full of prosperity. 

Seeing a pen and ink shop, Xie Zhihui became interested, "Big sister, we 
come out of the palace, so there is no need to rush back, right?" 

"It may be a little late to leave the palace today, let me go shopping with my 
second sister tomorrow!" Just in time, she was going to prepare some health-
preserving medicine for her grandfather. 

"Okay, okay, big sister, let's go together." Xie Zhihui felt that being able to be 
with her big sister would make everything she did happy. 

Ask for votes, do you like it? Ask for a ticket! 

(end of this chapter) 

 


