
The First Heir Chapter 2961 - 2965  
 

Chapter 2961 
Samuel was stunned for a moment before he looked at the white jade box with horror. 
That thing inside was trying to resist! 

Philip sneered. He had known about it long ago because from the moment he stood on 
the altar. The golden mark on his arm had been feeding him a warning message. The 
thing contained in the white jade box was definitely an existence that made the royal 
monster on his arm apprehensive! 

To be precise, it was a rivalry! 

It was a life form with the same existence as the White Marsh royalty. In other words, 
another royalty of the other shore was sealed in this box. Therefore, the mark on his 
arm continuously fed Philip a danger signal. 

The two of them just looked at the white jade box, at a loss. After pondering for a 
moment, Philip reached out the arm with the golden mark and grabbed the white jade 
box. 

In an instant, the golden mark on Philip’s arm dazzled! 

An extremely powerful aura appeared in the space. The aura that fell from the sky was 
so huge that everyone could not help but want to worship it! 

Rumble! 

The entire space began to shake. The shattered ground began to collapse, and gravel 
flew. 

Crack! 

Cracks began to appear in the space as if it would collapse at any minute! 

Buzz! 

A terrifying golden wave gushed out from Philip’s arm. A huge royal beast shrouded in 
golden light suddenly appeared behind Philip. 

It was the White Marsh royal family! 

Its whole body was golden and exuded a majestic noble aura. At the same time, the life 
form in the white jade box also glowed with white light, fighting against the golden 



airwave. The life form in the white jade box suddenly floated out, shaped like a white 
snake! 

Suddenly, this little thing enlarged and turned into a 100-meter long white snake. This 
big snake opened its jaws in a roar and accelerated the collapse of this space. The 
snake looked like a dragon but had the head of a snake with no limbs. It was covered 
with white scales and had two wings on its back. More terrifyingly, the snake had three 
heads! 

A Three-Headed Flying Serpent! 

The moment he saw the snake, Philip realized that it should also be a royal creature of 
the other shore. It must be an extremely powerful existence to trigger the golden imprint 
on his arm like this. 

Samuel was also shocked by the scene in front of him and shouted, “Royal White Marsh 
and royal Flying Serpent. You actually have the mark of the royal White Marsh on your 
body! This is a royal beast on the other shore! How could you have it? Impossible, 
absolutely impossible!” 

Samuel was extremely agitated. However, in the next second, the entire space began to 
crumble! 

Before Philip had time to think, he grabbed the white jade box and used the power of 
White Marsh to break the rules and powers of this place. He unleashed the power, 
swooped down, grabbed Layla and the others, and shouted, “Let’s go!” 

Samuel reacted instantly and shouted angrily, “After them! They took the ancient sage’s 
secret treasure!” 

Chapter 2962 
Immediately, Samuel and the other group gave chase! 

After the secret treasure left the altar, the previous restriction effect disappeared, so 
everyone recovered their strength. In an instant, various energy storms and attacks 
blasted at Philip. 

The black bear roared. The chimpanzee hammered the sky. The devil’s shadow 
writhed! 

The space was ravaged by tremendous energy and the power of rules. Philip and the 
others ran but quickly fell into this energy storm. 

Boom! 



The huge chimpanzee and black bear punched at Philip with terrifying energy 
fluctuations enough to destroy the world. Philip’s speed was already at the speed of 
sound, but he still could not escape. He had to turn around and counter with a few 
chimera fists! 

However… 

Boom! 

Philip could not withstand the terrifying attacks of these two at all. Moreover, in the 
devilish energy field not far away, Samuel and Hugh also attacked Philip. 

One person against four powerhouses of the seventh zone would die for sure! 

Lord Ludo shouted anxiously, “Philip, throw the secret treasure away! You can’t beat 
them!” 

However, Philip did not do so. He mobilized the energy and the power of rules in his 
whole body. A platinum sword of kingship appeared in the sky. The five-colored sources 
of kingship constantly rotated and finally turned red. 

Boom! 

In an instant, endless raging red energy surged from Philip and his entire body seemed 
to be covered in flames. The huge human-shaped fire chimera behind him roared and 
punched! 

Rumble! 

The world shook! 

Vast energy spread like waves. In this energy storm, a person was also sent flying. 

The masked man roared angrily, “Young man, leave the secret treasure behind or I’ll kill 
you today!” 

Samuel hovered in the air at the moment. His face was cold, and he shouted angrily, 
“Hand over the secret treasure! Otherwise, I can only do something against my will!” 

In an instant, the two powerhouses at the peak of the seventh zone, Hugh, another 
person at the early stage of the seventh zone, and the remaining seven or eight people 
of the sixth zone stood in front of Philip. 

Philip was sent flying by their combined attacks. He stabilized himself. His eyes were 
red, and his body was surging with monstrous fighting intent. He stuffed the secret 
treasure into his jacket and said with a sneer, “Come and take it if you can!” 



“How dare you?!” 

“Young man, you’re courting death!” 

Boom! 

In an instant, these people joined forces and attacked again! 

The humanoid fire chimera behind Philip threw chimera fists at them one after another. 
However, the attacks were diffused immediately. 

A devilish shadow roared angrily and slashed at Philip with a huge sword. 

Philip raised his hand and met the attack with a flaming chimera sword that appeared in 
his hand! 
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Clang! 

The sky shook, flames burned, and devilish energy surged. 

When the chimera sword collided with the devil’s sword, a huge energy storm exploded 
and formed a circle of energy ripples that swept the space with a bang. This terrifying 
energy ripple also accelerated the collapse of this space. Cracks appeared one after 
another, and the space began to collapse into fragments. 

Fennel led the others. They were fighting while retreating and kept looking for a way 
out. 

“The exit is over there! Quick!” Fennel found the exit and reared angrily. 

Everyone ran quickly! 

Lord Ludo did not want to leave. She looked back at Philip who was locked in a fight 
with several people and shouted, “No, I can‘t leave! He’s still there!” 

Fennel glanced at Philip who was caught in a fight over there and said with a hint of chill 
in his eyes, “We can’t stay here. We’ll only drag him down! Go!” 

With that said, Fennel grabbed Lord Ludo and tossed her out the exit. At the same time, 
the red dragon halberd in his hand turned into a red dragon and swept across the 
people sneaking up from behind. 

Rumble! 

Fennel fought with these people and shouted at 17 and the others, “Go! Take them out!” 



17 nodded heavily, glanced in Philip’s direction, grabbed Lord Ludo, and ran for the exit! 

On Philip’s side, he was caught in the battle and quickly fell into a disadvantage. 
Against two powerhouses at the peak of the seventh zone and two in the early stage of 
the seventh zone, Philip could only fight and flee. 

The other party’s attacks were fast and aggressive. 

“Young man, hand over the secret treasure, or I’ll take it after I kill you!” The masked 
man surged with terrifying energy pressure. 

The shadow of the huge chimpanzee behind him threw a punch filled with terrifying 
energy pressure. Philip defended passively and raised his hands to form a flame barrier 
in front of him. 

Boom! 

The chimpanzee’s punch hit the flame barrier. 

Anothe boom! 

The barrier collapsed, and Philip was blasted hundreds of meters away by the 
tremendous force. 

Puff! 

He spat out a mouthful of blood, and the angry flames in his eyes intensified. 

“You’re no match for us. I don’t want to kill a young human talent here, so hand over the 
secret treasure and I’ll spare your life!” The masked man shouted solemnly. 

Obviously, he did not want to kill Philip. All young talents were precious. However, 
Samuel had different thoughts. The devil’s shadow behind him was much stronger than 
Hugh’s and more realistic, like an ancient warrior in armor. The shadow slashed down 
with the sword in its hand, wanting to kill Philip in one blow. 

It was an attack from a powerhouse at the peak of the seventh zone. The power was 
shocking. With this attack, the impact of the collapse of this space was doubled. 

Rumble! 

The huge devil’s sword slashed down at Philip with raging devilish energy. 

Philip mobilized the energy and the power of rules in his whole body. A silver snake 
mark appeared between his eyebrows, and the flaming chimera sword in his hand 
buzzed constantly. He raised the chimera sword and clasped it in front of his chest. He 



activated the sword and enlarged it several times. The human-shaped fire chimera 
grabbed the sword and slashed away in a streak of red! 

Buzz! 

The world trembled! 

The chimera sword collided with the devil’s sword again. This time, a shocking and 
terrifying energy pressure spread all around! 

Crack! 

Half the space collapsed. Philip could not withstand this blow and was sent flying 
hundreds of meters away. 

Samuel did not expect Philip to have such a deep understanding of the rules of 
swordsmanship as he stumbled a few steps back. 

“I see. The rules of your swordsmanship came from him. It’s such a pity. If you still 
refuse to repent, I can only punish you on behalf of Heavenly Court!” Samuel said 
coldly. 

The shadow behind him once again held up the sword and slashed four or five times in 
a row! 
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The overwhelming four or five sword slashes went straight at Philip. Such a powerful 
attack was not something Philip could resist! 

He quickly stepped back and mobilized the energy of his whole body. The human-
shaped fire chimera behind him blocked the attack with the chimera sword in its hand. 

Clink! Clang! 

With several consecutive blows, Philip was engulfed in the monstrous black devilish 
energy. This blow seemed enough to split this space open! 

Boom! 

Philip was sent flying, his body covered in blood. The fire chimera behind him also 
suffered several wounds, and the chimera sword in his hand also cracked in several 
places. He wiped the blood that spilled from the corner of his mouth and could barely 
steady himself. With a fierce fighting intent in his eyes, he said angrily, “Again!” 

With a roar, Philip did not back away but attacked again! 



He raised his hand, and the human-shaped fire chimera behind him did the same! 

Philip drew a circle of fire with both hands in front of him, and the human-shaped fire 
chimera swung a circle of fire waves in the sky with the chimera sword. He roared, and 
the mark between his eyebrows shone brightly. The chimera sword formed dozens of 
swords neatly in a row in front of Philip, which aimed at Samuel and the others! 

In the air, dozens of huge chimera swords buzzed with heat waves constantly. 

“All swords unite!” Philip roared angrily, then the dozens of chimera swords in the sky 
buzzed and swooped at Samuel and the others! 

At the same time, behind Philip and the huge human-shaped fire chimera, dozens of 
longswords with fire waves appeared and transformed into a flaming dragon that roared 
and swept at Samuel and the others. 

This was Philip’s strongest blow! 

Samuel looked up at the sword formation shaped like an approaching flaming dragon. 
He waved his arm, and the shadow behind him roared. The devil’s sword in its hand 
enlarged several hundred times and slashed at the flaming dragon with overwhelming 
devilish energy. 

Clatter! 

The devil’s sword shattered a wave of sword lights. However, the flaming dragon also 
engulfed the devil’s sword and slashed at the devil’s shadow. 

Boom! 

An earth-shattering energy storm exploded. A huge force of impact rippled out with the 
two as the center. Like a nuclear explosion, the force drowned the whole space. 

The space barrier collapsed once again! 

The terrifying energy swept over everyone like a destructive storm. In this energy storm, 
the raging energy completely engulfed the shadow and the humanoid fire chimera. 

After everything dissipated, Philip was covered in blood and gasping for breath with 
blood dripping from both arms. The human-shaped fire chimera behind him also 
disappeared with a puff. 

On the other hand, Samuel’s shadow was cut in half and its sword was also broken. 
Samuel had several wounds on his body, but his injuries were nothing serious. 



With anger on his face, he stared at the weak Philip and said, “You lost! Hand over the 
secret treasure or be killed!” 

Philip lost… His current state was no match for Samuel at all. 
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Philip had put all his strength into the attack just now, plus the rotation of kingship 
power, before he could release the power in the middle of the seventh zone. Even so, 
not much damage was done to Samuel at all. 

That was the actual gap between the realms! 

Philip sneered and said, “Do you want the secret treasure? Dream on!” 

With that said, Philip turned around and ran away. Of course, he would run if he could 
not win. He could not foolishly wait to die. 

“You want to run?!” Samuel roared, and the shadow behind him stepped forward to grab 
Philip. However, at that very moment, this layer of space shattered completely, and a 
huge claw fell from the sky. Under the gigantic claw, the shadow was crushed like an 
insignificant ant! 

Puff! 

Samuel spat out a mouthful of blood and flew out. 

Everyone was stunned and stared at the sky! 

The huge black claw with tough scales suppressed the entire space. A claw that was as 
big as the entire space. 

Unbelievable! It was shocking and astounding! 

“What’s that?” The masked man asked coldly. 

Even a powerhouse at the peak of the seventh zone like him shook with chills. 

Too scary! 

This was just one giant claw. It was hard to imagine how big the thing behind this giant 
claw was. 

Could it be thousands of miles in size? 

When the giant claw pressed down, an aura that did not belong to the civilization of this 
world suddenly spread to the surroundings! 



Samuel immediately roared, “The other shore! This creature is from the other shore! 
The space barrier here has shattered and the passage has collapsed. The creatures 
from the other shore are about to invade this world!” 

Hearing that, everyone’s faces turned pale. 

The creatures from the other shore were about to invade this world! 

Did that mean that human civilization was about to suffer unprecedented destruction? 

Terrifying! 

Philip frowned. Judging from the aura on this giant claw, it was at least a half-step to the 
other shore. It could even be a pseudo-realm to the other shore. That aura was too 
terrifying. Just this giant claw had made them unable to resist! 

Just as everyone was dumbfounded and about to flee, an imposing green sword light 
suddenly descended from the sky. The rules and energy on this green sword light were 
like a vast ocean. It slashed on the giant claw. It cut off one sharp claw, which 
immediately gushed blood! 

Roar! 

A roar resounded throughout the space. The giant claw writhed and stirred up a 
terrifying energy storm! 

The existence behind this giant claw seemed like it wanted to force its way inside this 
world through the broken space. However, the intertwined power of rules in the void 
was preventing its invasion. Coupled with the green sword light from earlier, it was 
unable to move even an inch. 

“Damn it! Who dares to cut off a finger of mine? When I arrive, I’ll destroy this Land of 
Cage of yours!” A roar that shook the world with supreme imperial pressure swept over 
the area. 

A hunched figure suddenly appeared before everyone. It was a dirty old man with his 
hands behind his back. He stood proudly. He looked up at the giant claw that covered 
the sky and said with a snort, “The emperor from the other shore, the rules have not 
been broken and the time has not come yet! How dare you force your way in here? Do 
you think the human race is a pushover?!” 

Domineering! 

He reprimanded the emperor from the other shore in the sky. 

“Who are you? How dare you shout at me? You’re courting death!” 



The giant claw swung violently and grabbed the shabby old man with a force that could 
destroy the world! 

 


