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"But before that I need to give the four uglies some tasks to complete, also I 
need to inject my ’Immortality Serum’ and then we’re good to go to complete 
my first goal." Virus said as he started walking towards the lab. 

There the four uglies were still sitting waiting for their master to wake up, 
seeing their master come they jumped and immediately stood up coming in 
front their master saluting without any words. 

"The first thing guys need to do is to buy an Island without any inhabitants." 
Virus commanded, thinking the money won’t be enough as he had almost 
spent the whole 21 billion dollars in this short period of two years he started 
gathering money from all over the world as his bank account started 
increasing again. 

1,264,410,011 $ 

4,555,104,326 $ 

14,418,092,122 $ 

23,002,173,843 $ 

70,153,522,634 $ 

115,633,090,001 $ 

"hahaha, these monkey’s should soon cause a commotion and ruckus once 
again, it’s a little fun teasing them like this." said Virus after stealing endless 
amount of money from around the world. 

’You’re one of those monkeys too now master.’ The golden beauty and the 
four uglies thought inside amused, though they wouldn’t dare say it outside. 

And then looking at one of the Ugly robots Virus said "I’ve already made an ID 
for you and made lots of money ready for spending , go buy an Island in an 
underdeveloped country that doesn’t stick it’s nose in everything like here, this 
place is too small and eye catching for the next thing I’m going to do." Virus 
said with a serious face. 
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Looking at the three remaining uglies Virus said. "and you three, start making 
worker robots, make as many as you can as soon as possible, you guys can 
use the workers available in the building too, just make sure to be careful so 
they won’t learn the process’." This was his way of testing them and helping 
them gain experience, eventhough he could do all of them without even 
moving from the place he was standing he didn’t. he was already very much 

tired of doing those stuff and unless he had to, he wouldn’t.ｆ𝓇𝘦ℯ𝙬𝑒𝐛n𝐨νe𝙡.c𝑜𝗺 

"Yes master." the four uglies answered at the same time and each went to do 
their own things. 

"What do I do master?" the golden beauty said.𝙛r𝚎𝐞𝑤𝚎𝗯𝗻𝗼𝐯e𝚕.𝒄𝐨𝓂 
"you? you just stick beside me wherever I go and let me enjoy your beauty. 
But You have the most important job of them all, and that is to protect me 
against any kind of danger untill I’m strong enough." Virus replied to her 
question with a little tease along with being serious. 

"Yes master, I will protect you with all my life, I won’t let anything ever happen 
to you! I swear." the golden beauty said with absolute seriousness too but 
even her serious face made a funny and sweet atmosphere, amusing Virus a 
little. 

"I know you will lil beauty, Now I need to inject my ’Immortality Serum’ come 
with me." and then they went to the place Virus had placed the serum, inside 
the cabinet in the lab. 

taking the serum out he injected it directly to his right arm with his left hand 
and after that he said. "Done... this should take about three or four months to 
completely change my DNA and mutate and strengthen all the cells inside my 
body. but after it has done it’s job, I’m never gonna age forever." Virus said 
talking to himself. 

"but why doesn’t it come into effect immediately master?" hearing her master 
talk the golden beauty asked eventhough she had expected the answer would 
be the thing she was thinking. 

"well isn’t that obvious? imagine changing all the DNA in a body all of a 
sudden? how would that body feel?" Virus asked back. 

"Unimaginable intolerable extreme pain." The golden beauty answered telling 
the obvious. 



"bingo! You knew the answer already yourself." Virus said. 

"now that the injection is complete and everything else is being handled by the 
four uglies, let’s go complete my first goal." Virus said with a serious face 
making the golden beauty blush. 

After that, they started walking outside virus’ building. 

____________________ 

At the same time a huge commotion was caused all around the world, as 115 
billion dollars was stolen this time from all around the world. 

news agencies were going crazy reporting the news of this matter. 

"The ’Ghost Theft’ happens once again a little while ago, now let’s listen to 
one of our reporter’s interveiwing the Press Secretary Ari Fleischer about the 
matter of the ’Ghost Theft’ in the White House." an thirtyish years old looking 
young newscaster who was sitting behind a desk and broadcasting the major 
news on that channel said. 

Afterwards the scene changed to inside a conference room in white house. 

"we’re doing everything we can in order to find this criminal and we have 
already put this matter at the very top of every most wanted lists in all 
government’s organizations. Everyone is doing their best right now to find out 
who is the person, group or organization who has hacked the world and stolen 
this much money from the whole world, other countries too are doing their 
best and working together by sharing all their information and resources to 
find the person, group or organization behind this. now I’ll pick some of you to 
ask questions, you." Press Secretary Ari Fleischer said as he pointed at one 
of the reporters who in return asked. "how much is the stolen money this time 
and what’s the president saying about this?" 

"The stolen money this time is being counted world wide and is estimated to 
be around 100 billion dollars give or take." Press Secretary Mr. Fleischer said. 

"And Mr. President is very angry about this and has allowed to use every 
source available in and out of the country." Press Secretary Mr. Fleischer 
continued. 



Almost all of the governments around the world were going even more crazy 
trying to track down either the money or the stealer. 

even the largest or smaller companies in the world were going nuts as lot’s 
their money was also stolen. 

while all this was happening the person who was the reason for all of this was 
trying to get laid. 

____________________ 

After going down with the elevator everyone in the building was looking at the 
new charming man and the golden beauty, they had seen the golden beauty 
couple times wandering inside the building, but this was the first time they 
were seeing the new gentleman beside her, all of them thought unconsciously 
he was the most handsome and charming man they’ve ever seen, women’s 
cheeks turned red unconscously while men became extremely jealous of him, 
cursing the heavens for being this much unfair. 

Both men and women were captivated by the man’s handsomeness and 
charm and they were even more captivated as the golden beauty walking 
beside him complimented him to perfection. 

Seeing them walk together, all of them thought they were a match made in 
heavens eventhough the men were jealous of Virus while the women were 
jealous of the golden beauty. Without bothering himself with others’ gaze for 
even a second Virus walked outside along with the golden beauty, and 
outside as he had ordered, a Matte Black Lamborghini Aventador roadster 
was waiting for him. 

Walking beside the car he lifted the door open, and from the other side the 
golden beauty also opened the door and went inside. 

She was very excited inside as she was seeing and talking to her master in 
his real body and they were even going to go outside together, though she 
didn’t know why or where they were going outside all of a sudden. 

Turning the engine on Virus put his feet until the end on the gas pedal as the 
Lamborghini disappeared into this full of light city which was surrounded with 
the darkness of the night. 

 


