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Chapter 121 “How did you become the alpha leader of the north region if it 

wasn’t passed down to you from your father?” Athena asked with a confused 

frown. 

“Oh, we don’t become the alpha leader by inheritance or by defeating the alphas 

in the region. ” Dominic answered with a small shrug, making her confused. 

“Then how do you become the leader?” Athena asked with a frown as everything 

started to get messed up in her head again. She thought one has to fight for the 

position. 

“Of course, we are chosen by the moon goddess, Athena. Didn’t you know that?” 

Dominic asked, he was very confused that she didn’t know such an obvious fact. 

“No, genius. I didn’t know that. Because I didn’t go to any high school, does that 

ring a bell?” She said in a sarcastic tone while rolling her eyes at him, making him 

look at him sheepishly Then he nodded at her in an understanding way. 

“Yes, Athena. I am sorry I forgot it. But yeah, the moon goddess chooses the 

leader. Because the strongest one can be evil as well.” He explained and she 

nodded at him, understanding what he meant. 

“But how do you know that you are the selected leader?” Athena asked in 

confusion, not understanding how it works. 

“Oh, that. At the red moon night which comes once in twenty years, she selects 

the leaders. By …” He trailed off, unsure if he should share this with her or not. 

“By?” She asked in an anxious tone. She didn’t know why but she felt like 

something big was coming 

“By blessing us with tattoos… which we both have…” 
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122. First meeting 

“Wha-…?!” Athena couldn’t complete her sentence after coming out of the shock when 
loud banging on the door made them jump and sit up straight. 

“MOMMY! MOMMY! MOMMY!” Ace’s loud crying was heard from the other side of the 
door, making them forget everything that was happening before that. 

 

“Oh my god! Ace! He is crying. I am such a terrible mother!” She exclaimed in shock 
and panic filled tone. 

She was going to get down from the bed immediately, without looking around and 
completely forgetting the state they were in. She forgot that she was completely naked 
and filled with Dominic’s marks. But obviously Dominic didn’t forget about that and 
stopped her exactly at the right time by holding her hand. 

“Stop… stop… stop, Athena!” Dominic spoke up with an amused chuckle. His eyes 
were filled with amusement as he imagined about the disaster that might have 
happened if she had ran to open the door in that state. 

“What?! Why did you stop me? Can’t you hear? Our son is crying.” She scowled at him. 
Her mind was so focused on going to Ace and in calming him down that she still didn’t 
realize the situation. 

“I can definitely hear him crying but at the same time I can imagine him being sacred for 
the rest of his life. ” He joked with a teasing smirk, making her frown. 

“What do you mean?” She asked in confusion. 

“Oh my god, Athena. How cute you can be?! You are naked, love! You aren’t wearing 
anything.” He exclaimed while laughing out loud when he saw the look of realization 
drew upon her. Her face instantly turned red in complete embarrassment. She 
immediately hid her face behind her hands. 

“Oh my god, Dominic!” She exclaimed but before Dominic could hug her to comfort her, 
Ace’s little hands banged on the door once again. 

“Mommy! I miss you mommy!” He cried once again. 

“You go to the washroom and get dressed. I will handle our little champ till then.” 
Dominic said while getting up and getting dressed. She quickly nodded at him before 
running toward the washroom without 

wasting any more time. 



He chuckled at her once again before walking toward the door while buttoning up his 
shirt buttons. 

This is going to be their first interaction where they are both aware of each other’s 
identity. 

With a deep breath, he opened the door, only to meet the tear filled innocent eyes of 
Ace looking up at him with a lot of complaints and hope. Within a blink of an eye, he felt 
a soft force and looked down to see Ace hugging his legs. 

“Papa, I missed you.” 
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123. Completed 

“Wh…what did you call me?” Dominic asked in a shook tone while kneeling down in 
front of Ace. 

Even though Dominic tried to pick him up but as if all the strength from him was taken 
away the moment Ace called him ‘papa’. So, when he couldn’t feel his hands anymore, 
he dropped to his knees with slouched shoulders. His eyes were teary and his hands 
were shaking badly as he raised his face, trying to touch Ace’s face. But he was afraid 
that Ace might disappear if he touched him. 

 

“Papa… I missed you…” Ace cried out before opening his arm widely and jumped on 
Dominic. Dominic quickly caught him, hugged him back, coming out of the shock.. Ace 
started crying louder than before after getting into the embrace of his father. 

“Oh my! I missed you too, my baby. My champion. I love you so much. Call me ‘papa’ 
again.” Dominic couldn’t stop his cries anymore as he sobbed out loud while holding his 
son tightly in his embrace. 

He couldn’t explain how sensitive the situation was for him. He felt truly blessed after 
having him in his life. 

“Papa! Papa! Papa!” Ace shouted, suddenly giggling out, finding his father’ s demand to 
be really silly. “Do you like hearing ‘papa’ from me?” Ace asked with a toothy grin while 
pulling away from the hug to look at his father. 



“Yes, I love to hear that from you. Call me ‘papa’ again.” Dominic said while wiping 
away the tears which were not stopping at all. 

“Papa, you are just like mummy.” Ace giggled while hiding his mouth behind his little 
palm. 

“How, champ?” Dominic asked in a confused tone while having a small smile on his 
face. 

“Mummy also loves to hear ‘mummy’ from me. She used to make me chocolate muffins 
in exchange for a lot of ‘mummy’ from me.” Ace said and laughed out loud. 

“What are you guys talking about behind my back, hmm?” Suddenly Athena came out 
from the pillar where she was hiding, with a big smile on her face as well. Seeing the 
bond between her child and the father of her child was the best scene ever. 

“Mummy!” Ace exclaimed loudly and within a second came out from his hold and ran 
toward Athena. She was quick to pick him up. “I missed you, mummy.” He said with a 
pout while hugging her tightly. 

“I missed you too, baby.” Athena kissed his cheek. 

“Papa, come here! Group hug!” He exclaimed loudly and Dominic couldn’t wait there 
anymore. 

He quickly headed toward them and engulfed them in his safe and protected embrace. 

“Today I feel completed.” 
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124- In the closet 

IN SUZANNE AND NATHAN’S MANSION 

 

“SUZANNE!” 

Suzanne jumped in fear at the loud voice and the glass filled with water which she was 
holding fell down from her hands. 



“Oh, my god, Suzanne! What’s wrong with you?! Where are you lost?!” Nathan 
exclaimed loudly in shock and worry before running toward her fast. 

“Oh, what happened?” Suzanne asked in a lost and confused tone and was going to 
step forward on the broken glasses when Nathan quickly pulled her back. 

“What’s wrong with you, Suzanne?! Where are you lost?” He asked while hugging her 
close to his chest, looking down at her worriedly. He was afraid for her. He didn’t want 
her to get hurt. 

“Huh, what’s going on?” Suzanne asked, sounding really confused about her state. She 
looked as if she wasn’t there. She looked as if she was somewhere else and she was 
pulled away suddenly. Nathan looked at her in confusion after realising the same. 

“I have been calling you for the past ten minutes but you seem to be lost somewhere. 
And why the hell are you so cold? Are you okay?” He asked while touching her face 
with a big frown on his face. She was as cold as the ice at that moment and it worried 
him beyond limit because it is not possible to be so cold and not be dead. 

Suzanne looked a little shocked and scared after hearing him. She looked as if she was 
caught while doing something. 

“Uh, nothing is wrong, Nathan. I just came out from a hot shower which might have 
made my body cold. 

And I am sorry, I was just…lost in some thoughts..?” She said which sounded more like 
a question. 

“What thoughts?” Nathan asked with a small frown. 

“The thought of my past.” She didn’t take time to answer. 

FLASHBACK 

“It’s okay, Suzy… you are okay… Everything is okay. Stay inside the closet some more 
time and dad is going to calm down soon and then you can come out.” A little girl 
whispered to herself who was hiding in a closet at that moment. 

She kept mumbling self assuring things to herself while rocking herself back and forth. 
She was hardly seven or eight years old but she was a really small girl compared to her 
age to fit into the small closet. And the look on her face was nothing compared to her 
regular terror. 

She was hiding there from her father. He was not afraid of her father. She loved her 
father a lot. She knew her father loves her a lot as well. It was just the… beast that 
resides inside her father. 



A wolf. Not everyone’s wolf is a beast like her father’s but her father’s wolf has turned 
into a monster 

because of her mother. She didn’t understand it but that’s what her father explained 
when the beast was sleeping. He said that his wolf had gone mad because her mother 
died. Her father gave her the idea of hiding inside the closet whenever the beast was 
out. 

Suddenly she realised something. All the noises stopped all of a sudden. There was no 
shouting. There was no sound of breaking things. There was no growling. No nothing. 
She couldn’t hear anything at all. 

“Did dad go outside for a run to calm himself down?” She asked herself with a small 
frown on her beautiful face. 

“Maybe. That’s why everything is so calm. Yay, that means I can come out of the closet 
now. Fun!” She exclaimed to herself in happiness while slowly pushing the door open. 

She peeked outside carefully to check if her father’s beast was hiding anywhere or not. 
But she didn’t find anyone. She slowly came out and stood straight. 

“Papa?” She whispered out loudly and walked out of her room to look for her father. 

“Papa, are you here?” She asked once again, this time raising her voice some more. 
But there was no response but suddenly she didn’t feel good. There was some bad 
feeling which settled in her stomach, making her eyes teary. 

“Papa, I am scared. Where are you? Papa…” She suddenly started to cry out loudly as 
she ran upstairs to look for his father in his room. She didn’t know 

why but she was scared. She was scared of losing her father. 

Was she going to lose her father? No, right? Then why was she getting this kind of 
feeling? And why was she getting this kind of picture in her mind where her father is ha-
…. 

“Papa?” 

She just reached her father’s room as she called him but soon her voice died in her 
throat as she looked at the scene in front of her where her father was 

HANGING WITH THE CEILING FAN. 

“PAPA!” 



And that’s how her tone changed from questioning to shock and despair as she fell on 
the floor. Her mind went blank at that moment and what happened after that was still 
blurry until she got the second shock on the same day. 

The shock of being banished from her own pack because- “Her parents were the 
backstabber who got the princess kidnapped.” i 

That’s how her life ended and she was born new that day. She was hardly eight years 
old that time and going a rogue at that was harder than anything else in the world. 

She was terrified. She didn’t know what to do, how to survive. Those hungry wolves 
were behind her young flesh, chasing her for miles to eat her. Her mind was giving up 
but her leg didn’t. Only she knew how hard it was. 

Still she managed to survive. She learned to look past everything and started newly. A 
new life. Where she was seeing everything from a new light. A light which was full of 
positiveness and kindness. 

She didn’t behave rudely with anyone ever or caused any intentional harm to anyone. 
She accepted everything in her life with a smile until now. 

Until she had to face her past again and that too through the closet person of her life. 

How was she going to handle that… 
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125. Didn’t bought it 

“Dominic, can you please come with us?” Nathan asked with a little bit of urgency in his 
tone which made Athena frown. 

 

Athena who was putting a morsel in Ace’s mouth stopped doing what she was doing 
and looked at Nathan with a frown. She didn’t like the tone of Nathan. It was filled with a 
tense feeling. He seemed worried about something and that immediately made her 
worry more. 



It was the first normal day and dinner of their lives. All three of them cooked dinner 
together for the first time like a real family. But now it was ruined because of something 
that happened. It seemed like the whole world was against her happiness. 

Anyone could understand her frustration and Dominic could feel her frustration through 
the mate bond. 

She was hella pissed. 

“What is it, Nathan? Did something happen?” Athena asked in a cold and intimidating 
tone while looking at him with squinted eyes. She was literally glaring at his soul. That 
was so intimidating that Nathan looked away from her immediately and looked at 
Dominic for an escape. Dominic immediately understood and shook his head a little 
before looking at Athena. 

“Athena, don’t scare the poor soul. Why don’t you continue feeding Ace. I will be back 
soon and then we both will have dinner together. Trust me, it won’t take much time.” 
Dominic quickly explained without giving her any chance to say anything. He just 
wanted to walk away from there as soon as possible and return back to her after getting 
done with it. 

“Wait!” Athena snapped at him, making him stand straight and close his eyes tightly. 

But Athena wasn’t going to let it go so easily. She was adamant at that moment and that 
shows her displeasure to let Dominic go at that moment. 

Dominic gulped down, knowing that it was going to be hard for him to convince her. 

Athena looked down at Ace who was busy playing some wolf running game on her 
phone. He didn’t have any attention toward the adults. Athena knew he was going to be 
stuck there until she was done with the conversation with them. So, she put another 
morsel in his mouth and walked toward Dominic. 

She stood in front of Nathan with her arms crossed and gave him the same intimidating 
look which made him squirm in his place. 

“I asked you a question, Nathan. Did something happen?” She asked in a cold tone. He 
gulped yet again and looked back at Dominic for help who shrugged his shoulders at 
him, leaving him on his own. 

‘Do whatever you want, say whatever that comes into your mind. Just don’t let the 
actual thing out if it’s something serious. Make up something fast, don’t let her doubt.’ 
Dominic’s mind linked him, making him glare at Dominic. He gave Dominic an 
unbelievable look. 



‘What a great leader you are! Leaving your companions in the middle of the battlefield!’ 
Nathan scoffed at him through the mind link. 

‘The person you are battling against, I can only have white flags in my hand in front of 
her, not any sword.’ Dominic said, making Nathan sigh. 

He couldn’t say anything after that. Even though he was afraid of messing up in front of 
Athena, at the same time he was proud of Dominic. He loved hearing Dominic declaring 
that he was always going to submit in front of Athena. 

His boy was in love! 

“Nathan! Are you buying time to make up a lie? Don’t even try it. Tell me what’s going 
on? Why do you need him at this time? It’s so late.” Athena said with a deep frown, 
adamant to not to let Dominic go without knowing the reason. 

But it was too late. Nathan came prepared already. So, he was confident. He looked at 
her with a strained smile, trying to look normal. 

“Oh, Athena. I am sorry if I caused you worry by sounding urgent. Please don’t worry. 
It’s nothing. It’s just that I am in a hurry for dinner as well. Suzanne is waiting for me.” 
Nathan explained with the same smile, trying to sound as casual as possible. He 
smartly passed the actual question and gave her the assurance she unknowingly 
needed. 

‘That was a smart move.’ Dominic couldn’t help but praise him and he felt happy after 
getting praised by his alpha. 

“You still didn’t answer my question, Nathan. Why do you need him?” Athena asked 
with a frown, almost letting go of the worry after hearing his explanation. 

“It’s just the paperwork which needs his signature. We had some project of development 
with a neighbouring pack which was supposed to start from tomorrow after getting a 
pass signature from Dominic. But as he was in a coma, it got delayed a little. We need 
to start the project tomorrow only. So, we need the signature today and send it to the 
neighbouring pack so that they can continue with the work on the exact day as 
previously planned.” Nathan explained in one breath and took a lot of deep breaths as 
soon as he was done. 

The look of confidence didn’ t weaver from his face as he patiently waited to hear 
something from her. She silently judged him for sometime, a few seconds, before 
directly looking away from him and walked toward Ace. She walked past Dominic and 
didn’t even look at him. 



“Fifteen minutes. You have exactly fifteen minutes to return back to this dining table and 
have dinner with me if you don’t want to sleep in the garden tonight.” She said in a cold 
tone and continued to feed Ace again. 

Dominic and Nathan shared a confused look. They couldn’t understand what was going 
on in her mind. They couldn’t understand if she bought the lie or not and it made them 
anxious. But they decided to not to poke her more at that moment and take the 
opportunity. They can think about the rest later. 

“I will be back in exactly fifteen minutes, love. After all, what are the uses of these 
powers if they can’t save me from sleeping in the garden?!” Dominic joked before 
turning around to leave with Nathan quickly. They didn’t want to waste another second 
there. 

“Oh, Nathan?” Athena called him at the end moment, making him turn around to look at 
him. 

“Yes?” He asked innocently yet anxiously. 

“Too much explanation and smiles can be anything buttrue.” 

That’s what she said while feeding Ace with a smile. 

She didn’t even look up at them yet managed to kill them with her look. 
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126. Guard’s mate 

“Ugh! How could I get caught?!” Nathan exclaimed in shock and disbelief as they both 
kept walking fast toward the pack house office. 

 

He still couldn’t digest the fact that his master plan was caught by Athena so easily. 

“You are thinking about that? I am still stuck at the smile she was having at the end. It’s 
still giving me chills.” Dominic said as he actually shook his head, as if he really got a 
chill run down his spine at that moment. 



“Oh, don’t even talk about that.” Nathan said with a nervous look on his face while 
opening the door of the office room where a guard was waiting with Justin. 

“Whoa, you came fast.” Justin exclaimed in surprise as he thought it was going to take 
time to convince Athena. “What’s wrong? Why do you both look like you have been 
chased by a ghost?” He asked with a frown as he couldn’t think of anything else seeing 
their faces. 

“No, we have been chased by a ghost smile.” Nathan said with a small roll of her eyes, 
confusing Justin more than ever. 

“What do you mean?” He asked. 

“Nothing, he meant nothing. Forget all these. Just start with the god-damned meeting. I 
have only thirteen minutes left.” Dominic scowled at them and that widened Nathan’s 
eyes. 

“Oh yeah, otherwise you have to sleep in the garden. Let’s hurry up.” Nathan said, 
immediately earning a glare from Dominic. 

The thing Dominic was trying to hide from the guard actually came out through Nathan. 
That stupid man! 

Justin’s eyes widened when he heard Nathan and he immediately understood what was 
going on. He got serious in no time after all he couldn’t let his best buddy sleep in the 
garden. But the guard was having a hard time handling his smile. 

His alpha, sleeping in the garden! He couldn’t imagine! 

“Enough now! Why did you call me? It obviously isn’t for signing some damn paper and 
what’s he doing here?” Dominic snapped in annoyance while looking at the intruder. 
Suddenly everyone got serious again. 

“Alpha.” The guard bowed in front of him to show respect which he accepted with a 
small nod. Dominic looked at Nathan to explain what was going on. 

“Dominic, he is one of our guards. And he has found his mate.” Nathan said and 
Dominic frowned hearing him. 

“And why are you telling me that? Do you want me to congratulate him?” He asked with 
a frown. He was being extra sassy at that moment because he was displeased after 
being called at this moment as well. Also the fear of Athena’ s threat was there as well, i 

“No, his mate is from the shadow eclipse pack.” Justin continued for Nathan without 
paying heed to Dominic’s sarcasm as he could understand him. 



Dominic frowned hearing him. 

“Derrick is torturing his mate as well? I swear to the goddess, I am not going to leave 
him this time if that’s the case.” Dominic said with gritted teeth and fisted hands. 

As a leader, he couldn’t bear anyone going through any bad experience luck torture and 
abuse. Nothing angers him more than an abusive man. He swore to protect everyone in 
his region when he promised to be their leader. And he was going to keep his promise 
even if that means killing an alpha. 

“No, it’s not that. His mate is actually off Derrick’s rader and she has been handling 
herself very well there. But the fun thing is, they found each other for a long time now.” 
Nathan said with a smirk, making Dominic confused. 

“For how long?” Dominic asked the guard with a frown. 

“One month now, alpha.” The man answered. 

“Why?!” Dominic asked with a deep frown, unable to understand why someone would 
stay away from his mate for so long. 

“She said she had something to do there before she left the pack and joined me here.” 
The guard said in a monotonous tone. 

“What is that?” Dominic asked yet again. 

“The destruction of her current alpha.” The man answered with his eyes held high, 
making Dominic shocked. 

“Why does she want his destruction and how is she going to do that alone?” He asked 
with a frown. 

“She didn’t tell me why yet, alpha. But she is going to once she is here. And how is she 
going to do that? By giving me the pack’s inside news.” The guard answered while 
looking away from Dominic. 

Dominic’s face went cold seeing him look away and he immediately understood that the 
guard was lying. 

“Stop lying to me, bud. You know that’s not going to end well!” Dominic snapped at him 
and the guard looked at him with widened eyes. He looked unprepared. 

“L..I’m… alpha, actually…” He tried to find words but gave up at last when he saw that 
he couldn’t win this against his alpha. He let out a sigh. “She didn’t tell me this yet but I 
heard from someone in the pack that-…” He trailed off, closing his eyes. 



“That?” 

“That she used to be the alpha’s ‘toy woman’ who promised to make her the Luna but 
he tossed her away after using her and hence she wanted revenge. I am not sure of this 
yet.” The guard explained and Dominic let out a sigh. 

“Do you realise this type of disloyal woman is dangerous for our pack as well?” Dominic 
asked. If the woman could betray her alpha, no matter how bad he was, he could betray 
him any moment. He didn’t want such troubles under his pack. 

“I understand, alpha. I have warned her of such things already, alpha and she accepted 
everything and apologised to me. She was ready to come with me and live as a low 
rank guard’ s mate for the rest of her life. She said that she had learnt her lesson and 
now wants to spend the rest of her life in peace.” The guard defended his mate hard 
and Dominic could understand where he was coming from so he let out another sigh, 
not wanting to think about this matter at that moment anymore. 

“And what’s that news?” 

“That alpha Derrick is planning to attack us at your ceremony.” 

“I would like to see him try. What’s the name of your mate?” Dominic asked while 
turning back to leave. 

“Amanda.” (Who’s Amanda?) 
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127. Long night 

The night after tomorrow night is the night. The biggest night of their lives. The biggest 
night of Athena’s life. She already marked Dominic to heal him but this time he was 
going to mark her. 

 

They already accepted each other as their mate. After the marking, there isn’t any 
turning back. It’s not like they are going to leave each other anyway. They can’t live 
without each other now. Heck, they find it hard even breathing. 



They are not going to let anyone or anything come between them again. They are going 
to fight against any attack, any evil, any power together and stay with each other. They 
were ready for anything. They are not going to let anything ruin the day after the day 
after tomorrow night. No one is going to let that happen. The pack members were ready 
as well. 

“What are you thinking of, Athena?” Dominic asked while hugging her from the behind. 

He had just come out from the washroom after freshening up when he didn’t find her in 
the bedroom. After looking around a little, he found her standing on the balcony and 
looking ahead. He was curious about where she was looking. 

The almost full moon or the mysteriously calm forest? 

“I am thinking about the day after tomorrow.” Athena didn’t hide her thoughts from him. 
She leaned her head back to rest her head on his toned chest. He hugged her more 
lovingly while looking at the moon, i 

“What about the day after tomorrow?” He asked. 

“What if something bad happens the day after tomorrow?” Athena expressed her fear. 
He already knew about it. Hence his hold tightened around her. 

“Don’t worry, even if something bad happens, I am going to turn it against them and use 
it for our good.” Dominic said with a hidden mystery in his tone. 

Athena was quick to read the mystery and immediately turned around to look at him 
with a frown. 

“What do you mean?” She asked in a serious tone. She felt as if something was going 
to happen and he knew about it but she didn’t ask about it directly. 

“What I mean is…” He trailed off with a thoughtful look on his face. He was thinking of 
how to explain things to her. “Let me give you an EXAMPLE. 

Suppose, someone is going to attack us that day.” He couldn’t continue when Athena 
snapped at him. 

“Who?! What are you talking about?” She snapped, not liking this at all. 

“I said ‘suppose’, love. It’s just an example. And it can be anyone. Derrick, alpha leader 
of the South, the rogues, any new enemy. Anyone. If they attack us, we are going to be 
prepared to welcome anyone and treat them the way they should be treated.” He said, 
making her confused. 

“What do you mean?” She was still confused. 



“I mean, if they deserve to be punished, they will be punished. If anything else is 
needed, we are going to be prepared for everything.” Dominic said, not explaining 
clearly. 

“I am very confused, Dominic. Is there going to be an attack?” She asked directly this 
time. 

“Why are you thinking about all these at this time? Forget it and leave it on me and time. 
lust focus on me now.” He said with a smirk. His posture and voice changed suddenly. 
She looked at him with a raised eyebrow. 

“What do you mean now?” She asked, knowing very well what he meant. 

“Give this night to me.” He said before claiming her lips for a hungry kiss and picking her 
up in his arms. 

He went inside the bedroom. It’s going to be a long night. 

He gently tossed her aside, making sure she didn’t bump into something. She has still 
not recovered properly from things that kept happening to her. He was aware of it but 
it’s hard to keep himself away from her anymore, especially after the hot yet innocent 
look she was giving him. All he wanted was at that moment to fuck her right there and 
quench the burn she had created inside him. 

He threw himself back on the bed as she lied right there in front of him. Through the 
deemed lights, she looked a hundred times more seductive. His guilty gaze scanned her 
from head to toe. She’s wearing a tank top with shorts, her cleavage slightly visible, her 
tempting breasts making his throat drier. She was staring at him anxiously with her two 
beautiful eyes, her fluffy lips shivering. 

How can a woman look so sexy yet adorable at the same time? He wondered. 

“Strip!” He husked out of nowhere as her eyes turned bigger. 

She parted her lips in shock. Her eyes refused to blink. 

“Didn’t you hear me, my love?” He raised his eyebrows, tilting his head. “I said STRIP!” 
His tone was soft yet commanding, making it hard for her. 

She took a while staring into his eyes and her hands slowly lifted to her top, shivering. 
She lifted her top and took it off slowly, revealing her tight breasts secured with that red 
bra. Hot breath gushed out of him as he watched her treat his eyes. 

Then she let her shorts go down. 



Her face had turned red and hot as she didn’t meet his eyes. Maybe because it’s the 
first time she has stripped in front of him like this. He liked to undress her every time but 
watching her stripping for him was the next level of satisfaction he could feel at that 
moment. 

She took her hand behind to take off the lingerie. 

“Stop!” He groaned. She paused right away and looked up. 

Getting onto his feet, he took off his coat, tossing it aside, and then his shirt. Her blazing 
eyes shivered when he walked towards her and cupped her buttock from behind that fits 
completely in his palm. 

“These were made for my hand only.” He said with a chuckle. 

Her cheeks turned hotter and rosier with his words. Then with just a single yank, he 
pushed her up into his arms, straddling around his waist as she wrapped her legs tightly 
around him. He held the back of her head, taking a fistful of her thick hair and seizing a 
feverish kiss from her luscious lips. 

Stepping towards the bed, he threw himself onto the bed and her back hit the surface 
first before he rose onto her body, trailing wet kisses down to her neck. She moaned 
simultaneously each time he kissed a section of her skin, greedily inhaling her addictive 
scent. 

“You smell different today.” He muttered, nibbling her neck. “But I like my scent on you 
the best.” He said while rubbing himself on her.. 

“I-,” she strived to speak when he teased her skin with soft bites. “I love that as well..” 
She moaned out. 

It made him smile how innocent she sounded at that moment. 

“Is that so?” He grinned and scraped her breasts over the lacy bra. She gathered the 
sheets and clutched them tightly, arching her back, her chest rising towards him as he 
watched her. 

“Dominic!” A set of hungry moans escaped her lips as he hungrily kissed her lips. She 
responded with each of his touches. 

He kissed her again, down to her neck, her wide bare chest. Wilder and harder. She 
hisses, whines and moans, driving him crazier and crazier. 

He didn’t wanna stop relishing this woman ever. 



“Dominic!” She whined as he nibbled her blossom gently and threw himself back. Her 
eyes turned bigger in urge and lust, desperation visible in them as if she was scared 
that he was gonna leave her like this. 

He smirked at the way she feared getting driven away from him. 

“Don’t worry. I’m not leaving you so easily tonight.” Chuckling, he walked back to the 
place where he tossed his clothes and spotted the tie. 

Turning around, he spotted her eyes stuck on him, those eyes showering heat with 
needs. He surged back to her and dug his knee in between her legs. Then he grabbed 
her both wrists tightly, leaning closer and inhaling her scent again. 

“This scent suits you, love.” He rasped, rolling his tongue across her neck as she 
moaned. “I love the way you smell like me.” He said in a loving tone. 

Husking, he yanked her hands upon her head and fastened them up with the headboard 
with his tie. She nervously looked up, terror filling her deep breathtaking eyes. 

“And I’m gonna fuck you until you smell like me.” He announced and her eyes widened 
hearing that. 

“Ssshhh!” He placed his index finger on her lips and smirked when she was going to 
say. “I told you to use these pretty lips to moan for me.” He said with a smirk. 

“Dominic.” She panicked. “What is this? Open me.” 

She looked afraid suddenly, her body vibrating badly. He leaned closer and kissed her 
sweet lips to decrease her fear. 

“Relax!” He husked near her face and looked deeper into her fearful eyes. “You trust 
me?” He asked. 

Her eyes calmed down with his words right away and her body slowly relaxed. 

“I do.” She said, looking straight into her eyes. 

It seemed like the entire scenario and environment had changed between them with 
that piece of conversation. He kissed her passionately this time and ripped off her 
lingerie, getting her naked in his arms. 

He found the blindfold under the mattress and wrapped it around her eyes as she 
breathed heavily without resisting, 



Kneeling between her legs, he placed his fingertips on her forehead, slowly sliding them 
down to her face. As soon as his fingers reach her lips, she parts her lips greedily to 
catch his fingers. 

“Is that what you want?” He teased her while chuckling as she struggled to take his 
fingers into her mouth. “Such a dirty girl you are, huh! But I love it.” He praised 
immediately, not to make her feel embarrassed. 

He slipped his two thick fingers into her mouth as she feverishly wrapped her lips 
around them, sucking them with passion. He groaned, staring down at her and 
imagining how it would feel if it was his cock instead of his finger. What a fucking great 
feeling that would be! 

He took his fingers out of her mouth, coated with her saliva as she gasped for air. 
Sliding his knuckles down across her naked body, he delivered goosebumps all over 
her. She vibrated and moaned, unable to see and move her hands. 

Moving down to the apex of her legs, he parted them slowly and inhaled her feminine 
scent. It worked like a drug and he felt his head getting heavier, his body starting to melt 
with hers. She was dripping harder when he claimed her dampness. 

“Oh, God! Dominic!” A scream of pleasure escaped her mouth as she struggled with his 
tongue hitting her blossom. 

He lifted his gaze at her, continuing to devour her down there. That sight of hers tied in 
the blindfold, screaming and moaning his name, her body suffering from his lusty 
assault, wanting more. It was nearly heaven for him. 

“Dominic, Ahhh-” 

She was struggling to move her hands. 

He knew she always wanted to hold him tightly and scratch his skin when a sensation 
hit her. He noticed this about her. 

“Wanna hold me, love?” He asked in a husky tone. 

“Y-yes..” She huffed. “Open me, please. I wanna touch you.” She whined in a desperate 
tone. 

“That’s already a much smaller punishment. I’m being considerate enough. You better 
take it.” He said in a teasing tone, making her whine more. 

“Oh, God!” She yelped as he sucked her core, biting until it’s swollen with his mark. 



Her scream subsided and the blindfold went wet completely. She was breathing and 
shivering. Her clit had swollen red when he finished. 

“Tired already? I thought you would ask for more?” He teased.. 

“Yeah. I want-” She stammered. “Love me, please. Don’t leave me, please.” She 
whined, it was new for her but she was loving every bit of it. 

“I’m not leaving you tonight anyway.” He groaned out. Making sure the tie around her 
wrist is loosely attached, he gripped her ankles and turned her around. She was laying 
upside down upside down. Her stomach brushed across the bed. 

“Dominic!” Her voice is alarmed. “What- what are you doing?” She asked in a shaky 
tone. 

He didn’t reply to her and lifted her hips, sliding his arm under her stomach. 

“I’m not sure your swollen clit can take me any longer. ” He shrugged, unbuckling his 
belt and heard her gulping down in fear, anticipation and excitement. 

She was too nervous as she seemed as if she had got to know what he was gonna do 
next. Landing his palm on her ass cheek, he rubbed it wildly. She parted her lips wider 
and huffed. 

“You are doing whatever I am asking you not to do. You have not been obedient 
enough, Athena..” He groaned while reminding her about a ‘punishment’. 

‘That freaking woman I can’t resist.’ Dominic’s wolf said and it made him grin. 

“Are you going to punish me?” She purred, she was completely out of the general 
thinking state of mind. She was drowned in pleasure. 

“Do you think you can take it?” He asked with a smirk. 

“I trust you.” She whispered. 

“I won’t go easy with you. Think twice.” He told her, controlling himself with many 
difficulties. 

“I don’t want you to be easy, Dominic. Do what the fuck you want. Love me the way you 
want tonight.” She groaned and for a second it felt like a new soul of hers had gotten 
into her. 

“If that’s what you want..” He whispered. 

He spanked across her ass as she let out a soft cry, more of pleasure. 



“Does that feel good, my love?” He yanked her hair from behind, not so roughly, and 
kissed her wilder. He spanked her again as she moaned into his mouth. 

It’s not even as hard as he had thought it would be and her soft moans said how much 
she enjoyed that. Seemed like it’s more like a reward than punishment to her. 

Who cares? He freaking enjoyed her response. She loved it. They didn’t need anything 
else. 

He felt his erection getting overwhelmed, wanting to dig deeper into her hole and make 
her scream in both pleasure and pain. Needs to cram inside him, her moans making it 
hard to wait any longer. He rubbed his length against her ass cheek as she shivered 
with a whimper. 

“Ummm-Dominic” 

“Yes, baby. Moan my name. Just like that” 

“Ah! Please-stop” 

“Stop what?” He smirked, figuring out her pleasing tone. 

“Stop teasing me, please. I want you. I want you, Dominic. Love me completely. I can’t 
hold it anymore. ” She whimpered. 

He couldn’t hold himself anymore as well. Without prolonging it much, he pumped his 
length deeper behind her as she screamed out. He rocked her on the bed, stroking and 
enjoying her tightness. 

“Ahhhh! Oh my- Dominic” 

“You love it? Tell me you love it when I love you.” He groaned. 

“I-I love it. I-love- I love you..” She uttered, completely out of her mind. It increased his 
speed and he kept pounding deeper into her. 

Lord, he couldn’t stay away from this woman. Goddess knows he is going to completely 
lose it without her. 

“You’re mine, Athena. You’re only mine. You will always be mine- until I breathe last. I 
am never going to let you go away from me.” Saying he reached the 

climax, taking her to the point of pleasure and groaning. 

Swaying near her neck, he inhaled deeply again, “My scent indeed suits you the most, 
love. Just like my mark is going to be the best jewelry for you.” 
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128. Shopping 

THE NEXT MORNING 

Athena and Dominic were busy from the time they woke up. They had so much work to 
do that they didn’t even have the time to have breakfast together. 

 

Dominic had something in the pack house while Athena had something while feeding 
Ace. After that she dropped him off at the playground with other pups. 

As soon as she was done there, she was dragged away from there by Patricia and 
Suzanne. They were taking her to the mall to get her ready for tomorrow. Even though 
Suzanne didn’t look as enthusiastic as she should be because it was Athena’s biggest 
day. But Athena didn’t say anything about it and focused on herself at that moment. 

“Athena! Are you done trying that dress out? How long are you going to take to try just 
one dress? We have so much more to do!” Athena jumped a little after hearing Patricia 
shout from outside the changing room. Patricia’s tone was completely like a mom 
scolding her annoying child who takes forever to get ready for school. 

“Coming, coming! Geez!” Athena said while opening the door of the trial room. “The 
chain was stuck with something.” She said while coming out and standing in front of 
Patricia and Suzanne. 

“What do you think of this?” Athena asked nervously while looking at them for their 
consent. She actually really liked this dress. They have made her change at least more 
than a hundred dresses. 

She was exhausted as well and at the same time she really liked the dress. It was a red 
dress with a mermaid tail. It has beautiful expensive rose embroidery with diamond 
studded all over the roses. It was a really beautiful dress. It has a sweetheart neckline. 
She really loved it. So, she just needed her friends to pass the dress. 

“Oh my! Goodness!” 

“Oh my my, Athena!” 



Suzanne and Patricia shouted at the same time while looking at her with astonished 
eyes. 

“So, this dress is final?” Athena asked with sparkly eyes, happy to finally be free from 
this new job of dress changing. 

“Hell yeah!” Patricia shouted, making her sigh in relief. 

“Now I can rest in peace!” Athena sighed in happiness. 

“Hell no. We still have a lot to shop for!” Saying that Athena was dragged by Patricia 
and Suzanne somewhere else. 

“Girls! I don’t want to. It’s enough. I am tired.” Athena whined from the side bench where 
she was currently seated with all the things she bought from the past few hours. Which 
was just only a dress. 

“Come on, bestie. It’ll be fun! And at least this way you can make sure that you look the 
prettiest on your best day.” Patricia states as she was standing in front of Athena with 
her hands on her waist. She couldn’t believe that there are women in this world who 
don’t love shopping. She has heard about such ladies only in movies and fiction. 

“But why do I need to go? You know I don’t like to go shopping! I trust both of your 
choices. I know you both are going to get the best for me. Can’t you do this for me?” 
Athena said with a pout while giving them her best puppy dog eyes. 

“No, we can’t.” Suzanne brutally rejected her pouty face while Athena frowned at her. 

“Great, now that it’s settled! Come on, let’s go then!” Patricia quickly looked down to her 
list to decide where she was going to go then. 

“Suzy! I was completely prepared with my full on pout -face! You just can’t reject it so 
brutally. That is unfair!” Athena almost screamed with a pout which the girls found totally 
adorable. 

“Come on, Luna. Get up so we can go, we have a lot of things to try on before we can 
make a choice.” Patricia excitedly exclaimed and happily skipped toward new shops. 
Giving her a stern look, Suzanne follows behind Patricia as well. 

Athena stood up from the bench, grumbling and almost fell face down on the ground 
because her legs were tangled. The girls giggled and laughed harder when they saw 
the Luna’s annoyed face. 

“Come on you clumsy, let’s find something hot for you to wear after the party is over. If 
you know what I mean.” Suzanne teased, making Athena turn completely red. 



“Suzy! I am going to make you do such weird things after I officially become your Luna! 
You will see!” Athena gritted her teeth before following them with defeated shoulders. 

They’ve been in about ten stores already and they’ve got a pretty good idea of what 
they want for them for the after party after the ceremony. They’ve come to the 
conclusion that everybody is going to wear the same and they’ve decided gowns only, 
following the dress code which was black for the after party. They were mostly excited 
about the after party. That’s when the fun was going to happen. Everything which they 
planned. 

If only they knew that they wouldn’t be able to reach that anyway. 

“Let’s shop for the boys..” Athena suggested and the girls immediately agreed, they 
couldn’t let such an opportunity go. 

“Let’s go!” 

“Okay, girls, what about this?” Patricia held up the first dark coloured blazer she could 
find in hopes that Athena would actually like something because she’d been literally 
turning down everything they held up for the past hour. They already bought suits for 
Nathan and Justin but Athena couldn’t choose anything for Dominic. 

It’s a dark grey blazer and a little white stripe on each side which turn out to be the 
beginning of pockets. Athena looked up for about three seconds and shook her head. 

With a sigh, Patricia dropped the blazer somewhere and started to wander around the 
store. It’s actually quite a nice store. Big. Athena is not a big fan of shopping so she 
actually doesn’t know if it’s really a good store but since Patricia took her there it must 
be. But still she couldn’t find anything that would make Dominic look the finest-… 

Suddenly something caught her eyes… 

“Girls, look I’ve found the perfect thing!” Athena exclaimed and the girls immediately 
looked at what Athena found. 

Their Luna held it up proudly and she was right it was perfect. It’s a simple dark blue 
vest. It’s the exact balance between a sharp contrast with the white t- shirt and still 
matching with the black pants without being the exact same colour. 

“Yes, this is exactly what we need.” Athena said as she walked over to the counter to 
ask for Dominic’s size. 

“She suddenly got energy to do shopping?” Patricia asked in an amused tone while 
looking at a happy Athena. 



“She’s always energetic to do something for her close ones.” Suzanne said with a smile 
while admiring Athena as well. 

“Are you done?” Suzanne asked as they walked toward Athena who just got the suit 
packed. 

“Yes!” Athena exclaimed happily. 

“Girls, how about we go to ice cream and then go for a movie? Let’s make it a 
memorable girls day?” Patricia offered and Suzanne and Athena immediately agreed. 

“Let’s do this!” (The chapter isn’t that important. I just wanted to give the girls a few 
scenes together to show their bond which are like normal girls. Thank you and love 
you!) 
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129- Love the darkness 

SOMEWHERE 

A man in his late forties was sitting inside his bedroom with all the lights completely off. 
There wasn’t any light in the room. It was pitch dark inside the room, i 

 

His life was filled with darkness which is why he didn’t find it necessary to fill the room 
with light anyway. His heart and mind was filled with darkness as well and he was ready 
to fill everyone’s life with the same darkness as well if it wasn’t for his… Mate. 

“Dante?” 

Immediately after he thought of his mate, he heard the sweet voice of his mate. He 
opened his eyes to meet with a bright light which was coming from the balcony door. 

Her mate opened the door as soon as she came inside the room and filled his room with 
light just like she had been doing the same with his life. She was the light of his life, if it 
wasn’t for her, he would have destroyed everything. He would have killed everyone in 
madness. She kept him calm and collected. 



She was his life but still his life wasn’t complete. Because his smile was taken away 
from him years ago. It’s been years he hasn’t smiled. His mate and people around him 
almost forgot how looked when he used to smile. 

“Dante? How many times do I have to tell you? Don’t stay in the darkness.” Her mate 
scolded him with a small frown on her face. 

He looked up to see her beautiful face which looked as beautiful as the time when he 
first saw her. When she was only eighteen and now she was nearly forty five years old 
but looked flawlessly young. Her beautiful blonde hair and deep sea blue eyes were his 
favourite. But they looked pale as well because of the light which they lost. 

“I started to love the darkness, Lucy. It’s the only thing which keeps me close to my 
sunshine.” His agony filled tone broke her heart as she could understand what he 
meant. She walked toward him and sat on the bed beside him and kept her hand over 
his chest to calm him down a little. 

“But she used to hate darkness, Dante.” Lucy said, her tone was heavy as well. 

“I am sure she started to love it as well, Lucy. Because that’s what her life is currently. 
Filled with darkness. Didn’t you hear what our spy said? They kept her in a cell! In a 
freaking cell, Lucy. There’s nothing but darkness in a cell. She started to love it as well.” 
Dante said as his wolf was growling inside his chest. They both were getting angry 
again as they remembered about it again, i 

“Calm down, Dante. Only one day left. Our life will be filled with sunshine again and we 
will fill her life with the same as well. We have to be strong and happy for her. We will do 
everything to help her start her life with a fresh start. She will forget all her experience 
from that dark basement. We will love her that much. ” Lucy said while rubbing his back 
up and down as if she was trying to calm herself down as well. 

“You are right. Just one more day. After that I will not let any harm come to her 
anymore. I am not going to listen to anyone tomorrow and will get her back to me no 
matter what. I am never going to let anyone take her away from me until my last breath.” 
Dante said with fire in his eyes. 

He looked as if he was going to burn everything tomorrow to get what he wanted and 
Lucy knew he wasn’t going to hesitate if it’s needed. He would actually burn everything. 

“Are you going to call for a war?” Lucy asked with fear filled eyes as she looked at his 
face in disbelief. 

If he calls for a war, it’s going to turn out to be disastrous. But she knew that she didn’t 
hold that much power to stop him if that’s what he was going to do. 



“I already called for a war, Lucy.” Dante answered with gritted teeth while looking ahead 
at a blank space. 

“What?! You didn’t give any warning or send a letter for the war, Dante. How is that a 
war?” Lucy shouted in disbelief and panic, afraid of what her mate was planning. 

“I am going to go there without any warning.” Dante said in a blank tone. 

“It’s not a war then, Dante. It’s an attack, a low and cheap move which only cowards 
attempt.” Lucy shouted at him. 

“That’s what he deserves for keeping the daughter of the South Alpha leader in a cell!” 
Dante shouted back before walking out from the room, leaving a distressed Lucy 
behind. 

Lucy wept in silence while clutching her hands to her heart. She knew it was hard for 
her mate. But it was hard for her as well. She lost her only child years ago as well and 
couldn’t give her mate any more heir. It was very hurtful for her. She felt worthless 
silently, not letting anyone see that. She cried everyday but no one saw that because 
she had to handle the pack when the pack’s alpha was falling apart. She had to be 
strong because she had to support the pack and her mate. 

But who was going to support her and handle her? Who’s going to wipe away her tears? 
How she wished she had a daughter with whom she could be as close as best friends. 
But her dream was left as a dream only and she was left with many burdens. Burden of 
being a worthless and useless mate to her mate… 

But if something happens this time because of her mate’s decision, she doesn’t know 
who she is going to handle everything. She just hoped nothing bad would 

happen. Moon goddess was her only hope at that moment. 

“Alpha Dominic, one more day. Get ready to pay for the great sin which you committed.” 
Dante walked away with a promise to himself as he saw his mate crying silently like all 
these years. 
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130. Blindfolded night 



“Argh!” Groaning, Athena covered her face and turned off the table lamp. Darkness fills 
in the room, even though the window is open, the rays of moonlight flickering inside. 

A pointed sound of footsteps clicked her ears from a close distance. Dominic came 
back. As tomorrow was the function, he had a lot of work to do which kept him there till 
midnight. 

 

As she heard the sound of the knob twisting, she closed her eyes shut, pretending to be 
asleep. She didn’t know why she was hiding from him but as the time kept ticking for the 
final day, her nervousness kept growing. 

She heard his footsteps inside the room. Amidst the darkness and silence, those 
footsteps and his existence were enough to give her chills. However, she remained 
stable on the right side of the bed. 

His footsteps were heard closer to her and she could feel his existence much more 
clearly. Her heart throbs against her chest with the burning silence. It feels so 

weird. She knew that he was staring down at her. Her wolf was excited for the hide and 
seek of the game. 

She remembered those nights when he used to stare at her when she used to be fast 
asleep. One day when she realised him doing that, she deliberately pretended to be 
asleep only to experience the beautiful feeling. 

But at that moment, it gave her only anticipation. She gulped down, hoping he’ll 
eventually move away but the air around her got heavier and heavier as she felt the 
distance between them decreasing. 

Goddamn! 

She felt his hands slowly land on her torso, making her shiver against the bed. Her 
throat dried up as she breathed heavily, responding to his touch. Raw heat rushes 
through her veins as his hands slowly prowl tracing all over her. 

“How was the shopping today?” He asked casually, closer to her face. 

She found no reason to keep pretending anymore and opened her eyes wider at his 
silhouette. Amidst the sluggish darkness, she could see his structure clearly. 

“What’s keeping you awake at this hour?” His soft question caressed her face and 
through the moonlight she could see the turmoil on his face as well. 



“I-I wasn’t feeling sleepy..” Athena mumbled, not knowing what else to or how to explain 
things she was feeling. 

“It’s been a stressful day. You can’t handle stress unless you’re worried about 
something. What are you worried about?” Dominic asked while still caressing her face 
soothingly. 

Wow! Sometimes it scares her how well he knows her! 

“Why would I be worried?” She kept talking without looking at him while his hand kept 
caressing her body, making it hard for her not to moan in pleasure. 

He just touches her. And she was done. 

“Worried… hm, is it about the fear of something happening tomorrow and you are 
thinking how to prevent it yourself and be the hero?” He asked, catching her 
immediately. 

Fuck! 

“No”, She lied straight. Actually that’s what she was planning which is why she 
contacted Thea as well. But how did he know that? 

“Yes, Miss Liar. I know that.” He mocked me. “Well, you have been doing a lot of silly 
things today. Don’t you think you deserve a little punishment before we enter the new 
phrase of our lives?” He asked in a teasing tone. 

From his playful tone, she could feel what’s coming for her. And it made her anxious 
and nervous at the same time. 

“I guess you should res-..”, before she could even finish half of what she wanted to say, 
her vision got dark with a fabric landing on her eyes. 

Is it a blindfold? 

“Dominic!” She whispered. It’s pitch black all around her when she sensed his hot 
breath near her face. ” What are you doing?” She asked. 

She wasn’t afraid of the darkness, well, not anymore. But still she wasn’t fond of it as 
well but she trusted Dominic. So, it was okay, i 

“Shhh..” His thumb lands perfectly on her bottom lip, making them shiver. “You better 
use these pretty lips to moan for me tonight, not to question.” He said in a demanding 
tone which made her squirm in excitement. 



Her heartbeats increased rapidly. She parted her lips to utter something again but got 
interrupted by his hot mouth crashing over her. His palms wrapped gently around her 
cheeks to prevent her from moving away from the kiss. He plunges his tongue deep 
inside her mouth, probing for approval as she part her lips wider to let him in with all her 
needs. 

He stroked his tongue into her mouth passionately, giving rise to her longing. The kiss is 
soft and gentle, unlike all the kisses they shared after meeting after years. She didn’t 
know what made him kiss her so lovingly right now. But she loved it. 

With her vision restricted, all her nerves could feel every little movement around her. 
Her wolf was active as well. The clock ticking, the moist wind blowing inside the room, 
her groans and his intense breathing – such a deadly combination. 

She heard the rustling of the sheets beneath her, anticipation increasing with every 
single second. 

She was guessing the kiss wasn’t enough for him to give her enough anxiety, his hands 
joining the league cupping her breasts into his tender grip. He started kneading them 
with all his passion and desire, driving her crazier and crazier. He denied leaving her 
mouth as she let out a soft moan into his warm mouth. 

His skilled hands keep pleasuring her. Meanwhile, he tangled his fingers with the cord 
of her nightgown. The next second, she felt the cold breeze hitting her skin, causing 
goosebumps all over her body. His knuckles land on her flat belly, encircling her navel 
with his addictive touch. 

No words were shared that night. 

She panted harder as he let her lips go. Needs surges down her spine and she felt like 
she was gonna explode with the immense pleasure he was causing her. Her clit 
clenched with the dampness. She was already soaking wet for him, waiting to invite him 
to take her on. 

“Do you know what’s one of many things out of many I love about you?” He asked in a 
husky voice. 

She nodded slightly. 

“The way your body responds to my touch.” He doesn’t stop nuzzling and teasing her 
skin. Her chest heaved up, feeling his fingertips sliding down from her throat to her 
cleavage, then down-more down. 

He touched her through the lacy lingerie as she huffed. As she couldn’t see anything, 
the intensity of him increased much more. 



“Dominic!” She screamed out of pleasure as he slowly caressed her core over the 
fabric. 

Why was she so sensitive? 

“Do you know how much I love to tease you like this, love?” He whispered near her 
face, tease visible in his voice. 

She was completely under his mercy hence didn’t say anything. She hoped he wouldn’t 
leave her unfinished. It’s just not right to keep her hanging. 

‘God, no!’ Her wolf shouted even at the thought. 

“Dominic, please.” She pleaded her heart out, knowing it’s a win for him. But she also 
knows that she was gonna explode in longings if he acted like a jerk at that time. 

“I doubt if your pleadings will force me to give you what you want. That won’t be a 
punishment anymore, right?” Dominic asked while smirking which she clearly could 
imagine. 

Dammit! 

Terror fills me with his words. And he could clearly feel it through her dangerous 
heartbeat. 

She heard him chuckling. 

‘That’s so freaking cruel of him.’ Her wolf whined. 

Her breath catched as he captured her blossom in between his teeth without any 
warning. 

Damn him. 

It was the start of the last night of their previous life and they are going to make full use 
of it. 

It has just started. 

A new morning awaits for them… 

 


