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Xiao Xian’er flushed suddenly, lowered her head, tossing for a long time, and then
mumbled: “It has always been a matter of marriage, the order of the parents, the words
of the matchmaker, where can I get Xian’er? Call the shots? Everything depends on
Daddy’s instructions!” As

soon as the voice fell, Xiao Xian’er’s head dropped lower.

“Oh, this is going to be ordered by Dad again? Back then, when Pei Hu proposed
marriage, some people did not reflect this.”

“Haha, who said no. I still remember when Pei Hu came back.” , Some people refuse to
face to face, what else are they saying, what is it?”

“Haha, don’t marry after death!”

Hearing everyone’s words, Xiao Xian’er’s ashamed person is even more embarrassed,
just in this state, let go Some water can be boiled instantly on her delicate face.

“You are necrotic, laugh at them all.” Although angry, Xian’er was obviously happy in her
eyes, got up slightly, blushed and left the hall.

“Hahahaha!” When

she came out like this, all Qilin tribesmen burst into laughter.

However, how happy they laughed, George Han was speechless.

Even he had to split in place.

George Han, who was not in the mood and was forced to do business, barely dealt with
the happy elders. After drinking them for thirty years, George Han urged the pangolin.

However, this guy was already so drunk, no matter how George Han moved him, he
didn’t show the slightest reflection at all. George Han was extremely depressed. After
sweeping his eyes, George Han turned and left the hall, wanting to go out and take a
breath. , By the way, wait for this drunk bastard pangolin.

Although Xianshan had only experienced a great battle just before the wine, its recovery
ability seemed extremely strong. Just goodbye, the outside of the temple was already
bright, although it had faded into the night, the wind was high and airy, and it was quite
comfortable.



A few steps walked towards a bamboo forest beside the temple, and sat on the stone
table next to the bamboo forest. It was a rare moment of peace and nourishment.

The realm of the earth is indeed a wonderful place.

Just like a fairyland on earth, when there is time, George Han wants to ask Kylin
Patriarch for advice, how does this place exist? One day in the future, George Han also
wants to have a place like this to be his base camp. Although Xianling Island is good,
but there is rain before and Lu Yuan behind. They have all been near Xianling Island or
directly on the island. Naturally, the safety of Xianling Island is also Not guaranteed.

The realm of the earth is actually the best choice for George Han right now.

But… would the

Kylin patriarch tell himself this secret method?

I’m afraid, when this old man has the heart to kill himself, how can he teach himself? !

“Three thousand!”

At this moment, a soft call came, and George Han looked up, only to see Sheng Ran
with a smile on his face, and slowly walked over.

“What’s the matter? I think you seem to be in a bad mood, and you are still worried
about the revenge of the 梼杌 clan for just hitting Pei Hu?” Shengran smiled lightly and
sat down against George Han.

Seeing that there was no one, George Han also planned to tell Shengran clearly:
“Patriarch, in fact…”

“Actually, he is worried about when he can enter the bridal chamber.” When George Han
spoke, he said again. Interrupted George Han’s words.

George Han raised his head and saw that the pangolin’s servant had already walked
over.

Damn it, didn’t you just drunk as drunk? Now I am walking fast with Lao Tzu? !

Seeing George Han’s anger had risen, the pangolin sat down on the other side of
George Han, and then pressed George Han’s hands with both hands tightly to prevent
him from doing it, and then smiled shamelessly.

Shengran shook his head helplessly, ignored him, looked at George Han, and said:
“George Han, you might as well speak up if you have something to say.”

“I actually treat Xian’er, and…”



“In fact, he treats Xian’er early. I just coveted for a long time, when will you give me a
wedding date?” George Han wanted to speak again, but the pangolin had already
interrupted.

George Han understood that this cargo was just pretending to be drunk, for the purpose
of fearing that he would propose marriage.

He opened his hand directly, and some things could be fooled without being sloppy.
George Han stood up directly: “Actually, George Han came this time, not for Xiaoxian’er,
or to say, George Han was to Xiaoxian. I don’t have any interest.”

Hearing what George Han said, the pangolin immediately covered his face in
depression and sighed.

And Holy Burn…
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, after a moment of stunned, the next second, he smiled strangely indifferently.

“Understood!”

“Hey, old man Shengran, you are so crazy, you promised so simply? You…” Hearing
Shengran’s answer and seeing the appearance of Shengran, the pangolin was very
anxious.

The emperor was not in a hurry, and the eunuch died anxiously, which is the most true
portrayal at this time.

“Three thousand skills are deep, and the spells are exquisite. They are the dragon
among the people. To tell the truth, these people are the phoenix girls. How can
Xiaoxianer He De?” Shengran laughed softly.

“The patriarch, you are polite. Princess Qilin is all about her country, and her internal
strength is extremely deep. It is George Han who is not good enough. It is just that
George Han had a splendid wife long ago, and she is the only one in this life, and she
has never had a double heart.” Han Three thousand explained.

“One person, one sword, sincere love, good, good, very good.” Shengran laughed.

“Damn, old man, are you crazy? Such a future son-in-law is gone, how can you laugh
out so much?” The pangolin said very depressed.

“The yellow sand monster, three thousand are so mighty, but they can stand together
with their beloved wife, and they are a model. How can the old man be unhappy to know
such a person?” Shengran laughed softly.



Then, he sighed: “Actually, I have found Pei Hu from 3000, and I already know that the
purpose of his trip is to avenge the innocent villagers, not for Xian’er.”

“Then you. This old guy still…”

“Since Peihu’s forced marriage, in the past seven years, has the Qilin clan ever had an
Ann birthday? Everyone’s mood is very low and depressed, and finally, what they did
today, three thousand, let everyone breathe out. At the same time, I was in a bad mood.
How could I endure the old man? That’s why I was scheming. However, even if I was
wronged by Han Shaoxia, I still accompany the old man to finish the scene.” Shengran
finished speaking and bowed slightly. It’s an apology.

George Han hurriedly got up and bowed slightly as a response.”Well, well, you are all
good people, but I am a vile pangolin and yellow sand monster.” The pangolin couldn’t
help but feel depressed when he saw the two of them.

“You can bring three thousand to the rescue this time. You are already a nobleman of
my Qilin family. I also announced in court that you are a distinguished guest. What do
you want?” Shengran laughed.

Hearing this, the pangolin nodded: “Sure, since you all reconciled privately, I have
nothing to say. Xian’er is single, which means I still have a chance. However, I knew that
your relationship is so strong, I There is no need to mention the trick.”

“Oh? What do you say?” Shengran was a little strange.

“Oh, he wants to know some secrets, but I’m afraid he will mention it rashly, you won’t
tell him. So, let him conquer Xian’er first, and then use to defeat Pei Hu to conquer you,
and then you will be a family. Well, what he wants to know, you old man will certainly not
be stingy.”

“It’s just a pity our little Xian’er, it’s a pity that we will have to face a broken relationship
when we are in love.”

After finishing speaking, the pangolin servant pretended to sigh. .

Until now, George Han understood the series of actions of this grandson before.

This is clearly killing two birds with one stone. It not only helped myself, but also helped
George Han.

However, he did not expect that George Han would reject Xiao Xian’er.

Shengran nodded clearly, looked back at George Han, and said, “George Han, what do
you want to know?”

“He wants to know, I’m afraid you dare not say it.” The pangolin sneered: “This might
make it happen.” Your unicorn family has disappeared in this world from now on.”



Shengran frowned suddenly: “Is it possible?”

“Take it out.” The pangolin patted George Han lightly.

George Han nodded, and with a move in his hand, the five-element sacred stone was
directly pushed out.

In the next second, Sheng Ran suddenly staggered, terrified: “It’s… it’s it…”
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seeing Shengran reflect this way, George Han was a little strange, although for George
Han, the origin of the five-element sacred stone was a little unclear, and even the
implications were extremely bizarre.

But it was unthinkable, and far from reaching the level that can scare people.

Moreover, this frightened person still happened to the patriarch of the Qilin clan,
Shenglian, who was relatively calm and steady.

“Holy Patriarch, you are…” George Han frowned, puzzled.

“Why do you have such a thing?” Sheng Ran raised his head fiercely, answered the
question, and looked at George Han nervously.

George Han was puzzled.

“This…this…” Shengran hurriedly walked to George Han’s front, and then immediately
grasped George Han’s hand holding the Five Elements God Stone: “Hurry up, don’t let
anyone see it.

” As for the origin of this thing, you still don’t know.”

After speaking, Shengran looked around anxiously, for fear that someone else would
know about it.

But this undoubtedly made George Han even more curious. You must know that this is
the sacred place of the Qilin clan. As the patriarch of the Qilin clan, the Five Elements
Divine Stone can make him worry like this in his clan. This is really strange.

However, looking at Shengran’s appearance, it seemed that he was reluctant to say that
this made George Han quite uncomfortable.

The pangolin lightly raised its leg at this time, looking like a slapstick, and said: “Look, I’ll
tell you, if you don’t be the old man’s son-in-law, he won’t tell you.” The



pangolin’s voice just fell off. , The Shengran had already coldly scolded: “Don’t talk
nonsense.”

Then, he looked at George Han: “The old man doesn’t want to say more, but it is…”

“Hey!”

“Old man, you just said that you know everything, right now you are retreating like this, I
am afraid it is not good?” The pangolin was not affected by the holy fire’s rage and said
indifferently.

Shengran had nothing to say to Yan, and glanced at George Han: “Do you really want to
know?”

George Han nodded.

Shengran sighed and looked around: “This is not a place to speak, you follow me.” As

soon as the voice fell, Shengran turned and hurried towards the back of the hall.

George Han and the pangolin followed, and hurriedly followed.less than a moment, the
three of them walked around the main hall, and already came to a quiet inner hall.

The hall has three characters, the main building, and the east and west compartments
on both sides. The decoration is not so luxurious, but it is quiet, surrounded by towering
trees on the left and right, and behind the fairy mountain cliff with a sea of ​ ​ clouds,
which is very beautiful.

The three of them entered the main hall, and then Shengran looked around again and
confirmed that there was no one before closing the door.

After that, the Holy Burn slowly came to the main hall. Above the main hall, there was a
painting hanging high. In the painting, a unicorn was heroic, flying across the clouds.
There were some people under the clouds, holding weapons, staring and glaring,
majestic and majestic.

Shengran lit a stick of incense and bowed gently to the painting. Then, he looked back
and looked at George Han: “This is the ancestor of the Qilin family.” A

few steps walked to George Han, George Han. He also opened his hand clearly and
called out the Five Elements God Stone again.

Looking at this five-element sacred stone, Shengran fell into contemplation for a while.

George Han didn’t dare to bother more, just waited quietly.

“Do you know its name?” Shengran suddenly opened his mouth, looking at George Han
and said softly.



“I’m calling it the Five Elements God Stone. However, after hearing the pangolin, it is
also called Demon Heart. At this point, George Han is stupid, I don’t know what it is
called.” George Han said softly.

Shengran smiled bitterly: “The Five Elements Divine Stone is it, and the Devil’s Heart is
also it. The vast crowds are just called differently.”

George Han nodded, “However, the name of the Devil’s Heart is not the same as that of
the Devil.” Is the clan implicated? Or is it a thing of the

demon clan?” “There is no demon in the world, but God exists, so there is a demon. Just
as there is no beast in the world, when there is a man, there is also a man. Beast. If you
want to understand what you are holding, you must first understand a word.” After
Shengran said, when he moved his hand, the pen and paper on the side table quickly
flew over.

The paper was laid on the table safely, and the pen also fell on Shengran’s hand
instantly. He was not talking nonsense. With a stroke of his hand, a big stroke of the pen
dropped a big word on the paper.

When George Han saw the word on the paper, he couldn’t help frowning, and he was
very confused for a while.

“Witch?” George Han raised his eyes and looked at Shengran!
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