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“It was handsome just now.”

“Hehe, one move could kill the world in seconds, but it stopped halfway. It’s

a big batch, quite a big batch, worthy of my pangolin’s brother.” As soon as he entered
the house, The pangolins made various jokes, but obviously, there was nothing in the
room except the extremely cold atmosphere that responded to him.

Han Sanqian just sat at the table, the wine in the glass one after another, only when the
pangolin came in late, the big pot of spirits at the table had already gone for a long time.

Seeing that this trick didn’t work, the pangolin sat down, picked up the bottomed flask,
and forced himself a little bit into the cup, and then clinked a glass with Han Sanqian,
then slowly said: “That Is it my sister-in-law?”

Han Sanqian did not speak, but the pangolin was a little self-confident, and then said
leisurely: “Sister-in-law is really good-looking, and has outstanding temperament.
Seeing your eyes are full of love, it is worthy of you love you. For a long time, but why
did she refuse? In front of so many people.”

Han Sanqian smiled bitterly: “It’s not to blame her.”

Damn, when he mentioned his sister-in-law Han Sanqian, he opened his mouth, and the
pangolin frowned: “Why?”

“It’s all my fault. I don’t have the abilities myself. Since Yingxia and I got married, I have
almost never let her live a good life. Even if I keep trying to pay it back, I still owe him too
much. “

Even before I went to Bafang World, she was still full of crises. Actually, Ying Xia would
have lived well without me.” Thinking of this, Han Sanqian couldn’t help but smile.

The daughter of the Su family and the daughter of the supporter, no matter what status,
when she didn’t choose herself, she… should have lived very well.

Anyway, I will not follow myself, drift away, and live this kind of life.

“So, you mean, if you love someone, you should learn to let go and let her chase
happiness?”

Han Sanqian did not deny that he had such an idea, but he really couldn’t let Su Yingxia
go.



“Actually, she can marry Fang Kun, maybe as you said, the husband and wife are birds
of the same forest, and the disaster is about to fly separately. She made this choice, in
fact, it is easy to understand.” Han Sanqian lowered his head when he heard this. It was
true. In theory, Han Sanqian would abide by her wishes if Su Yingxia made any choice,
but this time…

Han Sanqian felt that he might have failed to speak .

Seeing Han Sanqian doing this, the pangolin smiled and patted Han Sanqian on the
shoulder: “However, in fact, you don’t have to be too discouraged. Although I don’t know
what happened between you and what you experienced, but I know, You love my
sister-in-law very much, and the eyes of my sister-in-law look at you are full of love. I
believe that the problem is temporary and will always be solved.”

Han Sanqian nodded, his eyes moved outside the house involuntarily.

He was waiting for Su Yan.

“The group of people outside the house, I let them go.” The pangolin would be wrong,
got up, opened the door, and then waved to Fang Biao and the others to signal them to
leave here.

Han Sanqian didn’t stop it, so it’s okay, at least it’s clean.

Seeing the pangolin coming back again, Han Sanqian sighed and picked up his wine.
Before drinking, he folded the pangolin in half.

The pangolin didn’t say much, he held up a cup and drank with Han Sanqian.

And almost at this time, Su Yan also slowly retreated from Su Yingxia’s room. After
closing the door, Lu Zhu was already waiting for herself at the door. Seeing the young
lady came out, she looked at her eagerly.

In fact, Lu Zhu also felt guilty. After all, when she didn’t know that Su Yingxia was the
Miss Su in Han Sanqian’s mouth, she said a lot of bad things about Han Sanqian in front
of Su Yingxia.

Now that the two of them are in such a situation, how can she not be annoyed? !

Su Yan sighed, then looked at Han Sanqian’s side.

“Miss?”

“Follow me to find Han Sanqian.” After Su Yan finished speaking, she quickly walked
towards Han Sanqian’s room with the green beads.

“Miss Su is here.” In the



room, the pangolin yelled, and then Han Sanqian stood up suddenly…
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he wanted to take a few steps to learn about Su Yan, but he got up too fiercely, and Jiu
Jin was extremely strong, and he almost staggered backwards in a moment.

The pangolin hurriedly supported Han Sanqian, and when he held him to the side of the
bed, the door was also opened there, and Su Yan walked in with a green bead
expression.

“How’s it going?” Han Sanqian ignored the pangolin’s support and was about to get up
in a hurry.

Su Yan glanced at the pangolin and then at the hip flask on the table. She immediately
understood something and nodded: “You go out first. I have something to discuss with
San Qian.”

“But he…” Pangolin Wang He glanced at Han Sanqian, who was not in a good state.

The spirits entered his throat so quickly that he was already a little drunk.

“I’ll take care of her.” After Su Yan finished speaking, she walked over slowly with a
fragrant smell.

The pangolin glanced at Su Yan, then looked at Lu Zhu, nodded, and retreated with Lu
Zhu.

Su Yan gently supported Han Sanqian, and then slowly put him on the bed, watching
Han Sanqian, who is usually very sane, is now lost, and there was a trace of distress on
her face, but she still shook it. Shaking his head: “She has decided.”

“What?!” When Han Sanqian heard this, the whole air defense Buddha heard his
heartbreaking voice, and his expression became very trance.

How could this be? !

Could it be that, as she said in her original letter, is Yingxia really completely dead? !

“She asked me to teach you this.” With that, Su Yan gently took out a note from her
hand.

The red color of the note was obviously cut temporarily from the red paper used in the
wedding. Although it was a bit hasty, it was more certain. This was written by Su
Yingxia.



Opening the note, there is a line of beautiful words in it, which is even more sure. This
was written by Su Yingxia.

“One is not two wide, I miss myself, but the past is so fleeting and fleeting, even if I try to
keep it, it’s just like holding a fine sand in my hand, and it’s nothing.”

“Three thousand, and you have never complained or regretted in the past, but in the
future , You and I need to say goodbye, take good care of yourself, take good care of
Nian’er, and welcome the summer.” After

reading these words, Han Sanqian’s hands trembled slightly, and the sharpness and
stability of the past disappeared from his eyes. On the contrary, some sluggish.
“Impossible, impossible, this is impossible.” Han Sanqian suddenly crumpled the paper
into a ball, and then threw the paper violently, and had to step on it.

Seeing this, Su Yan hurriedly reached out to stop Han Sanqian, hoping that he could
calm down.

Although Su Yan was only a woman, Han Sanqian who was lost and drunk was not
much better. As Su Yan got started, Han Sanqian’s body was instantly depressed by her
before she fully lifted up.

With the bang of the bed, Su Yan completely lay on Han Sanqian’s body, and the veil on
her face was also loosened at this moment, revealing her stunning face.

Su Yan was very nervous, and her breathing became abnormally rapid, but at this time
in such close contact between the two, Han Sanqian could clearly feel her breath, the
alcohol and the anger of the letter. , After making Han Sanqian stunned, he suddenly
pressed Su Yan back on the bed, and a big mouth was about to move up.

Su Yan’s face was flushed and her heart was anxious, but she still couldn’t help closing
her eyes, waiting for Han Sanqian’s strong kiss.

It’s just that she, who was already heartbeat, didn’t wait until the moment of the electric
shock. Suddenly, she felt a lightness in her body. When she opened her eyes again,
Han Sanqian had already stood up.

“I’m sorry.” Han Sanqian curled his face and said sorry.

Su Yan was heartbroken, even her face would fail at this time? But at the same time of
heartbreak, she was very moved. Looking at Han Sanqian, she said, “It’s because of Su
Yingxia, right?”

“I will only love her alone, even if she doesn’t love me.” Han Sanqian finished. , Got up
and opened the window next to him to let the air-conditioning in and calm himself down.

Su Yan smiled bitterly and picked up some clothes that slid down her shoulders, not
because she was not beautiful enough, but because of Su Yingxia.



Slightly getting up, Su Yan picked up some of the wine that Han Sanqian drank on the
table, raised her head and drank it, and the spicy moment went up to her throat. She
forced her uncomfortable intentions and looked at Han Sanqian’s back: “I have Ways to
get you with her!”
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