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The Dragon Clan Leader said, “Tang Daoist, you don’t know something, Sebastian is a recruitment
contest, is it, you want to participate as well?Although I don’t have a problem with it, but you’re at
least Xiao Bai’s brother, how can you participate in your sister’s marriage recruiting contest, how bad
is the rumor.Besides, the rest of my dragon clan will definitely not want you to participate.It’s not that
I’m squeezing you, but the humans in your Extreme South Continent do have a lower status.”

“Hmph, if I hadn’t happened to be here, we wouldn’t even know about this, so why would you let
Sebastian hold a marriage recruitment contest?”Omi questioned.

“Fellow Daoist Tang, I understand your feelings very well, but you should also think about it, Xiaobai is
a dragon girl after all, and as long as she is a woman, she is destined to find her other half.Do you want
Xiaobai to be a bachelor for the rest of her life.”

“But Xiaobai herself is unwilling.”

“Tang Daoist, I don’t know if Little White is willing or not, but Little White’s grandfather is willing,
before Little White’s grandfather ascended, he told us that in the future, when Little White is looking
for a husband, he must choose the best one and hold a marriage recruitment contest for her, only the
best will be worthy of Little White.”

Omi looked at Xiaobai, “Did your grandfather really say that?”

“It’s said, but I didn’t think it would be so soon.”Little White was depressed.

The Dragon Clan Chief laughed, “Fellow Daoist Tang, do you still want to stop it when people’s own
grandfather has given such instructions?Little White is not too young at this age, in order to reproduce
more offspring, almost all the young men and women of the dragon race are married very early, the
reproductive capacity of the dragon race is not as high as the humans in your extreme southern
continent, if you don’t do it earlier, the population will only get smaller and smaller.”

Omi said, “But you are inviting marriage from all holy beasts, this different race, what do you want
Sebastian to have?”

“Hahaha, Daoist Tang, you’re being superficial, in the Immortal Realm, there are thousands of races,
there are too many interracial marriages, and after becoming an Immortal in the future, whatever holy
beast will return to its human form more completely.Alright, I don’t want to explain so much to you,
Sebastian’s marriage recruitment contest, it’s already set, it’s going to be held in a few days, if you
sincerely come to congratulate me, I welcome it, if you come to mess up, then I’m not going to be
polite.”

Omi snorted, “As long as Xiaobai is unhappy, I’ll be in charge.” Remember the website .kanshu8.net

“Omi, I’ve already given you face.”The Dragon Clan leader’s face was cold.

The atmosphere in the palace was tense.



Omi wasn’t afraid of the Dragon Clan Chief, but with so many people around, if he really did it, one or
two deaths would be very likely, after all, Omi hadn’t reached the point where he could completely
spike the Dragon Clan Chief, and Mu Qianji and the others were so fragile that they could be blown
away in a single breath.

Xiao Bai was afraid that things would get too big, so he was busy saying, “Alright, alright, I’ll just
promise to hold a marriage recruitment contest, but I must be promised one condition.”

“Say.”

Little White said, “Brother Omi must also participate.”

“This.”The Dragon Clan Chief’s brows furrowed.

“If Brother Omi doesn’t participate, I won’t agree.”

“But he’s a human from the Extreme South Continent, if he participates, how will the other Sacred
Beast races view our Dragon Clan?It will think that we Dragon Clan have degraded ourselves, and also
that we have insulted other races who don’t care to compete with Omi.”The dragon clan leader said,
deep down he had never looked down on Omi, let alone the other humans of the Extreme South
Continent.

“I don’t care, brother Omi has to participate anyway.”

Omi’s brows were furrowed at the moment, wondering why Sebastian wanted him to participate.

The Dragon Clan Chief thought for a moment and said, “Fine, I can agree to it, but you are responsible
for any consequences that go wrong.If it’s a marriage recruitment

On the day of the tournament, the other races will be furious and will definitely be rude, and at that
time, it is possible that the entire human race of the Extreme South Continent will be plunged into a
crisis of extinction.”

“Ah, this.”Little White hesitated.

Omi was very upset and hummed, “I’d like to see who can plunge my entire continent’s human race
into crisis, Little White, I promise to participate.”

“Mmhmm, thank you, brother Omi.”

The dragon clan leader grunted and waved his hand.

Omi and the others were busy walking out of the clan leader’s palace, after which they arrived at the
palace where Little White lived.

“This is my private residence, so you guys can stay here.”.

Omi asked, “Little Bai, why did you let me participate?”

“Brother Omi, I don’t know if it’s because I have too much faith in you, but deep down I always thought
that you were the best.If you can defeat the other races, then I don’t have to marry them, I can follow
you openly.”

Mu Qianji said, “Little White, you want to marry Brother Omi, right?”



“Ah, no, no.”Little White blushed.

Omi said, “It’s fine to marry me, it’s better than marrying someone else.”Omi’s own face blushed after
saying this, and everyone looked at Omi, because they were under the impression that Omi wouldn’t
say such words so bluntly.

Omi was busy saying, “I, I don’t know how to say such words all of a sudden, I, I’m really so
wronged.What the hell, it must be the influence of my past life memories again.”Omi slapped his head.

Xiao Bai hee hee smiled, “Brother Omi, since you’ve said that, you must strive for it oh, otherwise I’ll
be someone else’s woman la.”

“, I really didn’t mean that, I just took you as my sister’s, I just, I don’t know how on my own.”Omi was
busy explaining.

“Brother Omi, I know it.”

“Mother’s egg.”Omi slapped his own head in depression.

Xiao Bai smiled happily and said, “You guys sit down first, I’ll go out and order the chef, we’ll have a
good meal tonight.”

Xiaobai slipped away in an instant.

Omi was left incomparably depressed, and Mu Qianji and the others were all stunned.

They were not so forward in their perceptions and always felt that Xiaobai was a dragon and Omi was a
human.

Omi actually read the memories of his past life, and indeed, in the Immortal World, there was no racial
distinction in the marriage contract.

It was like the Bull Demon King and Princess Iron Fan, one was a cow and the other was a human.Of
course, this is just an example, it doesn’t mean that the Immortal Realm necessarily has a Bull Demon
King.

Mu Qianji said, “Omi, no matter what, I support you.”

Xia Xiaoxin said, “Yeah, I’m not worried about Xiao Bai marrying a holy beast of another race.”

Tang Huan nodded and said, “Yes, I think so too.”

Lu Yuxi smiled, “I also think it’s good, and it’s about time those holy beast races looked down on us
humans, so it’s time to give them some credit.Brother Omi cheer up oh.”

Omi glared, “Don’t you guys just follow the nonsense.You guys know that, that sentence just now,
really wasn’t my intention, you guys have known me for so long, when have you seen me say
something so direct, I, Omi, am not such a person, it must be the influence frommy past life
memories.”

“Really?It won’t be an excuse.”

“I don’t want to talk about it, leave me alone.”
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