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After storing his opponent’s power from three attacks, Omi felt his body come, his body couldn’t really
store any more or he would surely explode and die.

Omi shouted, picked up the knife in his hand and struck out the power of the Xuanxian that he had just
stored three times.

“Yah.”Omi raised his blade and roared towards that Xuanxian Demon King to kill him.

This strike was flawless, this strike, and the earth shook.

That Xuanxian Demon King’s face changed, Omi, a Heavenly Immortal, actually took out a power that
was no less than his, he was an early Xuanxian Demon King.

That Demon King quickly picked up his spear to meet him.

“Dang.”Omi’s slash was the sum total of the opponent’s power from three attacks, it was by no means
simple, and with a clang, that Xuanxian Demon King’s spear was shaken out of his hand.

“Puff.”Omi’s blade, downward, from the top of that Xuanxian Demon King’s head, sliced into two
pieces with a single slash.

Omi himself had never thought that he had actually killed a Xuanxian Demon King.

Only, after Omi killed the Xuanxian Demon King, his body was suddenly empty, as if his entire body
had no blood, and his face was as white as paper.

At this moment, in one of the great halls of the Immortal Court, all the immortals who were watching,
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“That man, he actually killed a Xuanxian Demon King.”

“Tsk tsk, he’s just a Heavenly Immortal ah, how the hell did he do that.”

Everyone was filled with doubts and admiration, although, since ancient times, the lower realms
definitely couldn’t kill the stronger ones, but there was no absolute in everything, there were always
some people, although the realm was lower, but he was prodigious, using other methods, without
using the power of the realm, he could eventually kill the higher realms, this kind of person was
definitely a war god among war gods.

In the Heavenly Realm, those who could fight were called War Gods, and among the War Gods, that
was even more remarkable.

Right now, everyone saw Omi through the picture, and their eyes were glowing, this person must be
extraordinary.



In a certain corner of the palace, a woman of outstanding beauty looked at Omi’s eyes flashing, as if,
with just a glance, she saw it.

Unfortunately, Omi, who was killing enemies on the battlefield, had no idea that there was actually a
‘live broadcast’ like scene in the Immortal Court.

Omi’s face was pale, there seemed to be absolutely no excess energy left in his body, and this feeling
of impending death was very unpleasant.

However, at this moment, a demon soldier saw it and shouted, “Leader.”Seemingly, it knew the slain
demon king.

“I’m going to kill you.”That demon soldier became angry and killed Omi.

“Buzz.”Omi’s Star Hidden Great Law instantly absorbed and stored the power of that demon soldier’s
attack.

Omi’s body was like a cell phone that ran out of power and was about to shut off automatically, and
for a moment there was an extra bit of energy, which was far from enough, but it could save his life.

Omi didn’t rush to counterattack, allowing that demon soldier to slash and kill him, so after dozens of
times, Omi stood up and ended the demon soldier with a single slash.

And on Omi’s body, it was no longer so lackluster.

Omi rushed to the group of demon soldiers that were scuffling in front of him.

Immediately, a group of demon soldiers attacked Omi.

Omi stored up his strength as he responded.

Because Omi had to store up his strength as he did so, Omi’s killing speed was not as fast as before.

However, Omi believed that he

The life of the enemy was more important, or storing enough power in your body, that is, storing it
until it could no longer be stored, and then killing the enemy en masse.

This storage was for an hour.

This one had also been attacked thousands of times, and he had stored all this power.

Omi felt like the power in his body was about to burst again.Omi suddenly stopped storing it and
started killing it en masse.

This time, Omi was no longer afraid, and if a Xuanxian Demon King were to target him again, he would
be able to face it with more ease.

It was just a pity that he could only store so much power right now, if he could store even more, he
would not be afraid anymore.

Howmuch he could store was definitely related to two aspects, one was his realm and the other was
the profundity of the Star Hidden Great Law.



After that, Omi was no longer assassinated by Xuanxian level demon kings, instead, Dao Immortal
level demon soldiers, encountered many, but, none of them were a match for Omi, and Omi blasted
them all.

This battle went on for eight hours.

After eight hours, the Dragon Bone War God, the Wind and Fire War God, and the two of them flew
back from afar with a huge, black head.

“All demon soldiers, stop.”The War God of Wind and Fire shouted.

All the demon soldiers looked up and saw that their palace master, Old Demon Sky Demon, had his
head cut off.

“Ah, the Sky Demon Palace Master.”

All the demon soldiers were stupid.

Previously, the Three-Eyed War God, the Wind and Fire War God, and the Dragon Bone War God had
worked together to kill the Old Demon of Heaven, spending eight hours and fighting tens of
thousands of miles along the way, and finally, they had managed to behead the Old Demon of Heaven.

Unfortunately, things weren’t that successful, and the Three-Eyed War God paid a heavy price, the
Three-Eyed War God’s flesh body was destroyed, but the Primordial God fortunately didn’t die, but it
would take an unknown amount of time for the Three-Eyed War God to recover, and whether or not it
would still be this strong after recovery was something else to be said.That Old Heavenly Demon, his
flesh was cut off and his Yuan Shen fled, unlike the Three Eyed War God, the Yuan Shen of the Three
Eyed War God was undamaged, while the Old Heavenly Demon’s Yuan Shen was severely injured and
had already fled to nowhere at the moment.

Therefore, the war ended with the defeat of the Old Demon of Heavenly Demons.

Omi and the other 50,000 Heavenly Soldiers were, to be frank, just foils, not the key point of this war,
and now, a group of demon soldiers saw their boss dead and fled everywhere.

The surviving celestial soldiers that were still alive did their best to hunt them down, but also many
demon soldiers still escaped.

The Windfire War God said, “Clean up the battlefield, count the numbers, take the wounded with you,
and retreat.”

“Yes.”

After the battlefield was cleaned, 50,000 celestial soldiers, less than 20,000 were left, and more than
30,000 were dead.

However, more demon soldiers died, at least 200,000 demon soldiers died, of course, there were many
weak ones, otherwise they wouldn’t have died so much.

“All squads assemble.”

Omi returned to his squad, unfortunately, the 297 people who were in the same squad as Omi were
only about a hundred still alive, and nearly two hundred were dead.



Omi let out a deep sigh.

In fact there was no need to die so many, this kind of war, to win with the victory of the king, they only
needed to send the Heaven’s Eye War God, the Wind and Fire War God, and the Dragon Bone War God,
they only needed to kill the Old Demon of Heaven and everything would be over.

However, the Immortal Court couldn’t do that, because the Immortal World was already overcrowded,
in addition, there were hundreds of thousands of demon soldiers, how could each of the Heavenly
Soldiers, hundreds of thousands of demon soldiers if they besieged the three main generals, although
they couldn’t kill them, but they could hold them back, then, the old demons of the Heavenly Demons
would join forces again, the probability of failure would increase greatly.
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