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Chapter 1-2 

Chapter 1 Beginning 

Life was damn well going well for me again. Yeah you heard that right 

“AGAIN’ 

Yes, I may have been locked up, mistreated, and banish from someplace because of 
something that never happens but it did. I was the only one who was banished but my 
parents who know the truth resign from the pack and we move to my dad’s good old 
friend’s pack. 

The Alcaders were led by Alpha Lincoln Cruz back then now it’s led by Josh Hamilton. 
He is the Alpha’s nephew, he was made Alpha simply cause the Alpha’s daughter 
Aberdeen now my best friend oblige to her parents. 

She didn’t want the t**le instead she became one of the pack warriors. Plus her mate 
didn’t want to take over the pack as an Alpha. He loves his position as being the Beta. 

Well, I guess being beta is hot, I mean you should have seen him yet he’s my friend’s 
mate. I have no feelings for him. 

It’s funny when we moved here I was not allowed to go anywhere else except to stay 
indoors. I was home school never allowed to meet anybody else except Aberdeen and 
Josh. 

ADVERTISEMENT 

So after a year saw me being a good girl not causing any more trouble my parents 
finally decided to let me join the pack training and everything else a**ociated with the 
pack. 

Six months later on and I saw the proud look on my parent’s faces when I graduated as 
one of the top warriors in the pack. 

But that was back then, the last time I ever saw my parents smiling back at me. Now 
they are smiling at me from the heaven above and I intend to keep it that way. 

The smile fade when someone swings at me, I deflect his punches and kick him right 
where the sun doesn’t shine. 



“Next time don’t do that” I warn him. 

I continue to walk again pa**ing by Aberdeen who was training the young pups and the 
teenagers. She waves at me and all kids turn away from me without smiling. 

If anyone wanna know why kids never smile or like me it’s because I despise them. 

ADVERTISEMENT 

All their whiny, their wailing, and their pouty behavior which everyone thinks it’s cute I 
find annoying. Believe it, their tricks work only on Aberdeen but not me. 

So yes I’m like an old hag to them, who only gives a cold glare and a warning look that 
screams don’t mess with me. 

“Elle I need you and Aberdeen here in my office,” Josh’s mind links us. 

In the next 40 seconds, I was at his door-knocking ‘come in’ I open the door and went 
inside 

‘sit’ he ordered 

“I’m not a dog” I complain in a whisper 

ADVERTISEMENT 

“did you wanna say something Elle” I nodded my head no. 

After a minute our beta Leto came in with Aberdeen trailing behind him. Her face all 
blushing in red, those two are of course mates as I mentioned before and they both look 
good together. 

That’s another thing almost all of our pack members are mated hardly you find anyone 
without a Mate. 

Except for me, if we are all in a gathering or meeting or even a battle people can easily 
point me out as the unmated since no one stood with a possessive grip around my 
waist. 

Yet the feeling is mutual as there are some of us specifically me who came late in the 
race, and only to experience or feel pain when our mate died. 

Me the latecomer and did the writer says I need a mate Nah I don’t think so. 

 



Chapter 2 Camera, Lights, Action 

“Oh my, oh my my. I’ve waited all my life” 

I kept on swinging my hips and tries to cope with some bits move which I fail badly in 
doing it. 

‘The reality of struggling’ my wolf Eliz teases 

“shut up” I hissed back at her. 

“What? You’ve been practicing the same move for a month now” she counterpart. 

I glare back at her in my head, while she keeps on teasing me on how bad I did the best 
moves of a boy with love. 

Eliz and I have good connections we hardly disagree with one another but we only tend 
to annoy each other by teasing. 

“Elle” that was Aberdeen 

“yes” 

ADVERTISEMENT 

“Are you ready yet” she shouted from outside of our room’s door. 

“Coming” 

I readjust my high waist belted skirt again before smiling in the mirror and juggling my 
way out from this small room. I couldn’t believe it when Josh says that were going on his 
behalf for an important meeting at the Daluna pack. 

Wow, I was beyond excited I’ve never been to any other place apart from our pack. I 
hear whistles and hoots once I reached outside of the house. 

I keep my head up ‘unmated wolves make ways here comes the latecomer’ Eliz joke in 
my head. 

I gave her a picture of me glaring back at her. Which she burst into laughter. 

‘I just couldn’t believe we’re finally going somewhere,’ I nodded agreeing to my wolf. 

After all those years now I’m finally getting to see the world again. She whimpers when 
our thoughts reach the surface of our memories. I quickly remind her of our motto “past 
is in the past… Just let it go. So keep on smiling.” 



Alpha Josh bid us goodbye, he could see the smile on my face which he nodded his 
head and warn me not to get in any trouble. I beam with excitement turning around to 
face the front in my seat. My hand reached for the music to be played. 

ADVERTISEMENT 

“Noooooooo” Aberdeen screams at me but too late it’s already been played. 

I continued singing from where I left on in my room, “you got me high so fast….” 

Aberdeen face-palm herself, while Eliz whimper in my head. On the other hand, Leto 
just shook his head to the rhythm of the music. 

I was so excited to be away from the pack. I’m not looking forward to anything, just a 
feeling of being adventurous. The journey starts here, by going to this meeting and 
many other things to do and go to. 

Well, to meet my mate is not a quest anymore as that fate was sealed years ago. 

He’d gone no more him and I don’t want to dwell in it as it will only sadden Eliz. 

We arrived at our destination after driving for an hour. My back hurts a little not used to 
this. I stretch my arms, while Leto talks to one of the warriors maybe another beta 
before mind linking us to get out of the car. 

“Do you think, they have hotties?” Aberdeen’s eyes went up “Get out Elle and yes as 
you see there’s a hottie out there for you” she retorted. 

ADVERTISEMENT 

“Ouch” I wince and she laughs “I know you… You kept asking those questions but 
never in million years did you like anyone,” she got out signaling for me to do. 

So I imagine in my head what they do in movies. For my entrance door open slowly, 
legs out first then swiftly got out like that s**y model. 

Camera, Lights then action here we go. I did what I thought would be epic for me. In my 
head, I keep replaying those moves. 

‘All male wolves here comes the s**y, unstoppable, the one and only’ Eliz announced in 
my head. 

I open the door, legs out, and oops wrong move I almost trip so much for being the best 
actress of the year. So embarra**ed I smile at the hottie yeah Aberdeen’s word, not 
mine. 



Eliz laughs in my head uncontrollably and all I could tell myself is stupid. 

Love Xox 

Nica 

 


