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In her opinion, the reason why Omi spent 1 billion yuan to organize this game
event is entirely to make herself happy.

It’s great to have such a brother!

Omi said, “Between brothers and sisters, what else do you say thank you?”

At this time, a clear reminder sounded in Omi’s mind.

[Complete the task: hold a large-scale “Tentacle World” event with more than
500 people, and get praise frommore than 80% of the participants. Get 5 golden
red envelopes. 】

The task is complete!

When Omiyan heard it, the smile on his face became even worse.

…………

After the game “Tentacle World” ended, the crowd slowly dispersed after a long
time in the stadium.

meager.

[Satisfaction: The Tentacle World held by Qingshi is really awesome! Just like
what was advertised on the Internet, it really gave out a 1 billion bonus! I thought
it was just a gimmick. 】

[Like Chuzheng: Putting 500 million cash directly in the hot air balloon is simply
spectacular! 】

[Douban: 123 wooden people, stacking stars, tug of war, tentacles? As long as
you complete one item, you can earn at least 200,000 yuan! OMG! If I was
selected, even if I didn’t win the final victory, I could earn at least a few hundred
thousand! 】

[Big dull handsome: I forgot to sign up! It seems to have missed hundreds of
millions! 】
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[On duty: I don’t want the hundreds of millions of bonuses, mainly because I like
playing 123 wooden figures, stacking stars, tug-of-war and tentacles. So, when
will the next game be held? 】

[Twilight and night: In the end, a girl won 790 million yuan, the envy of her real
name. 】

…………

As more and more people joined the discussion, the popularity of the “Tentacle
World” game activity quickly rose to the top of the hotspot list.

Immediately afterwards, the share price of Netflix Group’s share price rose by
two points, and the Penguin Group’s share price rose by one point.

According to the proportion of shares held by Omi, Omi’s assets have increased
by 44 billion yuan!

In other words, spending 1 billion in bonuses to hold events, Omi’s assets
increased by 86 billion in total!

Of course, for these…

Omi didn’t care at all.

After returning home, he directly focused on the golden red envelopes.

“Five golden red envelopes, see what you can get.”

“Turn on!”

【Ding! Congratulations, you have received 500,000 yuan. 】

【Ding! Congratulations, you have received 100,000 yuan. 】

【Ding! Congratulations, you have received 900,000 yuan. 】

【Ding! Congratulations, get a 1 yuan crit card. 】

【Ding! Congratulations, you have obtained the skill God-level shooting. 】

Omi ignored the first four red envelopes and focused all his attention on the
god-level shooting.

Skill!



Long time!

It’s been a long time since I got the skills!

[God-level shooting: Know the specific structure and usage of all firearms, and
have the ability to hit 100% within twice the effective range of all firearms. The
more accurate the shot, the greater the charm! 】

At the same time, Omi had countless complicated firearms knowledge in his
mind.

See here…

Omi’s eyes lit up instantly.

For a while, he liked watching gunfight movies.

The reason is because I think the shooting inside is very passionate.

Good man, who doesn’t want to like shooting?

He also imagined that he would become a sharpshooter.

Unexpectedly, today has turned into reality.

The only pity is that he doesn’t have a gun, so he can’t shoot at all.

…………

Time goes by like water.

In a blink of an eye, the summer vacation came to an end.

For these two months, Omi has stayed at home.

This is the longest time since Omi has been working with a family, and it is very
warm.

Today, Dai Weixue cooked a large table of dishes, and the family ate them very
happily and contentedly.

Then, under the watchful eyes of Lin Tao and Dai Weixue, Omi drove Culinan to
carry Lin Xiaoyao and headed towards Jiangbei University.

Tomorrow is the day for the new students to report.

When she was at home, Lin Xiaoyao looked forward to going to Jiangbei earlier
and experiencing the good time in university every day.



In fact, the high school teachers portrayed the university so beautifully.

But when she really left, she looked at the receding houses and streets outside
the car window, and she looked very sad again.

Omi said, “I’m still in Jiangbei.”

“Hmm!” Lin Xiaoyao nodded vigorously.

Perhaps it was Omi’s words that worked.

When Cullinan drove in to tell, Lin Xiaoyao’s face was full of smiles.

She looked at the green trees outside the window and the sun hanging in the
mountains, and said excitedly: “Brother, look… so beautiful!”

“Yes.” Omi said.

“Brother, college is really easy, is it fun?” Lin Xiaoyao asked.

Omi said: “Easy, it’s very easy, if it’s fun, then I don’t know.”

Omi didn’t talk nonsense about this sentence.

Because when he was in college, he slept in almost every class, and he would
absent from class if he wanted to. If he wanted to ask for leave, he would ask for
leave. If this is not called easy, then what is easy?

Lin Xiaoyao yearned: “So what the teacher said is true.”

About an hour later, Cullinan arrived in Jiangbei.

Omi first took Lin Xiaoyao to the supermarket and bought a lot of daily
necessities.

Then, we went to a two-Michelin star restaurant and had a sumptuous dinner.

Lin Xiaoyao almost didn’t swallow her tongue, and exclaimed from time to time.

Finally, the two talents came to Panlong Villa.

When I visited Panlong Villa last time, Lin Xiaoyao only glanced at the
appearance.

Now, after living here, she looks at the gorgeous decoration, luxurious
furniture…so she is in the palace, and she becomes a gorgeous princess.

Tonight, Lin Xiaoyao slept very comfortably.



…………

The next day.

The birds outside the window fell on the branches early and made a crisp cry.

“I ate a bug today.”

“I haven’t eaten yet…”

Omi slowly opened his eyes, and he glanced at the phone casually.

“At 0:00, China Merchants Bank remitted 37899200 yuan.”

Then, he turned his attention to the sign-in system.

“Sign in!”

【Ding! Congratulations, you got 10 million yuan. 】

Then, he got up.

At this time, Lin Xiaoyao was already sitting on the big sofa in the living room.

After she saw Omi, she smiled and said, “Brother, morning!”

Omi said, “Morning, how did you sleep yesterday?”

Lin Xiaoyao said seriously: “Very comfortable!”

“Okay, let’s go out for breakfast, and then go to school.” Omi said.

“Okay.” Lin Xiaoyao answered.

…………

At this time, it belongs to the peak period of work.

What’s more, today is September 1st, and the roads are even more congested.

As a result, it only took 20 minutes to reach the distance.

In the end, Omi spent nearly an hour.

In the new school year, generally speaking, slogans such as “welcome new
students” will be hung up at the school gate in the most conspicuous position.



But this year…

Many other banners were hung up in a prominent position.

“Warm congratulations to Professor Omi of our school for winning the Fields
Prize in Mathematics”!

“Warm congratulations to Professor Omi of our school for winning the Nobel
Prize in Chemistry”!

“Congratulations to Professor Omi of our school for winning the Nobel Prize in
Medicine”!

…………

Looking up, it was almost all a banner congratulating Professor Omi.

There is only one hardly noticeable corner with a small banner: “Welcome to New
Students”!

Regarding this…

Whether it is an old student or a new student, there is nothing unpleasant.

On the contrary, their faces are full of excitement, full of looking up!

There is such a professor in my school, and I am proud!

Lin Xiaoyao exclaimed excitedly: “Brother, you are so awesome!”

Omi touched his nose and said, “Go in and go through the enrollment
procedures.”

“Crack!”

Lin Xiaoyao picked up the phone and, like many people, took a few photos at the
gate and the banner, and then said, “Okay.”

No matter what Omi said, he also stayed in Jiangbei University for nearly a year.
In addition, he is also a professor at Jiangbei University…

Therefore, I am very familiar with the registration location and process, and I
have avoided a lot of wrongdoing.

After lining up for about 10 minutes, it was their turn to sign up.



At this time, a woman with a hot body and heavy makeup came up to Omi and
said in a voice that she thought was sweet: “Hello, my classmate, I have
something urgent later, you can ask me to join the team. ?”

I have to say that in the youthful campus, this woman’s dress has a maverick
taste.

“No.” Omi said straightforwardly.

The woman with heavy makeup was stunned immediately.

She couldn’t believe her ears~~ When she wanted to come, she was so beautiful
and her voice was so sweet, how could a boy reject her?

Omi ignored that much, and continued to walk forward, saying, “Xiao Yao, take
out the notice.”

“Okay.” Lin Xiaoyao answered.

I just ignored myself?

The pretty face of the woman with heavy makeup flushed slightly.

Generally, freshmen apply for admission, and it takes less than an hour or two to
get it.

However, it only took Omi more than 20 minutes to finish all the procedures,
and then sent Lin Xiaoyao to the bottom of the girls’ dormitory.

Yes.

Lin Xiaoyao prepares to stay in the dormitory.

Generally speaking, all college students must live on campus.

Relying on Omi’s special status in the school, it can be completely special.

However, Lin Xiaoyao decided to stay in the dormitory.

And Omi did not oppose too much.

Because he feels that sometimes living in school is not a bad thing.

After all, Lin Xiaoyao has grown up and always has to get along with people all
alone.

After Omi had dealt with Lin Xiaoyao’s registration, he walked in the direction
of his office.



After all, he is now a teacher.

I haven’t seen my students for two months. What if they encounter problems?

Still have to help solve it.

“Tatata!”

At this moment, the heavy makeup woman who had been refused by Omi to
jump in the line just happened to come over from a distance.

She looked at Omi’s figure, her eyes turned slightly.

Seeing that Omi was about to go far, she hurriedly picked up the phone and
took a picture of Omi’s back, with a slight tick at the corner of her mouth.

With a sneer, “Don’t let me jump in the line? Okay!”

While talking, she slowly opened up the circle of friends and meager…
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[Sweet: On the first day of school, when I walked past the basketball court on the
playground, a boy in a gray T-shirt sneaked on my ass, no glasses, and a height of
about 180. Tall man, I really can’t beat you up, but I can kill you in the circle of
friends first.背影.jpg】

After the heavy makeup woman sent her friend group, she went to the class
group, grade group, and school group to say it again, which aroused many
people’s discussion.

[Second Brother Song: In broad daylight, I dare to sneak a girl’s ass! I will forward
it for you! 】

[King: I also forward it. 】

[Chaos: She die him! 】

[Fengzhong Tianyuan: Tang Si is sweet, right? She is really good-looking! Like it,
just pursue it, it’s so shameless to sneak in the ass! Expose him! 】



[One, two, three, wooden people: This kind of boy is really embarrassing to us
Jiangbei University! 】

[Xue: Shame? This is more than a shame! Already molested, crime! Tang Si, I
suggest you call the police now and catch him directly! 】

As more and more people joined the discussion, Tang Si’s photos were also
turned over and praised by many people.

Tang Si looked at the people’s insults to Omi and the praise of himself, and the
whole person was a little fluttering.

She likes this feeling very much.

Especially, when she saw someone saying that she was more beautiful than most
Internet celebrities and celebrities, she became happier.

At the same time, Tang Si’s mind began to liven up.

Many Internet celebrities suddenly became popular because of something, and
then soared into the sky!

One needs to have good looks and good academic qualifications. If this thing
works, can you also become an Internet celebrity?

Thinking of this, Tang Si’s heart began to beat faster.

She opened Weibo, sent the message in Moments, and sent it again.

Then, she went to place an order and invited a wave of naval forces to join in the
forwarding and commenting.

As one of the top ten key universities in the country, Jiangbei University has a
certain degree of enthusiasm.

Especially when Omi joined Jiangbei University, he first solved mathematics
problems and won the Fields Prize, and then invented many high-tech products
such as super batteries, earthquake predictors, carbon-based chips, etc., and thus
won four Nobel Prizes. The reputation and popularity of the university have
become even greater.

In addition, the issue of men and women is also a topic of concern…

After ‘1+1+1’, it really aroused the attention and discussion of many people.

Later, under the impetus of some interested people, Tang Si’s meager comments
went from a few hundred to a few thousand, and later it reached a terrifying
level of tens of thousands!



Finally, a headline appeared on meager: Jiangbei University molested male!

This title keeps rising, rising… and even, climbing to the top of the most
searched.

Some people denounced Omi, some suggested to call the police directly, and
some even came to Jiangbei University deliberately to find a man in a gray
T-shirt!

…

For these, Omi didn’t care at all.

At this time, he has come to the office.

Ordinary students, on the first and last day of school, have no intention of
studying or reading at all.

However, Xia Bing, Xia Xue, Hao Zhiwu, Nie Zhenjiang and others have already
immersed themselves in their studies.

“Meow!”

The cat Xiaobai on Hao Zhiwu’s shoulders was the first to spot Omi and let out a
loud cry.

“Master, you are finally here!”

“Meow!”

“Master, I miss you so much!”

“Meow!”

“Master, can you give me something delicious?”

Cat Xiaobai came to Omi’s feet while barking, moving back and forth, constantly
rubbing.

After two months of not teasing the cat, to be honest, Omi really missed it a bit.

He bends down, first slapped a few hands back and forth from start to finish.

Then, he picked up a pack of fine beef and cat food and put it on the ground.

“Cuckoo!”



Cat Xiaobai directly stuffed his entire head into the cat food, and ate it with big
mouthfuls.

That’s it!

too delicious!

At this time, Hao Zhiwu also noticed that the cat Xiaobai had jumped off his
shoulders. After he looked up and saw Omi, he exclaimed excitedly, “Professor
Lin!”

Then, everyone raised their heads.

“Professor Lin!”

I haven’t seen each other for two months. At this time, everyone seemed very
excited.

For one thing, I missed Omi.

Secondly, I am grateful to Omi!

gratitude?

That’s right!

Because, before the summer vacation, all the papers they wrote were
successfully published in the top issue under Omi’s revision.

In other words…

Nowadays, they are the people who write top magazines one by one!

To know…

Many university professors do not have a top issue!

This is definitely an amazing thing.

They understand that this is all Omi’s credit.

…

Xia Bing and Xia Xue hurriedly took out two bottles of Pulse and handed them
out.

Omi nodded to them, then, taking the pulse, took a sip of each, and said, “Did
you encounter any problems in the past two months?”



In fact, he asked casually.

Generally speaking, isn’t summer vacation a time for students to have a good
rest?

However…

Omi’s students are obviously extraordinary.

Hao Zhiwu was the first to say: “Professor Lin, I have done some research on the
nervous system, but there are still many things that I don’t understand…”

While talking, UU reading www. He took out a stack of dozens of pages of draft
paper.

On each page of draft paper, there are densely packed figures and characters,
and different colors of marks are also made.

If you are an average teacher, seeing so many draft papers, I am afraid you will
have a headache.

However, Omi didn’t care at all, he just glanced at Hao Zhiwu slightly
differently.

Then, I quickly flipped through the drafting paper.

“Wow!”

Just hear…

In about 2 minutes, Omi read all the content and understood all the knowledge
involved.

“You need to strengthen your neural connections and neurons. In addition, there
is a problem with your response here…”

Hao Zhiwu quickly said: “It turned out to be like this, thank you professor!”

At the same time, he admired Omi even more.

I just flipped it twice, and I knew my problem. I am worthy of being a professor!

Then Jiang Chaoqun came over with a stack of draft paper and asked questions.

Then, Liu Qianqian, Nie Zhenjiang…

Omi took about 10 minutes to answer their questions.



Then, his gaze fell on Xia Bing and Xia Xue.

“Have you encountered a question that you won’t be able to answer?”

Xia Bing and Xia Xue’s pretty faces blushed instantly, nodded lightly, and said,
“Yeah!”

After speaking, he also took out a stack of draft paper.

Some people say that genius is 99% of sweat, plus 1% of inspiration.

This sentence…maybe an exaggeration.

However, one thing is true.

Geniuses tend to work harder than ordinary people.

Xia Bing, Xia Xue, Hao Zhiwu, Nie Zhenjiang and others are the best proof.

They came to the office school in advance every day, and even during the
leisurely summer vacation, they did not relax.

(

On the first day, in the inquiries of Hao Zhiwu, Nie Zhenjiang, Jiang Chaoqun and
others, and Omi’s continuous answers, they slowly passed over.

As the sun sets, after Omi ate dinner, he went straight back to Panlong Villa,
sitting on the soft sofa, enjoying the scenery outside the window while drinking
spiritual tea.

…………

Today, it is the online world.

As the topic of “Jiangbei University molesting men” continues to rise, more and
more people have joined the crusade.

[Poor people: They are still students of Jiangbei University. The road to quality
education is a long way to go! 】

[Baby Feng: Who is in Jiangbei University? Get him out quickly! 】

[Flowers by the sea: Jiangbei University, if this student is not expelled, is he still
waiting for the New Year? 】

[Feng: Only expelled? That’s too cheap for him! Must be caught and jailed! 】



…………

Tang Si’s meager fans have also started to rise rapidly. From the initial 1120 fans,
in just one day, they have directly become 300,000 fans!

She looked at the beeping sounds of the mobile phone, her entire face was a ball
of laughter.

She seems to have seen the picture of herself becoming a hot super-net celebrity,
driving a luxury car, wearing a famous brand, wearing a famous watch… No
matter where she goes, there will be countless fans’ exclamations and pictures.

It’s so right to post this message yourself!

Many people on the Internet asked Tang Si to call the police and arrest the
molesting man.

She replied in a kind-hearted tone: After all, others have finally passed the exam
to Jiangbei University, and they don’t want to do too much and give others a
chance.

The reason Tang Si responded in this way was because she understood that Omi
had not touched her **** at all, and the investigation would intervene. If
something was discovered, it might be detrimental to her.

Secondly, it is because she wants to build a character, a kind, innocent character,
which is more pleasing!

Sure enough, after she responded like this, the number of fans increased again.

However, she did not call the police, but the ‘enthusiastic’ netizens couldn’t make
it through. Someone helped call the police.

Soon, Jiangbei investigation issued an announcement and will investigate this
matter.

Some ‘enthusiastic’ netizens have pulled out of Jiangbei University.

Regarding such matters, Jiangbei University did not want to reply, and only
conducted self-examination.

However, the enthusiasm was too high and it was under pressure… So that night,
an announcement was issued, stating that a strict investigation would be
conducted, and that it would follow-up processing and public release.

…………

Male dormitory.



Jiang Chaoqun, who had been studying all day during the day, took a cold shower
and then sat on the bed and swiped his phone for a while.

When he saw the hot search for “Jiangbei University molested man”, he clicked in
curiously.

After all, he is now also a student of Jiangbei University.

“The number of views is 350 million and the number of comments is 87,000? Did
so many people discuss it?” Jiang Chaoqun was surprised.

Then, Jiang Chaoqun looked down, and then his gaze fell on the back of the
‘obscene man’.

His brows frowned quickly, and he murmured: “This figure, and clothes…like…”

After Jiang Chaoqun pondered for a while, he opened the “Take-off Group” and
sent a message.

Jiang Chaoqun: Have you seen meager things?

The takeoff group is a group formed by Omi’s students, such as Hao Zhiwu,
Jiang Chaoqun, Nie Zhenjiang, Xia Bing, Xia Xue, Liu Qianqian, etc.

Take off… In the eyes of everyone, as long as you study under Omi, one day you
can take off.

Hao Zhiwu: Meager? Have time to watch that thing and play a few games. Isn’t it
fragrant?

Nie Zhenjiang: Is there any special news on the meager?

Liu Qianqian: Unexpectedly, there are also boys who like to play meager, I rarely
play.

Jiang Chaoqun: No. 1 in the hot search, Jiangbei University molested male.

Then, he posted the link.

Xia Bing: They are talking nonsense!

Xia Xue: They are talking nonsense!

Xia Bing and Xia Xue recognized at a glance, Omi was in the background.

And they obviously don’t believe in insults on the Internet.



Liu Qianqian: Is this Professor Lin from behind? It is absolutely impossible for him
to molest others!

She is also very sure of this matter.

Because Lin Qianqian knew that Xia Bing and Xia Xue had a deep affection
for Omi, I’m afraid they would follow Omi’s words.

Even without Xia Bing and Xia Xue, with Omi’s ability, no matter how beautiful a
woman is, it’s probably just a trick.

And the woman named Tang Si can barely be considered a middle-upper, where is
it worth Omi to molest?

After Liu Qianqian sent this message, Omi could not help but appear in her mind
to solve the problem, and the scene of throwing a basketball casually, and there
was a touch of special color in her beautiful eyes.

Hao Zhiwu: f*ck! This is definitely slandering Professor Lin! What a special one!

Nie Zhenjiang: The student named Tang Si must be asked to come forward and
clarify quickly, otherwise, Professor Lin will be affected.

…………

Xia Bing and Xia Xue did not continue to send messages in the takeoff group.

They hurriedly turned on the computer, and quickly jumped with both hands on
the keyboard.

They want to return Omi’s innocence!

Not long after ~~ dense codes appeared on the computer screen.

Then, Tang Si’s school status, test scores, school performance, college class,
contact information, etc., everything appeared on the screen.

With the contact information, Xia Bing and Xia Xue did not directly contact each
other, asking for clarification.

unnecessary!

Since the other party slandered Omi, it must pay a price!

Their hands continued to jump quickly on the keyboard.

Roommate Zhao Ni took a sip of ice-cola, hiccups, and asked in confusion, “Xia
Bing, Xia Xue, what are you doing?”



Xia Bing, Xia Xue and Zhao Ni have a pretty good relationship.

In the past, as long as Zhao Ni speaks, they will answer.

But today, they didn’t seem to hear it, their fingers still beating quickly on the
keyboard.

Because, at this time, Xia Bing and Xia Xue just wanted to restore Omi’s
innocence in the fastest possible time, and to punish the slanderer!

After a while, a video appeared on the screen.

This… turned out to be the campus surveillance of Jiangbei University!

In the morning, when students signed up, the whole campus was full of students
and it was very noisy.

Before long, a tall, handsome figure appeared in the screen.

It is Omi!

When Xia Bing and Xia Xue saw Omi, the two pairs of beautiful eyes seemed to
flash with light, extremely gentle.

Immediately afterwards, a woman with heavy make-up also appeared in the
picture, it was Tang Hui!

When Xia Bing and Xia Xue saw her, their beautiful eyes were slightly cold.

Omi always walked in front, and the two did not have any contact.

After seeing Tang Hui taking a picture of Omi, a sneer appeared on her face
immediately, so far, it’s over!

The truth is revealed!

This is framed!

…………

(

Song family.

Since Omi gave the Song’s new herbal tea formula, the sales of Song’s herbal tea
has started to increase day by day, and it has become the number one beverage
in China.



The entire Song family has also become busy, opening up the market, expanding
the growth line and so on.

Originally, the Song family wanted to wait for Song Jiaxin to start a company to
exercise her after graduation.

Then, let her enter Song Liangcha.

However, as the Song family got busier… the Song family changed its decision.

Of course, more importantly, Song Jiaxin is Omi’s classmate, and the
relationship is extremely unusual.

In this case, Song Jiaxin must be given power as soon as possible.

So that, on the first day of school, Song Jiaxin did not report to school, but was
dealing with company affairs.

Today, she dragged her tired body back to the villa until the evening and took a
very comfortable hot bath.

Then Song Jiaxin sat in front of the window sill, picked up the phone, and swiped
it casually.

Every day, only at this time can she have a little time for her own entertainment.

Tired and fulfilled!

Song Jiaxin opened the meager habitually.

Soon, she set her sights on the top searched title: Jiangbei University molested
male.

Song Jiaxin frowned.

She naturally feels very disgusted with molested men.

Unexpectedly, such people also appeared in my school.

With a touch of anger, she directly clicked in.

next moment……

Song Jiaxin frowned even more.

Back view of a gray T-shirt!

With just a glance, she confirmed that this person is Omi.



Omi molested a coquettish woman?

how is this possible!

Song Jiaxin instantly understood that this was framed!

She has seen many similar things.

In most cases, even if it is proven to be falsely accused, the woman is just a little
bit of criticism.

And men will be deeply affected.

However, the other party dared to frame Omi! ?

Song Jiaxin’s entire face was instantly cold, she opened the address book, found
black 001, and dialed the phone.

The network is one of the most important places for all enterprises.

It involves important information such as accounts, operations, planning and so
on.

Therefore, many large companies have their own celebrities and hackers in order
to block and conquer the enemy.

Black 001 is Song Liangcha’s most powerful hacker.

“Ms. Song, hello.” There was a slightly hoarse voice on the phone.

Song Jiaxin said: “Help me investigate the surveillance of Jiangbei University,
especially the surveillance of molested men at Jiangbei University, and related
information!”

“Yes, wait a minute,” the hoarse voice said.

After a while, a compressed package appeared on the computer desktop.

Song Jiaxin quickly decompressed. After a while, Tang Si and Omi met at the
registration office for the first time, and met at the playground for the second
time, taking pictures…

Then, Tang Si first sent it to the circle of friends, and then sent it to the meager
framing of Omi, and even the request of the Navy, all appeared in front of Song
Jiaxin.

The more Song Jiaxin looked, her face became colder.



“What a vicious woman! Humph!”

Then, she dialed the public relations department.

“Help me send out a video and article, I want it to be number one in the hot list in
the shortest time!”

“Yes!” There was a solemn tone on the phone.
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Jiangbei University.

Director Huang of the Academic Affairs Office, Professor Wang of the School of
Computer Science, and Director Liu of the Security Office gathered together.

Director Liu said: “Director Huang, all the school surveillance videos are here.”

Director Huang said: “Thanks.”

Then, to the bald middle-aged man next to him: “Professor Wang, I’m sorry to
trouble you.”

Professor Wang said: “It’s just a small matter.”

After speaking, he sat in front of the computer, preparing to copy surveillance
video.

At this time, Professor Wang said: “Huh? The surveillance video seems to have
been hacked.”

“Has been invaded?” Director Huang frowned slightly.

This matter is said to be small and big, and big to big.

After all, the location where surveillance video is installed is not a private
location.

However, it is also a troublesome thing to be used by some malicious people.

https://t.me/theamazingsoninlaw


Director Liu was obviously aware of this, and asked, “When was someone
invaded?”

“Just today, just now…” Professor Wang said, “However, you don’t need to be
too nervous. The other party only invaded today’s surveillance and just copied
the video.”

Director Huang and Director Liu all breathed a sigh of relief when they heard this.

If it is only today, it should not have much impact.

Professor Wang didn’t say much, his hands jumped quickly on the keyboard.

Then, quickly compared the back view of the’Jiangbei University molesting man’
with the surveillance system.

It has to be said that knowledge possesses incredible abilities.

Information that originally took several hours to watch at double speeds to learn.

Within ten seconds, the front, side, and back of the gray T-shirt man and Tang Si
all appeared on the screen.

Professor Wang said: “It has been found out.”

Then, the three of them looked at the screen together.

The next moment, Director Huang, Professor Wang, and Director Liu all opened
their eyes wide and shouted, “What?”

Omi!

The obscene man in Tang Si’s mouth~~ is Omi?

Director Huang yelled first: “Nonsense! Slander!”

Professor Wang also exclaimed: “The world is going downhill, and people’s hearts
are not old! Can you just open your mouth and talk nonsense on the Internet? It’s
unreasonable!”

Director Liu shouted: “The most poisonous woman’s heart!”

According to their initial thoughts, even after finding out the surveillance video,
they found that the man did not touch his butt.

Then you must find him out and make a careful inquiry.

But, now, no need!



It’s totally unnecessary!

Who is Omi?

A great mathematician who has solved several unsolved problems in
mathematics, a super scholar who invented an earthquake predictor, a
carbon-based lithography machine, a super battery, and an insulin rehabilitation
agent!

Nowadays, it is a great existence that is about to win Fields, and is about to win
four Nobel Prizes at once!

great!

That’s right!

This is enough to call it great!

Now, some people say that he molested himself.

How can this be!

Professor Wang said seriously: “Director Huang, I think the school must handle
this matter properly, otherwise, I am afraid that such a great scholar as Professor
Lin will be unjustly wronged!”

Director Huang solemnly said: “I will report to the school now to handle this
matter in the most severe and expeditious way, and strive to reduce the
grievances suffered by Professor Lin!”

Therefore, that evening, the president, vice president, director of the Academic
Affairs Office, and director of the teaching office of Jiangbei University, and
many high-level school officials, held an emergency meeting.

Generally speaking, in order to ensure the accuracy of information in dealing
with similar major network incidents, it takes at least three days of investigation
before it is announced.

But today…

Before reaching the early morning of the next day, Jiangbei University was a
little abnormal… released an investigation notice on Jiangbei University’s
molesting males.

ore and more people joined the discussion…

The emotions of the people continue to rise.

They are extremely empathetic to Tang Si.



There is even a sign that the molested man will be expelled immediately.

At this time, a hot search suddenly appeared on Weibo: She said nonsense!

[Bing: She is talking nonsense about what Tang Si said! Tang Si was not touched
at all! Video.mp4】

[Xue: She is talking nonsense about what Tang Si said! Tang Si was not touched at
all! Video.mp4】

This is the account registered by Xia Bing and Xia Xuexin.

Newcomers, new accounts, where might there be any heat?

However, their idea is to let more people know that Omi was wronged!

As a result, they used their own network technology to push the topic on the hot
search list abruptly.

This attracted comments from a few people.

[Chaos: I rub! After a long time, Tang Si is talking nonsense? Framed? 】

[Every day, every day: What is framed? Upstairs, don’t you look at it, just a few
comments? It turned out to be a hot search, isn’t it weird? 】

[The charm of nowhere to put: disgusting! This must be the stinking lewd man,
the Scrubbing Party invited! Also, buy traffic! Also use two newly registered
numbers to post topics! I bother! Do you think this will allow everyone to deny
what you committed? impossible! 】

[Flowers: Indecent men, I advise you to hurry up and stay in jail, don’t resist! 】

[Bi Xin: The shameless lewd man is really shameless. He even mosaics his face in
the video. Since you are pleased to clean the party, show your face! Scared? Be a
guilty conscience! Pooh! 】

Didn’t show your face?

That’s right!

Xia Bing and Xia Xue did not show Omi’s face.

Because they are observing Omi’s information every day.



Gradually, Xia Bing and Xia Xue discovered that Omi did not like to be exposed
on the Internet, so that, even if he had achieved such a huge achievement today,
no one of his photos was posted on the Internet.

In addition, Xia Bing and Xia Xue didn’t want to have any adverse effects on Omi
in this slander incident.

What Xia Bing and Xia Xue didn’t know was that they also mosaiced Omi’s video.

Otherwise, their video will not appear on the Internet successfully.

Because Omi owns the super smart watch Xiao Bai, and is always
executing Omi’s orders, as long as the videos and photos about him appear on
the Internet, they will all be eliminated in the first time.

At this time, the Internet has formed a unified offensive against Omi.

Even if Xia Bing and Xia Xue push the topic to the hot search, even if there is a
video as evidence, it will not have any effect.

But, it didn’t take long…

Many big media, such as Jiangbei News, Meager News, Daily News, Hot News,
Social Hotspots, etc., released news at the same time:

“The slander of a woman from Tang at Jiangbei University”!

In the news, all the mosaic videos of Omi and Tang Si in school today were
released.

Then, the previous cause and effect, as well as the matter of Tang Si’s invitation
to the navy, were analyzed and summarized, and the content was clear and clear,
so that people could understand it at a glance.

Originally, after a day of fermentation, the hearts of everyone on the Internet
were constantly boiling over the incident of male molestation at Jiangbei
University, like boiling water.

After seeing this news, he immediately poured a large scoop of ice water in
boiling water.

Everyone became calm again.

[Lin Zi: We seem to be used by others? 】

[Huanhuan: This…]

[Ling Bo Qiutang: What is the real situation? 】



[Zhou Yan: Why do I feel that something is still wrong? In this news, it is all
analysis and reasoning, in the final analysis, it is all speculation! To draw
conclusions, to report, and to investigate and report, right? No matter how bad it
is, it should be the official Jiangbei University, right? 】

[Coffee without sugar: That’s right upstairs! The whole story reveals weirdness! I
suspect that these big Vs might have been invited by the lewd man! I am here to
analyze a wave!

This molesting man may be the elder brother of a large consortium. The reason
why he dared to molest in public at school was all because he was powerful and
powerful, so he was unscrupulous!

Sisters, don’t be deceived by him. 】

[Orange Orange Orange: This…Is it impossible? These big Vs seem to have
official accounts. 】

…

This is from Song Jiaxin.

Although, failed to completely convince everyone.

However, some people are no longer so radical.

…

And when everyone was talking about it, Jiangbei University’s official website
also issued an announcement.

[Jiangbei University: Announcement about molesting men in this school. Our
school attaches great importance to this incident. Through careful investigation,
we are now responding to the incident and results.

This incident began when a female student Tang registered to jump in the line,
but the other party refused to cause resentment.

So when they met again, Tang took pictures and retaliated.

Later, because Tang wanted to use the opportunity to create hot spots and
became famous as an Internet celebrity, he deliberately expanded the incident.

Therefore, this incident has nothing to do with the man.

In response to Tang’s frame of the man’s spouse, UU Read Omi, our school has
now decided to record a major demerit and stay in school for probation!



Hope you all take this as a warning!

Finally, thank you all for your attention to Jiangbei University. 】

This news quickly attracted the attention and comments of countless people.

[Fangyuan: Terrible, it’s really framed! Isn’t it too bad? 】

[Mom Da Zhuang: Fortunately, I kept cheering and cheering on Tang Si, but it
turned out to be framed! 】

[Watermelon: Revenge for not letting her jump in the line? The mind is too bad. 】

[Bing Sha: This Jiangbei University investigation is so fast, but is this true? 】

…

Immediately afterwards, Jiangbei Investigation also issued a similar
announcement.

[Jiangbei investigation: After investigation, Tang admitted that he was purely
framed.

However, she also did not call the police.

Now Tang will apologize publicly to the other party and put it on top. 】

…

Soon, many people commented on the meager investigation of Jiangbei.

[MMM: It’s really framed. 】

[Shallow smile: to win the sympathy of the public and waste public resources! 】

[Lan Genie: The news that came out today will be the result today. Moreover,
regardless of the official website or the media, they all suddenly pointed the
finger at the girl Tang Si, just like there is an invisible big hand, constantly
advancing.

If it is really like what some people say, that molested man is the son of a big
consortium…it is extremely scary to think carefully! 】

[Text: Terrible! 】



…

Even though many big media, Jiangbei University officials, and Jiangbei
Investigation Bureau released news and announcements, they still haven’t
gained everyone’s trust.

Until… early morning!

The National Daily published meagerly.

PS: “.

National Daily: Defamation and slander are both crimes! Recently, Mr. Tang from
Jiangbei University had evil in his heart, using the Internet to slander and slander
others, but he did not know that he had already embarked on the path of crime! I
hope you all learn from it! 】

This article is not long.

However, in one fell swoop, everyone believed that Tang Si was framing Omi!

Because this is the National Daily!

The most just and dedicated national daily newspaper!

[Li Ruo: It turned out to be like this, I was almost deceived by Tang Si. 】

[Chen Niannian: I hope to deal with it seriously and avoid the incident of the wolf
coming. 】

[Xu Yue: Taking advantage of everyone’s sympathy, this kind of person is
terrible. 】

[Qian Kun Tian Xia: I saw that there are still people saying that the person who is
framed is the rich second generation, who covers the sky with one hand, and is
paranoid, right? 】

[The wind is blowing: Didn’t you say you committed a crime? Jiangbei Jicha and
Jiangbei University can’t just let her go! 】

[Love you for ten thousand years: One word, severe punishment! 】

[Mu Family: Although, I also want to say severe punishment, but isn’t this two
words? 】



…………

That night.

When Tang Si looked at the ever-increasing number of fans, his whole face was
full of smiles.

However, before she laughed long, she was called to the conference room by the
leaders of Jiangbei University.

There, she saw the professor, the director, the dean… even the principal!

For a long time, Tang Si felt that he would not be ordinary in the future, either to
marry a rich family or become a big internet celebrity or star!

But when she saw so many big leaders, she was still at a loss.

Answering questions in front of so many leaders is very stressful.

Coupled with professional and rigorous review, as well as the face of definite
evidence…

It didn’t take long before Tang Si explained all the causes and consequences.

Therefore, Jiangbei University punished Tang Si on the same day.

According to the principal and others, the impact of this incident is very bad.

If it wasn’t for Tang Si’s confession, it was okay, otherwise, he should be expelled
directly.

This is not over yet!

As soon as Tang Si returned to the dormitory, the two investigators rushed over.

“Hello, is it Ms. Tang Si? You are suspected of slandering others, please come
with us.”

On the first day of school, Tang Si was remembered by the school and stayed for
probation.

And, spent the night in the Investigation Bureau…

The whole person became extremely haggard, and his heart was filled with
endless regret.

…………



Omi didn’t know this at all.

Of course, even if he knew it, he wouldn’t care at all.

The next day, as usual, he came to Jiangbei University.

Last night, Xia Bing and Xia Xue already knew the result of Tang Si’s treatment,
and looked very happy, with a smile on Qiao’s face all the time.

Because, what happened yesterday, with some of their participation.

This made them feel like they had helped Omi, and they were very happy.

A few days passed in a flash.

In a blink of an eye, it was Saturday.

During the summer vacation, Omi stayed at Qingshi’s house, very warm and
comfortable.

However, the prosperous experience of big cities is missing.

So, after having breakfast today, Omi came to Jiangbei Financial Street, looked
at the tall CBD on both sides of the road, and experienced the prosperous city
that he hadn’t seen for a long time.

…………

Today, Wang Tong and Li Xinyue came to the Financial Street to go shopping
together.

Originally, Li Xinyue didn’t really want to go out.

However, Wang Tong repeatedly invited Li Xinyue to refuse.

After all, the two are roommates no matter what, the relationship is too stiff and
not good.

On the second day of enrollment, at the suggestion of Wang Tong, the four
people in the dormitory held a dinner together.

Coincidentally, Wang Tong happened to meet his boyfriend and two of his
friends.

So, a few people simply ate together.

After that, Wang Tong often consciously or unconsciously praised one of the men
named Tan Jiayou in front of Li Xinyue.



Said that his family has assets of nearly 100 million yuan, lives in a big villa, runs
supercars and so on.

He even asked Li Xinyue what he thought of him.

Li Xinyue is not a kid who knows nothing.

She naturally understood what Wang Tong meant.

The other party wanted to match himself with Tan Jiayou.

So Li Xinyue said straightforwardly: “I have someone I like.”

So far…

Wang Tong stopped similar topics.

Today, Li Xinyue agreed to go shopping together with Wang Tong’s invitation in
every possible way, but she did not expect to meet Tan Jiayou who happened to
be in a suit and shoes.

It happened once.

It happened twice.

Where are so many coincidences in the world?

Li Xinyue was unhappy, but she couldn’t just click on it, so she said more.

However, Tan Jiayou posted up like a mangy dog, constantly searching for topics.

This made Li Xinyue very bored, and she kept frowning. When she was trying to
find a reason to leave, she just saw a tall, handsome figure when she looked up.

It is Omi!

At this moment, Li Xinyue’s brows stretched instantly, and the whole pretty face
was like the spring of spring, extremely brilliant.

When Omi invited Director Li Quan to treat Li Xinyue’s father’s tumor, Li
Xinyue’s heart went through many changes.

At first it was grateful, but as time passed, Omi seemed to be firmly engraved in
Li Xinyue’s heart.

When Li Xinyue was alone, pictures of Omi chatting with her father often
appeared in her mind~~A picture of Omi smiling, the moment Omi opened the
door…



Gradually, Li Xinyue knew that she was in love with Omi.

She wants to be with Omi all the time.

It was this kind of psychology that made Li Xinyue study hard in the last semester,
and finally entered Jiangbei University with very good grades.

Since coming to Jiangbei University, Li Xinyue has been looking forward to
meeting him.

Today, it finally turned into reality!

Li Xinyue shouted in a trembling voice: “Brother Lin!”

Omi smiled and said, “Xinyue.”

Then, Li Xinyue no longer paid attention to Tan Jiayou who had been talking
about her, and ran towards Omi quickly.

During the college entrance examination, Omi discovered that Li Xinyue was
already slim.

After two months of growing up during the summer vacation, Omi found that Li
Xinyue’s face, waist, and thighs had not changed, but the bottom of her neck had
risen.

“Come to Jiangbei University?” Omi asked.

“Yeah!” Li Xinyue nodded vigorously, and while she was speaking, her beautiful
eyes kept shining brilliantly, and the whole pretty face was flushed, very excited.

The Tan Jiayou behind him saw this, his face sinking slightly.

Wang Tong next to him said at the right time: “Xin Yue, is this your friend? Why
don’t you introduce it?”

After a pause, he said: “Hello, I am Xinyue’s university and there is Wang Tong.”

Then, he introduced: “This is my boyfriend’s friend Tan Jiayou.”

As she introduced, at the same time, her eyes were still quietly looking at Omi.

Omi said, “Hello, I’m Omi, the senior of Xinyue High School.”

Although, Omi didn’t like this kind of scrutiny.

However, the other party was Li Xinyue’s roommate after all, and he couldn’t
make things too ugly.



(

Wang Tong thinks that he has a pair of piercing eyes that can see through men,
and he can easily spot men’s economic conditions.

Take a look at the watch.

Second, look at clothes.

Third, look at the shoes.

The poor play cars, the rich play watches.

As long as men with a bit of money, especially young people, unless they don’t
wear a watch…

If you wear a watch, it must be a luxury one! Not to mention Patek Philippe,
Vacheron Constantin, Rolex… the lowest must be Longines, right?

Omi wore a watch, but it was an electronic watch!

It’s ridiculous!

Don’t be afraid of being ashamed!

Where did Wang Tong know that Omi has dozens of watches such as Vacheron
Constantin and Patek Philippe!

However, Omi didn’t wear all of them, because those watches were just for
checking the time.

How can it compare to a super smart watch?

…………

People depend on clothes.

Clothes represent the taste of men.

In Wang Tong’s view, taste is brand!

For rich men, the clothes should be LV, Prada, Armani…

If it’s a sportswear, at least it must be a Nike or Adi, right?

But, what about Omi?

no brand!



I’m afraid, it’s just a stall!

Where does Wang Tong know? Omi wore something tailored by the famous LV
designer Lawrence Hatton when he went to the country last time. There was no
logo left at all, and it was not sold on the market.

She naturally didn’t know it!

…………

Shoes are the foundation of men!

In Wang Tong’s view, as long as a man with a bit of money has at least the least
shoes, he must be good!

If you don’t wear it, Hermès, LV… the lowest one has to be Chenaey, right?

Where is Omi?

There are no shoes of any brand!

I’m afraid, it’s a local stall again!

Where did Wang Tong know that these are also custom-made shoes when they
were sent to the country.

It’s just that this time it was designed by the famous designer Haston.

After all, Omi is a shareholder of LV, as well as a shareholder!

LV sent a special person to design, how dare to fall behind?

…………

Wang Tong didn’t know all of this.

However, in her eyes, she had already seen everything about Omi.

This is a loser!

Wang Tong’s eyes turned for a while, and he smiled contemptuously: “It turned
out to be Xinyue’s high school principal…”

“I wonder if Mr. Lin works here in Jiangbei?”

Omi said, “It’s true.”

This sentence is partly perfunctory and partly true.



Because he owns the largest shares of companies such as Xiaowu Wholesale City
and Yinshan Group.

Although, he only takes dividends.

But, at the same time, they also bear the titles of directors of these companies,
so they can be regarded as working.

Li Xinyue next to Omi cast a curious look at Omi.

Didn’t Brother Lin study at Jiangbei University?

Why are you still working?

Of course, Li Xinyue didn’t ask too much.

Wang Tong smiled and said, “Then today is a good opportunity!”

“You may not know that Mr. Tan Jiayou next to me is the young owner of the
famous Waffle Company. As long as you have a good relationship with him, you
will be promoted and raised in the future. There is absolutely no problem!”

After a pause, he said: “By the way, my family friend, is your waffle company
going public soon?”

First mentioning the owner, and then the listed company, invisibly elevated Tan
Jiayou to a very high position.

get promoted?

Li Xinyue blinked her big eyes, but still did not speak.

She knew that Omi had super running, and she could easily find Li Quan, the
director of the Association.

Even later, he took out a very magical potion and healed his father’s injury in an
instant.

All in all, it showed that Omi was not short of money at all.

Tan Jiayou raised his neck, pretending to be a casual expression, and said: “It’s
three years at the latest. The Waffle Company has now entered the IPO process.”

Wang Tong immediately opened his mouth and exclaimed, “This is too powerful!”

This compliment came fromWang Tong’s heart.

Because she knows very well what the listing represents.



It’s also possible to increase your value a hundredfold in an instant!

Tan Jiayou still looked like he didn’t care, but his neck was raised even harder.

He waved his hand and said, “Actually, I don’t care much about how the company
is at home.”

“I want to use my abilities to achieve some achievements. That’s why I joined
Maple Leaf Ventures. Now, I have some small achievements and work as a
department manager at Maple Leaf Ventures.”

Wang Tong once again admired: “Not only is his family background good, but his
ability is also so strong! My family friend, you are too good!”

As she spoke, her eyes seemed to flicker, and the whole person seemed to be a
little fan.

“It’s just a manager, it’s nothing, I’d better be a partner first.” Although Tan
Jiayou said so, his face was inadvertently showing a touch of triumphant
expression that could not be concealed.

I am so amazing!

Tan Jiayou was praised in this way. Perhaps even he had forgotten that his family
was only fantasizing about going public within three years.

When it will go public, or whether it will have a chance to go public, is still
unknown.

As for the position of manager of the Maple Leaf Venture Capital Company, it
was not obtained by his ability at all, but was directly earned by the relationship
between the family and the airborne.

After Tan Jiayou was proud, he seemed to realize that Li Xinyue’s high school
head Omi was still nearby.

He glanced at Omi and said, “This…Mr. Lin~~ You are Xinyue’s senior, that’s my
friend. If you don’t work well, you can also come to our company. In terms of
treatment, I will give you twice the salary of the previous company!”

2 times the salary?

Omi’s expression became very strange.

To know……

In addition to the distribution of companies such as Xiaowu Wholesale City and
Yinshan Group, these companies also specially prepared tens of millions of
annual salary for him.



2 times the salary?

Afraid it will cost one hundred million, right?

What kind of waffle company, does their annual profit have 100 million?

Tan Jiayou didn’t wait for Omi to answer, and said: “Of course, if you don’t want
to work and want to do business, I can also ask Maple Leaf Ventures to get you an
investment or something.”

Omi smiled and said, “Really? I really want to do business a little bit.”

“No problem!” Tan Jiayou said broadly, “How much do you want to invest?”

Omi said: “Let’s try some water first…”

While speaking, he stretched out a finger.

Test the water?

Howmuch can this be?

10000?

100,000?

Let alone a venture capital company, even Tan Jiayou himself can also take it out.

So he immediately opened his mouth and said: “Don’t worry, as long as you want
to do it, I can give you the money right away!”

“boom!”

At this time, a Lamborghini roared like a beast, and swept a hurricane, galloping
over from a distance.

When passing by Omi, he slammed on the brakes and stopped steadily.

Then, the man in a plaid shirt walked out of the car quickly.

He exclaimed in an extremely excited and respectful voice: “Brother Fan, what a
coincidence, I didn’t expect to meet you here!”

As soon as this statement came out, the whole scene suddenly fell silent.
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