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Chapter 107 - 5 million? How rude!

Su Xinyue sat on the couch, with her legs folded elegantly on one

other as she glared at Xu Nuan in irritation. She looked around and

frowned seeing how empty her house was. There is necessary
furniture but there is no comfy- homey feel to it. It's like the furniture
has been just put there.

Also, it was dirty as if the house hadn't been cleaned in days and the

things weren't organized as well. How does she even live in this dirty

house? She wondered.

Xu Nuan rubbed her aching temples and walked to her side. She sat
on the couch, opposite her and looked at her tiredly and said, " I see.
So you came here to talk to me after hearing Zhu Ai's words. Hmm…"
she pursed her lips and looked as if she was in deep thought.

" But...how do you know my address? Because I am sure I never told

Zhu Ai about it." she raised her brows as she asked this question.

Su Xinyue frowned seeing her attitude even after knowing that she is
Han Zihao's mother. She cleared her throat and said, " Zhu Ai's friend
Gu Xingren told me. I also know that you're the adopted daughter of

Gu's and yet you're being so haughty. Ah, I feel so bad for that poor

girl Xingren. I heard that this house was supposed to be hers but you

snatched it from her. How can you be so thick-skinned and

shameless?" she asked in disbelief.

"-_-"



Xu Nuan stared at her and scoffed lightly. So Xingren is the culprit

behind it. Why doesn't this girl focus on her life? Does she love her

that much?

Xu Nuan nodded as she understood everything. " So...can I ask you

why you took the burden to come all the way to my place?"

Su Xinyue frowned and blinked in confusion. Is this girl stupid? Isn't
this obvious? She should be scared and nervous that she came to

meet her all the way to her house but her reaction was as if her
building's secretary came to her house. This wasn't the question she

was expecting.

" What do you mean by why I came to see you? Of course, I came

here to warn you to stay away from Han Zihao. I don't want my son

to be engaged with you in any way. Whatever the relationship you

have with him, just end it. I won't accept a cheap girl like you in my

family. Understand that?" she said authoritatively.

Xu Nuan listened to her words with the least interest and said, "
Hmm….end our relationship...But we don't have any
relationship...yet," she added 'yet' to not give her any wrong idea.

She is not in a relationship with him now, but she wasn't denying that
she won't have any relationship with him in the future as well.

Su Xinyue furrowed her brows and scowled, " What do you mean by

yet? Huh?"

" It means what it looks like. We're not in a relationship at this point,
but I can't guarantee about the future." Xu Nuan shrugged her

shoulders casually.



Su Xinyue scoffed as her temperature was rising tremendously upon
hearing this girl's shameless words. What? She can't guarantee about
the future? How can she talk to her in this way?

" You...do you even understand what kind of situation this is? I am

telling you that I don't like you and don't want my son to have any

relationship with you, not now nor in the future. Do you

understand?" she said exasperatedly.

Xu Nuan nodded and smiled, " Yes. I know. I don't like you either."

"-_-"

Su Xinyue was trying so hard to not be one of those bitchy moms who
slaps a girl who tries to seduce their precious son. She has seen many

girls who try to seduce rich men to enjoy a comfortable life but this
girl was on a different level. She is not greedy but shameless as well.

Shouldn't she at least try to gain her favour? But how can she say that

she doesn't like her? She took a deep breath and said, " Well, it seems

like you're exactly like what Zhu Ai has said. What do you want to

leave Han Zihao? Money? Wait.'' She opened her purse and took out

her checkbook.

She signed one check and placed it on the table in front of Xu Nuan, "
Here. Take this and leave Han Zihao alone. Don't you dare interfere

between Zhu Ai and Han Zihao's relationship. I don't want a girl like
you in Han Zihao's life."

Xu Nuan raised her brows in interest. She never thought that there
will be a day where someone will give her a check to leave their son.
Her face lit up as if her one of fancies became true.

' Is this how it feels when someone offers them checks like this?'
That's the best way to earn money in the shortest period.' she thought
inwardly.



She picked up the check in excitement but her smile dimmed seeing
the check for only 5 million? Is she kidding me?

She was speechless seeing that she was offering her only 5 million to

leave Han Zihao. Hah! Did she take her for a beggar? She has

donated 5 million dollars to Han Zihao's foundation and she was

offering only 5 million to leave him?

'Is she really Han Zihao's mother? How come she can be so cheap?'
she wondered.

' She deserves a blank check at least.' She was offended by receiving

this check. It was a huge insult to her self-esteem. Even though she

isn't Jiang Yue anymore, how can she think that she will leave Han

Zihao for such a low amount. If not for her, at least think about Han

Zihao's image. Pathetic.

Seeing Xu Nuan's shocked, upset expressions, Su Xinyue smirked

thinking that Xu Nuan was upset that she was offered money to leave
Han Zihao. How can someone's love be counted in money? She

wondered if like the actresses in dramas, she will return the check

and will leave her son quitely.

Just like Xu Nuan, it was her first time offering someone money to

leave her son. She has seen the same dramas as Xu Nuan and was

waiting for her to cry and beg to not seperate them and give them
permission.

She smirked thinking that she did good by offering the check. This
girl needs to know her position and stop seducing Han Zihao.

Hmjusuz….ovu dfou vfl lmqu movuz nifrl.

Xu Nuan raised her head to look at her in confusion and asked, "
what...what is this? You're giving me a check to leave Han Zihao?
Aunt Su, how can you do that?" Xu Nuan asked in disbelief.



'Hah. At least she has some shame.' Su Xinyue thought seeing Xu
Nuan's upset expressions. Although she doesn't like her, she was in
no mood to give her money just to leave her son. It was her husband's
hard earned money after all. He will not leave her if she spent 5
million on someone just like that.

She has to agree that her current husband is stingier than he looks.
She regrets leaving Han Zihao's father at that time. He has treated
her the best, but...the deed has already done. What can she do?

However, she was glad that at least this girl had some shame and she

wasn't behind Han Zihao for his money. But how can she be sure?
What if she is behind Han family's property and money? She will get

alot if she marries him.

" Aunt Su, I am disappointed in you. How can you offer me 5 million

to leave him? Are you really his biological mother?" Xu Nuan asked

with a frown.

Su Xinyue smirked but her smirk faded when she heard her next
words, " Do you even know how much this condo costs? It's definitely
more than 5 million." she commented sarcastically.

" Even though I am the adopted daughter of the Gu family, I am still

their daughter. If I can get this condo, and not the real daughter, then
think about it, can't I get my share in the company if I want? Does my

worth look like only 5 million to you?" she asked while leaning

forward, supporting her face with her hand.
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