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“Extra! Extra! The mysterious Kun Lun sect defeated the Allied forces of the various sects in the great 
void realm!” 
 
 
“The primitive mountain, the mountain moving sect … The large sects have put out a reward for any 
clues related to Kun Lun!” 
 
 
The next day, the headlines of all major newspapers were all about this matter. 
 
 
In the past, there had only been a few newspapers in the ninth continent. The most famous one was 
naturally the southern region daily, but now, newspapers were all over the place. 
 
 
Eastern Region daily, nine provinces daily, and many other newspapers had sprung up like mushrooms 
after the rain. 
 
 
The newspaper industry was flourishing in the ninth continent. 
 
 
This also sped up the spread of the news, and by tomorrow morning, the entire ninth continent would 
know what had happened. 
 
 
When they took the newspaper, everyone was shocked again. 
 
 
It was truly shocking that a single sect had managed to defeat the Alliance of all the large sects of the 
ninth continent. 
 
 
Moreover, this was an unknown and unfamiliar force, which made everyone even more curious. 
 
 
“That’s too awesome! Where did this Kun Lun come from?” 
 
 
“I think this is definitely a hidden force!” 
 
 
For a time, everyone was in a heated discussion. 
 
 



Over the next few days, the ninth continent was in an uproar because of this. 
 
 
The members of the various large sects all moved out, and groups of people rushed in all directions with 
killing intent to search for the faction called Kun Lun. 
 
 
They had suffered a great defeat in the great void realm and had been holding back their anger for a 
long time. They only wanted to find this Kun Lun and take revenge. 
 
 
However, no matter how hard they searched, they could not find a single clue. 
 
 
They were all puzzled. Was there really a faction called Kun Lun in the ninth continent? Even if it was a 
hidden power, there should be some clues. 
 
 
However, Kun Lun seemed to have appeared out of thin air, and his strength was unbelievably strong. 
 
 
They had calculated that there were more than ten thousand people in the Kunlun Sect, which was 
comparable to their large sects. Among them, there were thousands of people in the consummate level, 
which meant that these people were at least golden core. 
 
 
Several thousand Jindan, this was more than any of their sects. 
 
 
What was even more shocking was that among these people, there were two to three hundred people 
who had spirit bones and their physical bodies were abnormally strong. 
 
 
All of this seemed so unbelievable! 
 
 
During this period of time, the Taoist masters continued to dominate the great void realm. 
 
 
After a while, when the situation had died down, groups of cultivators appeared in various parts of the 
southern region. They were traveling in groups of seven or eight. 
 
 
Very quickly, the number of thefts increased in all parts of the southern mountain range. One moment, 
a sect’s treasure house was emptied, and the next moment, a famous person was beaten with a stick, 
stripped naked, and thrown on the side of the road … 
 
 



“Could it be that Black Tiger has returned?” 
 
 
“No, it’s not one person. It’s a group of people. They’re even crazier than that Black Tiger thief. They 
won’t even let go of a single hair!” 
 
 
“Haven’t you guys heard? just a few days ago, the fire country’s Imperial Palace was raided by a bunch 
of bandits. Good Lord, in one night, they moved the entire Imperial Palace away, not leaving a single 
brick behind.” 
 
 
“I heard that the people from the Yan family were knocked unconscious. When they woke up and saw a 
flat ground, they immediately vomited blood.” 
 
 
“F * ck! Really? so brutal?” 
 
 
For a time, the people of the southern region were in a state of panic. 
 
 
At the same time, in the major cities of the southern region, an organization called “Amway” appeared. 
It spread rapidly and swept across the entire southern region, causing countless cultivators to go crazy. 
 
 
In addition to these, other strange things also emerged one after another, and the entire southern 
mountain range was extremely lively. 
 
 
These people were, of course, Kun Lun’s disciples. They had just arrived, so they were all extremely 
excited. Tang Hao let them cause a ruckus, treating it as training. 
 
 
Tang Hao had been staying in the valley all this time, studying the God void Scripture. 
 
 
He had been studying it for a long time and had many ideas, but he always felt that it was lacking. It was 
not good enough. This made him hesitate and he had been delaying it. 
 
 
“Maybe … I should look for other soul Arts to refer to and draw on the collective wisdom of others to 
create a better cultivation technique.” 
 
 
Tang Hao sat there, frowning in deep thought. 
 
 



A moment later, a golden light flashed on his forehead and his soul flew out of the sun Sky Valley. 
 
 
In a day’s time, he had gone to the ninth continent and visited many sects. He had obtained a large 
number of cultivation techniques and books, all of which were related to soul cultivation. 
 
 
There was no one in the ninth continent who didn’t recognize Tang Hao’s soul. When they saw it 
descend, they were filled with fear and trepidation. They didn’t dare refuse his request. They rummaged 
through the sutras Depository and handed over all the soul incantations. 
 
 
Tang Hao had also gone to the primitive mountain and obtained many soul incantations. 
 
 
Back in the sun Sky Valley, Tang Hao flipped through the soul incantations. 
 
 
These spirit incantations were mixed, for the most part incomparably mediocre. Tang Hao glanced 
through them once, then directly threw them away, only a few could barely enter his eyes. 
 
 
“It’s still a little lacking. Why don’t I go to other continents to take a look? That’s right, let’s go to the 
first continent to take a look. The cultivation world is at its peak there, so there will naturally be many 
good soul Arts. ” 
 
 
Tang Hao made up his mind after some thought. 
 
 
It had been a long time since he had left the first continent. He wondered how Shennong Valley was 
doing, and how Wang er, fatty Qi, and the other farmers were doing. 
 
 
“Let’s go take a look! Turn around!” 
 
 
Tang Hao stood up and said a few words to Daoist priest horizon, then set off. 
 
 
He was not worried about anything. The sun Sky Valley was guarded by master locust tree, and no one 
could break through it. Besides, there were also three thousand-year-old monsters, including Ziyue and 
withered bamboo. Even if there was any trouble, it could be easily solved. 
 
 
He took out the Thunder firmament battleship and shuttled through the void several times. After two 
days, he was close to the first continent. He could already see the vast land in the distance. 
 



 
“I’m back!” 
 
 
He murmured softly and smiled. 
 
 
When he first came to the first continent, his clothes had been tattered and he had been extremely 
unkempt. He had even been swept into the hurricane and ended up in the blood Lion Ridge. 
 
 
Now that he thought about it, he felt a little emotional. 
 
 
Waving his hand, he put away the Thunder firmament battleship. He changed his appearance and glided 
forward. 
 
 
In front of them was the Far East continent. 
 
 
He didn’t go to golden cloud Mountain immediately, but landed nearby and entered a city to inquire 
about the situation. 
 
 
“AI! Have you heard that the black meow thief has appeared again recently? he has committed more 
than ten crimes and stolen many treasures. Many people have gone after him, but he is very slippery 
and has escaped again!” 
 
 
“This black meow thief is really powerful! You’ve been chased for so long, yet you’re still alive and 
kicking. ” 
 
 
“I heard he’s quite young. He’s another monster!” 
 
 
Not long after he sat down, Tang Hao heard their conversation. His expression turned strange. 
 
 
Black meow thief? 
 
 
Wasn’t this him? 
 
 
Oh! That’s right! It must be Liu heihu! Why did he come to the first continent? 
 



 
Then, his eyes lit up with a thieving light. He remembered the treasure on Liu heihu. 


