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“BOOM!” 
 
In the valley, the pill cauldron shook and a beam of light shot into the sky. 
 
Another Super Tonic pill had been made! 
 
Tang Hao reached out and grabbed the pill, then put the cauldron away. He breathed a sigh of relief. 
 
This was the last elixir. There were still a lot of fierce beasts ‘corpses, but the spirit herbs were all gone. 
He could only wait until he went back and a new batch of spirit herbs matured before he could continue 
to refine. 
 
“Five tribulations great supplement pill!” 
 
Tang Hao picked up the pill in his hand and studied it for a moment. 
 
This pill was refined from the corpse of a fifth tribulation beast. Although this beast did not have the 
bloodline of the primordial era, its bloodline was quite powerful. Therefore, the pill refined from it was 
more powerful than the average fifth tribulation beast. 
 
“It’s a pity that we didn’t manage to capture the chaos bloodline this time!” 
 
Tang Hao felt that it was a pity. This time, Zao Huazi and the others had killed countless ferocious beasts, 
but none of them had the bloodline of the primordial era. 
 
If he were to use the corpses of the ancient bloodlines to refine pills, the effects would definitely be 
several times stronger than this one. One pill would be equivalent to three or four pills. 
 
However, he also knew that it was not so easy to encounter a creature with the bloodline of the 
untainted. Even if he did, he might not be able to kill it. After all, every creature with the bloodline of the 
untainted was a powerful existence. 
 
Tang Hao pondered for a moment, then raised his head and popped the pill into his mouth. 
 
Gulu! 
 
Once the pill entered his stomach, it instantly disintegrated. The surging medicinal power turned into a 
huge wave that surged into his limbs and bones. After circulating one round in his body, it turned into 
the purest immortal Qi and endlessly poured into his dantian’s sea of Dao. 
 
Huge waves rose above the sea of the path, and the Golden celestial core power surged violently. 
 
The door of the ancient palace floating above the sea of the path was wide open at this moment. It gave 
off a powerful suction force and drew in half of the celestial core power. 
 



With the influx of celestial core power, the palace shone with divine light, and the God statues seemed 
to come to life, roaring and chirping. 
 
About an hour later, all the medicinal power was absorbed. 
 
Tang Hao opened his eyes and looked inside himself. He could not help but look satisfied. 
 
In the past few days, he had taken a total of 11 5th tribulation great Supplement Pills and one 6th 
tribulation one. His cultivation base had soared and exceeded half of the 5th tribulation, one step closer 
to the realm of perfection. 
 
It had only been half a year since he had advanced to the fifth tribulation. This speed could be described 
as divine. 
 
“As long as I have more nourishing pills, especially those at the 6th tribulation, I will be able to reach the 
perfect realm. At that time, I will have more confidence in facing young master Taixu!” 
 
“This time, not only did my cultivation increase greatly, but sect master creation and the others also 
improved greatly. Their strength has also improved greatly!” 
 
Tang Hao was in a good mood. 
 
This time, their harvest could be said to be quite great! 
 
“I’ll keep these first and refine them when I return to the sect!” 
 
Tang Hao began to collect the carcasses that were piled up around the valley. 
 
There were too many corpses, and it took him a lot of effort. Before he could finish collecting them, a 
ray of light suddenly swept over from the sky. It was Fu Yunzi. 
 
“Master Tang, come quickly, I found it!” 
 
Fu Yunzi’s face was filled with excitement. 
 
Tang Hao was surprised at first, but then he realized that they must have found the tianluo ruins. 
 
He hurriedly collected the rest of the beast corpses and followed Fu Yunzi, flying toward the depths of 
the mountain range. 
 
The deeper they went, the thicker the fog became. All kinds of ancient restrictions and broken 
formations began to appear in the surroundings. Fu Yunzi carefully avoided them one by one as they 
continued to go deeper. 
 
Soon, on the mountain peak ahead, dilapidated palaces began to appear. 
 
“That’s right! It’s the ancient Tian Luo sect!” 
 



Tang Hao took a closer look. There were many unique symbols in the ruins, which belonged to the 
ancient Tian Luo sect. 
 
“Someone has already explored this place. We’ve looked around, but we didn’t find any treasures!” Fu 
Yunzi led the way as he said to Tang Hao,”however, this is not the real Tian Luo sect …” 
 
“You’re talking about … A small world?” 
 
Tang Hao was surprised. 
 
“Right! We’ve been searching here for two days, and we’ve finally found it. ” 
 
While he was speaking, Fu Yunzi descended and arrived at a public square. 
 
Zao huaizi and the others were all there. In front of them, there was a space ripple, which was obviously 
the door to that small world. 
 
“We just went in to take a look. It’s well-preserved inside, so no one should have explored it yet!” Said 
Zao Huazi. 
 
With that, he took the lead and walked through the door. 
 
After passing through the ripples, the scene before him suddenly brightened up, and a vast world 
appeared. 
 
“Such dense immortal Qi!” 
 
Tang Hao sensed his surroundings and was surprised. 
 
The density of the immortal Qi here was quite shocking. 
 
“The immortal Meridian here is extraordinary!” Said Zao huaizi with a hint of envy. 
 
Immortal veins were divided into different grades according to their size and the concentration of 
immortal Qi. Thanks to the ancestors, the one from the Fortune sect was a high-grade immortal vein. It 
was the top in the entire beihuang region and was not inferior to those big clans. 
 
And the immortal Meridian before him was clearly stronger than the one from the gate of fortune. 
 
“It’s a pity that we can’t move it!” 
 
Then, he sighed again. 
 
Even the smallest immortal Meridian couldn’t be moved at will, let alone such a top-notch immortal 
Meridian. Perhaps only a nine tribulation Supreme, who had extraordinary means, could do it. 
 
Tang Hao touched his mouth. He felt that it was a pity. 
 



It would be great if he could take away such a good immortal Meridian. 
 
“Even if we can’t move it, we can’t waste it!” 
 
Tang Hao mumbled. 
 
He waved his hand, and countless clones and souls rushed out. They scattered in all directions and 
excitedly began to search for treasures. 
 
“This … All of this?” 
 
Zao Huazi and the others were dumbfounded. 
 
The vast number of doppelgangers and souls had shocked them. 
 
Then, their expressions became a little strange. These doppelgangers and souls gave them a feeling of 
locusts. Wherever they passed, they scraped the ground three feet away, leaving not even a single blade 
of grass behind. 
 
“Too brutal!” 
 
They all muttered in their hearts at the same time. 
 
“Refine as many as you can!” 
 
Tang Hao waved his hand again, and countless beams of light flew out. They were magical formations. 
The clones and souls took them and began to set up formations to plunder the immortal Qi in the area 
and refine immortal Jade. 
 
Upon seeing this, Zao Huazi and the others came to a realization. 
 
Although this immortal vein couldn’t be moved away, it could plunder the immortal Qi inside and 
condense it into immortal Jade. Immortal Jade was also a very important cultivation resource, and its 
status was even higher than medicinal pills. 
 
“As expected of Master Tang!” 
 
Then, they exclaimed in admiration. 
 
They also knew how to refine immortal Jade. Every once in a while, the sect would refine some for the 
disciples and elders to use for their cultivation, but they only refined a few hundred pieces each time. 
 
But now, Master Tang had used thousands of clones and souls to refine thousands and tens of 
thousands of them. This speed was truly shocking! 
 
As they watched the immortal jades take shape and gradually pile up into small mountains, they became 
even more excited. With so many immortal jades, the cultivation of their creation sect’s disciples would 
improve even faster. The strength of their sect would also improve faster. 



 
“Let’s go! Let’s go and investigate!” 
 
Tang Hao led the way and flew toward the center of the small world to explore the ruins. 


