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Tang Hao was stunned. 
 
The group of men and women who came out of the passage were also stunned. 
 
The two parties stared at each other for a long time. 
 
“This is … An otherworldly demon?” 
 
Tang Hao recognized her immediately. 
 
These smoke-like creatures that were neither male nor female were the otherworldly demons! 
 
“Heavens! What a plump primordial spirit!” 
 
The group of otherworldly demons cried out in surprise. Their eyes glowed as they looked at Tang Hao, 
as if he was some kind of delicious food. Many of them even licked their lips and swallowed. 
 
Sky demons fed on all kinds of divine souls. The primordial spirit of this guy in front of them was 
especially powerful, and it had a primordial Yang Qi that they especially liked. It was simply a peerless 
treasure! 
 
“Such a delicious primordial spirit, I really want to have a taste!” 
 
“As long as I take a bite, I’ll be able to advance!” 
 
They stared at Tang Hao and gulped. 
 
However, they didn’t dare to act rashly. The guy in front of them was a fifth tribulation Saint, and his 
primordial spirit was so strong. Ordinary sky demons wouldn’t be able to tempt him. 
 
Moreover, he was still in the midst of his tribulation. 
 
The celestial demons were special. They wouldn’t be affected by the lightning tribulation, but if they 
charged out like this and ran into the lightning tribulation, they would still be killed. 
 
“We’ll make our move after this bolt of lightning strikes!” 
 
“We can’t deal with him. We have to call more people over. Even King-level experts aren’t enough. We 
have to call more Emperor-level experts over. This guy is fat enough. As long as we can have a bite, it’ll 
be worth it.” 
 
“Right, hurry up and call the Emperor!” 
 
The group of heaven demons made a ruckus before they turned around and rushed back, leaving only 
one or two people lingering at the entrance of the passage. 
 



“That’s … A heavenly demon?” 
 
At this time, everyone was also stunned. 
 
“It must be a strange treasure that is connected to the heavenly Devil World. Someone activated it and 
opened the passage.” 
 
“Good method! Which race did this person belong to? they actually thought of using heavenly demons 
to disrupt the Dao tribulation. This is really wonderful!” 
 
“Hahaha! It was indeed wonderful! Otherworldly demons are extremely terrifying and are the best at 
seducing people’s hearts. No matter how high your cultivation base is, you’ll easily fall for it. Many 
powerful people in ancient times have lost their lives at the hands of these otherworldly demons. ” 
 
“Even the ancient Saints of Buddhism had the Dao of the heavenly demon.” 
 
Then, everyone was overjoyed. 
 
“The celestial demon clan has a terrifying number of people. Now that the passage is open, I think it 
won’t be long before the Army of celestial demons comes. There will be celestial demon emperors 
among them, who are at the same level as us Saints.” 
 
“The heavenly demon Emperor’s art of seduction is even more terrifying. Even a Saint would fall for it 
with just a glance.” 
 
“We need to stay away from them, too. It won’t be good if the Army of celestial demons targets us!” 
 
Many saints retreated, afraid of being affected. 
 
They were all rather fearful of the celestial demons. 
 
“It’s a Heavenly Devil! So that was how it was! Brother ye, excellent!” 
 
“Brother ye, good move!” 
 
In the void where the geniuses were hiding, there were also sounds of joy. 
 
The group of geniuses looked at ye jiuxuan and praised him. 
 
“Hahaha! How is it? not bad, right?” Ye jiuxuan also laughed loudly, feeling extremely proud of 
himself.”This Tang guy is dead for sure. Once the Army of the celestial demons arrives, he will not be 
able to escape!” 
 
“That’s right! He’s dead! And this is all thanks to you, brother ye. If we manage to snatch any treasure 
later, it’ll be yours first. ” 
 
The Yao clan genius said excitedly. 
 



“Hey! Good! Good!” Ye jiuxuan smiled smugly. 
 
At this time, in the extraterrestrial Devil World, as the news spread, it gradually boiled over. 
 
“Have you heard? someone has opened a passage to Pangu world, and someone is undergoing a 
tribulation there. He’s a fifth tribulation Saint, and his primordial spirit is extremely powerful and fat. I 
heard that it’s a delicacy that’s rarely seen in a thousand years.” 
 
“What? a delicacy that’s hard to come by in a thousand years?” 
 
Upon hearing this word, the group of otherworldly demons lost their calm. 
 
“It’s true! It’s said to be a peerless treasure!” 
 
Gulu! 
 
The group of otherworldly demons began to swallow their saliva. 
 
“Hurry up! Quickly go and take a look!” 
 
They hurriedly moved and followed the main group as they rushed toward the passageway. 
 
For a time, from all corners of the heavenly Devil World, a mighty army of heavenly Devils surged 
toward the passage. 
 
Their numbers were like the grains of sand in the Ganges, uncountable. 
 
“A fifth tribulation Saint? Hahaha! And especially plump! Good! That’s great! I haven’t tasted such a 
delicacy in hundreds of years. I’ll have a taste today!” 
 
In this Army of otherworldly demons, there were extremely powerful auras and extremely fast speed, 
far beyond that of ordinary otherworldly demons. 
 
The celestial demons were also divided into ranks. Those at the same rank as the human race were at 
the commander level, Dao severing was at the commander level, and immortal Ascension was at the 
king level. 
 
These celestial demons were the strongest Emperor-level existences in the celestial demon clan. 
 
There were many of such auras. There were at least a hundred of them in the Army, which meant that 
there were hundreds of celestial demon emperors. 
 
This was nothing. The heavenly Devil World was vast and boundless. As the news spread quickly, more 
and more Heavenly Devil emperors came. 
 
They all wanted to try this so-called once-in-a-thousand-years delicacy and see how delicious it was! 
 
“Hahaha! I’m the first! This peerless delicacy is mine!” 



 
The heavenly demonic Emperor who was closest to the passage arrived at his fastest speed. He came 
out of the passage and transformed into an extremely handsome man with a graceful figure. 
 
“Is that him?” 
 
He looked around and saw a figure undergoing tribulation in front of him. 
 
“Heavens! How could this guy’s primordial spirit be so strong? It is impossible for an ordinary 5th 
tribulation to have such a powerful primordial spirit!” 
 
He was shocked at first. 
 
Then, he was overjoyed. 
 
To him, the stronger this fellow’s primordial spirit was, the fatter it would be. 
 
“There’s also a lot of primordial Yang Qi, great! I like this taste!” 
 
He became more and more excited. 
 
After the tribulation lightning dissipated, he immediately took action. His body turned into smoke and 
rushed forward. 
 
“They’re here!” 
 
“That’s a heavenly demonic Emperor! That kid is finished!” 
 
Seeing this, all the Saints exclaimed in low voices. 
 
“Mm! This guy is a man, a man, that’s the simplest, he just likes beautiful women, so I’ll give him a 
beautiful woman!” 
 
The wisp of smoke curled and turned into an alluring beauty that landed in front of Tang Hao. 
 
Her figure was graceful and extremely fiery. Every move she made could tempt people’s hearts. 
 
“I can’t look at it. That’s the charm of the heavenly demon!” 
 
The group of Saints in the distance exclaimed and quickly looked away. 
 
The skyfiend circled Tang Hao, trying to seduce him with all its might. 
 
As long as this guy relaxed his mind, he would be able to take advantage of the situation and devour his 
primordial spirit. 
 
However, even after going round and round, and using all his skills, this guy was like a piece of wood, 
with no reaction at all. 



 
“F * ck! Was this guy a man? This Emperor’s charm can even tempt those old bald donkeys, but this guy 
has no reaction?” 
 
“Don’t tell me … He likes men?” 
 
The heavenly demonic Emperor was puzzled. 
 
He thought for a moment and felt that he might have been wrong from the beginning. 
 
With a flash, he turned into a handsome man and continued to use his charming technique. 
 
However, there was still no reaction. The guy in front of him was like an ancient Boulder. 
 
He was even more puzzled. 
 
The otherworldly demons and the Saints were all dumbfounded. 
 
What was going on? 
 
Why didn’t that kid have any reaction at all? 
 
“Idiot!” 
 
Tang Hao could not help but roll his eyes. A golden light flashed above his head, and his primordial spirit 
left his body and turned into an ancient sorcerer God. He reached out his giant palm and grabbed the 
otherworldly demon. 
 
Then, he threw it into his mouth and swallowed it. 


