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“There are at least 1000 6th tribulation experts. This … How is this possible?” 
 
The four Hua Xing old monsters were dumbfounded. 
 
One must know that the orthodoxies only had 600 to 700 sixth tribulation cultivators. The clans of the 
eight desolates had even fewer sixth tribulation cultivators, with an average number of two digits. It was 
extremely rare for them to have 100 sixth tribulation cultivators. 
 
And this gate of fortune had more than a thousand! 
 
This number was too shocking! It was completely unbelievable that they had more than the orthodoxies 
of the heavens! 
 
How could this weak gate of fortune produce so many six tribulation saints? 
 
Moreover, what was even more shocking was that most of these 6th tribulation cultivators were in the 
late stage, and many of them had even completed it. 
 
“Look, not only the 6th tribulation, but there are also many 5th tribulation cultivators. There are simply 
too many to count!” 
 
Old monster Hua Xing of the divine curse heaven said in shock. 
 
He looked at the giant ship in front of him with his eyes wide open, full of shock. 
 
The number of fifth and sixth tribulation saints in the gate of fortune had completely crushed their 
heaven ‘s. In terms of the seventh tribulation, because of that kid surnamed Tang, they were not inferior 
to their heaven’s either. 
 
In terms of treasures, the gate of fortune had found the divine fate boat, which was comparable to an 
immortal artifact. As long as the gate of fortune could produce another 8th tribulation expert, the 
overall strength of the gate of fortune would surpass that of the various great heavenly mantras. 
 
“This …” 
 
“This …” The devil Dao ancient Emperor was stunned, completely speechless. 
 
If it was the 33 heavens, it would still be normal. However, when it came to the gate of fortune, it was a 
little ridiculous! 
 
Twenty years ago, the gate of fortune was still poor. They only had three sixth tribulation disciples and 
ten fifth tribulation disciples. They were pitifully weak. But now, their number had increased by three to 
four hundred times! 
 
No one would believe that the sect’s strength had increased by three to four hundred times in just over 
twenty years! 



 
He was stunned for a long time before he came back to his senses. He glanced around the ship and his 
expression turned ugly. 
 
Other than the kid surnamed Tang, the other disciples of the gate of fortune on the warship were 
nothing in his eyes. However, they had the advantage in numbers. Furthermore, many of them were not 
from the gate of fortune. They were wearing the uniform of other forces and were probably the guest 
elders. 
 
Among these people, there were quite a few at the seventh tribulation. In total, there were more than 
30 of them. 
 
The power of the millions of xiuzhe on the ship had all been absorbed by the divine boat under their feet 
and gathered together. 
 
Kacha! 
 
The bow of the ship cracked open, revealing a pitch-black hole. The next moment, a dazzling light shone 
from the hole, as bright as the stars. 
 
A terrifying aura gathered at the entrance of the cave, and the aura was skyrocketing at an unbelievable 
speed. 
 
Gulu! 
 
The devil Dao ancient Emperor couldn’t help but gulp as a look of panic appeared on his face. 
 
At this moment, he felt a little ridiculous. An eight-tribulation venerable Emperor, one of the most 
powerful men in the world, actually felt a little scared. 
 
“They’re just a bunch of ants. No matter how many of them there are, they can’t hurt me!” 
 
He snorted and his expression became ruthless. 
 
Then, with a thought, the treasures flew over from all directions. Fire crows, millions of ghosts, and all 
kinds of spirit beasts all gathered to protect him. 
 
His body flashed with treasure light, and a few defensive Supreme artifacts flew out and circled around 
him. 
 
As a venerable sovereign, he couldn’t escape. He could only take the attack head-on. As long as he could 
take it, he could easily destroy the entire creation gate. 
 
Millions of cultivators sat down on the divine fate boat and channeled their celestial core power to the 
boat under their feet. At the bow of the boat, the light at the entrance became brighter and brighter. It 
illuminated the sky and earth for millions of miles. 
 
“What’s going on?” 



 
“It’s the gate of fortune. What’s happening?” 
 
On the ground, countless cultivators raised their heads and cried out in surprise. 
 
They narrowed their eyes and looked into the distance. They could only see the faint shadow of a golden 
ship in the depths of the light. 
 
“What’s that?” 
 
“Such a huge ship. Could it be the legendary thing?” 
 
As they guessed, they all revealed excited expressions. 
 
“No! This aura … It’s too terrifying!” 
 
“Go! Hurry up! Otherwise, we’ll all be caught in the shockwaves and turn into dust!” 
 
As the aura at the entrance of the cave continued to surge, the four star transformation realm old 
monsters could no longer stand still and retreated as if they were escaping. 
 
Among the four of them, the strongest had more than 7000 drops of blood. On that ship, there were 
thirty to forty seventh tribulation cultivators. The combined power of these seventh tribulation 
cultivators was not something they could withstand, not to mention that there were millions of other 
xiuzhe. 
 
Their faces were pale, and they retreated tens of thousands of feet in panic before stopping. When they 
turned around to look, they were all still in shock. 
 
“Kid, come! I’m not afraid. If your cannon can hurt me, I’ll avoid you in the future!” 
 
The devil Dao ancient Emperor coldly snorted. 
 
On the ship, Tang Hao looked at him and laughed mockingly. 
 
He raised his hand and pointed forward. 
 
In the next moment, the giant ship under his feet shook violently. 
 
BOOM! A thunderous sound erupted. 
 
An indescribably huge pillar of light shot out from the bow of the ship. Wherever it passed, the void 
twisted and black cracks appeared. 
 
The fire crows, ghosts, spiritual beasts, and puppets were instantly engulfed by the light beam and 
turned into ashes. Then, the five elements avatars formed the five elements great formation and 
blocked the blast. 
 



However, as soon as it came into contact with the light pillar, the five elements formation was torn apart 
like paper. The three avatars were sucked into the light pillar and exploded. 
 
Then, the divine cauldron was blown away by the cannon. 
 
Then, a tortoise shell Shield and a silver spiritual shield appeared … 
 
Under the terrifying power of this cannon, the Dao devil ancient Emperor’s defenses were destroyed 
layer by layer. 
 
“This … This is impossible!” 
 
The devil Dao ancient Emperor’s eyes widened as his face contorted in shock. 
 
He was too confident! 
 
He was so confident that he had completely miscalculated the power of this cannon! 
 
The aura condensed at the muzzle just now was not as good as his 8th tribulation, but after it was fired, 
the power instantly increased several times, making him feel a little trembling. 
 
It was too late for him to Dodge, and he could only watch as the cannon shot towards him, crushing all 
his defenses and finally landing on his body. 
 
Ah! 
 
He let out a shrill scream. 
 
Under this blast, his body cracked in several places and turned into ashes. 
 
He endured the pain, turned into a beam of divine light, and escaped. 


