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The battlefield was empty. 
 
All that was left was the white-robed figure standing in the air. 
 
He raised his head and looked at the sky with an imposing aura. 
 
Around him, there were eight true dragons and twelve ancestral sorcerers. 
 
Soon, dark clouds rolled over and covered the sky. In the dark clouds, there were flashes of lightning. 
 
A deep, murderous aura spread out. 
 
The air in the area seemed to have frozen. 
 
Boom! Boom! Boom! 
 
A moment later, a muffled Thunder exploded, shaking the entire area. 
 
The dark clouds had already turned into thunderclouds, and lightning was surging, gradually forming a 
vortex. 
 
The whirlpool gradually expanded, and the lightning inside became more and more intense, turning into 
a sea of lightning. 
 
“This is …?” 
 
At this moment, on the battlefield closest to them, both sides of the battle sensed the change in the 
world. 
 
“It’s the lightning tribulation. Why is there someone undergoing the Tribulation at this time?” 
 
Some xiuzhe looked over and were puzzled. 
 
This was the time of the battle, who would choose to cross the Tribulation at this moment? 
 
“It’s the ninth tribulation! Someone’s going to attempt to break through to the Paragon level!” 
 
They were even more shocked when they saw the level of the lightning tribulation. 
 
“Are those all true spirits? Oh my God! Who is he?” 
 
When they took a closer look and saw the white-robed figure standing in the air, they were all stunned. 
 
One, two, three … A total of twenty true spirits! 
 



This guy had actually refined twenty true spirits, and all of them had been raised to the scale of 30000 
meters! 
 
This was too shocking! 
 
“There’s something strange about this human!” 
 
The Dragon count, who was being attacked by many cultivators, was also attracted by the aura of the 
lightning tribulation and turned his head to look. 
 
Then, he revealed a surprised expression. 
 
In the eyes of a God of Dragon count like him, the human race was nothing more than an ant. Even if it 
was a nine tribulation Supreme Being, he would not put them in his eyes. However, this human was 
different. He had a very strange aura. 
 
“Who is he?” 
 
“Heavens! 20 true spirits that are 30000 meters long!” 
 
As the aura of the Thunder tribulation continued to spread, people on the battlefields of Qi Yuan planet 
kept looking up with shocked expressions. 
 
All of the Dragon counts looked over and were attracted. 
 
“This is … The aura of tribulation lightning? That’s strange! Why is there a lightning tribulation?” 
 
“Who’s going through the Tribulation?” 
 
In various parts of Qiyuan star, in some hidden corners, divine thoughts were probed out. 
 
These were the half-zhizun realm experts who had been hiding. They had also sensed the aura of the 
lightning tribulation. 
 
This was the ninth tribulation, and its momentum was particularly great. At this moment, everyone on 
half of Qi Yuan planet could detect the aura of the Thunder tribulation. 
 
When they activated their divine eyes and Dharma eyes to look in the direction of the lightning 
tribulation, they were all stunned. 
 
Wasn’t the one standing in the air and facing the sea of lightning pill ancestor Tang? 
 
Why was he undergoing tribulation here? 
 
You can even undergo tribulation in this place? 
 
Also, what were those? Could it be that he was the one who had refined their true spirits? 
 



They looked at the true dragons and the ancestors of sorcery, dumbfounded. 
 
Of course, they knew that he had refined many true spirits, but they never thought that he had refined 
as many as twenty. What was more terrifying was that he had refined all of them to 10000 feet and was 
about to cross the Tribulation! 
 
They just hid in their cave abodes and looked on in a daze, unable to come back to their senses for a 
long time. 
 
At this moment, somewhere on Qi Yuan star, a divine light was speeding. 
 
Plop! 
 
Suddenly, the divine light fell and hit the ground, and a figure appeared. 
 
“Motherf * cker!” 
 
The man crawled out of the hole in the ground and cursed angrily. His sinister face was a little pale and 
his Qi was weak. He was obviously seriously injured. 
 
“You little brat! You’re harming me again! I’m not done with you!” 
 
“You think you’ll be fine after avoiding this? Hmph! Just you wait, as long as you’re still in this world, I’ll 
keep an eye on you. Once I find an opportunity, you’ll be dead!” 
 
He clenched his fists and shouted. 
 
His narrowed eyes were filled with hatred. 
 
He sat down cross-legged, took out a few bottles of pills, and swallowed them. After regulating his 
breath for a while, his Qi recovered a little. 
 
In the nine tribulations realm, getting injured was a very troublesome thing. He needed to recuperate 
for a long time. Ordinary medicinal pills were not of much use. He would need several months to fully 
recover from these injuries. 
 
However, even if he was injured now, it was more than enough to deal with that brat. As long as he 
found an opportunity, that brat would die without a doubt! 
 
He stood up and prepared to find a safe place to recuperate for a while before he went to keep an eye 
on the kid. 
 
But at this moment, his expression suddenly changed as he raised his head to look at the sky in the 
distance. 
 
There seemed to be the aura of the lightning tribulation coming from there. 
 
“That’s weird! Why is there a lightning tribulation?” 



 
He frowned and asked in confusion. 
 
How could there be a lightning tribulation at this time? furthermore, this aura was that of the ninth 
tribulation. Someone was about to undergo the Tribulation and break through to the Supreme-being 
realm! 
 
“Let me see!” 
 
Out of curiosity, he activated a pair of divine eyes and looked in that direction. 
 
“Eh? Wasn’t this the battlefield? Don’t tell me it’s that kid’s tribulation!” 
 
He jokingly muttered to himself after seeing the lightning tribulation’s location. 
 
He laughed after he finished speaking. 
 
How could that brat choose to undergo his tribulation here! 
 
Besides, it shouldn’t be the time for that kid to cross the Tribulation yet. He had refined more than eight 
true spirits. With his arrogant and bold character, he would definitely wait until all his true spirits had 
risen to 10000 feet before he would attempt the ninth tribulation. 
 
Therefore, it was impossible for this to be that kid! 
 
But sometimes, a slap in the face came so quickly! 
 
He swept his gaze and saw a white-robed figure under the sea of lightning. There were eight true 
dragons around him and 12 ancestors of sorcery surrounding him. All of them were 10000 feet in size! 
 
His entire body trembled as if he had been struck by lightning! 
 
His eyes widened so much that they were about to pop out. 
 
F * ck! 
 
It’s really that kid! 
 
Furthermore, his true spirit had already reached 30000 meters! And there were twenty of them! 
 
How could this be possible? 
 
It hadn’t been long since that brat had reached the half-zhizun realm. It was already incredible that he 
had eight true spirits to 10000 feet, but now, he had 12 to 10000 feet! 
 
How did he do it? 
 
He stood on the spot with a dazed expression. 



 
At this moment, his mind was in a daze, and he felt that everything was like a dream. Whether it was 
being stared at by hundreds of ancient Supreme martial artists or this brat’s tribulation, it all felt like a 
dream. It was too unreal. 
 
Soon, his heart sank and he felt a little desperate. 
 
If this kid successfully passes the Tribulation and advances to the ninth tribulation, then wouldn’t he 
have no other way? 
 
His dream of collecting all the great void imprints would no longer be realized! 
 
His dream of becoming a true immortal was about to be shattered! 
 
“Eh? What’s going on?” 
 
At this moment, Daoist Tianhong, who was guarding the entrance of the spirit illusion immortal realm, 
suddenly opened his eyes with a look of surprise. 
 
In this spiritual fantasy wonderland, a passage to another world had been opened, connecting to the 
outside world. From this passage, there were actually traces of the aura of the lightning tribulation. 
 
“There’s actually someone undergoing a tribulation inside?” 
 
He mumbled, his expression shocked. 
 
The spiritual fantasy wonderland had opened so many times, but no one had ever transcended 
tribulations inside. 
 
“I wonder who it is!” 
 
Then, he smiled in delight. 
 
Although it was a strange choice to cross the heavenly Tribulation inside, it was undoubtedly a good 
thing. He must have gained something inside and crossed the heavenly Tribulation on impulse. Once he 
succeeded, his Holy region would have another Supreme martial artist! 
 
“It’s him!” 
 
“Twenty true spirits! What a good fellow!” 
 
“Good, good, good! It seems that our sanctuary is about to give birth to a Supreme martial artist who is 
less than a hundred years old! The heavens have blessed the human race!” 
 
After he saw it clearly, he was first shocked, then he laughed out loud, extremely happy. 


