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The surroundings were deathly silent. 
 
Everyone was stunned. Their eyes were wide open, and they were in a daze. 
 
Then, they shuddered and woke up with a start. Their faces turned pale instantly, revealing extreme 
shock and fear. 
 
Many people’s bodies went soft, and they almost fell down. They were scared out of their wits. 
 
That was clearly the immortal radiance of the ninth tribulation! 
 
This wasn’t a 30000-meter-tall old monster at all, but a genuine nine tribulations Saint ancestor! 
 
An unparalleled mighty figure! 
 
Even the ROC Emperor and the Haoran immortal trembled and looked a little frightened. 
 
“Nine tribulations! This is the immortal radiance of the ninth tribulation!” 
 
Inside the formation, the Luosha Island master screamed in horror. 
 
He had never expected that this guy would be a ninth tribulation! 
 
On this Azure meteor, there are only a few 9th tribulation experts. Who is this? 
 
“How could it be the ninth tribulation?” 
 
The Luosha Island venerable sovereigns around them also shouted in panic. 
 
“Don’t be afraid! We’re inside the formation, he can’t get in. He can’t break this formation!” 
 
The Lord of Luosha Island calmed down and shouted. 
 
He looked at the figure outside the formation with a gloomy expression. 
 
He had never thought that this would be a nine tribulations Saint ancestor, because nine tribulations 
Saint ancestors were too rare. 
 
However, since he had already offended him, he had no choice but to fight it out. Anyway, with the 
formation, this guy couldn’t enter. After a while, he would be able to cross the Tribulation and break 
through to the ninth tribulation. Once he succeeded, he wouldn’t have to fear this guy anymore. 
 
However, at this moment, his pupils suddenly shrank. He saw that a crack had appeared on the 
outermost layer of the light screen. 
 



The next moment, the cracks expanded and spread out like a spider web. 
 
“This … How is this possible?” 
 
He gasped in shock, unable to believe his eyes. 
 
This was a high-grade defensive array set up by an underground immortal vein. It was made by a famous 
master and an ordinary ninth tribulation cultivator couldn’t break it at all! 
 
Under his shocked gaze, the cracks continued to spread and finally, it exploded. 
 
“It’s broken! The formation is broken!” 
 
Cries of fear rose up in all four directions. 
 
The evil cultivators looked up at the sky, their faces pale and terrified. 
 
“It’s broken just like that?” 
 
Outside the island, Emperor ROC and the others trembled again when they saw this, and their 
expressions became more and more frightened. 
 
Didn’t they say that the nine tribulations couldn’t break these great formations? 
 
How did he break through one layer in the blink of an eye? 
 
Which divine ancestor was this guy? This sacred art was too terrifying! 
 
“It’s not too tight!” 
 
“I’ll go,” Tang Hao mumbled. He moved forward to the second light screen, raised his hand, and pressed 
it. 
 
“Not good!” 
 
The Luosha Island master was shocked. 
 
He didn’t know where this nine tribulations came from, but it was unbelievably powerful. He was afraid 
that it wasn’t an ordinary early stage, but an even more terrifying middle stage, or even late stage. If he 
continued to break it, these defensive formations would be broken sooner or later. 
 
He started to activate the killing formation. 
 
Aooo! 
 
Dragon roars that shook the heavens were heard. 
 
The black water dragons roared and pounced from all directions. 



 
There were also the malicious ghosts that filled the sky. They gathered together and turned into ghostly 
creatures that pounced over. 
 
The demon gods also came from all directions and attacked. 
 
Countless black sword lights also rushed out from the formation … 
 
Layers of killing formations were activated at full power. 
 
“Small tricks!” 
 
Tang Hao turned around and chuckled in disdain. 
 
These arrays were nothing in his eyes. Their standards were too low, and their power was barely 
satisfactory. 
 
He had also refined the twelve celestial capital demon gods formation before, but the standard of this 
set was not even enough to carry his shoes. 
 
He raised his hand, and monstrous flames of anger surged out. 
 
The Red Lotus true fire formed a giant palm that covered the sky and slapped forward. 
 
Water dragons, ghosts, fiendcelestials, and sword Qi were all destroyed. 
 
Peng Peng Peng! 
 
In an instant, a bright light exploded like fireworks. 
 
Si si si! 
 
The xiuzhe in the four directions all widened their eyes in shock and took in deep breaths. 
 
This Palm’s momentum was like splitting the sky and splitting the earth. It was incomparably terrifying. 
 
In the formation, the Luosha Island master was stunned again. He couldn’t believe his eyes. 
 
“Break!” 
 
Tang Hao turned around and slammed his palm against the light screen. 
 
Bang! 
 
There was a loud bang. 
 
The light screen shook violently. 
 



The hearts of everyone in the array trembled, and their faces turned pale. 
 
Peng Peng Peng! 
 
Following that, a series of explosions rang out. Under the frenzied attacks, the light screen trembled 
violently and its brilliance dimmed at a speed visible to the naked eye. Finally, with a bang, another loud 
sound, the light screen exploded. 
 
The Luosha Island master’s eyes widened in shock. 
 
The second layer of the light screen was blown apart just like that! 
 
How long has it been? 
 
It hasn’t even been half a quarter of an hour! 
 
How long could the remaining light curtains last? 
 
He was finally a little afraid. Looking at the figure outside, he couldn’t help but tremble. 
 
He felt that he really couldn’t stop them today. The destruction of the Luosha Island was imminent. 
 
“Another layer has been broken!” 
 
“That’s too terrifying!” 
 
On the four warships, Emperor ROC and the others cried out in shock, their expressions becoming more 
and more frightened. 
 
Peng Peng Peng! 
 
For a time, only such a loud sound was left between the sky and the earth. 
 
The cultivators from all directions and the evil cultivators in the formation could only watch in a daze as 
the formation was smashed open layer by layer. It had only been half a day, and it had already reached 
the last layer. 
 
And this last layer was also dim and lightless, and was about to break! 
 
The faces of everyone in the formation were already extremely pale. 
 
“No, I can’t just sit here and wait for death!” The Luosha Island master murmured with determination in 
his eyes. He had to break out later. Otherwise, he would be killed if he was stopped. 
 
He had cultivated for thousands of years and finally had the hope of breaking through to the ninth 
tribulation and entering the divine ancestor realm. How could he die Here and let all his hard work be 
destroyed in one day? 
 



He activated the four-sided killing formation again with his spiritual will. Then, he tore open the void and 
was about to escape. 
 
“You want to run?” 
 
Tang Hao smirked coldly. His eyes flashed with lightning, and with a powerful strike, the last layer of the 
light screen was broken. 
 
His figure flickered, and he appeared beside the Luosha Island master and struck out with his palm. 
 
Bang! 
 
The Luosha Island master didn’t even have time to get into the void ripples before he was sent flying, 
spitting out blood. 
 
“Hmph! Even if you tear open the void and escape, so what? even if you escape to the ends of the earth, 
you can’t escape from my palm!” 
 
Tang Hao sneered. He leaped forward, reached out his palm, grabbed the Luosha Island master’s throat, 
and lifted him up. 
 
He looked at them coldly, his eyes filled with disdain. 
 
All those below the Supreme level were ants. 
 
In his eyes, this guy was only a slightly stronger ant! 
 
He did not have the slightest bit of pity. Which evil cultivator did not have monstrous killing sins? who 
knew how many innocent people’s blood had been stained with them? a cold light flashed in his eyes, 
and he clenched his fist. There was a fire in his palm, and with a flash of lightning, he directly shattered 
the Luosha Island master into powder. 
 
 


