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“Thank you for your advice, Daoist Tang!” 
 
Mirror flower Palace mistress sat down again, still looking excited. 
 
Fellow Daoist Tang’s words had enlightened him. He was truly amazing. 
 
“I’m fine!” Tang Hao smiled and said,”do you know about the recent situation in Great Yan Dynasty?” 
 
“Great Yan! Back then, they also exchanged for a true immortal inheritance, but it was taken away by 
the people of the great emperor mountain. To the great emperor mountain, a power like Great Yan 
Immortal Dynasty is nothing more than a dog that they have raised outside. ” 
 
“Do you think they’ll let their dogs cultivate the inheritance of a true immortal?” 
 
Mirror flower Palace head said. 
 
“I see! To your Alliance, the Great Yan Dynasty is not a big problem. The Tian long divine dynasty is the 
biggest problem. ” Tang Hao said. 
 
“Yup!” 
 
Mirror flower Palace head nodded with a serious expression. 
 
The Sky Dragon divine dynasty was backed by an evil Big Shot like the great joy heaven. 
 
“Why don’t we join forces with Great Yan and destroy this dynasty?” Tang Hao said. 
 
“This … Will this work?” 
 
Mirror flower Palace head’s expression changed. 
 
The Tian long divine dynasty was quite powerful and had the great joy heaven behind it. Even if they 
could be destroyed, what if the great joy heaven sent people to take revenge? 
 
“With the name of the great emperor mountain, how could it be a problem to destroy their dynasty? 
moreover, the people of the great joy heaven won’t come out now.” Tang Hao said. 
 
“Why would I?” 
 
Mirror flower Palace head was taken aback. 
 
“You really think that they didn’t send anyone to kill me this time?” 
 
Tang Hao said with a smile. 



 
Mirror flower Palace mistress’s expression changed. Her eyes widened in shock. 
 
From his tone, it seemed like he had killed another group of people from the sky of great joy! 
 
He killed them so much that the joyous sky didn’t even dare to take revenge! 
 
Such strength was too terrifying! 
 
“Since the people from the heaven of great joy are no longer a threat, then it’s easy to handle. Great 
Yan Dynasty will definitely be very happy to do so. With the Alliance of a few other powers, we can 
easily wipe out this dynasty!” Mirror flower Palace head said excitedly. 
 
“You can discuss this with the Crown Prince of Yan! If you don’t have enough manpower, I can help. ” 
Tang Hao said. 
 
“There should be no need! We’re enough!” 
 
Mirror flower Palace head said hurriedly. 
 
Crown Prince Ao and a group of nine tribulations Saint ancestors of the dynasty had been killed by this 
man. There were only a few of the nine tribulations left, including the current Saint Emperor and a few 
old monsters. As long as Great Yan’s nine tribulations were all mobilized, and the nine tribulations from 
all sides joined forces, it would be more than enough to wipe out the dynasty. 
 
“I’ll take my leave now, fellow cultivator Tang. Wait for my good news!” 
 
After chatting for a while more, he took his leave. 
 
Tang Hao rose and stepped out of the hall. He looked in the direction of Huangzhou, his eyes cold. 
 
He had long wanted to destroy the Tian long divine dynasty. 
 
Once this divine dynasty was eliminated, Cang Liu star would be safe and he could leave in peace. 
 
As for this spirit void Alliance, once it was established, there would be more than ten ninth tribulation 
forces. It was not a small force and it could continue to grow. 
 
In the future, he might have a use for this Alliance. 
 
And all of this was also his preparation for the people of the sacred zone to leave Pangu world. 
 
He stood in place and pondered for a long time before leaving. 
 
After returning to the pavilion, he took out the materials and continued to make immortal rings. 
 
“Oh right, I’ll need a ship to go around the starry sky. It has to be fast enough to save time.” 
 



Tang Hao thought of the flying boat when he was done crafting the ring. 
 
He had to make one for himself. 
 
He felt that Ji Ruyin’s ship was not fast enough, so he wanted to craft the fastest flying boat. 
 
He had all kinds of materials on him, so he didn’t have to buy them. After a day or two, he came up with 
the blueprint. Then, he began to refine it. In just three days, a silver flying boat was refined. 
 
It wasn’t big, only a thousand feet, and could at most carry two to three hundred people. 
 
“Let’s call it … The star Shuttle!” 
 
Tang Hao came up with a random name. 
 
After the flying boat was finished, mirror flower Palace mistress’s news arrived. 
 
He had joined forces with Great Yan and a dozen ninth tribulation forces to attack the Tian long divine 
dynasty and successfully exterminated it. 
 
After a few days, Ji juechen successfully transcended the Tribulation and ascended to the ninth 
tribulation. 
 
When the news spread, it shook the entire Cloud Sea. People from cangliu came to congratulate them, 
and the Ji family was lively for several days. 
 
“The divine dynasty has been destroyed, and the Ji family has a ninth tribulation to hold down the Fort. 
With the help of the mirror flower Palace Master and the others, there won’t be any problems. As for 
the great fate sect, lady su and little ye have both gone to the stellar mountain, so there’s nothing to 
worry about.” 
 
Tang Hao sat in the attic and pondered for a while. Then, he felt relieved. 
 
“Eight months! I wonder how the Saints are doing?” 
 
Tang Hao stepped out of the building and looked up at the sky. He was a little emotional. 
 
He calculated that he had been on this planet for just over eight months. 
 
During this period of time, his gains were not small. The biggest was naturally the spiritual void realm 
and his own cultivation. Just this cultivation saved him thousands of years of bitter cultivation, not to 
mention the spiritual essence in his body now. 
 
When they returned to the Holy region, these essences could be used to create countless experts. 
 
“It’s time to go!” 
 
Tang Hao heaved a long sigh, then turned around and headed toward the building. 



 
“Holy ancestor!” 
 
Chun Xuan and Qiu CI had already packed their things and were waiting for him. 
 
“Let’s go!” 
 
Tang Hao said. 
 
The two women responded and flew out of the pavilion. They stood in the air and looked around, their 
eyes filled with reluctance. 
 
After all, this was a place where he had lived for decades, and it was also the place where he was born 
and raised. It was naturally difficult for him to leave suddenly. 
 
“Sister, don’t be sad. In the future, wherever the divine ancestor is, it will be our home!” 
 
Seeing her sister’s eyes red, Ji Qiuci comforted her in a low voice. 
 
“En!” 
 
Ji chunxuan nodded. 
 
The two sisters held hands as they charged toward Tang Hao. 
 
“If there’s a chance in the future, I’ll come back!” Tang Hao smiled at them, then turned around and left. 
 
When they arrived at the main hall, Ji juechen, the others, and Ji Ruyin were already waiting. Ji Ruyin 
was saying goodbye to everyone. 
 
“Divine ancestor, I’ll leave this girl and ru Yin in your care. You don’t have to worry about the Ji family. 
With the treasures you’ve given us, the Ji family will definitely grow and live up to your expectations, 
divine ancestor.” 
 
Ji juechen came forward and bowed when he saw Tang Hao. 
 
“Alright!” 
 
“Okay!” Tang Hao nodded. 
 
This Ji juechen was a typical old monster. He was thoughtful, thoughtful, and smooth. With him leading 
the way, the Ji family wouldn’t have any problems. 
 
“Miss Ji, let’s go!” 
 
Tang Hao flicked his sleeve and summoned his Star Shuttle. 
 



Ji Ruyin bid farewell to the last person, turned around, and acknowledged him before leaping up and 
boarding the swift Boat. 
 
“Farewell, divine ancestor!” 
 
When Tang Hao boarded the ship, the Ji family members knelt down and greeted him respectfully. 
 
Soon, the same shouts came from all directions of the Ji family. Like a tide, they rolled out and did not 
stop for a long time. 
 
Whoosh! 
 
Under the Ji family’s watchful eyes, the flying boat trembled and turned into a stream of light, flying 
away and disappearing into the sky. 
 


