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“You … You …” 
 
Xuan Yuanlong raised his hand and pointed at the head that was peeking out from above. He cried out in 
shock. 
 
The expression on his face was twisted as if he had seen a ghost. 
 
This guy was the white-robed devil they were talking about! 
 
But how was that possible? 
 
Wasn’t this demon trapped in the star-devouring beast’s body? 
 
And why would he appear here, sitting in this restaurant, leisurely drinking wine? 
 
In the crowd, ning Yuzhen was also stunned. His red lips opened and his Phoenix eyes widened. 
 
Why was this bastard here? 
 
Shouldn’t he be struggling in the star Devourer beast’s body? 
 
But look at him now, his smile was so bright, so carefree! 
 
“It’s you!” 
 
When she came back to her senses, her face darkened and was covered with a layer of frost. 
 
Her Phoenix eyes were filled with hatred. 
 
Ever since the cangliu incident, she hated this guy to the core and wanted to take revenge at all times. 
However, this person’s background was too mysterious, and the sect did not dare to act rashly. With her 
own strength, she was far from being his opponent. 
 
Therefore, she could only give up for the time being. 
 
“He’s that devil?” 
 
“What is he doing here?” 
 
The group of young men exclaimed in shock. 
 
“Alright! He had appeared just in time! Let’s see how I’m going to deal with him today!” 
 
“Fairy ning, just you wait. Today, I’ll slaughter him a thousand times. I’ll kill him until he doesn’t dare to 
enter the spiritual void realm again!” 



 
Then, they became excited, as if they had been injected with chicken blood, and their expressions 
became excited. 
 
Wasn’t this a heaven-sent opportunity? 
 
It was a good opportunity for them to put on a good show in front of fairy ning! 
 
While he was at it, he could also become famous in the entire spiritual void realm! 
 
The corners of ning Yuzhen’s lips lifted, and a smug look flashed across his face. 
 
This guy’s appearance was really coincidental. He had delivered himself to the door. 
 
Her chance for revenge had finally come! 
 
Today, she had to kill this guy over a hundred times. Only then could she vent the hatred in her heart. 
 
“Hey! You demon, get down here! If you have the guts, come outside with me and fight to the death!” 
 
“Demon, fight me if you dare! I’ll kill you until you cry for your parents!” 
 
The group of young men shouted. 
 
The streets were in an uproar. 
 
“He’s the white-robed demon who slaughtered the heaven of great joy and chased the nine magnates 
away?” 
 
On the street, everyone gathered around and looked at him in shock. 
 
This white-clothed freak was now a legendary figure! 
 
“Eh? It doesn’t look like it?” 
 
After they investigated, they were all a little puzzled. 
 
The young man in front of her was dressed in a snow-white robe. He was handsome and his eyes were 
clear. The smile on his face was like the afternoon sun, so bright and warm! He didn’t look like a peerless 
madman who would kill without blinking an eye! 
 
“There can’t be a mistake, right?” 
 
Someone mumbled with a disappointed expression. 
 
The person in front of them was not at all like the unparalleled madman they had imagined! 
 



“Fellow Daoist, why don’t you come down and have a competition with us? The people here are the 
most outstanding figures of the younger generation of the origin immortal realm. They’ve admired you 
for a long time, and since we’ve coincidentally met today, why don’t we exchange some pointers?” 
 
Ning Yuzhen raised her head and smiled at Tang Hao. 
 
“Outstanding? Just them?” 
 
Tang Hao looked around him and smiled. 
 
They were just a bunch of bootlickers! 
 
What kind of monster is he? he’s a genius! 
 
“Don’t … Don’t be so arrogant!” 
 
“Bastard, come down if you have the guts. I’ll break your dog head!” 
 
The group of young men were immediately enraged. 
 
This guy still dared to look down on them, he was really looking for death! 
 
It was said that this guy’s body was extremely strong, which was why he could kill the spirit devouring 
evil child of the heaven of great joy. However, his cultivation base was not that great. He was only at the 
Dao glimpse realm before. 
 
He was only in his 90s, so his soul must be nothing special. At most, it was a true spirit. How could he be 
their match? 
 
“Demon, get down here. I, Xuanyuan long, the sovereign of the Xuanyuan clan, challenge you. Do you 
dare to accept?” 
 
In the crowd, Xuan Yuanlong shouted,”if you don’t answer, you’re a coward, a woman!” 
 
“Alright! Since you’re so enthusiastic, I can’t reject you anymore!” 
 
Tang Hao was still smiling. 
 
“Then get down here. Let’s go to the village entrance and fight to the death!” Xuan Yuanlong shouted. 
 
With that, he turned around and walked out. 
 
There was a commotion all around. 
 
The people on the streets all revealed excited expressions and also wanted to head towards the village 
entrance. 
 
“Village entrance? No need!” 



 
But at this moment, a cold voice came from the top of the restaurant. 
 
The next moment, there was a whooshing sound. 
 
The white-robed figure shot out like a graceful swan. The aura around him had completely changed. His 
face had become extremely cold, and his cold eyes seemed to be frozen with a layer of eternal frost. 
 
He stretched out his hand, and there was a shocking lightning and fire in his palm as he slapped. 
 
Everyone was stunned! 
 
Their eyes were wide open in disbelief. 
 
This guy actually dared to make a move in the village? 
 
Was he crazy? 
 
Xuan Yuanlong turned pale with fright and hurriedly attacked. He also struck out with his palm, and 
divine light of various colors emerged. 
 
Bang! 
 
There was a loud explosion. 
 
The two palms collided, and a dense radiance exploded. 
 
In the next moment, there was a scream from Xuan Yuanlong. His palm was destroyed as if it was rotten 
wood. His various Tao techniques were completely vulnerable in front of the Thunder fire. 
 
The light of the Thunder engulfed him in an instant and burned him into ashes. Then, he turned into 
white light and disappeared. 
 
Everyone was once again stunned. 
 
The streets were deathly silent. 
 
Everyone was dumbfounded, unable to believe their eyes. 
 
This guy actually dared to kill people in the village! 
 
Furthermore, he had killed the Xuanyuan clan’s heaven’s pride expert with just a single blow! 
 
This … How bold was this, and how powerful was this strength! 
 
“Why would I?” 
 
Ning Yuzhen’s beautiful eyes also widened in disbelief. 



 
She was very clear about the strength of this young master long. He had two undiscovered true spirits 
and his divine soul was much stronger than an ordinary ninth tribulation. In this spiritual void realm, he 
should have had a great advantage. But how did he die in a single encounter? 
 
How strong was this guy’s divine soul? 
 
“Hmph! What Xuanyuan clan’s heaven’s favorite? he’s nothing!” 
 
Tang Hao laughed disdainfully as everyone watched. 
 
Then, he strode forward and slapped a young man in front of him. 
 
In an instant, lightning filled the sky and turned into true dragons that wrapped around his arm. 
 
Bang! 
 
Ah! 
 
With a scream, the young man’s body was blown up by the Thunder and fire, turning into white light 
and disappearing. 
 
Then, the Thunder and fire on his body brightened and turned into countless true dragons. They 
pounced in all directions and killed the young heaven’s favorites. 
 
 
 


