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The old monster was so scared that his soul almost flew out of his body. 
 
F * ck! 
 
Who could withstand the two celestial artifacts? 
 
He blocked it in a hurry and vomited blood. He screamed and flew backward. 
 
“Hurry up! Quickly join forces and stop him!” 
 
The rest of the old monsters were a little flustered. They shouted and attacked again. 
 
However, even though they had joined forces, they still couldn’t stop that figure. He held the immortal 
Bell in his left hand and the immortal sword in his right hand. With each strike, his aura was ferocious 
and he was simply a mess. 
 
Their attacks were constantly being disintegrated, and there were old monsters who were constantly 
being smashed until they vomited blood and were sent flying. 
 
For a moment, the entire world was filled with the screams, groans, and cries of fear from the old 
monsters. 
 
The surrounding xiuzhe, and the countless xiuzhe outside the four symbols formation, were dumbstruck. 
 
The scene in front of him was too ridiculous! 
 
There were so many peak experts, but they still couldn’t do anything to one person. They were killed 
until they lost their helmets and armors, and they cried out in pain. 
 
And that person was just a young boy who was not even a hundred years old! 
 
In the immortal Palace, the members of the Ji family were also stunned. 
 
From the beginning of the battle, they had been dumbfounded. From the beginning to the end, they had 
such dull expressions and had not recovered from the shock. 
 
“Hurry up! Hurry up and run!” 
 
After fighting for a while longer, the group of peak stage cultivators were completely terrified. Many of 
them were already injured. If they continued fighting, they were afraid that they would lose their lives. 
 
At this realm, who among them was not afraid of death! 
 



However, they looked around and found that they were surrounded by the four symbols formation. 
They couldn’t get out at all. Then, they remembered that the control of this immortal Palace was in the 
hands of this kid. If he activated the formation again, he could kill them here. 
 
With this thought, they were even more afraid. 
 
“Fellow Daoist! Stop!” 
 
“Little friend, let’s talk this out.” 
 
The Lingxiao holy man and the others shouted. 
 
“We admit defeat. We are willing to apologize to you, young friend!” Seeing that the figure had no 
intention of stopping, they hurriedly shouted again. 
 
“An apology? Can you afford to pay for it?” 
 
Tang Hao smirked. 
 
“No matter the price, we’ll pay!” 
 
The Lingxiao holy man laughed bitterly. 
 
They had no choice but to pay, or else they would all die Here! 
 
With this person’s courage, he would definitely do such a thing. 
 
“Alright!” Tang Hao stopped and gently pulled on the flying sword in his hand.””Hand over your 
cultivation, and each of you nine forces will get two. For the great emperor mountain and Jing Yan 
house, it will be doubled. For you forces, each of you will get one. If you hand it over, I will let you go!” 
 
As soon as he finished speaking, the expressions of the peak experts changed. 
 
“Do you want to die or do you want Dao attainment? think about it clearly!” “Also, I didn’t do this,” Tang 
Hao said coldly.”There was a traitor in the Yun family, and I’ve already killed him.” 
 
“If I wanted to kill more people, I wouldn’t have to set up such a trap!” 
 
As he heard this, the Ling Xiao holy man and the others laughed bitterly. 
 
That’s right! With his strength, he was clearly an invincible great emperor. He could kill whoever he 
wanted. There was no need to set up such a trap and lie to them. 
 
The Daluo heavenly Palace pays!” 
 
He stretched out his hand and called over a few elders of the Daluo heavenly Palace. He whispered a 
few words to them, and the elders nodded. 
 



There were many Dao integration experts in the Daluo heavenly Palace, so it was not difficult for him to 
take out two. 
 
“My Fen clan has also paid!” 
 
The fen clan’s side chimed in. 
 
Compared to losing his life, provoking such an almost invincible great emperor was nothing. 
 
“Why do we have four at the great emperor mountain?” 
 
The peak-level expert from the great emperor mountain said unhappily. 
 
“Why four, you should know very well. If you want to exchange for the immortal Bell, then take four 
more!” Tang Hao said coldly. 
 
“You …” The peak expert of the great emperor mountain was so angry that his face was red. He wanted 
to curse but he didn’t dare to. It was so unbearable. 
 
“It’s all your fault! What are you shouting for!” 
 
He turned around and glared at the successor of his own echelon. His face was livid as he cursed. 
 
The young man was dumbfounded and speechless. 
 
“My Jing Yan Zhai will also pay! I also want that immortal sword back!” The beautiful woman from Jing 
Yan house shouted. 
 
She looked at him coldly, hatred surging in her eyes. 
 
She would remember today’s grudge and take revenge in the future if she had the chance. 
 
“Alright!” 
 
Tang Hao said as he looked at her. 
 
“My Wu clan will pay too!” 
 
“The same goes for my Zhou consortium!” 
 
A group of 36-star forces also voiced their opinions one after another. The Wu family’s elder was the 
most enthusiastic. 
 
He was really scared out of his wits. 
 
If he didn’t hand it over, he was afraid that he would die Here later. Moreover, this kid would find his 
Wu clan and exterminate his entire clan. His Wu clan wasn’t like the nine magnates, who had layers of 
true immortal arrays protecting them and were unbreakable. 



 
“My young friend, these are two cultivation beads from the Daluo heavenly Palace!” 
 
The Lingxiao holy man was the first to rush over. He took out two golden Dao beads and pushed them 
over. 
 
Tang Hao used his divine will to check, and there was nothing wrong with it. He opened his mouth and 
swallowed it. 
 
Upon seeing this, the Ling Xiao holy man was stunned. 
 
Was he … Swallowing his Dao attainment and refining it? 
 
But how was that possible? 
 
How could he still cultivate? 
 
The crowd was also stunned. 
 
He must have only stored his Dao attainment! 
 
Then, they consoled themselves. 
 
If this child could continue to refine his Dao, then he would be too heaven-defying! 
 
“This is the Dao of my Fen clan!” 
 
“This is my myriad beasts sect’s …” 
 
The nine major forces came one after another and sent Dao attainment. 
 
The Daluo heavenly Palace and the other seven forces had two, while the great emperor mountain and 
the quiet Speech House had four each. They said that they would come back to exchange for celestial 
artifacts in the future, so they had a total of 22. 
 
Then, there were the thirty-six stars, and the raging fire sect and other forces. Each of them had one 
cultivation, and in total, they had a total of fifty Dao attainment. 
 
“Seventy-two!” 
 
Tang Hao did some calculations after he collected them. 
 
He had devoured all of them, and with the original 23, the number of Dao attainments in his immortal 
abode had now reached an astonishing 95. 
 
“You guys can leave!” 
 
Tang Hao flicked his sleeve and activated the four symbols formation. 



 
The group of old monsters hurriedly stood up and left as if they were escaping. 
 
“My young friend, I’m really sorry!” 
 
The Lingxiao holy man and the others bowed and apologized before leaving. 
 
Tang Hao watched them leave. After they were all gone, he reopened the formation. 
 
He stood in place and pondered for a moment. 
 
Just now, he did have the chance to kill them all, but he didn’t want to do so. Firstly, these people didn’t 
want to kill him at the beginning. They just wanted to suppress him and drive him away. 
 
As long as these people said the word ‘kill’, he would kill them all without hesitation. 
 
Secondly, once he did so, he would have to fight to the death with these forces, especially the nine 
magnates. He didn’t have the ability to destroy them now, and they would be a big problem in the 
future. 
 
Moreover, he didn’t plan to stay here for too long. He still needed to find the star pupil and return to 
Pangu as soon as possible. He didn’t want to be entangled with these forces here. 
 
After receiving so much Dao attainment, it was not considered a loss this time. 
 
After a while, he turned around and returned to the Golden Palace. 
 
 


