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The beautiful woman in front of him had a graceful figure and was extremely beautiful. 
 
A thin black chiffon dress wrapped around a mature and enchanting figure. The curves of her body were 
exquisite and extremely hot. 
 
There was a mature charm on her beautiful face, and her bright eyes were like autumn water, full of 
charm. 
 
This was a mature stunner, and she didn’t need any seduction techniques to be able to seduce one’s 
soul. 
 
Tang Hao glanced at her and sniffed her strong fragrance. He could not help but feel his heart flutter. 
 
She stood in front of him, raised her dazzlingly beautiful face, and looked at him with her beautiful eyes. 
 
“How do you think I should repay you? My good little brother …” 
 
She mumbled as she raised her hand and touched his cheek, feeling a little emotional. 
 
When she left, she felt that she would be able to forget everything very soon. Perhaps if fate allowed it, 
they would meet again in the immortal world. But now that they met again, looking at this handsome 
face in front of her, she knew that she could not forget it at all. 
 
At this moment, she was a little agitated and could not suppress her emotions, which proved everything. 
 
She had once loved someone deeply, so deeply that it was etched in her heart. 
 
However, that was more than 3000 years ago. Time had erased everything, leaving only a few blurry 
figures. 
 
That figure had been replaced by the one before him. 
 
She gently caressed his face and looked at him in a daze. 
 
Her heart was also constantly trembling. 
 
“Good brother, I’ll stay with you! After you leave the origin immortal domain, I’ll leave. ” 
 
She really wanted to say that she wanted him to go with her and ascend to the celestial world. 
 
However, she knew that he must have his own matters to attend to. There were still many people who 
loved him and were worried about him. How could he leave with her just like that? 
 
It was better to spend some time together like this and leave behind some good memories. 
 



In the future, they would meet again in the immortal world. 
 
“Alright!” 
 
“Okay,” Tang Hao replied softly. 
 
“That’s great!” She immediately smiled brightly, and her beautiful eyes curved slightly, which was very 
beautiful. 
 
“I know that there must be a lot of people who like you, and we might not be able to be together in the 
end. After all, I still have the Yun family to carry the burden. But I don’t care at all. As long as you belong 
to me during this time, that’s enough.” 
 
 
She said emotionally as she opened her arms and hugged him gently. 
 
Tang Hao was silent. 
 
It would be impossible to say that he had no feelings for her. After all, they had been intimate with each 
other. 
 
He pondered for a moment and was about to speak. 
 
“Shh! You don’t have to say anything, I understand!” She took a step back, raised her hand, and touched 
his lips. 
 
She pursed her lips and smiled. There was an indescribable charm in her eyes. 
 
“Now, all you need to do is love me, just like … That night, bad brother!” She hugged him gently again 
and whispered in his ear. 
 
———- 
 
The days passed by quickly. 
 
In the blink of an eye, ten days had passed. 
 
Ten days of being together from morning to night, warm and lingering, was as beautiful as a dream. 
 
She rarely asked about him, but she often talked about her past. 
 
Her passion and her mature style made Tang Hao feel intoxicated. He felt as if he was in a warm and 
gentle home. 
 
It was as if the Yun family had disappeared. No one knew which mountain they had gone to, and they 
had never shown their faces. 
 
“My good brother, are you leaving?” 



 
Another five days passed. 
 
Yun feiwan seemed to have sensed his intention to leave. Her mood became low and her expression 
darkened. 
 
The two of them sat on the top of the immortal Palace, looking at the sea of clouds in front of them. 
 
She turned around and looked at him. Her eyes were deep, as if she wanted to imprint this face in her 
mind forever. 
 
“Soon! I still have things to do!” 
 
Tang Hao said. 
 
“En!” 
 
She responded in a low voice and nodded.”Then I should go. I will return to the Yun family and reforge 
the immortal mansion. After refining two more Dao attainment beads, I will be able to ascend. You don’t 
have to wait until then. I’m afraid that I won’t bear to leave with you around.” 
 
“When I reach the immortal world, I will work hard to cultivate. That way, when you reach the immortal 
world, we will have a chance to meet again.” 
 
As she spoke, she reached out and grabbed his hand tightly, squeezing it. 
 
“You must remember me too. Don’t forget me just like that. I’ll be very sad if you do.” 
 
“My good brother, although you’re not the first person I’ve loved, you’re my first man and will be my 
last!” 
 
She muttered as she looked at the young man beside her, her eyes filled with gentleness. 
 
She gently leaned over and kissed him. 
 
Another few days of lingering. 
 
She finally left. 
 
Just like that day, he got up early in the morning and left. 
 
When Tang Hao woke up, the immortal Palace was empty. 
 
Tang Hao walked out of the main hall and looked around. He felt a sense of loss. 
 
Recalling the days they spent together, it felt like a dream. 
 
To him, this relationship had come a little too suddenly and too violently. 



 
“Forget it, I won’t go!” 
 
He looked in the direction of the Yun family for a long time, then suddenly shook his head. 
 
If he went, he didn’t know when they would be able to part. He did have many things to do. Of course, 
he had to go to the immortal world, but not now. He couldn’t leave until he got rid of the nine-colored 
God clan and that immortal-ranked Dragon count. 
 
“I should leave this region and look for the star pupil and the XI Fang race. I should also find the way to 
Pangu.” 
 
He muttered. 
 
“By the way, I have something to do before I leave. I have to go to the star Mountain to see miss su and 
little ye. I haven’t seen them for a long time. As for the Ji family and cangliu, I don’t have to go back for 
the time being. I’ll come back in the future anyway.” 
 
As he pondered, he thought of su Xuezi and ye Siyao, who were at the star Mountain. 
 
He had originally wanted to return to cangliu, but after thinking about it again, he would still have to 
return to this place after going to the various major Immortal Realms and returning to Pangu. There was 
no need to go back now. 
 
“Before I go to the star Mountain, I have to refine the clear sky elixir. Then, I will give one to lady su and 
one to little girl ye.” 
 
“Also, the key to the spiritual illusionary realm. When you go to the major celestial realms, spread the 
spiritual illusionary realm out and let it spread throughout the entire starry sky.” 
 
He pondered for a while and had a rough plan. 
 
He took another look at the Yun family, then composed himself and took out the golden seal that 
controlled the immortal Palace. 
 
He activated it and the void around him distorted. The huge Mountain Gate suddenly shrank and 
disappeared into the golden seal. 
 
After a while, he activated it again, and the mountain Gate appeared again. 
 
After familiarizing himself with it, he kept the mountain Gate, turned into a divine light, and rushed out 
of the sacred beast planet. 
 
After traveling for six days, he returned to the Forbidden Zone. He found the star Devourer and entered 
its body. 
 
The star Devourer beast had been awake the whole time, moving slowly in the Forbidden Zone of the 
starry sky. Every time it moved, its direction would change. 



 
After returning to the blood sea, he went to see Chun Xuan, Qiu CI, and Ji Ruyin. Then, he went into 
seclusion and began to refine pills. 
 
 
 


