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“The song family of the North cloud continent has sent a ten-thousand-year-old immortal medicine!” 
 
“Xiling continent, Lin clan, present ten true dragon bones! Three Phoenix Feathers!” 
 
As he flew up and arrived at the floating island, he heard shouts coming from the island. 
 
On the island, there was a stage set up by the people of the blue water Palace. 
 
The xiuzhe that had come all rushed forward and presented the gifts they had brought. 
 
After they paid their respects, someone led them to the square in front. 
 
Many people were already seated in the square. 
 
Further ahead was a high platform, on which many figures were sitting. Judging from their clothes, they 
were all from the blue water Palace. 
 
The one in the middle was a white-haired old woman. She was the main character of this birthday 
banquet and one of the three most powerful figures of the blue water Palace, the purple jade holy man. 
 
Not far to her left sat a woman in a purple robe. She had a graceful figure and was charming. It was 
obviously the goddess, Xiao Lingxi. 
 
The others were elders of the blue water Palace. 
 
They sat on the high platform, chatting and laughing with the people below. From time to time, they 
would raise their cups and drink, creating a festive atmosphere. 
 
From time to time, their eyes would sweep over to the stage. When they heard that they had received 
some good treasures, they couldn’t help but be even more delighted. 
 
“Yo! Isn’t this old heavenly worker!” 
 
Tang Hao landed and walked forward. Someone turned around and recognized him. 
 
“Heaven’s craftsmen faction?” 
 
When the cultivators heard this name, they all frowned slightly, and many of them revealed a look of 
disdain. 
 
“Old heavenly worker, what treasure did you bring this time? Quickly take it out and let us see!” 
 
Someone shouted. It was purely an attitude of jeering and watching a joke. 
 



“Hey! Aren’t you making things difficult for him? He had just entered the nine tribulations not long ago! 
Where can I find any good treasure!” Some people laughed along. 
 
Many people looked at Tang Hao with mocking eyes. 
 
On the high platform, many people heard the commotion and looked over. 
 
Tang Hao turned around and scanned his surroundings. He grinned and said loudly,””I’ve prepared a 
very special treasure for this trip. It’ll definitely shock everyone!” 
 
All the cultivators were stunned. 
 
It was a very special treasure that could shock everyone? 
 
You must be bragging! 
 
“Tsk! You can really brag!” 
 
“Why don’t you take it out and show us!” 
 
They laughed out loud. 
 
On the high platform, more eyes were cast over. Even the Ziyu holy man looked over with interest. 
 
“Is this the one from the heaven’s craftsmen faction? The heaven’s craftsmen faction is so poor, how 
could they have any good treasures!” 
 
“I think he’s just bragging!” 
 
A few elders of the blue water Palace began to discuss in low voices. 
 
“Alright!” 
 
“Yes,” Tang Hao replied, then raised his hand to signal for the people in front of him to move aside. 
 
When there was an empty space, he flicked his sleeve, and a big black bell flew out. It was more than 
ten meters tall, and with a clang, it fell to the ground. 
 
Everyone was dumbfounded. 
 
The entire square fell silent. 
 
They stared at the black bell in disbelief. 
 
This was a birthday banquet! 
 
What’s the meaning of you giving a clock? 
 



Was he here to F * cking ruin the event? 
 
“This … This …” 
 
“Old heavenly worker, are you crazy?” 
 
After a long period of dead silence, the surroundings began to boil. 
 
They all felt that it was a little unbelievable. This old heavenly worker had just reached the ninth 
tribulation. As far as they knew, he had no enmity with the blue water Palace. Why would he do such a 
crazy thing? 
 
“Old heavenly worker, How dare you!” 
 
On the high platform, a group of elders of the blue water Palace stood up and scolded him. 
 
The white-haired old woman’s face suddenly became gloomy and a cold light flickered. 
 
She didn’t know why this guy had disturbed her birthday banquet and what kind of deep hatred he had 
with her blue water Palace. However, since he had done such a thing, he couldn’t be forgiven. 
 
The cultivators around Tang Hao all backed away, afraid of being dragged into the mess. 
 
Tang Hao stood next to the bell and clapped it with a smile.””Look at this clock, isn’t it big and round? 
it’s such a good clock. It’s perfect for your blue water Palace!” 
 
“You … You’re looking for death!” 
 
The elders of the blue water Palace all slammed the table in anger. 
 
“You’re just a mere Dao glimpse stage cultivator. How dare you cause trouble in my blue water Palace? I 
can suppress you without the formation!” 
 
An old man rushed up from the high platform and stood in the void. He raised his hand, and a Golden 
Jade Ruyi flew out. It instantly expanded and knocked forward. 
 
Tang Hao chuckled and slapped the bell beside him. 
 
With a clang, the big bell flew out and collided with the Jade Ruyi scepter, creating a deafening sound. 
 
Pfft! 
 
The old man’s body trembled, and he spat out a mouthful of blood. 
 
“You … You’re not Daoist heavenly Smith!” 
 
His face was pale as he screamed. 
 



Taoist Tiangong had just entered the ninth tribulation not long ago, and he was a Dao condensation 
cultivator, so he could have easily crushed him. However, he was so shocked that he vomited blood 
during the confrontation today, which proved that this person was definitely not a Dao glimpse stage 
cultivator. He was probably a Dao integration stage old monster who had deliberately disguised himself 
as Taoist Tiangong and sneaked in. 
 
“If he’s not Daoist Tiangong, then who is he?” 
 
“Who has the guts to come here and cause trouble?” 
 
The crowd was in an uproar again. 
 
On the high platform, the Ziyu holy man squinted his eyes and carefully probed around. Then, he 
frowned. 
 
Even she couldn’t see through the disguise of the person in front of her. He was really brilliant. 
 
This also proved that this person had a strong background. 
 
“Fellow Daoist, since you’re already here, why are you still hiding? why don’t you show your true face 
and let me see?” She shouted coldly,”I really don’t know when my blue water Palace has provoked such 
a great enemy like you.” 
 
“Don’t you know what you’ve done?” 
 
Tang Hao smirked. 
 
“They really came to seek revenge!” 
 
“That’s strange. I’ve never heard of any trouble that the blue water Palace has caused recently!” 
 
All the cultivators discussed. 
 
“My fellow cultivator, don’t make false accusations in front of the whole world. My blue water Palace 
has always been open and honest, and we have never done anything wrong!” The purple jade Dao 
sovereign shouted. 
 
“Let me ask you, more than a decade ago, was there a genius in your crystal-clear water Palace who had 
a Mystic fairy Pearl?” 
 
Tang Hao shouted. 
 
“The mystic Fairy bead?” 
 
“Are you talking about the missing genius of the blue water Palace?” 
 
When the cultivators heard this, they immediately broke out into an uproar. 
 



Everyone’s faces were filled with shock. 
 
No one had expected that this man was here for the missing genius of the blue water Palace more than 
ten years ago! 
 
The purple jade holy man and the elders of the blue water Palace changed their expressions. 
 
“What’s going on? Didn’t she have no family or reason? It’s been so many years, so why would someone 
come looking for her, and a Dao integration stage one at that?” 
 
The purple jade holy man was shocked and confused. 
 
There should not have been anything left behind about what had happened back then, and she had 
thought that it was over. But now, a mysterious Dao integration stage old monster had suddenly come 
to her blue water Palace to pursue this matter! 
 
“My Lord!” 
 
The group of elders looked over one after another, their expressions somewhat strange. 
 
“Don’t panic. She once mentioned that she once had a master, and it might be this one! However, 
according to her, he’s just a rogue cultivator. What’s there to fear from a Dao integration stage rogue 
cultivator?” 
 
The purple jade Dao sovereign transmitted a message. 
 
When she raised her eyes again and looked at the figure in the middle of the field, a hint of ridicule 
emerged in her eyes. 
 
Did this guy think that he could shake the crystal-clear water Palace and avenge that girl with his own 
strength? 
 
Hmph! 
 
He was really overestimating himself! 
 
It just so happened that he had to kill this guy today, and this matter would be completely settled. 
 
 


