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“It’s really good wine!” 
 
On the Xuanyuan warship, Xuanyuan lie held a jar of wine and praised. 
 
“That President Shi is also a talent!” 
 
Then, he sighed. 
 
In just two years, he had established such a huge Chamber of Commerce and expanded his business to 
all corners of the immortal world. If he wasn’t a talent, what was he? 
 
Everyone praised him as a rare business genius, and it was true. 
 
Such a sophisticated and smooth person who was well-versed in social relations could not possibly be 
that lower realm monster! 
 
“What a pity!” 
 
He sighed. 
 
If that was the case, then he wouldn’t have to continue looking for her. 
 
“Where is that demon hiding?” 
 
He looked around with a worried expression. 
 
In order to find this monstrous talent, the Xuanyuan clan had sent many elders to search all over the 
immortal world. By right, they should have found some traces of him, but they found nothing. 
 
That demon seemed to have vanished from the world. 
 
They had also thought of using divination to divine this person’s whereabouts. However, none of the 
forces dared to accept it. They all said that the karma on this evildoer was too great. They did not dare 
to divine it, nor could they divine it. 
 
Therefore, they could only go around and try their luck. 
 
“Elder, we’re leaving just like this?” 
 
A man behind him said. 
 
“Let’s go! We’ve already investigated all the loose Immortals here, so let’s go over there and continue 
our investigation!” 
 
Xuanyuan lie pointed ahead and said. 



 
“Yes! Elder!” 
 
Soon, the ship started and slowly sailed away. 
 
After they had left, a figure flew out of Nantian city. 
 
Tang Hao’s expression was grave as he watched them leave. 
 
This Xuanyuan clan was really persistent. 
 
For the time being, he did not have the risk of being exposed, but he was not sure that it would never 
happen. 
 
“It’s time to make some preparations!” 
 
He mumbled to himself as his figure flickered and he returned to Dragon Mountain. 
 
He sat down in the hall and muttered to himself. 
 
There were two ways for him to further improve his strength. The first was to find the third connate 
spirit item and form the Golden Flower of Dao to break through to the Golden immortal realm. The 
second was to collect more immortal materials and refine the immortal spirit body. 
 
No matter which one it was, it was not easy. 
 
For the former, spiritual items were hard to find, and he didn’t know when he would be able to find a 
third spiritual item. 
 
Even if he did find it, it would take time to form the Golden Flower and prepare for the Tribulation. 
 
In comparison, the second method was more reliable and easier to achieve. 
 
“If I want to refine an immortal spirit body, I still need a lot of immortal materials, but now that all the 
major forces are on guard, I won’t have a chance to do it.” 
 
He mumbled, feeling a little troubled. 
 
The amount of immortal materials needed to refine an immortal spirit body was simply too huge. Even 
though he had stolen from the treasure vaults of several forces and bought quite a lot, it was still not 
enough. 
 
“I have to buy more immortal materials. I can use master Haotian’s name to accept artifact refining 
commissions and collect immortal materials as remuneration … I can also find more immortal materials 
myself.” 
 
After pondering for a while, he had a plan. 
 



He didn’t take action immediately. Instead, he spent half a month to make a large number of products. 
Then, he went to the sky seeking Pavilion. 
 
“Grandmaster wants immortal materials, and the more the better? No matter what immortal material it 
is?” 
 
“Grandmaster has accepted a request to refine artifacts?” 
 
Feng Qingyan’s beautiful eyes lit up when she heard that. 
 
This was great news! 
 
She was a loyal fan of the master, so how could she let go of such a good opportunity? 
 
“Yup! If a master wants to forge a treasure, he needs a lot of immortal materials. ” “Guild leader Feng,” 
Tang Hao said,”do you know where I can find immortal materials in this realm?” 
 
“This … It’s not easy to find.” 
 
Feng Qingyan frowned,”those that are easy to find have basically been taken away. Many of the 
immortal materials sold in the market now are all cultivated by the major powers. They are naturally 
rare.” 
 
“However, there is a place that might have a lot of natural immortal materials!” 
 
She pondered for a moment and suddenly said. 
 
“Oh? What place is it?” 
 
Tang Hao was surprised. 
 
“This place is called the land of absolute beginning. It’s not in any of the major continents, but in the gap 
between a few continents. It’s a vast, chaotic space. It’s said that this world was created from there.” 
 
“That’s why the environment there is very complicated and dangerous, but there are also great 
opportunities. It’s said that you can find some very ancient immortal materials and ores there.” 
 
Feng Qingyan said. 
 
“A place where the heavens and earth were created?” 
 
Tang Hao was surprised when he heard that. 
 
If it was true, then it was indeed a bit incredible. 
 
“It’s also a legend, no one can say for sure. However, the opportunities there are real, and many people 
go there to search for treasures. As long as you are careful, there is no danger to your life. ” Feng 
Qingyan said. 



 
“Then I’ll go and take a look!” 
 
Tang Hao mumbled. 
 
“President Shi, don’t be in such a hurry! Didn’t you say that Grandmaster wanted to accept a 
Commission? it just so happens that I have something for Grandmaster to refine. ” Feng Qingyan was a 
little excited, and her beautiful eyes were shining. 
 
“Oh! May I know what guild leader Feng wants to refine?” 
 
Tang Hao said. 
 
“Of course it’s the clothes. With President Shi’s design and the master’s superb skills, I’m sure you’ll be 
able to refine the world’s most beautiful and most useful immortal robe.” Feng Qingyan said. 
 
“Don’t worry, I’ll definitely give you enough compensation. Take a look and see if this thing will work.” 
 
As she spoke, she flicked her sleeve and a huge piece of gold metal flew out. It was as big as a millstone 
and was in the shape of a water drop. 
 
“Immortal gold tear?” 
 
Tang Hao was shocked when he looked at it. 
 
This was the first time he had seen such a huge immortal tear gold. Furthermore, it was of the immortal 
grade. 
 
“This …” 
 
Tang Hao looked at the immortal tear gold, then at her. He was shocked. 
 
To take out such a huge piece of immortal tear gold, this was simply too extravagant. It seemed that this 
person’s net worth was also quite rich. 
 
“What’s there to be surprised about? I’ve been the president of the spirit Toad continent’s main branch 
for so many years, how could I not have some background?” 
 
Feng Qingyan proudly raised her head and smiled. 
 
“That’s true!” 
 
Tang Hao smiled wryly. 
 
“I’ve also prepared the materials. Take a look and see if they’re okay.” 
 
Feng Qingyan flicked her sleeve again, and small boxes flew out one after another. 
 



Ka ka ka! 
 
The boxes opened one by one, and divine light poured out of them, almost blinding Tang Hao’s eyes. 
 
“This is … Phoenix Feather, and it’s at the Golden immortal level. This is … Golden silk. Judging from its 
aura, it’s not spat out by ordinary golden silkworms. Is it also at the Golden immortal level?” 
 
Tang Hao was dumbfounded when he looked at the items. 
 
These materials were too extravagant! 
 
This woman … Was really a rich woman! 
 
“How is it?” 
 
Seeing this, Feng Qingyan couldn’t help but purse her lips and smile, feeling even more proud. 
 
She had spent a lot of time and effort on these materials, and she had finally been able to use them 
today. 
 
With the best materials, the best design, and the best level of blacksmithing, he would definitely be able 
to make the best immortal robe. 
 
 


