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“What is he doing?” 
 
Everyone in the sea of lightning exclaimed. 
 
Everyone’s face was filled with shock. 
 
It was normal for that kid to use his immortal spirit body, but what was abnormal was that he actually 
opened his mouth and welcomed the Tribulation lightning. 
 
In their eyes, this was undoubtedly extremely crazy! 
 
Many of them had immortal spirit bodies. Of course, they knew that although immortal spirit bodies 
were made of immortal materials, their internal parts were much weaker than their external parts. How 
could they withstand such violent tribulation lightning? 
 
If this lightning struck, the immortal spirit body would probably explode internally. 
 
However, the scene that they were expecting did not happen. 
 
The giant opened his mouth and caught the lightning, but his body remained still. 
 
“What … What is he doing?” 
 
The old monsters were stunned again. 
 
They couldn’t figure out what this guy was doing. 
 
Was it devouring the lightning? 
 
This … How could this be possible! 
 
This was the Tribulation lightning of the Golden immortal tribulation. How could it be absorbed? 
 
Moreover, how could an immortal spirit body absorb the Tribulation lightning? there was no such 
immortal spirit body in the world! 
 
They just stood there in a daze. In shock and bewilderment, they watched the lightning gradually 
dissipate. 
 
“Did you receive it or did you swallow it?” 
 
After a long while, they finally came back to their senses and looked at each other, their eyes somewhat 
blank. 
 
Very quickly, with a crackling sound, another bolt of lightning struck down. 
 



The giant still opened its mouth and welcomed the attack. 
 
One after another. 
 
The old monsters ‘expressions became more and more dazed. 
 
They had never seen such a strange and special way of transcending the Tribulation! 
 
Whoosh! 
 
There was another loud noise. After a few minutes of preparation, the last lightning tribulation finally 
fell. 
 
The giant opened its mouth again and caught it. 
 
When the lightning dissipated, the old monsters didn’t react for a while. 
 
They were still standing there in a daze, looking at the beam of light falling from the sky and enveloping 
the giant. 
 
“It’s over!” 
 
After a long while, someone finally came back to his senses and shouted. 
 
Everyone seemed to have woken up from a dream and returned to their senses. 
 
However, they didn’t move after that. They all stared at the figure. 
 
They could sense that something was being nurtured in the giant’s body, and it was emitting a terrifying 
aura. 
 
“If you guys aren’t moving, then let me do it! He’s just a little kid, what’s there to be afraid of!” 
 
On the warship of the primitive sect, Daoist heaven’s way sneered and walked out with a flick of his 
sleeve. 
 
He looked around with a sneer in his eyes. 
 
This group of people was too timid. Just because of that unusual thing just now, they were so scared 
that they didn’t dare to make a move. 
 
“Let me cut off his arm first!” 
 
He opened his mouth, and a small golden sword flew out. 
 
Weng Weng Weng! 
 



The small golden sword trembled and released a shocking sword Qi that seemed to be able to cut the 
sky and split the earth. 
 
“Go!” 
 
He shouted in a low voice, and the small sword trembled and shot out. 
 
In the next moment, it suddenly expanded, creating a sword Qi that was tens of millions of feet long, 
slashing down at the dark golden giant. 
 
The giant raised his head, and his throat moved. He opened his mouth again, and a shocking lightning 
bolt shot out. 
 
In an instant, the entire world was lit up by this bolt of lightning. 
 
Even the zenith heaven old monsters narrowed their eyes and were almost dazzled by the blinding 
lightning. 
 
“Heavens!” 
 
“This … How is this possible?” 
 
Their hearts were filled with shock and disbelief. 
 
The lightning that was spat out clearly carried the aura of the Tribulation lightning. That kid really 
swallowed the lightning and turned the Tribulation lightning for his own use. This … Was simply too 
unbelievable! 
 
That was the lightning tribulation! 
 
Furthermore, it was the lightning of the Golden immortal tribulation. How could it be devoured and 
turned into his own? 
 
“The aura of this lightning is a little off. There’s been a huge change!” 
 
Then, some people were more sensitive to the fact that there was something wrong with the aura of the 
lightning. It seemed to be more violent than the lightning of tribulation, with a trace of destructive aura. 
In short, it was more powerful and its aura was more terrifying. 
 
This discovery made them even more shocked. 
 
They couldn’t figure out what kind of Divine Art or method could modify the lightning of tribulation and 
make it stronger. 
 
BOOM! 
 
The Thunderbolt collided with the sword light and immediately exploded with a shocking divine light. 
 



Circles of ripples spread out madly with the collision point as the center. 
 
“No… That’s impossible!” 
 
The heavenly Dao Daoist was a little dazed. 
 
His sword attack was actually blocked. 
 
This … Was too F * cking ridiculous! 
 
He was a Grand Luo immortal! Even if it was not an all-out attack, it was not something a puny gold 
immortal could withstand! 
 
Just as he was in a daze, there was a loud clang. The giant opened its mouth and spat out another bolt of 
lightning. It headed straight for him and the Golden battleship behind him. 
 
He clicked his tongue and immediately called his flying sword over, slashing out. 
 
After he destroyed this patch of lightning, more lightning came in the next moment. One after another, 
they came crazily. 
 
He kept swinging his sword, cutting the lightning apart. 
 
He was safe and sound, but the large ship not far behind him was struck by the exploding lightning and 
directly exploded. Accompanied by a series of panicked screams, the people on it swept out and fled in 
all directions. 
 
Ye Futian, the Taixu sovereign, and the others were all terrified and pale. 
 
They all felt it was ridiculous. 
 
They had thought that this time, they could easily suppress that demon, but in the end, that demon had 
swallowed the Tribulation Thunder and withstood the attack of the zenith heaven immortal. 
 
“Hurry, hurry up and move further away!” 
 
The members of the sect of Yuanshi shouted and fled. 
 
“What did this kid do?” 
 
“What’s with this immortal spirit body? How can it devour the Tribulation lightning?” 
 
All the zenith heaven old monsters widened their eyes and stared at the giant, their hearts filled with 
confusion. 
 
Everything before their eyes had completely subverted their understanding! 
 
“We have to capture this brat and find out the secret of this immortal spirit body!” 



 
“This immortal spirit body is too special! We must snatch it!” 
 
Gradually, their hearts began to burn. 
 
They all realized how special this immortal spirit body was and its value. As long as they seized it and 
studied it, they might be able to modify their own immortal spirit bodies and become stronger. 
 
In their eyes, the value of the immortal spirit body was comparable to the two immortal Emperor 
Supreme treasures. 
 
Some people even felt that the immortal spirit body was worth more. 
 
This was because even if they took back the ultimate treasure, it would be used to suppress the luck of 
their own forces and become the treasure of their sects and families. It was not as practical as this 
immortal spirit body. 
 
Soon, someone made a move. He stretched out his hand, and a giant palm that covered the sky 
appeared and slapped toward the dark golden giant. 
 
Then, the old monsters all attacked. 
 
For a moment, all kinds of divine abilities appeared. Some were aimed at the giant, and some were 
aimed at the opponent. The situation immediately became chaotic. 
 
 
 


