
The Mightiest Little Peasant Chapter 3140 
“It’s been a few days, why hasn’t he come out yet?” 
 
“Don’t tell me he really died inside!” 
 
In the mission Hall, many people were sitting cross-legged, looking at the passage and discussing in low 
voices. 
 
It had been twelve days since that Qin fellow, long Xiaozi, and the others had gone in, and not a single 
one of them had come out. 
 
“Hahaha! That brat must be in a terrible state now. Even if he’s not dead, he must have suffered a lot of 
torture. How could he come out so quickly?” 
 
“That’s right. If I were long Xiaozi and the others, I’d definitely torture that kid for a month before I let 
him out.” 
 
Many people laughed and gloated. 
 
They all felt that the kid had either fallen into the hands of long Xiaozi or the Xiu clan. No matter which 
one it was, he would end up in a miserable state! 
 
“I hope it won’t kill anyone!” 
 
Elder Zhao sat in front of the hall and muttered as he looked at the passage. 
 
His brows were slightly furrowed and his eyes were filled with worry. 
 
How could a boy who was only a little over a hundred years old with a cultivation of only six thousand 
Dao attainment complete such a seven-star task? he would be a piece of cake if he went in, not to 
mention that a group of heaven immortal level monsters were chasing after him. 
 
“It’s been twelve days. I’ll go in and take a look in a few days!” 
 
He mumbled. 
 
As soon as he finished speaking, he caught a glimpse of a figure from the corner of his eye. A figure 
flashed and someone walked out. 
 
He looked up and was stunned. 
 
At this moment, the discussion in the hall also disappeared. Everyone raised their heads and looked at 
the figure who walked out of the passage. 
 
“Why is he the first one to come out?” 
 
“He looks fine!” 



 
They sized him up and were extremely bewildered. 
 
Logically speaking, shouldn’t the first ones to come out be those heaven immortal monsters? 
 
Moreover, in their opinion, this brat should have suffered all kinds of torture and was incomparably 
miserable, so why was he still so calm and composed? 
 
“You … Why did you come out?” 
 
“You’re fine?” 
 
The next moment, the hall was in an uproar. 
 
Everyone stood up and exclaimed. 
 
“Why can’t I come out?” 
 
Tang Hao glanced at them and chuckled. 
 
Seeing this, everyone was even more confused. 
 
This guy seemed to be completely fine. If he had really been tortured in there, he wouldn’t be acting like 
this. 
 
“I know, this guy must have hidden the moment he entered. He must have been hiding until now, and 
then he ran out.” 
 
A disciple said. 
 
“Yes, yes! It must be like this!” 
 
This statement was acknowledged by everyone. 
 
Because only in this way could this kid be safe and sound. 
 
Everyone’s gazes immediately turned to disdain. 
 
After hiding in there for twelve days and coming out dejectedly, this guy could still laugh, didn’t he feel 
ashamed? 
 
“Cough, cough! It’s alright, it’s good that you’re out!” 
 
Elder Zhao stood up and hurriedly said. 
 
He felt that this kid was quite smart. He knew that his strength was not enough and thus hid. 
 



“This mission ends here! You’ve tried your best, so I won’t blame you if you can’t complete it. After all, 
this is a Seven Star Mission. ” He walked up to Tang Hao and said with a smile. 
 
“Who said I didn’t complete it?” 
 
Tang Hao said. 
 
Elder Zhao’s expression froze for a moment before he smiled. 
 
Hahaha! This disciple was quite humorous! He actually knows how to joke! 
 
“Hahaha!” 
 
The disciples in the hall also laughed out loud, but no one cared. 
 
Who would believe that a mere intermediate human immortal kid had completed a seven-star Mission? 
 
However, as they laughed, their expressions gradually froze, and then they became extremely dazed. 
 
Their eyes slowly widened to the point that they were about to pop out. 
 
Elder Zhao’s eyes almost popped out of their sockets. 
 
His entire face was contorted from extreme shock. 
 
“Y-y-you … T-T-this …” 
 
He raised his trembling hand and pointed at Tang Hao as if he had just seen a ghost. 
 
In the hands of this brat, there was a bright pearl. Wasn’t it the Pearl of the mermaid King? 
 
But how was that possible? 
 
He had put this Pearl in there for more than two thousand years, and no one had ever taken it out. Even 
a group of heaven Immortals would be defeated if they went in. How … Could a 100-year-old boy with a 
cultivation of only six thousand Dao attainment possibly take it out? 
 
This was simply too unbelievable! 
 
“Elder, are you alright?” 
 
Tang Hao looked at him and smiled. 
 
“I’m … I’m fine!” 
 
Elder Zhao took a deep breath and forced himself to calm down. 
 
“You … Where did you get this thing?” 



 
Even though he was trying to suppress the shock in his heart, his voice still trembled. 
 
“I picked it up!” 
 
Tang Hao mumbled. 
 
“You … You picked it up?” 
 
Elder Zhao’s mouth fell open, and he was stunned again. 
 
Then, his face twitched violently. This was the F * cking Pearl of the merman King, the most important 
mission item, how could he have picked it up! 
 
“Then … Where did you pick it up from?” 
 
“A treasure vault, I guess! There were quite a lot of treasures there, I picked them up along the way!” 
 
Tang Hao said with a smile. 
 
“Treasury? King Zhou’s treasure house?” 
 
Elder Zhao muttered in disbelief. 
 
This kid had entered King Zhou’s treasure house and successfully stolen the Pearl? 
 
However, no matter how he thought about it, it was impossible! 
 
King Zhou’s treasure house was in the deepest part of the king Zhou’s Palace. King Zhou personally 
guarded it, so how could this kid sneak in? 
 
“How did you get in?” 
 
He shouted, his emotions becoming somewhat agitated. 
 
“It’s very simple. No one was watching. I broke a few arrays and entered very smoothly. That’s right, the 
Shark King Palace is quite lively, it seems like they’re holding some banquet, it might be related to this!” 
 
Tang Hao said. 
 
“This …” 
 
Elder Zhao hesitated. 
 
Banquet? 
 
Right, maybe King Zhou was holding a celebration, and this guy took advantage of it and got the 
treasure. 



 
This kid’s luck was too good! 
 
He sighed to himself. 
 
Of course, this kid was quite capable as well. He could even break the array and enter the treasure vault 
smoothly. 
 
“I didn’t expect that a seven-star legendary mission, which had been on the list for more than two 
thousand years and no one could solve it, would be completed so easily by a mid-stage human 
immortal!” 
 
He took out the Pearl, weighed it in his hand, and couldn’t help but smile bitterly. 
 
“This is too damn lucky!” 
 
“This works too?” 
 
At this time, the disciples in the hall finally came back to their senses and were in an uproar. 
 
Their faces were filled with shock and intense jealousy. 
 
This was a seven-star Mission. Once it was completed, the reward would be extremely generous. This 
kid was going to strike it rich! 
 
“AI! If I had known earlier, I would have gone too!” 
 
Many people slapped their thighs in regret. 
 
If a mere human immortal could do it, it would be even easier for earth Immortals or even heaven 
Immortals like them. 
 
“Congratulations on successfully completing the 7-star Mission, King Zhou’s Pearl. I’ll get someone to 
prepare the reward now. Just wait for a moment, it’ll be ready soon!” 
 
Elder Zhao put away the Pearl and looked at the disciple in front of him with a complicated expression. 
 
Initially, he and elder di had only wanted to teach this kid a lesson and urge him to work hard. That was 
why they had chosen a seven-star Mission for him. However, they had never expected that this kid 
would actually complete the mission in one go! 
 
He did not know what to say to elder di. 
 
He laughed bitterly, then called a person over and told him to prepare the reward. 
 
 
 


