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“Who is this fiancee you’re talking about? It’s not me.” 

“It is you.” Jim curled his lips into a smile as he used his uninjured arm to hold Bonnie 
close to him domineeringly. 

“Since we’re on this topic, I want to announce that Bonnie and I will be having our 
wedding ceremony three days from now. I hope everyone can attend.” 

This announcement had impacted Sean negatively, evident in the way his expression 
morphed into one of bitterness. It was plain to see how dejected his gaze seemed as he 
stared at Bonnie with a frown. 

Bonnie pursed her lips while she tried to break from Jim’s arm, hissing, “What are you 
bullshitting about?” 

“Well, I’m not even lying. Didn’t you agree to marry me before I lost my memory?” 
countered Jim. 

This effectively stunned Bonnie, who was dazed as she gaped at Jim. She wanted to 
say something, but nothing came out in the end. 

She had indeed discussed marriage with Jim before he lost his memory, but he did not 
believe her and even ignored her. What else could she say after he decided to 
announce the news to everyone? She would be lying if she denied it, but if she admitted 
it… 

Feeling helpless, Bonnie could only keep quiet. 

Pleased to see that Bonnie was not arguing, Jim laughed. “Nonetheless, it was just a 
misunderstanding between me and Sean. Him and Bonnie were just pretending to be a 
couple; my fiancee was never in love with him.” 

Jim then turned and sat on a chair. He lowered his head and played with his injured 
hand that had just been wrapped. “I want to apologize to Mr. Wheeler. I was too 
impulsive and, in turn, hurt you accidentally. I’m really sorry.” Sean merely scoffed at 
what Jim said. He looked the other way and ignored Jim entirely, focusing solely on 
Samuel. “Father Samuel, you said my mother and Mr. Lynch are related. Is that right?” 

Bonnie was shocked to hear this. 

She had wondered why Sean would be in the Quinn Mansion, and after hearing what 
Sean had said… 



She subconsciously looked at Samuel. ‘Was I right all along, then? Sean’s mother truly 
is Joshua’s aunt DXRaL;IL Jim’s biological mother, Lucy? Will Samuel reveal all this?’ 
“Yes,” Samuel sighed, his gaze alternating between Jim and Sean. 

He exhaled heavily. 
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Frankly speaking, Samuel should not have revealed the truth at this moment, especially 
when Jim and Sean were at odds. 

Nonetheless, his mother’s life was at stake. To earn leniency from Joshua for his dying 

mother, Samuel continued to take out everything from the box. “Sean, do you still 
remember what your mother told you before she passed away? If one day, her family 
and your brother come looking for you, you need to pass everything here to them. 
Now…” 

Sighing, Samuel looked at Joshua and Jim back and forth, 

“Your mother’s family and your biological brother are here, looking for you.” 

Feeling Jim and Sean’s dubious gazes on him, Samuel took a deep breath and said, 
“Sean, Jim Landry is your biological brother.” 
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Both Jim and Sean were stunned by Samuel’s words. 

Sean gazed at Jim, then at Samuel. “E-Father Samuel, there must be a mistake! How 
could I and Mr. Landry be…” 

“That’s right.” Jim frowned. “My mother died twenty years ago, and I can’t possibly have 
a brother. Did my mother rise from the dead?” 

“She didn’t rise from the dead. She didn’t die.” 

Samuel sighed, took out a disk from the box, and gave it to Malcolm. “Play the video.” 



Malcolm frowned and hesitated before accepting the disk. He found a laptop in the room 
and turned it on, wanting to play the disk straight from the laptop. 

Frowning, Lucas passed a small projector to Malcolm, which Malcolm accepted and 
connected to the laptop Seconds later, a video started playing on the white wall in front 
of them, revealing a woman with a pale face, smiling at the camera. 

“Hello everyone, I’m Lucy Hamilton.” 

Jim, still seated, felt his whole body freeze as he stared in disbelief at the woman in the 
video. He felt like all the joints in his body had gone stiff. 

‘How could that be?’ 

The woman in the video looked just like his mother, Lucy, but the face he was staring at 
looked older than the one in the photo he had seen; she seemed at least 20 years older. 

Despite that, he could recognize with the first look that this was his mother. The way her 
eyes looked, and her voice…were the same as the photos he had seen! Jim could feel 
his blood rushing from his feet to his brain. He looked at the video again and felt like his 
soul was taken from him. 

‘H-How?’ 

On the contrary, Sean was much calmer than Jim. The only thing he was curious about 
was when his mother filmed this video. 

“I know that everyone is probably wondering a lot of things. Since many of you have 
thought that I have died a long time ago, I’d like to first thank Samuel-no, I need to call 
you Father Samuel now. 
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“Thank you for saving me, Father Samuel. “Secondly, I wanted to apologize to my 
family, and Charles, whom I used to love, and…” The woman sighed, and her gaze 
wavered with melancholy. 

“And my son, Jim. 

“I’m sorry. All these years, my husbAYShI>ML, Richard had suggested many times that 
he wanted to leave Merchant City with me. It wasn’t safe for me to stay here after all. 

“He was afraid that people from the Landry family would find me, afraid that the Quinn 
family would seek revenge on me, but I insisted on staying here in Merchant City just so 
I could secretly see jim more often.” 



Having said that, she took out a stash of photos. They were all photos of Jim from when 
he was about five until he was a grown man. Each photo was taken from a candid 
angle. 

“These were taken by Richard for me.” 

The woman’s lips curled upward. “I’m not a heartless mother, Jim. I wanted so much to 
hug you, to tell you that I’m still alive, but I was too weak.” 
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“After Samuel saved me, I lost my memories, and despite him wanting to help me 
regain my old memories, I refused to let him do so. 

“I didn’t have the courage to face my past, nor was I willing to come to terms with the 
hurt I’ve caused other people, but most importantly…” 

Lucy Hamilton sighed and continued, “I broke my vows and fell in love with Richard, the 
man who took care of me. Because of this, I wasn’t willing to return to Charles, the 
husband with whom I had no memories. That’s why…” 

She closed her eyes. “For the sake of my happiness, as well as me and Richard’s son, 
Sean… I chose to become an irresponsible mother. 

“Even though I had been living in Merchant City all this while, I had never reached out to 
my son. I never even gave him so much as a hug.” 

Lucy sniffed and wiped the tears from her cheeks. “I can’t express how sorry I am for 
being such a coward. I didn’t have the courage to face my past and regain my old 
memories. If…” 

She lifted her head to stare straight at the camera. “Jim, Sean, if one day, either of you 
happens to end up in a similar situation as me, I hope that you won’t make the same 
mistake I did and choose to hide from the truth.” 

Bonnie furrowed her brows at this and instinctively glanced in Jim’s direction. 

At this moment, Jim was staring dazedly at the video projected on the wall. The light 
reflected on his handsome face, making his features appear even more striking. 



Suddenly, he frowned and turned his head in Bonnie’s direction as though he had felt 
her gaze. 

Their eyes met. Bonnie’s entire body stiffened, then quickly turned her head away to 
avoid his gaze. 

She looked like a startled little rabbit. Jim curled his lips into a small smile and resumed 
watching the video on the wall. “Samuel has already filled me in on what happened in 
the past, and if one day, this video does come to light…I wish to provide an explanation. 
“The truth is, the vengeance between the Landry and Lynch families isn’t what it seems. 

“Samuel had told me that the reason I had gotten into my incident all started when 
Charles attended a business conference that was hosted by Rosalyn. 

“Because I had just given birth to Jim, I wasn’t in the best of health GPXhJ>KK mind, so 
I couldn’t help feeling that Charles would cheat on me. Hence, I left home and sought 
out Samuel to help me catch Charles and Rosalyn in their act. “However, Samuel 
wasn’t willing to help me with this, which led to our argument, and subsequently, I met 
Quentin…” 

Lucy mustered an awkward smile and added, “Therefore, this was all my fault and had 
nothing to do with Charles at all… As for everything that happened after this, I’m sure 
Samuel has 
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plenty of evidence to prove my point. Since I had lost my memories after that 
unfortunate event, and I’m not willing to retrieve my memories, I have no account of 
what happened at all. 

“Finally, the reason I decided to record this video is to tell everyone watching this right 
now that I didn’t die in that incident after all, contrary to what everyone might think. 

“I was rescued by Samuel and managed to survive. As of now, I’m living the life that I 
want-a poor but happy one–and even gave birth to my second son, Sean. 

“Unfortunately, I miscarried my third child because of Richard’s passing, but… I 
managed to adopt Nikki, and I’m grateful she’s such a happy, adorable child.” Then, she 
smiled and waved at the camera. “I don’t have much time left, and to all of you watching 
this video many years from now, I sincerely hope you won’t blame me for my 
selfishness and cowardice. 

“I wish you all the best!” With that, the video ended. 



The entire room fell silent. A split second later, Jim lifted his head and let out a bitter 
chuckle. “This means that… “She had given up on me even though she had survived, 
hadn’t she?” 
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Jim’s voice faltered as he stared at the space in front of him, “She was alive all this 
while…” 

His mother, Lucy, had been alive. 

She had been living in the same city as he was all this while, but even until her death, 
she had never attempted to see him at all, much less reclaim him! 

Jim’s body started to shake at the thought of this. 

When he was a child, he thought Rosalyn was his mother, and because of this, he had 
always been content with his life. 

However, after discovering that he was not Rosalyn and Charles’ son, he started 
secretly trying to track down his birth mother. 

The reason he had agreed to help Harvey search for his birth mother was that he did 
not want Harvey to end up a motherless child like him. However, no matter how hard he 
tried, Jim could not find any trace of his mother’s true identity. 

It was only after Rosalyn volunteered this information that he finally found out the truth. 

Rosalyn had been honest with him about everything, including how jealous she had 
been of Lucy in the past. 

That night, Jim had gotten himself drunk. 

He thought he did not have a mother because Lucy died in an accident. 

Until now…after watching the video that Lucy had recorded, Jim suddenly understood 
that his mother had not died after all, but she refused to reclaim and reunite with him! 



A self-deprecating smile crept across Jim’s face at the thought of this, “It turns out I’m 
the biggest loser of all.” Luna furrowed her brows when she heard this. “Jim…you’re not 
a loser. Aunt Lucy had no choice.” 

“She had no choice?” Jim interrupted her curtly. “Just because she fell in love with the 
man who took care of her and didn’t want to return to my father’s side, she had no 
choice but to abandon me? Or are you saying that she abandoned me because she 
didn’t want to face her 

Past?” 
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Jim shook her head, smiling bitterly. “No matter how many reasons you give, none of 
them will be enough to justify her abandoning and giving up on me. The fact is, she 
didn’t want me anymore, and that’s the cold, hard truth!” 

Luna furrowed her brows DPWDM?JM bit her lip nervously. She wanted to say 
something further, but Joshua grabbed her wrist and shook his head, indicating that she 
should not continue. 

Luna paused for a moment, then finally sighed and stayed silent. She knew that as 
Joshua’s wife, she should not be saying anything to aggravate Jim’s anger, 

but… 

She was not just Joshua’s wife, but Jim’s sister too. 

Even though Jim had committed many mistakes after losing his memories, he was a 
good person deep down, so how could she not feel pained by his sorrow? 

“It’s okay.” Bonnie sighed when she sensed the tension between Jim and Luna, then 
walked over to Jim’s side and gently grasped his hand. 

To her surprise, his usually warm hand was, at this moment, as cold as ice. Her chest 
tightened, and she bit her lip as she reached her other hand out to clasp his in hopes 
that this warmth and proximity would reassure him. 

No matter how many unfortunate things happened between them, she could not help 
wanting to console him in his time of need. 

When he felt Bonnie’s warmth on his skin, Jim let out a bitter chuckle and pushed her 
away. 

He did not need her sympathy. 



Just a few minutes before, she had been arguing with him and claiming that she never 
agreed to marry him, yet at this moment, she was offering herself to him in solace, Did 
she take pity on him and think he needed more love and sympathy? No, he did not need 
anyone’s sympathy! At the thought of this, Jim sneered and stood up. “I never thought 
that the joke would be on me in the end.” 

He let out a self-deprecating chuckle and added, “Thank you – all of you-for making me 
realize what a loser I am.” 
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