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let go 

When Cen Yuanan saw it, he shivered again. 

But soon, she reacted, and suddenly, after a stronger resentment and unwillingness 
surged up in her chest, she became even more emotional. 

“Did I say it wrong? Her grandfather killed so many people, how can they still live well in 
this world?” 

“…” 

“Go and see, Huo Yin, how many families are because of that beast. Kidnapped their 
children and ruined their families? How many people died because of his big dreams? 
So many unjust souls, so many blood debts, why does Lan Yuan have descendants? 
Why?” The 

last sentence, this girl It was almost a hoarse roar. 

Huo Yin stopped talking. 

However, his expression became unprecedentedly cold and disappointed, and the chill 
around him was even more gloomy and scary! 

“Little Master?” 

“Take her to the police station and let them deal with it!” The 

disappointed teenager finally only ordered this sentence, and then he stood up from the 
chair, as if he had completely lost sight of this person. , lift your feet and go. 

Cen Yuan heard this, and suddenly, under great fear, she reached out and grabbed 
him. 

“Don’t hand me over to the police station, Huo Yin, if I go to the police station, I’ll be 
finished.” She finally knew she was afraid, and tears fell from her eyes. 

She begged bitterly. 
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But the young man just glanced at her very indifferently. 



“What about my little aunt? If it wasn’t for her cleverness, wouldn’t she have long since 
passed away? Cen Yu’an, you need a lesson, otherwise, your path will become more 
and more crooked.” 

Then, he put her He opened his fingers and left without showing any emotion. 

Yes, this girl, until now, she still knows how to reflect and thinks it is natural for her to do 
so, so letting her go will only hurt her. 

What is the right to life? 

The right to life is the right that every citizen of this country enjoys in accordance with 
the law to protect his life from illegal infringement. 

So, why can’t Shen Shanshan have it? 

Legally, even if he is a death row prisoner who has committed a serious crime, the state 
will not deprive him of any rights after his child is born. Now, what right does Cen Yu’an 
have to question those words? 

What is the difference between her current approach and the original Lan Yuan? 

Every life should be respected! 

Huo Yin came to the hospital again, and when he came this time, Shen Shanshan had 
already woken up. 

“Yinyin, are you… Are you okay at the construction site?” The 

girl just woke up, her cheeks were still red and swollen, and she looked very bad. 

However, as soon as she saw him coming, she immediately asked anxiously. 

Huo Yin hurriedly came over and stood beside her: “it’s alright, how are you feeling? Is it 
better?” 

He looked at her with concern, and in his beautiful dark pupils, there was unconcealed 
worry and urgency. 

Shen Shanshan smiled… 

“It’s okay, just a little skin trauma, Yinyin, don’t worry.” 

“…” 



After looking up and down for a long time, Huo Yin left after making sure that this little 
aunt was really okay. Open, take the cup to the water dispenser and pour her a glass of 
water. 

God Shanshan took it. 

After moistening her throat and seeing the young man sitting beside him with a 
handsome face that was not so worried, she held the water glass and looked at him. 

“I heard from Tian Hao, you locked up Cen Yu’an?” 

“Well.” Huo Yin admitted frankly. 

“This is what she did. I can’t forgive her for being so vicious against you, so I decided to 
hand her over to the police and let them deal with it.” 

“Huh? 

” Shen Shanshan, who was sitting on the head of the bed, sat up anxiously. 

“Don’t do this, Yinyin, if you send her to the police station, she will be ruined.” 

Never thought that this girl would actually speak out for Cen Yuan. 

Huo Yin looked at her angrily: “but if she did such a vicious thing, do you forgive her? I 
have talked to her just now, and she still has a completely unrepentant attitude, and she 
still feels that she did that. It’s just right. If I don’t send her to the police station and teach 
her a lesson, she will still do it to you in the future!” 

He finally revealed his true intentions, precisely so that the little aunt in front of him 
would no longer suffer harm. 

In fact, the current Cen Yu’an has been completely blinded by hatred, and this 
possibility cannot be ruled out. 

Shen Shanshan lowered her eyes and looked at the steaming cup of water in her hand. 

“Yinyin, I know you’re worried about me, but I’m Lan Yuan’s granddaughter. This is a 
fact that can’t be changed. I can understand her hatred for me. So, if you have to forgive 
others and forgive them, just be I’m paying it back.” 

“Little aunt!!” 

Huo Yin, who was sitting next to him, became even more angry when he said this. 

What is repayment? 



That old beast isn’t her, so why should he do what he did to her? Is she stupid? 

Huo Yin’s face was ashen with anger. 

But in the end, because of this little aunt’s insistence, Cen Yuan was not sent to the 
police station, but was released. 

Seeing this, Huo Yin had no choice. He had to settle for the next best thing, and let the 
school arrange a transfer for Cen Yu’an. This time, he did it himself. 

Cen Yuan heard about it and went to the school library to find him. 
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Force 

“Huo Yin, are you really that ruthless?” 

“…” 

Huo Yin, who was sitting there looking at a book, raised his head to look at her, his 
handsome face full of indifference, showing a trace of it again at a loss. 

“What ruthlessness? I asked you to transfer schools, which is the best way to deal with 
your matter. Are you still not satisfied?” 

Contented? 

Hehe, he actually used the word contentment for her? 

Cen Yuan looked at him, unwilling to the extreme, and all that was left was a sad and 
bleak smile. 

“Yeah, you are all high-ranking and powerful families. As ordinary people like us, as 
long as you give a little alms, of course it is a gift to us.” 

“What did you say?” 



Huo Yin’s face was even more ugly. 

However, this Cen Yuan suddenly walked towards him, and when he got to him, he 
looked straight at him and asked, “I’ll ask you one more question, so the kindness 
you’ve treated to me during this time is all the same. Is it because of my brother?” 

“Is there a problem?” 

Huo Yin frowned. 

“If it weren’t for your brother, I wouldn’t let you go so easily this time. The little aunt said, 
I want to give you a chance. You are still young, so you can’t just ruin it. Then I believe 
her and give you this chance. , I hope you can catch it well, and don’t do such stupid 
things in the future.” 
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The boy who was still angry, when he mentioned the last few sentences, his tone was 
already very sharp. 

Between the handsome and delicate eyebrows, naturally there is no gentleness of the 
past. 

See you Cen Yuan. 

With a chill in her heart, she suddenly remembered how the two of them got along 
during this time. 

From the first day she was scolded for moving his computer in the library, to the 
meeting when he fell to the ground while riding a bicycle… 

Does he really have no feelings for her at all? 

No, not possible. 

During that time, when she went out to buy milk tea and go to work, he accompanied 
her. At that time, his face was very soft, and these beautiful eyes were like melting ice 
and snow. 

Little by little she clenched her fingers. 

After a while, she turned around and left the library. After she got out of the school, she 
took a taxi to the hospital. 



In the hospital, Shen Shanshan was asking the nurse to remove the gauze on her 
fingers and was about to be discharged. If the gauze was still wrapped around her, it 
would make her fingernails difficult to grow. 

“Hold on, little girl.” 

The doctor told her when she was tearing down. 

Shen Shanshan suddenly turned pale. 

She was afraid of pain, and her family had known this since she was a child. This time 
in the hospital, she endured it. 

Finally, when the gauze was removed and the medicine was replaced, her forehead 
was covered in sweat, and her face was so white that there was no blood at all. 

After changing the medicine, she came out of the nursing room. She was going back to 
the ward, but in the corridor, she saw a familiar person, and this person seemed to be 
looking for her. 

“Yuan, why are you here?” 

After a brief moment of stunned, she greeted this person generously. 

That’s right, this person is Cen Yu’an. 

A greeting came down, probably because this person didn’t expect that after such a big 
incident, this god Shanshan could still greet her like a normal person. 

Suddenly, many of the coping words prepared in her heart before she came, could no 
longer be uttered in her throat. 

“…Well, let me see you, how are you…how? Are you feeling better?” 

“It’s alright, why don’t you go and remove the gauze? You should be able to leave the 
hospital tomorrow.” 

Shen Shanshan showed her the two fingers that she had just removed the gauze, and 
smiled. 

Cen Yu’an: “…” 

It wasn’t until the two of them returned to the ward that the girl who followed behind 
finally spoke up. 



“Shen Shanshan, Huo Yin wants me to transfer schools, saying that this will ensure 
your safety. However, I don’t want to transfer schools. This school has always been my 
dream school, and I don’t want to go to other places.” 

“…” 

“So , can you turn?” 

She raised her head and shot her two straight eyes. 

Shen Shanshan was stunned. 

so straightforward? 

Also, is the tone so natural? 

She looked at her quietly, without too many emotional fluctuations, but in just a few 
seconds, those eyes that were like bright mirrors seemed to have read the depths of the 
girl’s heart. 

Cen Yu’an: “…” 

Just a little annoyed. 

But at this moment, she saw this girl who was only one year older than her, and looked 
away lightly. 

“Then can you guarantee that those people behind you will no longer trouble me?” 

“What?” 

Cen Yuan’s face changed. 

She actually… even knew that there was someone behind her? Huo Yin didn’t mention 
this. 

“If you can guarantee it, then I’ll promise you to transfer, but if you don’t have the ability, 
I’m sorry, I won’t leave here. I haven’t thought of encountering danger in other places.” 

Shen Shanshan calmly said. Once again reiterated its own conditions. 

After Cen Yu’an stood there blushing for a while, this time, she couldn’t answer this 
question at all. 
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Become a Buddha and become a devil? 

Is she tender guarantee? 

Of course not! 

She doesn’t even know who the people behind her are now, why should she guarantee 
it? 

Cen Yuan’s finger bones were pinched until blue veins burst. 

When Shen Shanshan saw it, she sat on the hospital bed and said lightly: “Or, if you 
really want me to go, there is another way, and that is to hand over the person who is in 
contact with you.” 

“!!! !” 

This time, Cen Yuan was not only shocked. 

She felt a terrifying chill climb down from the soles of her feet. 

Why does she even know this? 

She obviously didn’t say anything, how did she know she had accomplices? Did she 
keep staring at her too? Mingli talked and laughed with her as before, but in fact, 
everything Cen Yu’an did did not escape her eyes? 

Cen Yuan finally didn’t dare to say another word, she turned around and left as fast as 
she was running away. 

Shen Shanshan saw it behind her, and just watched it quietly, until the shadow 
disappeared completely in front of her in a panic, then she withdrew her gaze, and there 
was a cold sneer on the corner of her mouth. 

Of course she knew. 



From the last time she plotted against her and wanted her to transfer to another school, 
she brought the whole school to attack her, twisting the truth, she had already begun to 
doubt it. 
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Later, the protagonist who was “harmed” by her was uncharacteristically good to her, 
and she felt even more wrong. 

She is not a fool. 

I didn’t expose it, I just wanted to give her a chance. 

Unfortunately, she still let her down. 

Not only let her down on the construction site that day, but today, let her down. 

The girl calmly sorted out the documents on the bedside table. After a while, after her 
brother Shen Tianhao came over, the two went down to go through the discharge 
procedures. 

“Tianhao, did your basketball league match end in two days?” 

“Yeah.” 

Shen Tianhao looked at his sister, “What’s wrong?” 

“It’s nothing, it’s just that you have been abandoned a lot recently because of this. After 
your studies, don’t go to participate in these anymore, honestly in school, I will keep 

an eye on you.” Shen Shanshan said lightly. 

When Shen Tianhao heard it, he immediately exploded. 

“Why don’t you let me participate again? Sister, it’s an after-school activity, and I won’t 
affect my studies. You can’t do this.” 

“What’s wrong with me? Is it wrong to let you have a good school? The scope of 
activities can only be school and apartment, I will go to school with you every day, you 
can do it yourself.” 

Shen Shanshan didn’t expect this younger brother to be so playful, she got angry for a 
while, and she went to pay the money by herself. . 

Shen Tianhao, who was so angry at the back… 



What kind of nerve is this? Could it be that this time I was so scared that my brain went 
wrong? 

Shen Tianhao was very dissatisfied. 

However, he didn’t know that when their sister and brother were arguing, Huo Sijue, 
who was in Guanhaitai in the capital, was handling Huo’s mail in his study. After hearing 
Leng Xu’s report on the past few days, he said The first sentence is this. 

“Shen Shanshan doesn’t have the ability to protect herself yet. The only thing she can 
do at the moment is to take good care of her brother.” 

“Then… shall we take care of it?” 

Leng Xu asked hesitantly. 

Tube? 

After Sijue Huo sat there and glanced at him, he was always neat and tidy, but this time, 
he was a little hesitant. 

He actually wanted to see how smart this girl was. 

In the kidnapping incident at the construction site, if she hadn’t left a mark on the 
transport passage at the critical moment, I’m afraid, his people would not be able to find 
her quickly and save her. 

So, in the face of the current crisis, what will she do? 

Huo Sijue thought for a while, and finally shook his head. 

“Don’t intervene. Some people can become invincible powerhouses in the face of 
adversity, but some people will become demons in the dark. I really want to know, is the 
Lan family’s genes a Buddha or a demon?” 

This man, actually At the end, he showed a wait-and-see expression, and his interest 
was also very strong. 

Seeing Leng Xu, she couldn’t help but feel a little ashamed. 

Is this too busy now? There is still such a mind to play such a game. 

However, having said that, the test is indeed necessary. The Lan family’s genes are too 
powerful. Once it really goes dark, it will be another ticking time bomb. 



“Then what the president means is that you don’t need to care about those little 
hooligans? According to our investigation, those people are most likely the family 
members of those children at the time, or someone is deliberately inducing them. Just 
like now Just like Cen Yu’an, if this is the case, it’s not a petty fight, and the danger to 
the siblings sometimes involves the safety of their lives.” 

Leng Xu reminded again. 

That’s right, the anonymous person who contacted Cen Yu’an, Leng Xu had already 
arranged for someone to investigate it long before they took action against Shen 
Shanshan. 

In the end, it was found that many of the information about those people matched the 
address of Lan Yuan’s original list of children, that is to say, they must be related to 
those children. 
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With such an identity, how could it be possible to let this pair of siblings go? 

But the man remained indifferent. 

“Let’s see when the time comes. If you really want to be killed, you will have time 

to take action.” With such a light sentence, the topic ended. 

Leng Xu was stunned. 

It wasn’t until he came out that Wen Xuxu, who was drying the dried sweet potatoes 
sent over from the brook, saw his expression that he still didn’t understand, and then 
explained it to him. 

“What your CEO means is that you want to see Shen Shanshan’s true strength. A 
person’s potential can only be revealed when he encounters a huge crisis. If Shen 
Shanshan can’t save himself in the end, it’s not a problem.” 

“…” 



Captain Leng, whose IQ was not at the same level, finally understood. 

“Then…what if she solves it?” He couldn’t help but ask again after he understood. 

solved? 

Wen Xuxu couldn’t answer this question. 

She turned her head and looked at the man in the room who started working again. 
Seeing that he was still calm, she looked back and the corners of her mouth curved. 

He naturally has arrangements… 

——T 
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Big. 

In the end, Cen Yu’an failed to do so. 

However, in order not to want to transfer to another school, she also thought of a 
ruthless solution, that is, when riding a bicycle back to the dormitory one afternoon, she 
deliberately fell. 

Broke her legs. 

“God, why is Cen Yu’an so unlucky recently? She nearly had an accident on the 
construction site not long ago, and now she has lost her leg again. Is she retrograde?” 

“Yes.” 

The people in the school, because Huo Yin listened to Shen Shanshan’s words, did not 
announce the incident on the construction site, and they didn’t know what Cen Yuan 
did. 

So, after seeing her broken leg, they all sympathized. 

Only Huo Yin, after hearing this, a cold and handsome face was extremely gloomy. 

“Yinyin, forget it, her family background is not good, since her younger brother was 
abducted and her father died in a car accident, now their mother and daughter are all 
counting on her to study and have a good job in the future, don’t force her, it’s up to her 
For my brother’s sake.” 

Shen Shanshan persuaded again after seeing it. 



Huo Yin: “…” 

At first he wanted to say something, but the little aunt’s words “for her brother’s sake” 
made him unable to be ruthless. 

He always felt guilty towards Tong Hui. As the first friend who opened his closed world, 
no matter whether he betrayed him or not, he let him know that there are other colors 
and warmth in this world. 

So, he is still very grateful to him. 

In the end, Huo Yin still listened to the words of his little aunt. 

And Cen Yu’an was overjoyed when she learned the news. On the same day, she 
deleted all the information about the anonymous person on her phone and changed her 
card. 

She didn’t want to live that dark life either. 

Everyone seems to be back on the right track again, starting the previous campus life, 
calm, but full of vigor. 

“Shanshan, did I hear that you are going to take the exam? Can you go to practice 
ahead of time after the exam?” 

“Yes.” 

One day, after Shen Shanshan arrived at school, her classmates from the same 
department came to ask her. , the expression is full of envy. 

Shen Shanshan did not deny it either. 

The other girl next to me saw it, and immediately became even more excited: “Wow, 
you can do an internship so early, Shanshan, can you tell me what company it is?” 

“This…” 

Of course Shen Shanshan couldn’t say, that was Huo Shi . 

This is what Huo Sijue promised a long time ago. Now that she can go to the internship, 
she has gone through a little back door, and she is a little ashamed. 

But Shen Shanshan swears that she will work hard with her own efforts, strive to show 
Huo Shi’s true abilities, and then keep her. 

Shen Shanshan went to the examination room. 



However, she did not expect that, with such excellent grades, she did not pass the 
exam on this day. 

How could this be? 

When she heard the news, she looked at the test results she received on her mobile 
phone, and remembered it for a long time before she hurried to the teacher to find out 
what was going on. 

“Teacher, my grades…” 

“Shanshan, I’m sorry, your grades haven’t passed, the papers are all here, you can take 
a look.” The 

teacher was also very generous and gave her the answer directly. 

Shen Shanshan saw it, and immediately took it over and checked it there. As a result, 
her heart sank to the bottom of the valley immediately after this investigation, and her 
face was even less bloody. 

According to the basic knowledge of accounting, her answer is actually no problem. 

But the key lies in a practical account data attached at the back. 

“Teacher, I want to ask, where did this practical data come from?” 

“Oh, this is the latest practical data obtained not long ago. It is said to be from the 
financial department of the famous Huo Group in our country. Bring it, all your problems 
are in this data.” The 

teacher took a closer look with reading glasses and explained. 

After Shen Shanshan heard this, that pretty face turned even paler. 
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What you said… is it true? 



The Huo Group. 

Why did they send data over at this time? 

Is it true that all the accountants who took the accounting exam were wiped out this 
time? After all, no one should have encountered such practical data. 

“This question you’re talking about? No, we will only give this data if the students who 
submitted the application are for Huo’s internship. I don’t know about the others, and no 
one here dares to mention going there for an internship, Shanshan. Classmates, why 
don’t you change one?” The 

teacher finally persuaded kindly. 

However, how could he know that Shen Shanshan’s goal was originally to go to the Huo 
family, so he came to test this certificate? 

Shen Shanshan returned to the apartment in despair. 

In the apartment, Huo Yin didn’t go to school that day. His projects in the building have 
reached a critical moment these days. With his IQ, it doesn’t matter whether he can 
attend the classes in the school. 

So he took a few days off. 

Suddenly seeing his little aunt coming home, he raised his head on the coffee table in 
the living room, very surprised. 

“Little aunt, why are you back?” 

“…” 

For a moment, the frustrated girl in the exam room almost blurted out after seeing this 
young man, asking him if his daddy didn’t like her? guard against her? 

Then I don’t want her to go to the Huo family. 
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However, she finally endured it, and then returned to her room to cry silently. 

It wasn’t until evening when her younger brother Shen Tianhao was coming back. After 
hearing that she had come back, she shouted outside that she was hungry, and then 
she came out of the room. 

“Huh? Sister, what’s wrong with your eyes? Why are you so swollen?” 



“It’s nothing to do with you!” 

Shen Shanshan avoided the younger brother in a panic and went directly to the kitchen. 

Shen Tianhao: “…” 

He glanced sideways at the young man who was also looking at their siblings over the 
coffee table. He shrugged and went into his room. 

When the food was ready and Shen Shanshan brought it out, her mood had completely 
calmed down. 

“Yinyin, Tianhao, it’s time to eat.” 

“Come.” The 

two young boys put down their work and came to the dining table. 

Braised pork ribs, tomato and egg soup, and a carefully fried steak were all prepared for 
Huo Yin. 

“Eat it.” 

Shen Shanshan brought all the dishes, and after helping them serve the food, he 
greeted them to eat. 

Shen Tianhao was used to being served by his elder sister. After the meal was brought 
to him, he immediately picked up his chopsticks and ate it. 

Only Huo Yin didn’t start to move chopsticks until the little aunt also sat down. 

“Sister, how’s your exam going? When are you going to get the certificate?” While 

eating, Shen Tianhao suddenly remembered that his sister took the exam today, so he 
opened his mouth and asked. 

Hearing this, Huo Yin’s eyes also looked over. 

Shen Shanshan’s complexion, which had not taken long to recover, turned pale again. 

“Well, wait for the notice.” She casually said. 

“Wait for the notice? When is that? Haven’t you decided to go to Yinyin’s company for 
an internship next month? Will that delay it? We will have a holiday next month. Once 
the holiday is over, you have to come again. Going to school.” 



Unexpectedly, this worry-free younger brother kept asking. 

Shen Shanshan finally got a little impatient, put down the chopsticks, and she also 
questioned: “Then when are you going to go back to see mom? You’ve already finished 
the fraternity competition, why don’t you go back?” 

“I… I’ll be back in two days. just go back.” 

Shen Tianhao hesitated and finally did not dare to speak. 

A meal, eat like chewing wax. 

the next day. 

Shen Shanshan got up, sat on the bed and took a deep breath, she got up and opened 
the door. 

“Little aunt?” A 

little surprised, Huo Yin was standing at her door early in the morning. 

Shen Shanshan was stunned. 

“Morning, Yinyin, are you hungry? Then I’ll cook breakfast for you.” She thought that he 
was hungry, so she planned to prepare breakfast for him immediately. 

However, the young man who came to her door early in the morning shook his head. 

“There were so many things last night that I didn’t even bother to ask you, did 
something go wrong with your exam? Didn’t you pass?” 

“…” 

For several seconds, Shen Shanshan stood there sluggishly. 

In her chest, she held back the grievances that had been held all night, and after it 
rushed up like a tide, she almost couldn’t hold it back. 

In fact, she thought about it for a whole night last night, and she analyzed for herself, 
why did this happen? Even trying to convince herself that maybe she just happened to 
meet. 

But in the end, the ironclad facts dashed her hopes. 

Huo’s is not another company, the probability of recruiting interns from the school is 
almost impossible, so she should be the first. 



Well, that data is for her. 

She is a college student, how could she be so complicated? 

Shen Shanshan finally lowered her eyes, pretending that her eyes were still a little 
awake just after getting up, she rubbed it hard, rubbing away the acid inside. 

“No, there is no result yet.” 

“Well, the result is out. Let me know. If you haven’t passed it, you don’t have to worry. 
After the holiday, you can go directly with me. It doesn’t matter if you have the certificate 
or not. 

” In his trouser pocket, he stood in front of her and said something unusual. 

The voice fell, and Shen Shanshan raised her head sharply. 

Is he going to take her there directly? 

That…that… 

she couldn’t make a sound out of her throat for a long time. 

However, in the bottom of her heart, those things that had just sunk to the bottom of the 
valley seemed to be brought up all of a sudden, so turbulent that she could no longer 
hold back the tears this time. 
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Finding clues 

Because of Huo Yin’s words, Shen Shanshan finally let go of her heart. 

What’s strange is that a week after this incident, when Shen Shanshan was about to 
forget, she suddenly received an email from Huo Shi. 

Miss #DEAR God: 



Your email has been received. Regarding our company’s requirements for recruiting 
interns, the attachment has been sent to you. Please read it. Our company welcomes 
every interns to come. 

TKS! 

from: Human Resources Department of Huo Group Co., Ltd. # 

神山山 was stunned. 

This email was actually sent to the Huo Group by her before the exam. 

At that time, she was also very confident about the exam, so after thinking about it, she 
decided to send an email to Mrs. Huo to see what requirements they had, so she could 
prepare in advance. 

As a result, this email was actually replied today. 

The girl stayed there, her eyes staring at the email, just like a storm suddenly broke out 
on a calm lake, and it began to churn. 

Huo actually replied to her email? 

So, was her previous guess wrong? The data given by Huo’s is not that they are 
deliberately making things difficult for her? 

But all the interns who go to Huo’s internship will receive such data? 
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Thinking of this, she suddenly stopped going to the cafeteria, turned around and ran 
towards the Internet cafe outside the school. 

“Shanshan, what are you doing? Are you not eating?” 

“Don’t eat.” 

She waved her hand and ran fast. 

Ten minutes later, in the Internet cafe near the school, she turned on the computer and 
found some posts on the campus Internet about wanting to apply for an intern at the 
Huo Group this year. 

【Student A from XX University: I want to go to the Huo Group for an internship. I don’t 

know if I can get in? ] 



[XX University Student B: I think so too, but this company is too big, we shouldn’t have 
this opportunity, right? ] 

[YY University student: Actually, it’s okay. Although the Huo Group is big, their 
recruitment process is very transparent. I had a senior who went to the human 
resources department before. As long as I got a graduation certificate and passed the 

interview, it’s fine. 】 

【XX University Student A: Really? Don’t need anything else? ] 

[Student B: Yes, they are such a big company, don’t they have any other special 
requirements? ] 

The whole post is sending out such questions. 

However, this student of YY University, because he had seen a senior who had gone to 
the Huo Group for an internship, he gave a very positive answer, that is, no. 

[YY University student: What other special requirements do you have? You are only 
going for an internship, and you are not going to their company to interview for 
executive positions. How can people make so many demands on you? ] 

[…] 

When this reply appeared, not only the students in the post, but even Shen Shanshan 
who was sitting in front of the computer was stunned for a moment. 

So, what he meant was that the Huo family had to put so much thought into their 
interns. 

That is to say, the data she came across was probably not given by the real Huo Shi. 

The girl’s eyes finally turned cold. 

When I came out of the Internet cafe, it just happened that it was raining lightly outside. 

She raised her head… 

“Yuan, why are you still coming out when it’s raining? Can’t you wait?” 

Suddenly, there were voices coming from the side. 

Shen Shanshan turned her head to the side, and saw a girl pushing a wheelchair in the 
rain at a glance, and the person in the wheelchair was Cen Yu’an. 



“Well, my mother is ill. I have to come over and pay her some money. I’m sorry.” Cen 
Yuan was sitting in a wheelchair, apologizing to the girl pushing her behind her back. 

Is her mother sick? 

Shen Shanshan’s heart moved, and she looked up at the rain that was falling in the sky. 
She simply didn’t leave, and turned back to the entrance of the Internet cafe. 

For a moment, in the rain curtain, she saw that the two girls went to the opposite bank, 
and clearly watched the person named Cen Yu’an walk into the ATM. 

Regarding the Cen family, she has indeed investigated very clearly during this period of 
time. 

Their house is really bad. 

However, how could it have gotten to the point where this girl could send money to and 
from home? She is still a student, and even though Father Cen is dead, the Cen family 
still has family members in Xixiang. 

For example, Cen Yuan’s uncle and her grandfather are still there. 

Then her mother is sick, will they not pay? Do you still need to ask a student who is 
studying to send her money? 

Shen Shanshan waited for her to go back again. After a long while, she pursed her lips, 
and decisively returned to the Internet cafe, where she anonymously found a master 
hacker. 

[Shen Shanshan: I want to see the monitoring of XXX bank teller machine at 13:15, can 
I? ] 

[Hacker: Yes, but the price needs five thousand. 】 

Five thousand, which is very high in school. 

Shen Shanshan gritted her teeth, and finally took 5,000 from the living expenses her 
mother gave to their siblings and gave them to this hacker. 

A few minutes later, the efficient hacker sent her the surveillance of that bank, and she 
was about to finally see that Cen Yuan deposited a stack of thick banknotes into the 
ATM. 
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There will be no second chance 

This is really interesting. 

The last trace of warmth in her eyes cooled down. 

Back at school, after she got to the classroom, she didn’t do anything that afternoon, 
just kept writing something in her notebook until the end of the class and someone 
came to her outside. 

“Sister Shanshan, we have a reception today, do you want to attend?” 

It turned out to be Ning Xiner, who hadn’t seen her for a long time. 

Reception? 

Invite her to attend? 

Shen Shanshan looked at her with a smile on the corner of her mouth, and at the same 
time there was a hint of teasing in her eyes: “You really invited me to go? Not for 
others?” ” Sister 

Shanshan!” 

Immediately, the whole round face turned red. 

Shen Shanshan: “Okay, I’ll call Yinyin and ask him to come with you. I won’t go. I have 
to fix it later at night.” 

She rejected her, but she also thought about this little girl. The person took the initiative 
to send it to her. 

Ning Xiner finally ran away happily. 

For a moment, when Shen Shanshan called Huo Yin, Huo Yin walked out of the 
teaching building and saw a very ostentatious Lamborghini parked there. 
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“Yinyin, Xiner said that he would like to invite you over to their house tonight to play. 
Your project is almost done. Why don’t you go and play? I’ll let Tianhao accompany you 
and relax.” 

Shen Shanshan was on the phone Li advised. 

In fact, she has always firmly remembered the words of her cousin and sister-in-law. 

They said that letting this nephew come to study here is to allow him to better integrate 
into the society and learn to get along with others, so an opportunity like tonight is the 
most suitable. 

However, what made her a little strange was that after she called the boy this afternoon, 
she actually said this and the phone was hung up. 

Shen Shanshan: “…” 

What are you doing? 

Is your phone out of battery? It’s never been like this before. 

Shen Shanshan could only sigh and hang up the phone. 

At six o’clock in the evening, most of the students in the school had already returned to 
the dormitory. Shen Shanshan finally dispatched. After she came to the Finance 
Department, she went directly to the office of the Student Union to find Cen Yuan, who 
had not left yet. 

“Cen Yuan?” 

“Huh?” 

Cen Yuan, who was writing something, immediately raised his head. 

God Shanshan? 

She looked at the girl who suddenly came to her in surprise, one of them was not 
paying attention, and after a panic in her heart, her face changed there. 

Shen Shanshan was very indifferent, she came in with a smile, carrying some gifts in 
her hand. 

“Why haven’t you left yet? I just went to the dormitory to see you. Your classmate said 
that you haven’t gone back yet. I’m probably here, so I’ll come over. How is it? Are your 
legs okay?” 



“Ah?” Cen Yuan looked at Looking at the gift on the table, I felt even more 
uncomfortable. 

“No…it’s alright, thank you…” 

“Don’t be so polite, I should have come to see you long ago, but I was busy with the 
exam some time ago, so I was delayed. I’m sorry, Yu’an.” 

Shen Shanshan was very pleased . Guilty to the girl. 

So, she really just came to see her? 

Cen Yu’an’s heart was finally relieved, and the whole body’s defenses gradually 
relaxed. 

“It’s okay, it’s not a big deal, it’s all going to be fine.” 

“Yeah, that’s fine.” Shen Shanshan nodded in relief. 

However, after she sat down, she opened the box of matcha cakes she brought and 
placed it on the girl’s table, and she sighed again. 

“Actually, I’m not in a good mood during this time. I failed the exam, and I may not have 
a chance to go to Huo’s internship.” 

“Ah?” 

Cen Yuan raised his head immediately, and a trace of guilt was fleeting in his 
expression. 

“How could this be? Your grades have always been very good, so why did you fail the 
exam this time?” 

“It is said that the Huo Group suddenly released a data requesting interns to practice. I 
have never seen such complex data. , was brushed down.” 

“…” 

“However, I checked, and there seems to be no such thing on Huo’s side. I plan to ask 
Yinyin to ask in person. If it is sure that it is not, then there should be someone behind it. 
You’ve made a fool of yourself .” The 

calm-looking girl said as she shoved a piece of cake into her mouth. 

The office finally quieted down. 



As if the pause button was suddenly pressed, the two of them did not make a sound, 
making the office so silent that even a pin dropped on the ground can be heard. 

Go to Huo Yin to confirm, no matter what it is, you can see it at a glance. 

Cen Yu’an’s hands under the table were as cold as in an ice cave. In her chest, she 
quickly climbed up in panic, and her throat was dry. 

Why is she so smart? 

“Okay, then you go back to rest early, I’m going back too.” 

Seeing that she was silent, Shen Shanshan stood up and was about to leave. 

Cen Yu’an: “…” 

Until the girl was about to walk to the door, and finally, she summoned up the courage 
to stop her: “If someone is playing tricks, have you ever thought about who did it?” 

“No, but I think it’s for sure It won’t have anything to do with you, will it?” 

The girl standing at the door turned her head back calmly. 
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Senior Sister Shanshan, I will take care of him in the future! 

Cen Yuan was stunned. 

“Why…why?” 

“Because you made a mistake last time, do you still want the first time? Yu’an, 
opportunities don’t come often, you should cherish the opportunity you have to stand in 
the sun at the moment.” 

Shen Shanshan stood at the door and warned the girl with a very solemn tone. 



It seems that at this time, she officially got up, and the expression between her 
eyebrows did not mean the slightest sarcasm, it was very serious, with a hint of 
warning. 

Yes, she doesn’t give her chances very often. 

How rare is it to be able to live under the sun? 

Others may not know, but their sister and brother are clear, in order for them to 
completely get rid of the Lan surname and get rid of the darkness, their father has died. 

Then, why did she Cen Yu’an think about it? Going headlong into the dark? 

Shen Shanshan left the student council. 

On the way back, her phone vibrated, and when she looked down, she realized that it 
was Cen Yuanan who sent the message. 

[Cen Yu’an: I’m sorry, that thing… I did it. ] 

[Shen Shanshan: It doesn’t matter…] 

In the end, she only replied with such a faint word. 
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Immediately, after the message was returned, another call came in from her cell phone, 
and this person was still Cen Yu’an. 

“You… don’t you blame me?” 

“Why should I blame you? You are also being forced, aren’t you?” 

“…” The 

cry finally came from the phone, and across the screen, Shen Shanshan was here You 
can hear her uncontrollable grievances, regrets, pains… 

“Yes… I’m sorry, I didn’t mean it, I just wanted to stay here. Then they said, if you go to 
Huo’s internship, you will get closer to Huo Yin, I… I’m not reconciled, just Secretly put 
the data they gave into the test paper.” The 

girl was out of breath crying on the phone. 

What has she been through during this time? 



In fact, it is not an exaggeration to describe it as thrilling, having walked from heaven to 
hell. 

She was originally an ordinary girl, but suddenly she learned that her younger brother 
was kidnapped. She was arrested to become a chip man, and then died tragically in 
their hands for the dominance of the old beast. 

Can she hate it? 

Also, her father, who died unexpectedly because of this incident. 

Therefore, it is normal for her to lose her composure in the end, and to be encouraged 
by those who take advantage of it. Fortunately, she has just started, and in her heart, 
she still has a conscience. 

Shen Shanshan waited patiently for her to vent her emotions before continuing to speak 
up. 

“Then can you tell me the contact information of those people now?” 

“Wh… what?” 

“If you don’t tell me, they will still be looking for you, Yu’an, if you don’t want to go into 
this muddy water, you Just let their spear point directly at me, there is an injustice and a 
debt, you know?” 

Shen Shanshan explained. 

The voice fell, and Cen Yu’an on the other side of the phone struggled again. 

“They’re going to kill you, aren’t you afraid?” 

“Is it useful? I have nothing to do but face it. I know that a large part of the reason why 
you do this, and Yinyin, you like him Isn’t it?” 

Suddenly, the girl mentioned this again on the phone. 

Suddenly, Cen Yuan listened, and blushed in the office: “I… I don’t.” 

“You don’t have to deny it, I can see it. It doesn’t matter, if you like it, then fight for it. Yin 
Yin is a very good person. When he was with you before, he was also happy, and you 
are still Tong Hui. Sister, he will have a different feeling for you.” A 

little surprised, she actually persuaded her on the phone. 



She asked her to take the initiative to attack, and in her tone, there was no other 
meaning at all, just for her to get close to the boy again and let her work hard. 

Cen Yuan was stunned. 

“You…is this your truth?” 

“Yeah, what’s wrong?” 

“…No, I just thought…I thought you liked him too!” Finally, Cen Yu’an said these words, 
and the whole The tone is like letting go. 

Sure enough, after these words fell, the phone became quiet. 

All that was left was the sound of the electric current, and at this moment, the dead 
silence could even hear each other’s breathing. 

“Shen Shanshan?” 

“Cen Yu’an, I don’t understand your brain circuit. Do you not understand what the 
relationship between aunt and nephew is? What you just said, are you sure your mind is 
clear? 

” The voice of Shen Shanshan finally came. 

However, what surprised Cen Yu’an was that she had an incomprehensible tone and a 
faint hint of anger. 

Cen Yu’an was startled again. 

“But you are not aunts and nephews…” 

“So what? He has already called my little aunt for more than ten years. Are you kidding 
me?” Shen Shanshan was anxious on the phone, and finally laughed. . 

Really ridiculous! 

Does she really like her nephew? What are you thinking about? 

She was about to hang up the phone. 

But at this time, the girl inside said again: “In that case, I will go after him, I will confess 
everything to him, I choose to stand in the sun, then Senior Sister Shanshan, you can 
go to the apartment Move out? I’ll take care of him in the future!” 
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The broken old father 

Shen Shanshan finally refused the request. 

“That’s not good, take care of Yinyin, that’s what I promised his parents, you can go 
after him, but it’s impossible for me to move out of the apartment. Besides, you two fall 
in love, stay with me The apartment doesn’t matter, it’s like if you go to his house, can 
you tell his parents not to be at home?” 

She looked at the girl who was a little bit timid with a half-smile. 

After the words fell, Cen Yu’an’s face flushed red, and finally, she stood behind her and 
didn’t dare to say anything. 

She did go a little too far. 

God Shanshan left. 

That night, she gave the contact information of those who got her hands to her own. 

“Uncle Yu, help me find out who these people are? Last time, they were the ones who 
wanted to kill me . 

“ 

readily agreed. 

Seeing this, Shen Shanshan was ready to hang up. 

“Then… What if you find out? Miss, what are you going to do? If they were really the 
family of those kids back then, they wouldn’t let you and the young master go.” 

The person inside actually added another sentence . , mainly to remind him. 

Shen Shanshan listened, but didn’t react much. 
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“If that’s the case, then hand them over to the police together. If there is no evidence of 
a crime, please ask Uncle Yu to stare first.” 

“Just staring?” 

“Otherwise? What else do you want to do? Yu? Uncle, you must remember that you 
can’t kill any more, if they really want to kill our brothers and sisters, don’t worry, I will 
hand them over to my cousin and let them be punished!” 

She heard this! The old man on the phone actually asked such a question, and 
immediately his face became very stern, and he even spoke with a hint of warning. 

Yep, that’s her attitude. 

She can’t kill. If she can’t protect herself, she will hand over these people to Yinyin’s 
daddy to deal with. She believes that he will protect their siblings. 

The old man finally wanted to say something, but Shen Shanshan had already hung up 
the phone. 

Back at the apartment, it was already very late at night. 

However, she didn’t expect that the lights in the apartment were still on, and as soon as 
she came in, she saw a tall and slightly thin figure sitting on the sofa watching TV in the 
living room. 

“Yinyin, are you back? Why haven’t you slept yet?” 

She was very surprised. 

That’s right, I’ve been doing all these things at night, and I don’t even care about how 
this little guy goes to the banquet at night? 

Shen Shanshan hurried over, wanting to care first. 

Unexpectedly, she had just come over, and the boy who was sitting on the sofa 
watching TV suddenly stood up, and immediately he was an 18-year-old boy, about 1.8 
meters tall. 

After suddenly standing up in front of her, the tall shadow forced her to take a step back 
subconsciously. 

“Yinyin, you—” 



“Where have you been?” 

His eyes were cold, his handsome and beautiful face was covered with a layer of chill, 
and it was really scary to look at. 

Shen Shanshan felt guilty for no reason. 

“I… I didn’t go anywhere, I was studying at school late, what’s wrong with you? Did you 
not have a good time at the banquet? Or… blame the little aunt for not picking you up? 
Yinyin, I…” 

” No need!” 

Just like that. 

This young man, who had never had such a dark face in front of her, raised his feet and 
left. 

“boom!” 

The bedroom door was forced shut, and Shen Shanshan shuddered when she heard it 
outside. 

Damn, he must be angry, he has no experience of attending banquets with so many 
people, she suddenly pushed him out, he must not be used to it. 

God Shanshan regretted. 

And that night, because she was worried, she also specifically told Wen Xuxu, her 
sister-in-law in Guanhaitai, about this. 

[Shen Shanshan: Sister-in-law, I asked Yinyin to attend a banquet at a classmate’s 
house today, but he was very unhappy when he came back. Sister-in-law, did I do 

something wrong? Did it make him uncomfortable? So what should I do now? 】 

After she sent this message and went out, she fell asleep with her phone in her hand. 

After learning that her failure in the exam had nothing to do with the Huo family, her 
respect for this cousin and sister-in-law returned to normal. Naturally, these things will 
be reported one by one. 

View the sea platform. 

Wen Xuxu only saw this message when she woke up the second time. When she saw 
that it was about her son Huo Yin, she immediately got up. 



“Yinyin also went to the banquet? Such a good thing!” 

She took her mobile phone to the balcony outside and showed it to the man standing 
there who was exercising. 

Huo Sijue glanced. 

“Banquet? She was talking about the small party of the Ning family last night?” 

“It should be right, everyone can go to the banquet. It seems that we sent Yinyin to 
Shanshan and the others. It was a correct one. The choice, just Shanshan said, Yinyin 
seems to be very angry, this child is really…” 

Wen Xuxu said this, and couldn’t help but worry again. 

Huo Sijue didn’t speak. Seeing that Zhong Zong’s words on the balcony were budding 
in the morning light, he picked up the watering can beside him. 
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Really came to the door 

Wen Xuxu: “By the way, Shanshan also said that this is a girl, brother, you say, is this 
the girl our son likes? He’s too good, he actually has someone he likes.” Sure enough, 
he was naturally sensitive to gossip, and he immediately caught what was in this 
information. 

Suddenly, she held the phone and shouted excitedly next to her. 

The man who was watering the flowers saw it, and finally couldn’t help but say: “What 
girl do you like? How old is he?” 

Wen Xuxu: “No, my son will be 18 soon, can’t he like girls? I married when I was 18. I’ve 
got it for you.” 

“…” 



“Wait a minute, don’t you look down on this Ning family? Speaking of this, Huo Sijue, I 
have to ask you carefully if you have any questions about the marriage of your two 
sons. Do you want to ask for it? Do you want to be a family member?” 

Suddenly, after seeing Huo Sijue’s attitude a little perfunctory, she immediately thought 
of another question, and then hurriedly asked him there. 

Huo Sijue: “…” 

What is this mess? 

The family is right, he used to marry her, and her Wen family background can rival that 
of the Huo family? 

He was helpless. 

“No, as long as they like it.” 

“It’s that simple?” 

Wen Xuxu couldn’t believe it. 
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Because, this man just had the same feeling that he didn’t take this Ning family in his 
eyes at all. 

But when the man heard her question, he nodded with certainty and assurance. 

“I’m not one of those old antiques, and I’ll ask them to follow my request on this matter? 
Look at that little girl’s movie, when did I take care of her?” 

After all, the man mentioned his little padded jacket that leaked the wind again, of 
course, at this time, he was a little bit resentful. 

That’s right, the little jacket that has been raised for so many years, when he is not 
careful, he has someone in his heart, and he has tossed himself to death several times 
for that person, which means that he is still young. 

Otherwise, when he is older, he will have a heart attack. 

Wen Xuxu finally understood, and suddenly, she came from behind and put her arms 
around the injured man. 



“Okay, okay, don’t be angry anymore, Sixteen is fine, you see, we don’t have to worry 
about it now, right? After graduating in the first half of the year, Ruoruo will go directly to 
his university to graduate, how good, we are completely Don’t worry.” 

“…” 

Although he said so. 

However, the man’s handsome face was even darker, because the little padded jacket 
had no hope of returning to his embrace. 

Little bunny! 

Wen Xuxu determined the man’s meaning, and when she returned to the bedroom, she 
also sent a message to Shen Shanshan who was still waiting over there. 

[Wen Xuxu: Shanshan, it doesn’t matter, it may be the first time to go to this kind of 
occasion, you can accompany him more, and if you have time, you can take him to 
participate in such activities more in the future, and slowly he will will get used to it. ] 

[Shen Shanshan: Okay. 】 

Almost seconds back. 

It can be seen how anxious this girl is waiting. 

After receiving this message, Shen Shanshan put down her heart. After she came out of 
the bedroom, she immediately ran to Huo Yin’s room. 

“Yinyin, are you up yet? Today is the weekend, will my aunt cook Chaos for you?” 

She knocked on his door and asked outside to please. 

There is no way, the child is angry, of course he has to coax. 

Fortunately, after a night, this guy didn’t hold any grudges so much. He knocked for a 
while, and after hearing the movement inside, a short while later, a handsome boy in 
home clothes with black and thick short hair was messy. appeared in front of her. 

“Yinyin? That aunt will do it for you?” 

Shen Shanshan saw it, and after laying her hands on the edge of the door, a pair of 
beautiful big eyes stared at this guy as if to please. 

Huo Yin: “…” 



Forget it, don’t bother with her. 

The boy finally nodded coldly: “Yeah.” 

Shen Shanshan couldn’t wait to raise her arms and cheer: “Okay, then I’ll go make 
breakfast for my Yinyin, you wait, the delicious Chaos will come soon. Come.” 

She happily ran to the kitchen. 

And the boy at the door of this room also raised the corner of his mouth, then turned 
around and went to the bathroom. 

About half an hour later, Shen Shanshan was done in chaos, and Huo Yin was also tidy 
up. The two of them were about to have breakfast together. At this moment, the doorbell 
rang suddenly. 

“Who?” 

Shen Shanshan froze for a moment. 

Huo Yin didn’t even know, he basically had no friends here. 

Shen Shanshan went to open the door. 

“Yu’an? Is that you?” 

“Yes, Senior Sister Shanshan, early, I… I saw that the Yonghe Soy Milk in the school 
opened today, so I bought the freshly baked fried dough sticks and millet porridge, and 
sent them to you. “You haven’t eaten yet, have you?” 

I never thought that the person who came here early this morning was actually Cen 
Yu’an. 

At this time, she had long black hair and a shawl, but she was wearing a light green 
short skirt with an embroidered white decorative belt around her waist. At first glance, 
she looked like a hibiscus out of water, very beautiful. 

Shen Shanshan was stunned. 

Is it really coming? 

The first thought that popped into her head was this. 

And when she saw her exquisite dress, her eyes looked at the pajamas she was 
wearing at the moment like a conditioned reflex, and suddenly, there was a trace of 
discomfort for no reason. 
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