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Yang Yu did not take the road, but from the path in the past,

so you need to walk through the countryside, the distance

is much shorter. There are many terraces and abundant water

sources in yunu village. In addition to the yunu River,

there is a small river in the front mountain, which is much

smaller than the yunu river.

Widow Liu lives by this river, and her uncle's fish field

is nearby. Just walk a little further outside, but widow

Liu's house is the outermost house at the entrance of the

village, and then there are only terraces.

But as soon as Yang Yu stepped up, he heard a voice coming

from the inner room: "Uncle Zhang, don't do this, don't,

don't!"

Yang Yu looks through the crack of the door, and it's

amazing that widow Liu's upper body is already naked, with

two breasts hanging. Uncle holds widow Liu's hands in one

hand and takes off widow Liu's trousers in the other. Widow

Liu is struggling in vain.

Secretary Zhang put her on the stove and said, "what else

does a widow pretend to be? You are the face of a dead man.

I'm afraid you're suffocating. Don't be ungrateful. "

"Uncle Zhang, I'm not that kind of person. Please, let me

go!" Widow Liu covered her milk with her hands, but Uncle
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Zhang didn't give it. This scene is like

PA!

Zhang Shuyi slapped in the past, and immediately widow Liu

was honest. Zhang Shuyi took off widow Liu's lower body.

"It's flourishing! Open your legs for me? " Uncle Zhang

roared.

Uncle Zhang's name is Zhang Yang. He is a well-known villain

in the village. He specializes in making soft persimmons,

widows, left behind women and honest people. He will bully

anyone who is good at bullying.

Widow Liu shook her head hard, jumped off the stove and

tried to run out.

"Still want to run?" Zhang Yang grabbed her hair directly

from behind and lifted it up. Widow Liu cried in pain.

"Bend down for me!"

Liu widow can only obediently bent down, Zhang Yang patted

buttocks, also praised a, ready to take off pants.

"Stop it Open the door, Yang Yu! Widow Liu looked up, very

embarrassed.

Zhang Yang was angry: "who are you? I want to take care of

everything? Don't want to live? "

Yang's nose waved, but he didn't dare to speak this kind

of words. Yang Yu did not say roll, stare at him a few times,

that piece of Yang is rolling away.



Yang Yu quickly closed the door. Widow Liu covered her

breast with one hand and her lower body with the other.

Without saying a word, Yang Yu picked up widow Liu, carried

her into the bedroom and put her on the bed.

Yang Yu didn't say anything. He turned around to go back.

This kind of occasion is really embarrassing. It's better

to give widow Liu some space, but she just took two steps.

Yang Feiyu ran from behind and suddenly hugged her.

"Will you accompany me? I really can't carry it. " With that,

widow Liu began to cry. Yang Yu didn't speak. He just

thought of Zhao Yingjie, who was the same, with a child,

the same size, a left behind woman and a widow. But the same

hard, suffering.

No man, anyone will bully you!

Yang Yu is ambivalent in his mind. If he stays, he will cause

trouble. He just borrows a shoulder to leave others. But

after all, she put down her morality, put out the light,

turned around and took widow Liu to bed. Widow Liu leaned

against Yang Yu and said nothing.

For half an hour, widow Liu said thank you! Yang Yu just

nodded with a smile and left.

Yang Yu returned to his attic, and Lin Yina appeared again.

"Why, not as tall as me now?" Lin Yina sat on the roof of

the third floor, her legs cocked out, just facing Yang Yu's

window, but she was still much higher than Yang Yu's window.

"What happened to the man? Didn't stay with you? " Yang Yu



didn't choose to turn on the light. Sometimes it feels

better to turn off the light. He lies on the window and looks

up at Lin Yina.

"I don't want him to accompany me. I want you to accompany

me." Lin Yina is like a fox, a fox in spring.

"Don't you think I'll come to you tomorrow night? Why can't

you wait? " Yang Yu also follows her wishes, joking.

"Yes! Now I'm not brother Qiang's woman, tomorrow night is

his. Dare you come tomorrow night? " Lin Yina swings her

legs. Even she doesn't know why she said this during the

day. Tomorrow night is the wedding night. Brother Qiang

will always follow him. How can he have a chance to steal

sex for Yang Yu?

"If you come here, I'll always steal for you in the future!"

Lin Yina looks directly at Yang Yu: "I also introduce my

sister to you."

"Sister?" Yang Yu a Leng, this fox spirit still want to play

double fly? Her sister is as open as she is? Yang Yu doesn't

know, but it's fun: "aren't you afraid of brother Qiang?"

"I knew you had no guts!" Lin Yi Na white he one eye,

satirize a way, then got up to prepare to go. Who knows,

Cui Qiang has been standing behind her. Lin Yina panicked

and turned pale. Looking at Cui Qiang's face and triceps,

she swallowed deeply and stammered: "brother Qiang, when

did you come up? I don't even know. "Cui Qiang coldly looks

at Lin Yina and Yang Yu. Lin Yina has realized that things

are not right. She will get married tomorrow. If she wants

to know that she still wants to steal, she will surely bury

herself alive.



"What are you two talking about? I can't smell a breath of

jealousy. " Cui Qiang has an evil smile on his face.

"We're talking. If you can't get married tomorrow night,

I'll help you!" Yang Yu secretly looked at Lin Yina. Lin

Yina pursed her mouth and wanted to laugh. That's true. How

can it sound like a joke?

"Ha ha! I can even handle a few cows, just a girl? " Cui

Qiang laughs. In this respect, he is quite confident, but

he has a strange habit, that is, he has to wait until the

wedding night to get Lin Yina.

In fact, Lin Yina repeatedly hinted at Cui Qiang, but Cui

Qiang refused, saying that he must go to the wedding night.

As a result, Lin Yina is still a place. Yang Yu couldn't

have thought of that. It's like a sow climbing a tree. It's

incredible. Where will Lin Yina be? That really blinded him.

But what you don't believe is true. If Yang Yu knows where

Lin Yina is, he will never be able to reach brother Qiang!

"What makes you so happy?" Cousin probably also heard the

chat, stay bored, climbed up to Yang Yu's attic, heard the

laughter, also followed Yang Yu to the window, without

asking.

That Cui Qiang a look, turned out to be a beauty Li Yuanxi,

Li Yuanxi's beauty, that is the end of explosion Lin Yina

10086 street! See this kind of beauty, is a man will be soft,

body trembling, even talk will not stutter.

So Cui Qiang stammered immediately:



"it's Yuanxi's sister. She's still so beautiful! Beautiful!

beautiful! He he "Cui Qiang giggled like a hen laying eggs.

Li Yuanxi chuckled and turned his head to look at Yang Yu.

Yang Yu's side face was very handsome in the moonlight at

night. Li Yuanxi was not attracted.

"You know, sister Yuanxi, you can marry her. Hum Lin Yina

is not happy. Her boyfriend praises other women for their

beauty in front of her face, which will not give her face.

Lin Yina got up early and went crazy, leaving behind a word.

"Yimei, Yimei!" Cui Qiang just knew that he had made a

mistake. He gave Yang Yu a silly smile and chased back.

When Li Yuanxi saw the scene, she laughed and turned her

head to find Yang Yu looking at herself. Her eyes were not

right.

"How beautiful my cousin is Yang Yu also lightly said, can't

help but say, cousin is like a magnet, and all the men in

the world are iron, are attracted by cousin.

"You have a funny brain, don't you?" Li Yuanxi patted Yang

Yu's head on purpose, but she was very happy. Since her

cousin came here, she found that her mood had changed. She

used to be followed and peeped by a group of abnormal people

in the village. Her life was not peaceful. Later, she wanted

to marry silly two dogs. She didn't have a few happy days.

But since the day when Yang Yu's cousin came to her home,

she was in a better mood. Yang Yu even coaxed her and cared

about her. The most important thing is that she felt very

happy and safe with Yang Yu. She even felt a little afraid.

If this situation goes on, what should she do if she likes

this cousin?



"I can't boast about my cousin. It's not tofu?" Yang Yu is

not happy, the woman is really inexplicable.

"I haven't settled with you about last time!" Yuanxi has

been worried about losing her first kiss.

"Why don't I kiss my cousin back? Ha ha Yang Yu laughs. It's

fun to tease his cousin.

On hearing this, Li Yuanxi simply adds fuel to the fire.

She picks up the pillow and smashes it like two flirting

couples. How can Yang Yu admit defeat?

"You fight! You fight! It is said that beating is kiss and

scolding is love! If your cousin has the ability, fight!

" Yang Yu has brought out the heresy.

Sure enough, cousin stopped, Leng for a while, said: "also

let you say, let you say!" Another slap, just as her cousin

hit her with the pillow, Yang Yu suddenly reached out to

grab her, and finally caught her hands.

Yuanxi this sudden grasp, originally the center of gravity

has been inclined to Yang Yu, the result, impartial fell

in the past.

At this time, Yang Yu is lying on the bed, and then holds

her cousin's hands, with a pillow in the middle. Cousin

Yuanxi loses her center of gravity and falls directly on

Yang Yu's body and on Yang Yu's chest.

It's nothing. It's nothing. Flirting is common.

But the problem is, at the moment when Li Yuanxi looked up,



Yang Yu was also looking good. Their eyes were so close,

and their four clear eyes were wide open looking at each

other. Unexpectedly, unexpectedly, they got an electric

shock!

Li Yuanxi has lived for 21 years. She has seen countless

men, but no man has made her feel any more! She has been

waiting, waiting, waiting for the right man in her heart,

but even if the young man chasing her in the village can

go around the world, she still doesn't wait.

But, unexpectedly and cousin Yang Yu were electrocuted.

The feeling of electric shock swept through Li Yuanxi's

whole body in an instant, and his whole body trembled. His

heart was beating wildly at the speed of 120 beats per

minute. His heart was out of his mind, and his adrenaline

went up.The room is quiet! It's quiet!

Li Yuanxi immediately realized what, quickly stood up, said

nothing, directly rushed out of the attic!

Yang Yu was also in a daze. This kind of feeling happened

once when he first met his third cousin. It was the

strongest and the most confused time. Although he often got

an electric shock with his third cousin later, it was the

first time for him to meet his cousin.

Yang Yu also felt stuttering!
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Rural wedding that two words: lively! It will be busy for several
days. Unlike the city, go to the hotel to rub a meal, no, not only rub
not enough, money also rub No. But not in the countryside. It's fun.
It's lively. I'll support you.

Cui Qiang wears a bridegroom's dress. He's also a model. Although
he's the same as a rude man, he's forthright. Let's take drinking as an
example. Don't say anything, take it up and drink it. Anyone who
respects him will drink it. On the contrary, the bride Lin Yina is a
little more formal, which is not like her usual style.

Yang Yu naturally came to help and did everything.

There are many relatives who come here to drink. Yang Yu only
notices a gorgeous woman. It looks like 2829, but actually it's just a
young woman. It looks like Lin Yina, but it's much more amazing
than Lin Yina. Moreover, it's a lot more implicit. It's not as wild and
open as Lin Yina.

Is she Lin Yina's sister?

But this young woman is elegant, with a smile, a shy face, and has
become a wife, not like the kind of woman who pinches flowers
everywhere. What does Lin Yina mean by introducing her to herself?
Yang Yu couldn't figure it out.

Cui Qiang and Lin Yina have more than ten tables at the banquet,
which is quite good in the village. Cui Qiang was really happy. He
toasted when he saw people. In the countryside, he drank white wine.
The liquor is full of vigor. How many people can stand it?

Everyone was busy until one o'clock in the morning when the
banquet gradually dispersed, and the logistics personnel also cleaned
up. By two o'clock in the morning, everyone was gone and
completely quiet.

"Oh! Tonight can be your wedding night. Don't let the bride down
When they left temporarily, the village women did not forget to
make fun of them.



"Time is almost up, you ah, go into the bridal chamber quickly, it's
time to pass, you see this strong brother is drunk, Yina, help
brother-in-law into the bridal chamber quickly!" The young woman's
name is Lin Yiyi, her sister.

"I'm not drunk, hehe!" Cui Qiang is already out of his mind and can't
even stand: "come on, wife, let's go into the bridal chamber and see
how powerful my brother is. If we want to make you cry, ha ha"

"I know! Look at your virtue Lin Yina, while supporting brother
Qiang, did not forget to look at Yang Yu: "little brother Yang Yu,
please take my sister home! It's not convenient on this road, either! "

"No, it's not far away. Why bother others?" Lin Yiyi didn't look at
Yang Yu. She said faintly.

"I'd better send it. It's so late. There are a lot of abnormal people in
this village, just in case!" In fact, Yang Yu is just out of gentlemanly
demeanor. He is still thinking about Lin Yina's words: if you have
the ability, come to me tonight!

Lin Yiyi didn't shirk. They left with a flashlight. It's not very far for
Lin Yiyi to live on it, but if he takes a shortcut, he has to take a few
steps to the deserted mountain road.

Along the way, the atmosphere was a bit awkward. Yang Yu didn't
know what to say, but he stopped talking several times, and Lin Yiyi
didn't ask for a topic. But once Lin Yiyi almost slipped, Yang Yu
quickly pulled, Lin Yiyi just said thank you with a smile.

Until Lin Yiyi arrived at home, Lin Yiyi looked up at Yang Yu, and
soon fell down, like a shy girl, not like a young woman at all. Yang
Yu thinks that she's not Lin Yina. Besides, she's a wife. It's hard to
chat with others. There are many people in the village who are
talkative.

It's just that Lin Yiyi's home is very close to the legendary haunted
old house. Yang Yu looks up at the house on the mountain without
looking up. It's silent!



When they came back, the four of them had already gone to bed.
They took a cold bath in the backyard and went to the attic with only
a pair of underpants on. Looking at Lin Yina's bathroom on the
second floor and the wedding room on the second floor from the
window, the light has been turned off, very quiet.

Yang Yu quietly lying in bed, thinking that Lin Yina should be in
bud now, but he tossed and turned.

In the wedding night, secretly on a friend's wife? This makes Yang
Yu more excited!

Simply got out of bed and tried to stretch his head to listen to the
sound, but the wedding room on the second floor was quiet. Could it
be that the shooting was finished so soon? Or is Lin Yina biting her
teeth?

The more Yang Yu thinks about it, the more itchy his heart is. Even
if he can't satisfy his hunger, he can have a good time eavesdropping
on it!

Yang Yu tossed and turned several times: "play, give up!" Then he
got up without any clothes, went out and pulled up the ladder, put it
on the roof, and climbed up the roof. This roof is the same as Lin
Yina's, there is an open space of cement, which is convenient for
drying goods in rural areas. Other places are tiles.

Yang Yu didn't wear any shoes. He was afraid of making any noise.
There was only a distance of more than one meter between the
houses. Yang Yu crept over to Lin Yina's roof.

Then quietly go forward, barefoot on the cement, basically will not
make any sound, smear found the steps, down the stairs.

It was so dark inside that nothing could be seen.

Yang Yu was afraid that he would kick something carelessly, but
just thinking so, he kicked a bucket with a slap. Suddenly, the sound
rang again in the corridor. Yang Yu was flustered and quickly
backed back to climb back.



But a moment later, there was still no sound in the room, so I was
relieved and went on.Along the stairs, down to the second floor, the
second floor Lin Yina's wedding room on the left side of the stairs,
that is, the room facing the sun. Yang Yu sticks his ear to the wall
and wants to eavesdrop, but there is no sound in the room.

Did you really sleep? Can't you sleep in the wedding night? Cui
Qiang boasted that he could kill four cows.

Yang Yu listened closely again, but there was no sound. At this time,
the door of the wedding room creaked open. If Cui Yu is in a panic,
it's too late for him to go back.

Yang Yu looked around. Where can I hide on this staircase? I had to
stick my whole body against the wall.

Marriage room also quietly out of the personal! And followed by a
second person, this out in addition to Lin Yina who will?

"Lin Yina?" Yang Yu called softly!

"Shh!" Lin Yina made a quick silence, and then she laughed.

Lin Yina was wearing a white nightgown with bare thighs. She was
still very conspicuous in the dark night, and she was also very
beautiful and sexy. Lin Yina is suddenly happy when she meets
Yang Yu. In fact, she has been waiting for Yang Yu, hoping that this
man can be kind. However, she has been waiting for him. Do you
think she can be unhappy?

Yang Yu pointed to the wedding room with his finger, which means
obviously, but he asked brother Qiang?

Lin Yina pulled Yang Yu down from the stairs, and then pounced on
him. She put her arms around Yang Yu's neck and whispered: "he
fell asleep like a dead pig. I came out just now when I heard the
sound of a bucket. Are you looking for me?"

Can Yang Yu say no? Originally, I just came to peep. By the way, I



had a look at the market. Maybe I'm lucky. I really screwed her up.

Just now, Yang Na was so excited that she couldn't keep her eyes on
the bed? Why should I be ugly? I've been looking forward to Yang
Yu's coming. But the more I wait, the more anxious I am. The more
I wait, the more angry I am. I wish I could kill Yang Yu.

"I mean," Yang Yu suddenly said, "he just fucked you?"

Lin Yina glanced at Yang Yu and said angrily, "what? You don't
want it when you're on it? "

"No, no! He asked me if I was wrong Yang Yu speaks incoherently
and makes amends in a hurry. When Lin Yina saw Yang Yu like that,
she chuckled and her face was full of happiness: "he drank too much
and fell asleep as soon as he lay in bed. How can he do that?"

Lin Yina looks like a happy child, as if she is married to Yang Yu
tonight. Yang pouts her lips and is almost coquettish: "tonight is
someone else's wedding night. I will give you my first time. You
should treat me well!"

The first time? Yang Yu widened his eyes and thought he had heard
wrong. He thought how could Lin Yina be the first time? How could
it be the first time for such a bitch? If I'm really a virgin, I can pick
up the stool. I don't want it cheap. Am I Yang Yu or a man?

In the wedding night, a friend's wife, or a place, this world there are
so cool things? You can't find it with the lantern on.

"Go to me!" Yang Yu also hugs Lin Yina and stares at her prey like
a wolf, suggesting.
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Yang Yu, Leng, where can I go if I don't go to my room? Are there
any other bedrooms here?

"Go to my wedding room!" Lin Yina said seriously.

What? Yang Yu's face is black. What's the matter with you, brother
Qiang? What if he wakes up? He didn't take any sleeping pills. He
just fell asleep when he was drunk. He would wake up at any time.
Moreover, the action couldn't be released. Yang Yu hesitated.

"What? No guts? Dare to do it, dare not recognize it? " Irene grinned.
Yang Yu always feels that he will be killed by this whore sooner or
later. This is meant to punish me.

But how can Yang Yu watch the cooked duck fly away? In fact, Lin
Yina just wants to try Yang Yu's sincerity and courage. Even if she
doesn't agree, she will agree to go back to the attic with him.

Yang Yu laughed. The tiger didn't get angry. He really thought I was
a sick cat. Lin Yina will be a horizontal embrace up, one hand leg,
one hand back, Lin Yina hands around Yang Yu's neck, the heart
was happy.

Quietly push the door with your feet, the wedding room is dark, the
ground is covered with red carpet, and you can only hear brother
Qiang snoring.

Yang Yu puts Lin Yina on the sofa. Lin Yina sits with her back
against the sofa. Yang Yu's legs pass under Lin Yina's legs and
kneels on the sofa. Lin Yina naturally puts her legs on Yang Yu's
waist.

Yang Yu whole person pressed past, a tone up, immediately Lin
Yina like a cat, tightly hugged Yang Yu's neck.

At this moment, Lin Yina endured for a long time, like a thirsty
young woman, kissing Yang Yu crazily, eager to eat. His hands were
very irregular. He stroked Yang Yu's chest muscle from time to time,
and even tentatively touched it down.



Yang Yu picks up Lin Yina's nightgown and takes it off. His hands
start to touch her chest.

Lin Yina has been bullied like this for a long time.

"How are you, grass?" Yang Yu attached to his ear and said softly.

Lin Yina nodded her head three times.

It wasn't long before the sound of the crackle rang through the room.

At first linyina dare not shout, strong brother is snoring in bed.
However, by Yang Yu's crazy rape, where can I resist the pleasure?

Forced to endure for two minutes, suddenly burst into spring,
suddenly the whole room filled with three kinds of sound, strong
brother's snoring, piston movement, and Lin Yina's bold bed call.

Cui Qiang drank too much white wine and slept like a pig. His wife
was wowed by Yang Yucao on the wedding night, but he didn't
know it. Did he still sleep?

……

In the countryside of night, there are always some unknown and
mysterious things. How many women are pressed for breath, whose
men are pressed above? I don't know. Anyway, it's dark, especially
for the widows and left behind village women who are oppressed by
any villagers. They don't know who they are, so they are killed and
left. They don't know who they are.

The best disguise of human madness is night!

In the early morning, a ray of sunshine passed through the window
and shone on Yang Yu's face! I'll be late again this morning.

Cui Qiang gets up and sees the red on the bed sheet. Lin Yina says
with a smile: what you did last night, you were drunk, and you don't
remember anything, do you?



Lin Yina moved Luohong last night while she was still at night. She
was exhausted by Yang Yu last night. This morning, she was so sore
that she couldn't get out of bed. Cui Qiang laughed at her.

Lin Yina's heart is funny. Last night, she was yelled by Yang Yugan.
I don't know how happy she is. You are a pig, and you think it's
yourself! But as soon as I think of the excitement of the first night
last night, Lin Yina always wants to be like this.

It's said that cheating is addictive. Lin Yina has always suspected it.

"Hee hee, I want to introduce brother Yang Yu to my sister. My
sister must be satisfied! Ha ha Lin Yina said to herself.

Yang Yu held his tired body and didn't eat breakfast, so he finally
caught up with his class.

"Students! This class is a test When Yang Yu's words came out, the
whole class was in an uproar!

"Teacher, why don't you tell me about the exam in advance?" Most
of the students have different opinions.

"Don't be nervous. Your parents won't be informed of your grades.
However, if you don't do well in the exam, you may visit your
family. Most importantly, the teacher may open a tutorial class for
you, free of charge It's already planned for Yang Yu to open a small
cram school at the weekend, which is also the next strategy to
improve students' performance.

Originally this month, Yang Yu was going to take the students to the
city to have a look, but his uncle's accident made the whole family
heavily in debt, so he took them out with more money.

"Another month is the mid-term examination. This mid-term
examination is a unified examination of the whole school. Based on
the results of this examination, if you make progress, then after the
mid-term examination, the teacher will take you on a spring outing!"
Yang Yu said with a smile, this is not an incentive policy, but it's the
first time for this group of people who haven't played for a long time,



especially for such a handsome head teacher as Mr. Yang.

Yang Yu specially looked at Ji Ming, who was manicure in the
corner of the wall, and continued: "the examination depends on
self-consciousness."

Yang Yu sent out the paper and left.Don't invigilate? Students were
stunned, especially a few poor students, the contradiction, this is
cheating or cheating or cheating.

Yang Yu came into the office and saw Li Ruoshui changing his
homework wholeheartedly. He said with a smile, "dear, good
morning!"

Li Ruoshui raised his head and gave a white look, but he put on a
smile and said, "yes, dear morning!"

"Goose bumps are coming up!" Yang Lin was listening in. She was
shivering! But every time Yang Lin wanted to press Yang Yu, Yang
Yu would say, "teacher Yang Lin, do you remember taking a bath
that day"

"shut up Yang Lin not only let Yang Yu shut up, he will also shut up,
the bath that day, is their secret, agreed that no one can say, has been
Yang Lin's sensitive topic.

I'll come back with you next time! Yang Lin thought bitterly.
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back to you even more!" Last night, he was beaten hard by the
villagers, but he was not hurt by Zhang Yuanyang.

"Brother Zhang, I heard that Li Ruoshui, Secretary Li's woman, is
the boy's girlfriend." The man beside Zhang Yang is very rude. He
has dark skin and strong physique. He has a long scar on his lips.
When he sees such a man, Yang Yu will hide.

"But Secretary Li is not easy to be provoked. I'm afraid" Zhang
Yang came to Yang Yu, but!

"When is big brother so scared? If you want to play, you can play
something exciting. What's more, that girl is a beautiful girl. My
brothers and I have been itching for a long time! Didn't playing with
that boy's girlfriend make big brother more happy? ha-ha! Let's play
games with him. "

The scar man's name is Zhang Han. He has a cousin relationship
with Zhang Yang. He is a big gangster in the village. He is lazy at
ordinary times. He specializes in sneaking around and helping others.
But the villagers dare not provoke him, because he can do
everything. Besides, there are a group of brothers who hang out with
him.

The villagers are afraid and hate these people, but they can't help it!
If Yang Yu knew that Zhang Yang was a rascal, he would think
twice last night. It was not cost-effective to get dirty for a widow.

"When school is over, you guys will find a chance to catch Li
Ruoshui. We'll wait for you in the thatched cottage on the top of the
mountain and do it well."

Zhang Han, an old man, shouts to his villagers that these villagers
are not good either. Following Zhang Yang and Zhang Han,
although they can't eat anything fragrant and drink spicy, at least,
hehe, no one dares to bully them.

"Two elder brothers Zhang, is it too much to do this? Li Ruoshui's
father is the Secretary of our village, and we are kidnapping,
breaking the law!"



Among them, the villagers knew about the interest relationship. At
first, they just followed Zhang Yang to fight Yang Yu and taught
him a lesson. But Zhang Han's suggestion changed the nature of the
matter, so someone shrugged.

After hearing this, Zhang Han just turned his head and glared at the
man, who was so scared that his feet softened and began to climb.

Now Li Ruoshui and Yang Yu have no idea of the danger. Yang Yu,
in particular, is a fish in water in the class now, and even
occasionally plays a yellow joke in the class, which makes these
female students happy.

Every time, Yang Yu will use these topics to observe these female
students, to see which are shy, which are open, which are sultry, and
which are contemptuous of Yang Yu.

The school bell rings.

"Li Ruoshui, do you want to take you home?" Yang Yu said with an
ambiguous face.

"Classmate Yang Yu, you'd better send the girl students. They need
you more!" Li Ruoshui looks at Li Yunxi who is waiting not far
away. Although she knows that she is Yang Yu's cousin, the
woman's sensitivity is very high. At a glance, she can see that Li
Yunxi doesn't just treat Yang Yu as his cousin.

"How do you say, it's also my girlfriend. Give me some face and let
me show it." Yang Yu is reluctant. It's important to get along with a
girl. If you get along with her more, she will naturally rely on you.

"You don't really want to chase me, do you? I don't feel for you.
You'd better go to see our class girls! " With that, Li Ruoshui threw
his head away.

Yang Yu was left alone, embarrassed. He thought that this girl was
so smart that she could see through my mind of soaking my student
sister? It's the first time that I don't want to touch you.



Li Ruoshui took a few steps, stopped for a while, and saw that Yang
Yu didn't catch up, so he left.

Yang Yu looked at Li Ruoshui's back. He was in good shape. He
was not surprised. Then he turned around and went to find his third
cousin. It's the happiest thing for the third cousin to go home from
school with her cousin. Every time she goes on the road, she even
blushes when she talks to Yang Yu. This is not a child born after 90.

Yang Yu especially likes to tease her when her third cousin blushes,
which makes her blush even more. However, this is also the happiest
time with three cousins, carefree, but Yang Yu's heart is still cousin
Li Yuanxi.

For her cousin Li Yuanxi, Yang Yu has been secretly in love with
her since the summer vacation ten years ago.

His cousin's position in Yang Yu's heart is just like the first love,
bitter and beautiful. Yang Yu has always kept this secret love in his
heart, even forgetting it. Otherwise, the relationship would not be
rekindled.

However, Li Yuanxi is her own cousin. She can't be together. Every
time I think about it, I will shout!

As night fell, the whole family was sitting together for dinner.
Although life was much harder than before, everyone was the
happiest when they ate. At this time, the dark outside rushed to a
person.This man, Yang Yu has never seen, is tall and thin. He is also
wearing a pair of presbyopic glasses, which is different from the
usual villagers. He is more literary and scholarly.

"Secretary Li, why are you here? Have you eaten yet? Come, come,
come As soon as I see it, isn't this the village secretary? This kind of
people don't often go to Si Xiaoyun's house. If they come here, they
must have something to do.

Seeing that she was an official, she immediately stood up and was
very polite. Yang Yu was the only man in the family. She



understood the politeness and quickly stood up and gave up her
place.

Secretary Li didn't care about her, but first looked at Yang Yu: "are
you Yang Yu? My li Ruoshui's boyfriend? "

Yang Yu was stunned and immediately responded that he was Li
Ruoshui's father or the Secretary of the village. Li Ruoshui was the
second generation of officials. No wonder he had a special
temperament. He didn't pay attention to Yang Yu, a handsome guy.
People who can be called village flower always have some
expectations.

Although the girl friend is acting, it is obvious that Secretary Li has
believed.

"Yes, it's uncle Li. Hello!" Yang Yu says very sincerely, pull out
chair to let Li Secretary sit by the way.

Secretary Li is a man of culture, and he also likes him. Yang Yu is a
man of culture, and he is also a top student. Secretary Li Dequan has
heard about this for a long time. He didn't expect that he was
graceful and valiant.

This is the best choice for the son-in-law he always wanted. It's more
difficult to find a cultural man in this poor mountain than to ascend
to heaven.

A look at this Yang Yu, extraordinary behavior, in, like. But now he
has no time to think about it, because something happened: "have
you ever seen my home? Ah, the child hasn't come home since
school. I have to remember to eat this meal. I think she should be
looking for her boyfriend. "

"Secretary Li, if Miss Shui is not here, Xiaoyu, do you know where
she is?" The little aunt answered in a hurry. As a parent, the child
was flustered at the slightest thing.

"After school, we met. She went straight home. She didn't tell me
she was going to other places." Yang Yu touched his head and



recalled.

"Oh, are you her boyfriend? Of course, I want to send her home. Oh,
where is the child? It's not like that. " Li Dequan is already sweating.
Li Ruoshui is a girl in his old age. He's very popular.

"Don't worry, Uncle Li. I'll look for it right away. As long as I'm in
the village, I'm sure I can find it." Yang Yu took a steamed bread,
took a flashlight and went out. If you want to know what can happen
in this village, it must be that you've gone to chat with a good friend,
a woman. It's normal for you to gossip and forget the time to go
home.

Yang Yu remembered that he didn't know enough about Li Ruoshui.
Who are her friends? I don't know at all. I can't help it. Yang Yu ran
all the teachers in the school, but there was none. I went to all the
students' homes, but I still didn't.

Li Dequan, Li Ruoshui's relative, has already asked, but he has not.

Of course, Yang Yu didn't give up. He walked all the roads and
paths in the village. When he saw people, he asked if he had seen Li
Ruoshui, but he still didn't.

At this time, it was already ten o'clock. Now, even Yang Yu was
worried.

Li Dequan's family had already been as anxious as ants on a hot pot.
They turned round and round, and kept nagging: "where did the
child go?"

"Let's look for it again. Aunt Li will stay at home and wait for
Ruoshui. Uncle Li will call some relatives to look for it together. I'm
going to school. I'll find Li Ruoshui. Don't worry!" With that, Yang
Yu went to school.
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Yang Yu came to the school, came to the place where they separated.
Towards Li Ruoshui's house, along the road, Yang Yu was shining
on the ground, hoping to find something on the ground.

At a fork in the road, Yang Yu stops, a small lane, this lane can also
lead to Li Ruoshui's home, but Li Ruoshui's character is sure to take
the road, but Yang Yu turns and walks into the small lane.

This small lane is a muddy road. Without taking two steps, he
stepped on something. When Yang Yu flashed his flashlight, it was a
book.

"Junior three Chinese? This is Li Ruoshui's book Yang Yu has
realized that something has really happened to Li Ruoshui. He
stoops to check and finds that there are many messy footprints on the
soil.

"Kidnapping? What would happen in such a big village? " Yang Yu
couldn't believe it: "but why did you kidnap Li Ruoshui? Money? "
Yang Yu couldn't figure it out. He opened his Chinese textbook and
read on the front page: "do you want to find your girlfriend? We
have to hurry. We'll wait for you in the hut on the top of the
mountain. If you're late, our brothers will be happy one by one.
Wow, this girl's milk is really good!

Yang Yu's nameless fire broke out, and he rushed to the top of the
mountain.

A few hundred meters away from the west side of the mountain top,
there is indeed a deserted thatched cottage, and tonight, it is rare to
be lively here.

There was a fire burning in the hut. Several people were roasting a
pheasant and spraying incense. A girl was tied to a post in the hut.

"Brothers, do you think Yang Yu can find us?" Zhang Han chewed
chicken legs, full of sesame oil, looked extremely ugly, excited to
ridicule.

"I wish he didn't come here, hehe, because then, this girl will belong



to us in the evening, ha ha." we all laughed. It was Li Ruoshui who
was tied up by these villagers under the orders of the two brothers of
Zhang Jia.

Originally, they didn't have much thought. Seeing Li Ruoshui as
beautiful as that, how can they restrain the brutality of men? As soon
as I heard that as long as Yang Yu didn't come, this girl would take
turns at night, which would forget her illegal behavior.

"I'm not very demanding. I'll give it to brother Zhang for the first
time. Ha ha"

"there are six of us. If we come down this night, can water girl stand
it? Ha ha. "A villager turned his head and looked at Li Ruoshui on
the pillar wickedly. His saliva came out.

How did Li Ruoshui ever suffer such insults? He doesn't know why
these people arrested her, but from these remarks, we can see that
this is a turn! Li Ruoshui is about to cry. These men are so dirty and
disgusting. Usually, don't touch them. Even if they are looked at,
they will vomit. But now, they have to take turns all night. Li
Ruoshui is pale with fright.

"You beasts, let me go!" Li Ruoshui struggled, but the rope tightly
tied her, a weak woman, where to break away?

"She called us beasts? Ha ha, interesting? I wasn't, but now I am
That piece of fierce a listen to, come strong, chicken leg a throw, a
touch mouth, directly to Li Ruoshui but go.

Li Ruoshui hasn't seen such an ugly and disgusting man. Now she
understands how lovely Yang Yu is. Before, she thought she couldn't
look up to others, but now, is her body struggling with these people?
Li Ruoshui has the heart to die.

If they touch me at night, tomorrow, tomorrow I'll go straight to the
diving pool! Li Ruoshui watched Zhang Han come and cried. Zhang
Hun put his face together and smelled Li Ruoshui's body: "it's really
fragrant!"



I smell it all the time. I smell it from my neck, chest and abdomen.
Then I stretch my head between Li Ruoshui's legs and smell it madly!

Li Ruoshui has never seen such a perverted man. The man kept
smelling between his crotch, which made Li Ruoshui almost vomit.
There are still such perverted men in this village.

"The coquettish smell of virgins, ha ha, brothers, do you want to
smell it?" Zhang Han's whole face was pumped up, excited!

"Brother Zhang is too tasteless. If you want to smell it, you should
take off your pants. That's enough! Ha ha "a villager looks extremely
obscene. He laughs even more like a mask, which is terrifying.

Li Ruoshui heard, fear swept the whole body, tears can not stop the
flow, the original itself is so fragile, helpless: "you let me go, let me
go!"

The villager had already crept in, and his face was very obscene. Li
Ruoshui didn't dare to look at it, and his head was close to the pillar.
What else could he do except cry.

The villager drooled, his eyes lit, stretched out his hands and
touched Li Ruoshui's thigh!

A few hisses!

"No! No! No Li Ruoshui struggled even more severely. He twisted
his body and burst into tears. Then he found out how helpless he was.

The villager directly tore off Li Ruoshui's pants, white thighs
immediately revealed, pink lace underwear also loomed, suddenly
everyone was excited and surrounded.

The villager who tore his pants was the most exaggerated. He pulled
down his pants, took out the little earthworm, looked at Li Ruoshui
and rolled it up! Li Ruoshui vomits! The little earthworm shot!

Li Ruoshui will never forget this scene in his life! Dirty, disgusting,
scared, Li Ruoshui is crazy."Big brother, this girl is really good.



Why don't you go? Don't wait for that boy! " Zhang Han couldn't
stand it when he saw the beauty in the world. They met many village
women and left behind women and widows in turn, but none of them
was as beautiful as Li Ruoshui!

Li Ruoshui is a goddess. Even if you look at her white and sexy
thigh, you can make them climax!

"Well! A group of worthless guys, wait for Yang Yu to come, and
take turns in front of him. Isn't his girlfriend more fun and exciting?
" Zhang Yang is really crafty and has the heaviest taste. This kind of
spiritual stimulation is far more exciting than the body.

Just as Yang Yu opened his daughter-in-law's bud in front of brother
Qiang on his wedding night last night, it's exciting. No man has a
sense of achievement more than wearing a green hat on his
opponent's man.

"Are you waiting for me?" Suddenly there was a sound outside the
door. Of course, Yang Yu is not so stupid. No, he is so reckless! If
you go in directly, there are six of them and only one of them. How
can you fight?

When Zhang Yang saw that he didn't come in, he knew that this guy
wasn't a fuel-efficient light, but he had something to do and went to
Li Ruoshui:

"don't you want to come in and see your girlfriend?" Said, tore off a,
exposed bra! That bra is also lace flesh color, a deep cleavage can
drown people.

Li Ruoshui is crying and screaming! His thighs, brassiere, have
never been seen by men, but now they have been seen by six
extremely obscene men. What's the point of living?

"Won't you come in? Then we're welcome. " Zhang Yang said
treacherously, ready to tear her bra.

Yang Yu knew that he had no choice, so he took the courage to go in.
But as soon as he stepped forward, he suddenly fell on the ground.



When I woke up, I was already tied up.

Zhang Yang was looking at Yang Yu, who was tied up on the
ground. He was excited and said, "do you remember me?" With that,
Zhang Yang opened his mouth with his hand, but he didn't have a
front tooth: "this front tooth is thanks to you!"

"Hum!" Yang Yu cold hum: "who let you bully a widow!"

"I've had a lot of widows. I tell you, we took turns with your
girlfriend tonight to let the whole village know that your girlfriend
Zhang Yang, Yang Yu's girlfriend, and my brother, have also. It's
not enough. Tomorrow night we'll take turns with widow Liu to see
what you do?"

Yang Yu was angry and glared. Although he was just acting with Li
Ruoshui, it was ruining Li Ruoshui's life! I also live in regret all my
life.

"Then I'll throw your head off and hang it at the entrance of the
village!" Yang Yu's eyes are almost staring out. If Zhang Yang dares
to do this, Yang Yu dares to do it: "let's have a try!"

Yang Yu will never ask others, especially the enemy!

"You threatened me? ha-ha! Then I'll show you the grass! " Zhang
Yang's eyes are bigger than Yang Yu's, but he is not frightened:
"separate her legs for me!"

"Ah! No, no, no Li Ruoshui would rather die than be insulted like
this! But how to struggle, shouting is useless, the two villagers have
two points to lift up.

See that lace underpants show no doubt, that hair is still looming,
absolutely can attract any man to commit a crime!

Yang Yu looks at all this, Li Ruoshui's helpless eyes, Zhang Yang's
obscene expression and the abnormal appearance of other villagers.
It turns out that there are such rubbish people everywhere.



Zhang Yang stretched out his hand to Li Ruoshui's underwear in
front of everyone!
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When everyone's attention was put on the area between Li Ruoshui's
thigh and thigh, Yang Yu suddenly dropped something from his
pocket, quietly pulled it over a little, then stepped on his heel, and
then pushed it into the fire.

It's the battery of the big flashlight!

Just when Zhang Yang touched Li Ruoshui's underwear, suddenly,
the fire exploded.

Coincidentally, a piece of battery flashed into the back of the head.
And the other flames, the thatched cottage, flew on the spot, and
some flew directly to the villagers, which made him cry.

By this sudden explosion, the other several people were also
shocked dizzy.

Yang Yu took advantage of the situation and quickly moved over,
burning the rope with fire. The grass was extremely flammable.
When people saw it, they tried their best to escape, and the beam
was about to fall down.

Some villagers are burning and can't care so much. They beat
themselves with all their lives. Some villagers just run for their lives
when they see that the fire is not right. Zhang Han sees that the
thatched cottage is about to fall, but his cousin is still unconscious
on the ground. If he runs away, will his cousin not be burned alive?

After looking at Yang Yu, they didn't care so much. Anyway, they
couldn't escape, so they went to take off Zhang Yang first.

However, Li Ruoshui was still tied to the pillar, which was firm with
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the wooden pillar. There was a lot of smoke all around him, and he
choked so hard that he couldn't breathe.

Yang Yu pounced on him and pressed the fierce picture on the
ground. They rolled in the fire and started to fight. Although Yang
Yu has never learned Sanda, he is also a special student. It's a
common thing to fight. On the contrary, Zhang Han is a rascal, and
his physique is not inferior to Yang Yu. They are equal.

You punch me one leg, no one has the upper hand, but your face is
red and I'm blue. The thatched cottage is about to fall down. If we
keep on pestering, these four people will be buried in the sea of fire.

Yang Yu rushed to save Li Ruoshui. Li Ruoshui was choked and
fainted quickly. Zhang Han saw that his cousin was also a dead man,
but he had no choice but to run out with his cousin's body.

"Don't be afraid, don't be afraid, I'm here!" Yang Yu himself could
not open his eyes and coughed, but Li Ruoshui softened and fainted.

When he untied the rope, he ran into the back room directly. At the
same time, the whole thatched cottage collapsed, and the fire started
rolling up, and the smoke shrouded!

Yang Yu came out from the back, while Zhang Han and some of
them were at the front door. Yang Yu is carrying Li Ruoshui on his
back. If he takes the main road, he can't escape. The front is dark,
nothing can be seen, see the opposite several villagers chasing,
regardless of 37 21, to no road in the weeds rush past, also don't
know what road is in front of, just desperate to step down.

"Don't run! Stop A few villagers in the rear pursued him like a
shadow.

Yang Yu didn't know what was ahead. He just put the weeds and
branches in front of him. He just stepped on whether his feet were
empty or soft, or whether it was a hunting trap. Because he was
caught by these mobs, Li Ruoshui's life would be ruined.

Li Ruoshui's trousers have been torn, no shadow, only a pair of lace



underwear, coat is also good, lying on Yang Yu's back, choked by
smoke fainted. But just when Yang Yu wanted to stop and have a
rest, suddenly, with a puff, his feet sank, and they fell down with a
slap.

Bang, I don't know where I fell, and I fell dizzy.

Yang Yu's absence all night makes his aunt's family become ants.
His three cousins are crying. Li Deyang knows that something must
have happened when he sees that the woman is also absent all night.

In the early morning, dew drops down the grass, falling freely and
impartially on Yang Yu's mouth. Yang Yu suddenly wakes up from
his nightmare.

"I'll go. What the hell is this place?" Yang Yu wiped his eyes. After
a careful look, it turned out to be a hole.

Yang Yu raised his head, and the hole was covered by some weeds,
which was very secret. There was a few rays of sunlight through the
gap. It was seven or eight meters deep, with a radius of about one
meter. The hole was narrow, and it was estimated that it was only
half a meter in radius. Almost Yang Yu could just lie down. The
wall of the hole was muddy, smooth and wet.

"Who can dig such a hole when he's full?" Yang Yu secretly scolds,
only feels the whole body ache, and Zhang Han a fight can not be
light.

"Don't, don't, don't force me, don't!" Li Ruoshui struggled
desperately. His eyes were still closed. It was a nightmare. Yang Yu
quickly squatted down, threw Li Ruoshui in his arms and stroked her
head: "don't be afraid, don't be afraid, I'm here, I'm here!"

Sure enough, after a few strokes, Li Ruoshui calmed down and woke
up. Seeing that the man in front of him was not the six wretched
villagers, he burst into tears.

He rushed over and hugged Yang Yu tightly. Yang Yu also hugged
her tightly and comforted her: "it's OK, it's OK, I'm here!"



Li Ruoshui hugged Yang Yu and cried: "I'm so scared. I just dreamt
that they bullied me. It's so dirty and disgusting!" Yang Yu has been
holding her, comforting her, a moment later, Li Ruoshui mood to
calm down.

"Where are we?" Li Ruoshui looked around and found that it was in
a hole."Last night, I was chased too fast with you on my back. It was
dark again. As a result, I stepped empty and fell in! However, it also
escaped a disaster. " Yang Yu looked up at the sky and looked at the
mud wall. He went from one pit to another. It's not easy to go out
here.

"So how do we get out?" Li Ruoshui, of course, is a smart man.
Looking at the situation, it is obviously worse than last night.

"It's a barren mountain outside. Generally no one will pass by. Even
if there is one, we won't notice the cave. We are more or less in
danger." Yang Yu tried to recall what happened last night. He should
have run a long way. Li Da Road is far away. No one will pass
through this desolate place at all.

"Anybody? Is anyone here? Help Li Ruoshui yelled at the entrance
of the cave, but there was no sound outside: "are we just waiting?"
Li Ruoshui didn't eat last night. He was already hungry.

Yang Yu tried to climb, but the wall was so smooth that he couldn't
go up a step. If the hole was a little narrow, he could step on one side
of the wall with his legs apart. It was possible to climb up. Now it's
almost impossible to climb up.

Two people have gradually realized that the situation is not good, so
go on, may die here!

Die here!!

Both men realized the seriousness of the problem almost at the same
time.

If no one finds out, they will rot here!



"We need to calm down. Your parents and my aunt will definitely
come to me. If we keep our strength, we may have a chance. As long
as someone passes by, we will shout!" Yang Yu now can only
comfort Li Ruoshui, let each other calm down, but Yang Yu even
himself can't calm down.

Because the possibility of being found is almost zero. The area here
is too large, and there are not enough people. Unless the whole
village is mobilized, the mountain is rolling, too big, too big. It's not
easy to find someone? At present, Yang Yu can only place his hope
on Zhang Yang.

Only they know where they are. At that time, the whole village will
be mobilized to look for it, and there will be hope. But the problem
is, will Zhang Yang and Zhang Han do it? Will several other
villagers do that? Yang Yu has no idea of their character.

They sat at the bottom of the cave for one hour, two hours, one
morning and one afternoon. It was dark every day. They were almost
exhausted from hunger! I don't even have the strength to stand up.

"You say, are we going to die here?" Li Ruoshui's eyes were dull,
and she didn't talk about her first love, not to mention holding hands,
kissing, and dying on the first night. She was not reconciled, and she
just died: "I don't want to die here. I don't have a boyfriend yet Li
Ruoshui cried. The more he thought about it, the more sad he was.

"I'm not your boyfriend?" Yang Yu doesn't like it. At least we have a
reputation.

"You're not real." Li Ruoshui looked white and pouted.

"People are dying. Why don't we get married so that you can be a
woman?" Yang Yu is still in the mood to tease? The donkey kicked
me in the head.

Strange thing, Li Ruoshui is not angry, Leng is there. She is not
willing to leave the world when she is a virgin. But at this time,
Yang Yu began to take off his trousers. Li Ruoshui was nervous, and



I was still thinking about it. He cried out: "what do you want to do? I
didn't agree! "

But Yang Yu didn't care. He continued to take off his pants and was
ready to take off his clothes. Li Ruoshui was afraid, and he rolled
back to the corner, swallowed deeply, and stammered: "don't mess
with me! Don't do that

Yang Yu showed an evil smile.
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Li Ruoshui has been scared to curl up in the corner. If Yang Yu goes
to her now, she has no way at all. There is no one here, and she has
no strength.

Yang Yu laughed: "what do you think? It's dark. It's going to be cold.
Put on my pants and clothes, or you'll freeze to death at night. "

It's like Li Yu's painting on his thigh. Don't even notice that his thigh
is covered with mud. Yang Yu threw his trousers and clothes over.
He only wore a pair of underpants and a short sleeve, which made
him cold a lot.

It's getting dark.

It was dark in the cave. Li Ruoshui was a little afraid. Today was the
second night, and he was getting closer to death.

"Are you there?" Li Ruoshui gently asked: "I'm afraid"

Yang Yu is also exhausted. He consumed a lot of physical strength
last night. He didn't eat today. The most important thing is that he
has been thinking about all kinds of ways to go out, but he has been
denied one by one. He is depressed by despair and regret.

Yang Yu moved, picked up Li Ruoshui, and let Li Ruoshui sit on his
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lap. Then he hugged her with both hands. Li Ruoshui was close to
Yang Yu's arms, very warm.

"If we can get out alive, what do you want to do?" Yang Yu also
thought of many things.

"I'll let you chase me! Run after me Li Ruoshui has been pursued by
countless people, but no one's pursuit makes her happy. Yang Yu is
the most satisfied one. However, she has been spoiled since she was
a child. Living in a rich family, she has also developed an aloof
character. No matter whether I like you or not, I am a superior
princess.

"You have no feelings for me, what am I chasing?" Yang Yu is able
to chase girls, but that was when he was young and frivolous. Now,
he has experienced a lot and knows a lot of things. They are all
mutual and mutual. If you don't like me, don't expect me to like you!

Even if I like you, it's none of your business?

"Hum!" Li Ruoshui, like a little princess, snorted coldly.

"Ah! Now that my favorite guitar is here, I can still sing a song in
Gaoge. It's my last wish Yang Yu looks at the sky, dotted with stars.
Even the sky looks so small. Yang Yu thinks that I am so small. If I
am lucky to live, I must do what I love to do madly, pursue my
cousins boldly, and soak up all these female students. None of those
village women will let go.

"You still have a guitar? Can you sing? " Li Ruoshui suddenly
became interested, because the man who can sing is so charming. He
once walked across mountains and rivers, lined up for two days and
bought a ticket for the concert, but he lost it. He cried for a whole
day and was scolded half dead by his parents. That ticket was his
father's income for half a month.

Li Ruoshui has been full of love for singing since he was a child. He
once vowed to marry a man who can sing. Unexpectedly, Yang Yu
can sing and play guitar? Li Ruoshui was so excited that he almost
forgot that he was in such a difficult environment.



As for Yang Yu, singing has always been a necessary artifact to
pretend to be cool and pick up girls. As a man full of dreams of
picking up girls, how can he not sing? Jokes.

"Sing a song! I want to hear it Li Ruoshui exclaimed excitedly.

Yang Yu also feels funny. This is his first time to sing, not to pick
up girls? This situation, this scene, do not sing, it is a waste of life.

"Andy Lau, maybe we can't die together in this life!"

"Searching

vanishes in silence

can't always find memories

can't find the forgotten

reality

"

"

Yang Yu sings the songs of his childhood idols, these old songs
accompany him to grow up together, and these songs also
accompany most of the post-80s. Li Ruoshui listened silently, only
to find that Yang Yu is so charming and manly. Isn't this the person
she has been looking for?

Li Ruoshui's eyes are full of light. Looking at Yang Yu's affectionate
face in the shimmer, her sexy lips are opening and closing. Li
Ruoshui is deeply stunned. Her heart beats wildly, and she looks at
Yang Yu without blinking. Suddenly, she can't believe herself. She
makes Yang Yu surprised.

Li Ruoshui, the first beauty in yunu village, suddenly sat up and
sealed Yang Yu's mouth. This was not enough. She immediately put



her tongue into Yang Yu's mouth. Suddenly, it was entangled with
Yang Yu's tongue.

Yang Yu didn't know that Li Ruoshui would have such a surprise
action. It was too sudden. But the experience of picking up a girl
made him react immediately. He hugged Li Ruoshui tightly, pressed
her head hard, kissed her crazily and licked her tongue crazily.

Driven by Yang Yu's exciting kiss, Li Ruoshui has already forgotten
everything and kisses more passionately and crazily. His two mouths
and two tongues are like fighting, wildly circling and licking each
other, and no one dares to fall behind. They are already breathing
heavily.

After kissing for five minutes, they slowly stopped, face to face,
forehead against forehead, panting. At this time, both of them
suddenly laughed. Suddenly, Li Ruoshui put his arms around Yang
Yu's neck and leaned on his shoulder. The woman is so inexplicable.
You can chase her crazy. You don't care. Even if it's just singing a
song, this girl will throw herself into her arms.Suddenly, a sound
came from outside the cave.

They stood up in a hurry. Like a rabbit, they pricked up their ears
and listened to the sound outside the cave. Sure enough, there was a
voice. Did they find it?

Two people a burst of excitement, shouting: "we are here, help, we
are here!"

They cried for a quarter of an hour, but no one came.

There was no sound or movement outside. Both of them collapsed
on the ground, and their last chance was completely destroyed.

Despair, the despair from heaven to hell, also completely shattered
the last hope of two people, they know that they may not even
survive tomorrow. Yang Yu holds Li Ruoshui tightly in his arms. At
the last moment of his life, the person around him will be her.

Fate, this thing, is so magical.



Time tick tick tick tick!

One minute, one hour!

Yang Yu is singing in a soft voice, singing a brilliant fairy tale. It
turns out that we all live in fairy tales.

Li Ruoshui, I do not know when, cried, has been crying, no one is
not afraid of death, no one, Yang Yu is also afraid, afraid to death!
But how, afraid, but also brave to face it.

"Am I beautiful?" Li Ruoshui raised his head and almost lost his
strength to speak.

Yang Yu laughed, stroked her face and said: "beauty! You are the
most beautiful woman in the village

Li Ruoshui smile, smile so desolate, so desperate.

"Yang Yu, can you make me a woman?"
Chapter 38

Name：A Sensualist's Sin Author：Rosemead

+ - Turn off Reset

Yang Yu and Li Ruoshui look at each other face to face, forehead
against forehead, nose together, lips and lips are so close, you can
feel each other's breathing.

Li Ruoshui's chest is gradually undulating and shortness of breath.
This is the first time that she has feelings for men and has sexual
impulse.

What else is Yang Yu waiting for?

It's nice to be a ghost before you die.

Yang Yu raised his hand and gently stroked Li Ruoshui's cheek. His
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skin was as beautiful as water.

Yang Yu gently wipes Li Ruoshui's tears, kisses her tears, kisses her
lips, the sexy and ruddy lips have become dry and pale, a burst of
heartache.

Yang Yu put his hands down his cheek, to his neck, to his chest, and
gently went to untie his clothes. Li Ruoshui's heart beat faster, he
was more nervous, he was breathing faster, and his body was still
shaking.

Gradually revealed a cleavage, this world can no longer find more
beautiful than this cleavage, moonlight, that cleavage deep and
elastic, smooth and delicate.

Yang Yu takes off Li Ruoshui's coat bit by bit. Li Ruoshui's whole
bra is exposed. It's made of lace and flesh. It's very touching.

Yang Yu kisses Li Ruoshui's cheek and reaches his hand behind his
back to untie his bra.

Li Ruoshui cried.

She cried not because Yang Yu was bullying her, not because she
was afraid of death in such an environment, but because of why the
most beautiful and happiest time in the world was so short, and what
these short times brought was even the pain of life.

All happiness comes from tragedy.

Li Ruoshui burst into tears! Why is Yang Yu not?

When the button is untied, Yang Yu is suddenly stunned there! He
didn't know what he was thinking! He's not willing, he's angry, he
doesn't want to give in to fate.

Yang Yu's hand stopped, the bra was not taken off, but the
unexpected thing: Yang Yu suddenly put the bra back!

Does everyone think Yang Yu is crazy? It's a donkey's brain.



Yang Yu holds Li Ruoshui's shoulders in both hands and stares at
her like a hungry wolf!

"Listen, we're going to live, we're going to climb out, we're going to
play, we're going to save it for me to play outside!"

Li Ruoshui was shocked!

Yang Yu stood up and said: "visually, it's seven and a half meters
high, I'm 180cm high, and you're 168cm high. If you stand on me, or
I hold you up, you can reach four meters high, and there are still
three and a half meters left. We just need to fill in a few meters
higher. Fortunately, it's all mud. It's estimated that this is a hunting
trap set by which villager. Maybe there's still hope."

Yang Yu said, regardless of everything, to dig the soil on the wall,
the soil is very sticky and wet, but not loose. When Li Ruoshui saw
it, he suddenly laughed, bit his teeth, stood up and dug up the wall.

They started to dig from a height of one meter, dug out and stepped
on their feet, but they didn't dare to dig too deep for fear of collapse,
so they buried them alive.

Yang Yu's hands are red, and his nails are all up and bleeding. But
all this is for picking up girls. When he thinks of waiting for his
cousins, Lin Yina, Xiaomei and Zishu, Yang Yu feels that he has
strength all over his body and has made great efforts.

What's more exciting than dredging is that when you dig a stone, it
can raise its height all at once. In order to make the best use of the
height of the stone and the soil, Yang Yu doesn't fill all the ground,
but only paves half of it. He lays half of it against the wall on the
other side, and tries to put the stone under and on the edge to
transport the soil inside and fill it up.

They didn't know how long they had dug. They were too tired to
survive. They lay down to have a rest and fell asleep.

On the morning of the third day, Yang Yu woke up at the dawn of



genius, and Li Ruoshui beside him slept soundly.

Yang Yu looked around and found that he had been buried more
than one meter high last night. Now it's really a race with death, it's a
race between your own vitality and death, to see who laughs last.
Yang Yu looked at the hole carefully, hoping to find something
useful.

"Is that the root of a tree?" Li Ruoshui had already woken up. When
she opened her eyes, it was a hole covered by weeds. But in the
position where she sat, she seemed to see something.

Yang Yu looked in that direction, and it was really the root of a tree.
The root of the tree tilted out more than one meter down and along
the cave wall, looming.

"If we can get to the root, maybe we can climb out."

Yang Yu calculated in his heart that if he could only grasp the root,
he could climb up, but he could not reach the height: "do you have
the confidence to grasp the root and climb out?"

"I don't know!" After last night's hard work, Li Ruoshui's whole
body has collapsed. He even has difficulty in standing up. Where can
he drag the root of the tree to climb up?

But this is the last chance. We have to gamble once.

"If we go out, I'll officially admit you as a boyfriend!" Li Ruoshui
said with a smile, this is also her last smile.

"Ha ha, is it possible to do anything?" Yang Yu did not forget to
tease at the last moment."Of course not. Anything but that." Li
Ruoshui's face turned red.

Two people climbed up the height of the soil filled area, Yang Yu
squatted down, hands on the wall, let Li Ruoshui climb up, stand on
his shoulder. This climb up, Li Ruoshui has been sucking. Li
Ruoshui weighs at least ninety. Yang Yu, who has no food, can't
stand it, but he has to.



Yang Yu stood up, Li Ruoshui holding the wall, not to fall.

Li Ruoshui raised his hand to look at the root of the tree. It looked
close to his eyes, but he couldn't touch it. He was worried!

Yang Yu is already dead under.

"I can't reach it!" Cried Li Ruoshui, burning with anxiety!

"I'll put your foot on it again Yang Yu roars, this is the last chance,
oneself must resist.

Li Ruoshui staggers and stands on Yang Yu's hand. If it wasn't for
the whole person lying on the wall to maintain the center of gravity,
he would have fallen down. Li Ruoshui tried to reach out his hand,
but he was still a little bit short. He hated that he didn't grow a few
centimeters longer.

Seeing that all her efforts are in vain, Li Ruoshui is not reconciled.
This is the last chance to survive. She goes all out. She doesn't know
how powerful she is when she is not in a desperate situation!

Li Ruoshui jumped up, this jump, day, she really caught!

Li Ruoshui stares at his legs and tries to climb up. But after all, he is
a girl. He has no strength and is still so heavy. Only then can he
experience how difficult it is to climb up like this.

Yang Yu looks more flustered and tangled below. He wants to cheer
and is afraid of distracting her. At this moment, Yang Yu really
wants to help them because there is a God in the world.

Li Ruoshui cried because he didn't even have the strength to hang up.
The more he hung up, the more tired he was. It seemed that he
would not be able to hold up. Li Ruoshui was biting his teeth,
thinking that he must insist on climbing up. So he took two more
steps, but there was still half a meter to the hole.

At the critical moment, Li Shengshui fell to the limit.



But at the moment when he fell down, suddenly, he stretched out a
hand from the mouth of the cave and grasped Li Ruoshui fiercely.
Yang Yu looked up and cheered out in surprise. It turned out that it
was Li Yunxi, his cousin.

At that moment, Yang Yu and Li Ruoshui suddenly felt reborn.

They swore that they would cherish life and time in the future!
Because you don't know if you can live tomorrow?

Li Yunxi pulled Li Ruoshui up and called a passer-by to pull Yang
Yu up with a rope.

Li Yunxi cried and rushed to Yang Yu's arms: "cousin, I thought I
would never see you again."

Yang Yu stroked her head, kissed her forehead, said with a smile:
"fool, cousin will not leave you."

At this moment, Li Ruoshui felt a sense of jealousy. She didn't even
know that she cared so much about Yang Yu's every move. Even if
he was holding his cousin, he was very jealous.

It turns out that Li Yunxi has never given up looking for Yang Yu,
because the thatched cottage caught fire and the flashlight he found.
The villagers actually came to find this place, but the area is really
too large, and they don't believe it. Why did they come here for no
reason.

Only Li Yunxi, her cousin, felt that her cousin must be around here.
When everyone was disappointed and gave up, Li Yunxi was still
looking there alone. She had been looking for him since last night.
She didn't understand why because of the faith her cousin gave him.
She only knew that she couldn't lose her cousin.

She has been deeply dependent on her cousin, go to school together,
play together, make up lessons together, eat together, chat together,
everything in her life has something to do with her cousin.



Little aunt, when my cousin saw Yang Yu come back alive, she also
cried! When Li Ruoshui saw his parents, he cried all the more!
Secretary Li Deyang looked at the frustrated Yang Yu, but he gave a
very positive.

Yang Yu went home to have a big meal, took a bath, and went to
sleep in the attic. These days, he was really hungry and sleepy, and
the experience of these days is more rich and exciting than his one
year experience.

Yang Yu goes to sleep with a smile. Although he experiences
adventure, he gains a girlfriend, Li Ruoshui, the first beauty in the
village. It's also worth it.

Tomorrow, Yang Yu told himself that he must do three things:

first, ask his parents to send the guitar;

Second, ask those friends who practice Taiquan to send a book on
Taiquan fighting skills and training, because he wants to protect
these women with his life;

Third, find a woman to relax and vent;

he didn't give the goddess Li Ruoshui to them in the cave Now,
Yang Yu regrets it!

Chapter 39
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The next day is Thursday, but Yang Yu is still very weak. Under the
dual care of her aunt and cousin, her physical strength recovers very
quickly. This day is probably the most comfortable one Yang Yu has
ever had. She can also act like a cousin, and her cousin will follow
him. On that day, Yang Yu simply changed his test paper in bed.

Zhang Yang's two brothers have fled, but Yang Yu knows that
sooner or later they will come back to find fault.
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On Friday, Yang Yu basically recovered, so he just went to class.

When Yang Yu saw these children again, it was really gratifying.

"This class is self-study. We will study by ourselves according to the
self-study method I taught you before, and then the exam results will
come out. I will call you one by one to talk. Of course, don't be
nervous, just chat and get closer to you, ha ha!" Yang Yu said with a
smile as usual.

Then Li Yunxi, the third cousin, was the first to be called out. The
third grade class of junior high school was in the last classroom at
the end of the corridor on the second floor, so Yang Yu simply went
to the end of the corridor, which was covered by the classroom wall,
and the students would not see or hear their conversation.

Yang Yu just touched Li Yunxi's head with a smile. He wanted to
say a lot, but he didn't say anything. He took out the test paper and
handed it to his cousin.

Li Yunxi looked at the score: 39? His face suddenly darkened. How
hard he tried to impress his cousin, and he always tutored himself,
but he got such a blinded score?

Then there was Xueba, who scored 67, which was the highest score
in the class. Yang Yu was also ashamed. The foundation of this
group of children was not built.

"I'm going to visit my family tomorrow." When Yang Yu handed Ji
Ming the 12 point test paper, he said by the way that the child really
had a big problem, but he was an extremely intelligent child. He just
didn't want to read. There must be some shadow.

"There is no one in our family. You are not welcome!" Ji Ming
pulled the test paper and rolled it into a ball in her hand. She went
back to the classroom with a cold face.

Then Yang Yu called over one by one. It was just a simple chat. The
most important thing was to have a look at their views and micro



expressions on the score.

Some children are really stupid, some are smart, and they are lazy.
Some are not attentive at all. The latter two are Yang Yu's first
targets, such as Ji Ming, a smart girl who is dying but has never used
her heart.

The next one is Zishu, a female student that Yang Yu has done twice.

"Will Mr. Yang come to visit us?" Zishu took the initiative to ask
this question.

Most of the precocious girls in Yilin village are young girls, and
most of them are young girls.

Yang Yu has long wanted to go to the field investigation, and there
are several children in the class who are from Hongxing Village.

At present, Yang Yu has long wanted to vent and think about it.

Zishu is the most hungry and thirsty one, and also the one who wants
to go to Yang Yu frequently. At noon or after school, he goes to the
old house's lunch break room and takes off his pants, then he can do
it directly.

In fact, the person Yang Yu most wants to go to is Xiaomei.
Xiaomei doesn't even have any milk in her first day of junior high
school, and she's very tight. Watching a little girl who doesn't have a
long hair under her body to vent her anger is the most fulfilling thing
for her. Moreover, Xiaomei, with her tender face, will scream madly,
which makes Yang Yu very excited.

Zhao Ying, Xiaomei's mother, is a young woman. She looks
embarrassed on the surface, but in fact she is ferocious and too far
away to be convenient. There is Lin Yina, but Cui Qiang is looking
at her. It's too risky for her to cheat. If she wants to do it, she can
only wait for the opportunity.

Of course, if Yang Yu wants to get on Zheng Xinyi by force, it's not
a bad thing. It's also a good place. However, at present, Yang Yu's



next teacher's goal is Yang Lin, because Yang Lin is familiar with it
and is easy to start. If there is an aphrodisiac or something, Yang Yu
will find Yang Lin for an experiment at the first time.

As for other resources, such as cousin, Li Ruoshui, Leng Xiaoxue
and several class flowers in the class, Yang Yu knows that the time
is not ripe at all, and he can't eat hot tofu anxiously. These goods are
the most delicious and delicious. Yang Yu is the best abalone he
wants to taste slowly.

"Are you inviting the teacher?" Yang Yu did not directly say that he
would go or not, but threw the problem back. These are all
communication skills.

"No, it's that" Zishu stammered and felt embarrassed to say it, but he
still forbeared to say it: "I told my good friend all our things, and
that's to say," Zishu said and stopped.

This matter Zishu has mentioned last time, Yang Yu also knows,
waiting for her to continue.

"I told her that Miss Yang was very powerful, but she said she had to
see you"

Yang Yu didn't understand. What was the meaning of this? Is this
about the gun?

"Why do you see me? It's not my student. It's OK to go to your home
and talk to your parents about your study. " Then Yang Yu handed
over the test paper, 43 points, medium grade. Even if Yang Yu is
willing, he can't promise directly. Then he will show his fox tail. He
needs to find a high sounding reason. I'm here to visit your family.
It's OK to meet your good friend by the way.Smart people do things
in a circle, or raise themselves to a certain height first.

Yang Yu is such a person. I am crazy about earning money. I also
want to say that I am creating employment opportunities for the
country, and the level and height will soon go up.

"Talking about my grades" Zishu was a bit embarrassed, but it was



always a happy thing for Mr. Yang to come to his home, so he
agreed.

As a teacher, at least two things need to be clear. The first is to
understand students and their family background. The second is to
understand students and make friends with students. So Yang Yu
decided to come to a small home visit first, to understand the
difficulty of each student and family situation, so as to suit the
remedy to the case to improve the students' performance.

Many teachers, in order to improve students' performance, blindly
tutor, blindly assign homework, in Yang Yu's eyes, that is silly
behavior.

However, Yang Yu is looking forward to his guitar. In the afternoon,
he has P.E. class. There are no facilities here. Basketball, football
and volleyball can't do anything. Do you want to run for the students?
They have come to climb the mountain to work. If they sing and
play games for them, maybe they can pave the way for their girls.

Today, Li Ruoshui still didn't come to Yang LindaI's class. Yang Yu
wanted to see her after school, especially for fear of her
psychological trauma. After all, she was almost taken turns by those
disgusting guys. It takes time to calm down.

But after school, the headmaster and Yang Lin planned to visit her,
so Yang Yu refused.

"Snow White!" Yang Yu stopped the snow ready to go home.

Snow white classmate this person and the name is not very match,
because she is the class fox spirit, just did not give this fox spirit any
ambiguous opportunity, because there is no man at all. White snow's
enchanting and purple Shu can be different, purple Shu is the kind of
more lustful but very direct girl, and white snow is just the opposite,
is a scheming heart also have ideas but not so direct expression.

For example, for Yang Yu, Zishu is very direct to tease teacher Yang,
but Bai Xue won't, she will only use her enchanting eyes, hanging
expression to discharge to Yang Yu.



Yang Yu is often numb with electricity. Purple potato is the
precocity of the body, snow is the precocity of the heart, but also
ripe.

"What happened to Miss Yang?" White snow holding the book, even
the book bag did not back, a beautiful look at Yang Yu, Yang Yu
was seen goose bumps.

"Do you mind if the teacher takes you home?" Yang Yu, of course,
is to promote communication with students, at the same time, for
home visits. Of course, you have to say that in order to soak her, this
is OK.

"Mr. Yang is so good today. She usually takes your cousin back.
Besides, there's Mr. Li Ruoshui. How can it be today?" Bai Xue is
still looking at Yang Yu with her big eyes like electricity.

"If you don't call Mr. Yang like this, I'll see you off next time!"
Yang Yu of course is joking, this kind of fox spirit girl, as long as it
is a man like, even if it is a woman, also like to die.

Bai Xue laughs, pouts her little mouth, blinks her big eyes, and says,
"but I call Mr. Yang, and Mr. Yang is indifferent."

You see, white snow and Zishu are different. Zishu will say that Mr.
Yang is very handsome and likes Mr. Yang. But white snow is
different. She will say some ambiguous and implicit words. This
kind of person will be talents in officialdom and shopping malls in
the future! She is the most intelligent woman, even if she spends a
little time on her study.

The purpose of Yang Yu's trip is to see where snow has spent her
time.

Chapter 40

Name：A Sensualist's Sin Author：Rosemead

+ - Turn off Reset

https://www.novelhall.com/a-sensualist-s-sin-17093/
javascript:void (0);
javascript:void(0)
javascript:void(0)
https://www.novelhall.com/a-sensualist-s-sin-17093/5026585.html
https://www.novelhall.com/a-sensualist-s-sin-17093/5026585.html


Yang Yu also went to Bai Xuejia for the first time.

It's on the side of the village. It's an old house. Many houses in
southern rural areas are built together. For example, five families
contribute to build a large house together and live in a separate place,
which saves resources and is lively. Bai Xue's family lives in the
east of the big house.

The white snow family is very happy to see Yang Yu's arrival. They
quickly find out the stool to sit for Yang Yu in the courtyard, and
specially pour a cup of tea for Yang Yu.

"Miss Yang, is my daughter not good at school? Did she fail the
exam again?"

"I heard that Mr. Yang is a top student. Can my women go to high
school?" The parents asked each other questions.

"Snow White in your family is very good. It's OK to go to high
school." Yang Yu drinks a cup of tea and deliberately tells a lie.
White snow a listen, silly, first don't say whether they are good, but
this high school is certainly not.

"That's good. There are three children in our family. She has two
brothers. They are spoiled by them. They don't know what they are
doing every day. They always shut themselves in the room and don't
let us in." Said, looked at his daughter, can't understand.

Yang Yu and his parents nagging, snow on the side, pretending to do
homework, look at her appearance, do homework that is in torture
her. Yang Yu wants to laugh when she sees it. Forcing someone will
make her crazy.

After chatting for half an hour, I got to know about Bai Xue's family.
Except for her two brothers, there was no problem. She didn't work
much and didn't help her family. It seemed that she was lazy. But
what Yang Yu was more interested in was what she was doing in her
house?

Are you reading yellow books? Yang Yu thinks that girls of this age



can really read romance novels.

"Snow white, can you take the teacher to your room?" Yang Yu
stands up and looks at Bai Xue, but Bai Xue stares big eyes,
obviously not happy.

"Why are you still in a daze? Take Mr. Yang quickly!" Snow
White's mother looks like snow white, no politeness, already scolded.

Bai Xue is extremely reluctant, as if there is something shameful in
the room, but Yang Yu is waiting. Bai Xue wriggles down,
helplessly picks up the textbook, and takes Yang Yu to the back,
muttering in her heart: ah, it's time to be disciplined again!

Yang Yu followed Bai Xue up the stairs and walked through the
wooden floor. The second floor was as big as the first floor, because
the second floor of all families was connected together, but each
family had its own stairs and rooms. Although they were separated
from each other, they could still climb from the east to the West by
climbing the floor.

Snow's room is locked, like a piece of pure land in my heart. Yang
Yu came into the room. The light in the room was very poor. There
was only a small window. However, Yang Yu was frightened by the
room.

There are posters all over the room, most of them are pop stars, such
as Alice, Adam Lambert and even Wang Feng. On the table, there
are some books and songs about music, but there is no radio or MP4.
Yang Yu looked at all the things related to music in the room, and
his eyes were moist.

Suddenly I think of the scene of celebrating New Year's day in
junior high school. When the school band sang beyond's "really love
you" on the stage, Yang Yu fell in love with music completely.

Junior high school dream, junior high school bohemian, junior high
school life in the most youthful and happiest years, Yang Yu once
was the same as her, but finally his dream was strangled in the cradle,
strangled in the system.



Snow has been lowering her head, Yang teacher will think that they
play with things, will certainly be hard to scold themselves.

Singer dream is the dream in Bai Xue's heart, but everyone is
laughing at her. Classmates, friends, brothers, parents, relatives,
playmates, neighbors and so on are laughing at her. You are a rural
girl, but do some "Daydreams" like being a singer!

No one understands Bai Xue, what Yang Yu pursued in that era, and
no one understands. Mrs. Yang Yu knows these students!

Yang Yu turns around and looks like a little white fox. Snow White
rubs her right hand with her left hand. She doesn't dare to look up at
Yang Yu. She scored 28 points in the exam. How can there be drama
in high school?

But!

"Put your head up!" Yang Yu becomes very serious! Bai Xue has to
look up and look at Yang Yu. This time, it's not the discharge, but
the training.

But!

What Yang Yu said changed the fate of Bai Xue's life!

"If you have a dream, you will pursue it without hesitation. If you
want to be a singer, you will show your ruthlessness, let those who
look down on you look up to you, and let those who support you no
longer be disappointed." When Yang Yu said this, his eyes were
firm, just like when he was talking to himself: "my guitar will arrive
next week, when the teacher will teach you to sing!"

White snow open mouth, can't believe what teacher Yang said, tears
suddenly emerged, no one understands her, Yang Yu understood.
White snow suddenly rushed to Yang Yu's arms, crying!

"But you have to know that if you can't go to high school or
university, you won't have the chance to get out of here or get in



touch with real music. There are many beautiful things about music
waiting for you in the University. Can you understand what Mr.
Yang said?" Yang Yu holds Bai Xue's head and presses her on his
chest. He doesn't want the students to take too many detours or be
covered with bruises.It's not the first time that she nods her head!
Bai Xue has been holding Yang Yu and refuses to let go.

"Is it really teacher Yang who teaches me to sing?" White snow a
face of childish ask a way.

"Well! certain. However, "Yang Yu laughs, deliberately selling a
pass:" if you do well in the final exam, the teacher may consider
giving you an mp4 as a gift. "

"Really?" White snow excited fast jump up, why Yang teacher so
understand themselves, understand themselves, know what they
want?

"When did the teacher lie?"

Yang Yu stayed for more than ten minutes. When he wanted to leave,
he did not forget to look back and encourage him. White snow
suddenly very serious said: "teacher Yang, I must study hard, also
must study singing hard, won't let you down!" With that, tears came
out again.

Yang Yu laughs: "well, next time, you can discharge to the teacher
like this, otherwise," Yang Yu points to her deliberately and laughs
obscenely.

White snow vomited tongue, made a grimace: "will, will! Mr. Yang
won't bully me, will he? " It's very cute, and it's really a goblin.

Yang Yu thinks that his students are more and more lovely. Fate
may be completely changed by someone's words!

Night!

Lin Yina and Cui Qiang come to visit Yang Yu. After all, they are
people who have just experienced life and death.



However, when Yang Yu saw them, he felt strange. You know, last
wedding night, he gave his wife up and gave Cui Qiang a green hat.

"Brother Qiang, did you enjoy the wedding night?" Yang Yu talks
about this topic on purpose, and looks at Lin Yina quietly by the way.

When Lin Yina listens to it, she wants to kick Yang Yu downstairs.
If she doesn't open it, she will raise it.

"Cool! Don't mention how wonderful that night, it made my wife
scream! Ha ha "Cui Qiang is still a dog. He likes to boast. But Lin
Yina, with a black face, said in a hurry: "you, don't lose face here, go
back!" Then he gave Yang Yu another look.
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