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This sudden scene was a real shock to me. Although my heart was cold because of 
Chen Tingting, I still subconsciously protected her. But at that moment, I couldn’t even 
take care of myself, let alone protect Chen Tingting. We both got into the van in front of 
everyone. 

“Behave yourself!” 

They just bellowed. 

Once we were in the van, I struggled, but they took control of us by sheer force of 
numbers. He tied us up and gagged us too. Black blindfolds were placed on our heads 
so that we had no idea where, exactly, we were going next. 

I listened to a whimper from Tina Chen’s mouth and became even more anxious. 

I reached into my pockets and was quietly trying to call Uncle Chen. After all, it was just 
a few contacts on my address book. Plus the phone I was using was a Nokia keypad. It 
was also much easier to find Uncle Chen’s phone number. 

It was just that they seemed to have realised my move and just yanked my hand out 
forcibly and took my phone away too. 

There was a pang of sadness in my heart. 

Were we really just going to be taken away like this? There was nothing we could do? In 
between my thoughts, the van suddenly started to lurch. It seemed to be going 
somewhere out of the way. 

“Get out!” 

They yanked on mine and just pulled me off forcibly. 

“Oooh ……” 

There was clearly a note of panic within Chen Tingting’s voice. 

In my desperation, I gave a kick to the person beside me. The other person screamed in 
pain and landed several heavy punches on my body, cursing, “F*ck you, I’ll let you do 
it!” I was in a pang of pain, but I was more worried about Chen Tingting’s situation. 



“What are you …… doing? Let go of me!” Chen Tingting was a cry of alarm. 

My heart was thumping as I listened to her words. I couldn’t make any sound with 
something still stuffed in my mouth. 

“Don’t …… you guys don’t do this!” Chen Tingting even let out a scream. 

And it was her words that were surprisingly accompanied by a sound of clothes tearing. 
When I heard it, my head was instantly blank. 

What should I do? 

Was I just going to watch Chen Tingting being raped and do nothing? 

I couldn’t stop clenching my fists. 

“I’m begging you guys, let me go …… not like this, okay? I’m begging you guys.” Chen 
Tingting was a wail. 

And the other side didn’t even budge. 

“Let you go? Wait until the brothers have had enough first!” They were bullying Chen 
Tingting while laughing exaggeratedly. 

“That’s right!” 

I was already furious to the point of storming out as I listened to their words. I clenched 
my teeth to death, my ears ringing with Chen Tingting’s shrieks, screams and pleas for 
help. Her voice was tinged with despair, humiliation and resignation. But there was 
nothing she could do in this situation at this time. 

They seemed to be too noisy for Chen Tingting, which meant that they gagged her 
again. 

The process turned her voice, into a muffled grunt, with her choking sobs. Neither of 
them took my blindfold off either, nor did they pay any attention to me, they just left me 
alone and ignored me. 

“Okay, stop it!” 

A female voice came in. 

With the click of her heels, the woman, was walking up to Tina Chen. I listened to her 
voice and instantly recognised it. The person who came was Sister Ah Jia! She said to 
Chen Tingting, “Why, you didn’t expect it to be me, did you? You’ve taken so much 
money from me, don’t you think I should get something back on you?” 



And listening to her words, Chen Tingting was a whimpering voice. 

“I don’t care what you think now. I’ve already had the video recorded just now. If you 
don’t want to make a fool of yourself, just listen to me honestly and keep on digging up 
manpower for me. And also open up with this little brother of yours, so that he can do a 
good job for me. Do you, understand?” 

Sister Aja’s words carried an unquestionable tone. 

“I don’t!” 

Chen Tingting’s mouth was loosened, and that was the cry. 

But as soon as her words left her mouth, it was a first class, crisp slap that made my 
heart contract even harder. 

“You don’t have a choice!” 

Sister Aja said with fury. 

Chen Tingting choked back a sob as she responded, “Sister Ah Jia, I’ve done 
everything you said. Ah Chao is also willing to sacrifice himself for me, but why do you 
still have to do this? Why do you have to insult me so much?” 

“Because I don’t see eye to eye with you. How about that, is that reason enough?” 
Sister Aga was the one who let out such a cry. 

As I listened to their words, I had long forgotten what had happened earlier. 

The man in front of me, it seemed, was removing the stuffing from my mouth just as 
Sister Aja had wanted. But what angered me in the process was that by my own 
senses, I took a bite at the man’s hand. The man ate a painful sensation, followed by 
him, was a heavy punch landed on my stomach. 

I gave him such a blow that my whole body trembled slightly in pain. 

But in the process I still rushed at Sister Aja and asked, “Is it true that if I am willing to 
cooperate with you, you can let us go?” 

And Sister Ah Jia said to me, “That also depends on how you are cooperating.” 

As soon as Chen Tingting heard my words, she was telling that I must not promise her. 

She said that as long as we held on, Uncle Chen would definitely find us and get us out. 
But I didn’t want to hear Chen Tingting’s miserable screams of being violated again. I 



gritted my teeth and still said to Sister Aja: Next, I’ll do whatever she wants me to do! 
Absolutely no half-hearted complaints! 

Chen Tingting was crying while she was cursing me silly under her breath, saying that 
what was the use of my agreeing to it? She said that if Sister Ah Jia wanted to do 
something to us, any promise would be useless! 

But that seemed to me to be a ray of hope! 

At least my promise would do something! 

“Okay, take her away!” 

 


