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As he moved closer and closer, Xia Jinsheng sounded an alarm bell in his heart and
tried to turn his head to avoid his kiss.

Where is Gu Nanchen? Suddenly grabbed her chin and accurately printed her lips on
her lips.

They held each other together, and she was pressed by him on the side wall and kissed.

Asshole! Because Xia Jinsheng's hands were still suppressed, the action of hammering
him on the chest was like a spoiled child. It was not painful or itchy.

The cold touch behind her enlarges with the slow heat of her body. In front of her is
the heat that can burn her, and behind her is the cold that tortures people.

The feeling of ice and fire makes people crazy.

At the beginning, it was still a shallow kiss, and slowly began to change its nature. The
spirit tongue pried open her teeth, sometimes heavy and sometimes light, went in and
out of her mouth, and absorbed sweet liquid

"Boo." When the two lips are separated, they make an ambiguous sound, and their
eyes are infected with a bit of emotion.

damn. Accidentally immersed in each other's superb kissing skills, Xia Jinsheng
secretly despised himself again.

When he finally realized that he couldn't let go like this, Xia Jinsheng was almost
scared out of his wits just after turning around.

"Summer rolling!" God, who can tell her why this little guy is here and think of the
absurd thing he just told Gu Nanchen. I don't know how many he was seen?

Think big.



The little guy's big bean eyes stared round, and his surprised little mouth didn't close
for a long time. Who can tell her what's going on?

Gu Nanchen didn't feel embarrassed. He went next to him and picked up the man,
leaving Xia Jinsheng with a goose like face.

The little guy held Gu Nanchen's neck and never forgot the scene he just saw, "second
uncle, what's the matter with my mommy? You... "

Later, the little guy was a little embarrassed and couldn't say it, so he replaced it with a
simple and easy to understand action: two curved thumbs vaguely together.

A kid as big as a kid, Gu Nanchen doesn't understand how she understands these
things.

"I'll be a rolling father from now on, okay?" Carefully put the little guy on the sofa,
and Gu Nanchen took off his things.

Hearing this, the little guy's first reaction was to look up at his mommy and dodge his
eyes. She wants her father. If Mommy doesn't agree, she'd better... Forget it.

Gu Nanchen is so smart that she doesn't know what she means? Yu just looked at Xia
Jinsheng with the same eyes. What does she mean?

She deliberately laughed with her, "I'm so hungry. I'll make noodles."

Before long, the kettle in the kitchen snorted. The little guy touched his stomach and
said, "Mommy, I'm so hungry."

"Huh?" Xia Jinsheng turned her head. It was clear that Gung Gung came in with Gu
Nanchen, but she pretended to only see her.

According to the truth, the little guy in Gu Wensheng can't have missed dinner, so
most of the reason is greedy.

"Have a snack at night? Can your little belly hold it? " Xia Jinsheng looked
suspiciously at her tummy and changed her mouth when she hit her firm eyes, "OK,
let's eat instant noodles."

She just bought two barrels.

Unexpectedly, the little guy shook his head, turned to stand in front of Gu Nanchen,
and pulled his clothes with his small hand, which was very flattering. Xia's voice is
soft and cute, which makes people unable to refuse:



"Second uncle, I'm hungry."

Gu Nanchen touched the little guy's head, went back to the living room, took out the
noodles he bought and boiled them, and took two eggs from the refrigerator to cook
poached eggs.

The little guy was happy to join the fun. When he saw Xia Jinsheng's appearance of
instant noodles, he picked up an adult's posture and taught him a lesson: "Mommy, it's
wrong to eat junk food."

Xia Jinsheng, of course, flipped the little guy's forehead impolitely.

At first she could still eat her mouth, Tucao, make complaints about the South dust,
and then she would be jealous after the egg noodles were cooked.

Damn, how can it be so fragrant.

The way she looks so full of eyes makes people laugh.

"Do you know what that's called?" Gu Nanchen suddenly asked her.

"What?" She didn't react for a moment.

"Eat what's in the bowl and think about what's in the pot."

Xinzhi was teased. Xia Jinsheng had a black thread. Even if Gu Nanchen asked her to
taste it later, she refused on the grounds of "not eating the food that comes".

After taking a bath, she insisted on sleeping on the sofa.

The next morning, I woke up in my bedroom and looked at my Gu Nanchen's eyes.

She pulled the corners of her mouth rigidly and tried to discuss with him: "second
uncle, distance produces beauty. Do you understand? "

Gu Nanchen suddenly waved the ape arm and the sky whirled around. Xia Jinsheng
found himself pressed down by him. There is no gap between them.

"The beauty of zero distance." The man who rises in the morning has a hoarse voice
and a charming magnetic cavity. As soon as he stood up slightly, Xia Jinsheng
immediately understood what zero distance was.

The red glow on his face is burning like the rising red sun in the sky.



"Old rascal!" Xia Jinsheng scolded for lack of confidence. There was no other reason,
but he vaguely felt that a part of him under the quilt had a tendency to look up.

"Huh?" He issued a syllable with a deep smile in his eyes. When he wanted to explore
the beauty of "negative distance" with her, the door of the bedroom was opened from
the outside.

The little guy rubbed his bleary eyes and said vaguely, "Mommy, second uncle, it's
time to get up."

The forbearing expression on his face like constipation suddenly made Xia Jinsheng
hum and laugh.

Like a monologue, the laughter sounded strange, but the owner's pleasure was
expressed through these syllables. The little guy looked at the two people in bed.

"Why does Mommy laugh? Curious? " It's confusing.

Gu Nanchen's face was black, and his big palm quietly swam to her soft waist. The
thin cocoon on his hand immediately aroused the tremor of her body.

"Well, you should..." don't be what she thinks, or you'll never have the face to be a
man in front of the little guy again.

Before he could continue to think deeply, Xia Jinsheng felt a dull pain in her soft waist.
Xia Jinsheng took a breath and pinched her.

In order to prevent him from attacking himself again, Xia Jinsheng jumped out of bed
without saying a word. His face was red and his carved jade bracelet was like an
excellent Red Fuji.

Experienced people can break the beauty between them at a glance. Fortunately, the
little guy is just a child.

Xia Jinsheng thought happily.

"Mommy, were you fighting with goblins just now?"

If she drinks water now, she will spray it out in one mouthful. Rao was so, she was
choked by her saliva.

"Cough, where did you see this?"



"TV."

A brain crippling TV series!

Feeling that mommy seemed angry, Xia Gungun immediately ran three steps and two
steps, dada ran out of the bedroom in small slippers.

"So what did you just think of?" Gu Nanchen came down from the bed and hugged her
from behind.

Xia Jinsheng had a red face and knew that he was just flirting with him. She would not
say, "when he touched his soft waist, he thought it crooked."

After dinner, she was absent from work and went back to Gu's old house. After a
night's work, she suddenly figured out that it's better not to force things that can't be
completed.

Anyway, even if you escape this time, there will be another time.

Chu Yu is enjoying sunbathing in the garden. It is surprising that Chu nianwan will be
there. Is everyone happy to neglect their work recently?

"Sister Jinsheng." Chu nianwan began to say hello at the first sight of her.

She nodded in response. Chu Yu caught a heavy color as soon as she saw Xia
Jinsheng's relaxed smiling face.

"Grandma." Reaching out without hitting the smiling face, even she noticed the subtle
change.

Grandma Chu nodded and her eyes fell on the nearby Chu nianwan. The latter was
stunned first and quickly found an excuse to leave.

"I'll make you tea."

After she left, she and Chu Yu looked at each other. Finally, Xia Jinsheng smiled
helplessly. She knew that it was not easy for the old lady to call herself back this time.

It's really not easy. The old man, who has always been smiling, suddenly became
serious, which makes it difficult for people to adapt.

"You still laugh." Chu Yu's tight nerves also loosened at this moment. She couldn't
help getting up and gave her a "sugar fried chestnut."



Xia Jinsheng quickly lowered his head and let him be at his mercy. He was obedient
and obedient.

"Did your grandpa look for you? Right? " Chu Yu sat back again. Xia Jinsheng took a
careful look at her and sat down in a chair.

The old man acquiesced in her behavior.

"Yes. Grandma, Grandpa bullied me. Obviously, he has passed the audit and has to
invest in practical planning. He called back and asked me to do it again. " Xia Jinsheng
immediately began to accuse her grandfather of his crime in front of grandma Chu.

In fact, Chu nianwan had told Chu Yu about this before she came. Although grandma
Chu was not satisfied with Gu Jun's practice, it was inconvenient for her to intervene
in business.

What matters more is another thing.

"Jin Sheng, to tell you the truth, whose is rolling?" She was worried when she thought
that she was the family's flesh and blood, but she had been living outside. She couldn't
enjoy the happiness of her family.

She has been thinking about taking xiaogungung home. How can she wait?

Xia Jinsheng was surprised, and his face was still calm. He thought of Gu Nanchen
who had got the paternity test. Did he always tell the truth to his family?

"Grandma, why are you still struggling with this?" It's all about monkey years and
horses. She pretended to be embarrassed.

When the old man disagreed, he slapped her on the forehead and asked fiercely,
"speak quickly, otherwise it will make you look good."

She's already pretty. No need to look better.

She dared not say this in front of Chu Yu, but she never said anything about it and said
without hesitation:

"Uncle's." With that, she could not help but silently light Zhu Xiang for Gu Wensheng.
She took him out as an excuse every time. It was really... Handy. When grandma Chu
heard this, she fell into silence first, and then clapped with her big hand, "OK, I'll let
your uncle marry you." Xia Jinsheng was scared to death!
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