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Time flies, and it's late autumn unconsciously.

In just two months, the situation in city a has suddenly risen. First, the president of
Gu's group held a press conference to announce the wedding news, and then its stock
market was turbulent, affecting the economy of the whole city A.

For a while, Gu's group lost hundreds of millions, internal staff were in panic and
rumors were everywhere. However, on the third day, Gu's president, Li Wang Fenglan,
cooperated with international well-known enterprises, which suddenly made a sharp
turn in the stock line on the computer screen.

With the trend of runaway wild horses, the rising trend has been continuously showing,
which has turned the original complaining people around all at once. Many people
became rich overnight, and even went crazy directly.

Gu's group's stock suddenly became a hot pastry in the eyes of everyone, and the
group of people on the board of directors also made a pot of gold foil. Compared with
the previous loss statistics, the company's profit has not only filled the loss, but also
doubled the profit.

Quite different from this is the Ling family, a well-known family in the next city.
Their company's shares fell again and again. The company had problems such as poor
capital operation, which was gloomy for a while.

It is worth mentioning that several tabloid newspapers have reported all kinds of
between Ling jiaqianjin and the president of Gu's group. Finally, they have been sued
in court and lost all their money

Experts watch the doorway and laymen watch the excitement, but there is only one
thing that everyone knows:

Gu Nanchen, this name has once again become a legend in the mall.

At the moment, the legend of the industry lies unprepared on Xia Jinsheng's thigh to
sleep. She was not willing to sleep, but she silenced after her eyes took aim at the
green shadow under his eyes.



Over the past two months, Gu Nanchen has been very busy. Although he didn't say it,
Xia Jinsheng sees it in his eyes. He goes out before dawn every day and comes back
late.

She can't help with things in the company. All she can do is help him look after his
home and take good care of him.

Now she is looking at the ready-made clothing samples sent by Wei Qing. Next month
is his clothing show. Xia Jinsheng, as the finale, is racing against time to absorb
relevant knowledge.

Time slips away from your fingertips bit by bit.

"What are you looking at?" Gu Nanchen opened another eye and saw her staring at the
laptop.

"Wei Qing's design." Xia Jinsheng's eyes didn't move away from the computer screen.
He clicked into QQ to chat with Wei Qing about the clothing show.

Worried that her legs would be numb, Gu Nanchen got up and saw the chat records of
the two people. The sentence "please, girl" made his chest stuffy:

"Are you talking to him?"

"Yes." Xia Jinsheng thought he would do his own thing, but he found a hot look stuck
on his face.

She finally turned around and saw him staring at herself seriously. Her heart trembled,
"what's the matter?"

Gu Nanchen didn't answer either. He reached out and closed her computer. He sat on
the sofa silently. Xia Jinsheng was confused by him.

Well, what's the matter? Is this the legendary "get up gas"?

She didn't dare to continue to use the computer. She looked at him carefully. A flash of
light came into her mind and suggested, "why don't we go and see rolling now?"

Today Saturday, after eating, the little guy went to the crew with ER Chun. Gu
Nanchen neither nodded nor shook his head. Xia Jinsheng dragged people to the crew
when he acquiesced.

The two were outstanding in appearance. The combination of handsome men and



beautiful women attracted attention as soon as they appeared. A staff member stared at
Gu Nanchen and looked at it fiercely. The more he looked, the more familiar he felt.
Later, he patted his forehead and instantly remembered that this person was president
Gu, who had been making a lot of noise a few months ago?

And he was also the biggest investor in the play. The staff immediately became
respectful and quickly informed the director.

It happened that the director had something to leave. The deputy director came, served
tea and poured water, and booed the cold and asked for warmth. He wanted to offer Gu
Nanchen as a living Bodhisattva.

Xia Jinsheng, who is with him, also enjoys special treatment. Xia Jinsheng hates being
treated like this. She can't learn to take care of Nanchen. She is going to find the little
guy.

It happened that Er Chun had come with Xia gungungung. Seeing this scene, he joked:
"Oh, what a big battle!"

"Don't be poor." Xia Jinsheng smiled and patted her on the shoulder. The little guy
immediately rushed over and shouted, "Mommy."

“mua！” She kissed Xia Jinsheng's face, and Xia Jinsheng kissed back. She looked like
a mother and daughter and envied others.

"Cough."

A cough suddenly sounded behind them, which was sent by Gu Nanchen, as if
deliberately reminding them of something. The little guy immediately ran over,
hugged Gu Nanchen's neck and kissed his face, "Dad."

Gu Nanchen touched her soft hair and answered, "HMM."

The interaction between big and small shocked others. What did Xia Gungun call their
investors just now?

dad? Doesn't that mean that she is Gu Nanchen's daughter and the legal successor of
Gu's group in the future. Originally, she thought she could be paid into the crew
background at a young age. Unexpectedly, she was so good.

In order not to be disturbed, they specially found a nearby cafe, which is very close to
the set, so that the little guy can take the last shot in the afternoon.

Since Gu Nanchen became the little guy's father, Xia Jinsheng has been very worried



about rolling things. For example, now, he is patiently feeding ice cream to the little
guy one mouthful at a time.

Er Chun saw this scene in his eyes and teased Xia Jinsheng: "are you married to a rich
family?"

"No!" Xia Jinsheng shook his head and said solemnly, "I am a rich family."

Although she didn't deserve to be beaten, everything she said was true. Er Chun, listen,
how do you think this sentence was once said by a big star?

Most of the time, er Chun and Xia Jinsheng chatted. The little guy and Gu Nanchen
listened quietly and could insert two sentences from time to time without losing their
demeanor.

Because he is a friend of Jinsheng, he also specially changed his silence in the past and
took the initiative to get closer to people.

Before long, er Chun had already patted his chest and promised, "Xia Jinsheng, if you
fail to live up to such a good man as Gu Nanchen, I will be the first to spare you."

Gu Nanchen smiled without saying anything. Xia Jinsheng wanted to lift the table,
"whose friend are you? The guy who forgets his friends. "

"By the way, have you ever thought about renaming the little guy?" Er Chun suddenly
put away his playful smile and said positively.

The play they shot this time is quarterly, which is divided into several sections. Part of
the little guy's shooting has been edited into MV and put on the Internet. From the
overwhelming replies, the little guy has his own group of fans before broadcasting.

Fans even spontaneously established a forum area, a fan group, and the crew called
more or less every day to inquire about the little guy's information.

Considering rolling's privacy, they didn't disclose much. At that time, the post
producer told Er Chun that it was best to think of a stage name for rolling.

No, she's consulting her two guardians now.

"Change your name?" Xia Jinsheng repeated it, vaguely remembering that Gu
Nanchen had said he would change the name of the little guy before.

It's not that she didn't think about the little guy's stage name, but now she gets the
license with Gu Nanchen, but without the recognition of her family, Xia Jinsheng



always has no sense of security.

Now we have to change the name of the little guy. It seems that her four years of hard
life abroad has been deliberately erased.

Her silence was beyond Erchun's comprehension. As long as he opened his mouth, Gu
Nanchen on the opposite side hissed at her. He looked at Xia Jinsheng with warm eyes
and held her catkins.

"I respect your choice." That's what he said.

The little guy's puzzled eyes wandered around everyone. She didn't understand, "why
should I change my name? Isn't rolling special? "

especially? Gu Nanchen remembered that when he first met the little guy, he did say
her name was special. The tip of the heart was soft and couldn't help touching her little
head. "It's very special. We can be a little name, but not a stage name."

"What is a stage name?" She looked at her father with a thirst for knowledge and
refused to give up until she understood it.

Gu Nanchen didn't know how to answer. Xia Jinsheng had solved the siege for him,
"just like your brother and Gu Tan for the rest of your life."

Hearing these two names from her mouth, Gu Nanchen couldn't help frowning. Gu
sighed that he knew it was a gorgeous peacock man. Who was it for the rest of his life?

Thinking that she has widened her circle of friends behind her back, President Gu's
heart is sour.

"What's my name?" The little guy waited for their answer with his chin on his back,
and his heart also gave birth to expectation. Is she going to change her name?

Be sure to pull the bully, cool and super windy!

Otherwise, she would turn to the dictionary at home. She has no literary cells and no
talent for naming.

wait! Literary cell... Xia Jinsheng held Er Chun's hand excitedly, "Xiao Chunchun,
why don't you give the little guy a name?"

Ask her to help with the name? Er Chun's eyes reflexively floated towards Gu
Nanchen. Sure enough, his eyes were cold. The other party had a strong aura and was
not of the same grade at all. She shrank her neck back.



"Xia Yuxiu."

Gu Nanchen took a sip of coffee and slowly spit out these three words.

"Xia Yuxiu?" Xia Jinsheng was stunned for a long time and found that she was talking
about the little guy's name.

Zhong lingyuxiu, these five words came out of her mind for the first time, which is
really suitable for today's little guy. I didn't expect that he would let the little guy with
his surname Xia. Xia Jinsheng's heart was unspeakable warmth.

Er Chun was also very satisfied with the name and casually asked, "how did you think
of the name?"

"I thought about it a long time ago."

A long time ago, I thought about it?

The smile on someone's face successfully froze, and even the sweetness in his heart
dissipated. He patted the table angrily, "agreed to respect my opinion? You thought
about it very early! "

It's unforgivable. Xia Jinsheng breathed heavily, and his delicate face turned red,
which was very vivid.

"Can't you think of it?" Gu Nanchen sipped his coffee again, and his faint eyes silently
condemned her fuss. Xia Jinsheng felt that she had been greatly humiliated. However,
she was helpless. She hesitated and said, "can't I ask Er chun to help me?" Then
zhierchun waved his hand again and again, "I can't do it." Xia Jinsheng: "..." whose
friend was that?
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