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Chapter 1691 

Hearing Zhou Qin’s order, Tang Qingyun and others quickly stopped and stopped 
chasing Zhu Rong. 

clap clap! 

Immediately afterwards, Tang Qingyun walked over and sealed the acupoints of Mu 
Xixi, Song Qian, and Yue Feng. Although the three of Yue Feng were extremely weak at 
this time, they were cultivators after all. Safest. 

I go… This woman is so ugly? 

When he walked to Liu Xuan, Tang Qingyun’s heart skipped a beat, and he couldn’t 
help but feel contempt. This Yue Feng is really romantic, such an ugly woman wants it. 

Thinking to himself, Tang Qingyun waved his hand and instructed the people around 
him, “Just tie this ugly monster directly.” 

Seeing such an ugly woman, she was unlucky when she saw it, and because of the 
resistance in her heart, Tang Qingyun didn’t want to shoot Liu Xuan at all. ‘s cave. 

Moreover, this ugly woman has no inner strength, so she can’t pose a threat to herself, 
and it doesn’t matter if she taps acupuncture points. 

“Spiritual Master Sanjue!” 

At this time, Zhou Qin smiled at Master Sanjue and said, “Today’s affairs are over here. 
In the future, when you Tianquan Sect go to Diyuan Continent, I will definitely entertain 
them. It’s getting late. I won’t bother, we’ll have an appointment later.” 

Although the tone was polite, it was domineering. 

After finishing speaking, Zhou Qin waved his jade hand and ordered a few Yue Feng to 
go down the mountain in a mighty manner. 

For a time, the masters of other continents around stood there, watching Zhou Qin and 
everyone go down the mountain, and no one dared to come out to intercept them. 

Although Zhou Qin is a woman, her strength has reached the realm of transcending 
tribulation, and she has the Dizi magic weapon in her hand. Whoever dares to stop her 
is courting death. 

Zhou Qin is here. 
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After leaving the Tianquan Sect Mountain Gate, under Zhou Qin’s signal, everyone took 
Yue Feng and a few towards the Earth Circle Continent. 

Soon, it got dark. 

After walking for a long time, seeing that the night was getting darker, Zhou Qin 
motioned everyone to stop and found an abandoned cottage to rest. 

This cottage was hidden among the mountains and mountains. It was originally the 
base camp of a bandit, but it was later destroyed, and the cottage was empty. 

Although the cottage is not big, the layout is complete, not only a place to rest, but also 
a stone prison. 

Yue Feng, Mu Xixi, Liu Xuan and Song Qian were naturally locked in the stone prison. 

“Squeak–“ 

As soon as he was locked in the stone cell, Yue Feng heard the cell door being gently 
pushed open, followed by a woman who walked in slowly. There was a sneer of pride 
on his beautiful face. 

It was Zhou Qin! 

Behind Zhou Qin, Hao Jian followed closely, also like a fox and a tiger. 

“Yue Feng!” 

When he got to the front, Zhou Qin said with a leisurely face: “Did you not expect that 
one day you will fall into my hands?” 

At the same time, Zhou Qin couldn’t help looking at Mu Xi next to him. Xi and Song 
Qian both had gloomy eyes. 

“Zhou Qin!” 

Yue Feng took a deep breath, endured the pain on his body, and said word by word: 
“The grievance between you and me is a matter of the two of us, don’t involve others, 
so, I stay, you You can do whatever you want with me, but Xuan’er and my little sister, 
you have to let them go!” The 

voice fell, Yue Feng stared at Zhou Qin with sincerity and seriousness on his face. 

Yue Feng knew that Zhou Qin did this just to take revenge because of his grudge. 



However, Xuan’er and Song Qian’s master and apprentice are both innocent. 

Zhou Qin chuckled lightly, her beautiful face was cold and arrogant, and she did not 
respond. 

“Yue Feng!” 

At this time, Hao Jian took a step forward, looked at Yue Feng playfully, and sneered: 
“What qualifications do you still have, and Qin… Zhou League’s chief explorer 
conditions? You are now a prisoner, a prisoner of you. Do you understand?” 

He originally wanted to call him ‘Qin’er’, but thinking of Zhou Qin’s anger before, he 
immediately changed his words. 

However, Hao Jian didn’t care about this at this time. When he saw Yue Feng being 
arrested, he only had endless joy in his heart. This Yue Feng was originally a door-to-
door son-in-law in Donghai City, and he was just a waste. Become a mainland hero. 

Chapter 1692 

What’s even more irritating is that I was abused by him countless times before. 

But today, Yue Feng was seriously injured and arrested, and he can finally let out his 
anger. 

The more he thought about it, the more relaxed his heart became, he sneered, walked 
slowly to Yue Feng, and said jokingly, “Yue Feng, weren’t you very good before? 
Tianmen sect master, or a mainland hero, why? You can’t look up now?” 

Shabi! 

Seeing Hao Jian’s schadenfreude on his face, Yue Feng ignored it and cursed inwardly. 

“Fuck you, and pretend it to me?!” Hao Jian shouted angrily, then he raised his foot and 
was about to kick towards Yue Feng. 

Yue Feng clenched his fists tightly, it was really the case that the tiger fell and Pingyang 
was bullied by the dog! Even if he was arrested, he would be humiliated by Hao Jian! 

So frustrating! 

Liu Xuan next to her, with a trembling body, was about to come over to block Yue Feng, 
but her hands and feet were tightly bound, so she couldn’t move at all. 

“Go to the side!” 



At this critical moment, Zhou Qinjiao shouted. 

Hao Jian raised his feet halfway and withdrew abruptly, and immediately turned to Zhou 
Qin in a puzzled manner: “Zhou Alliance Leader, this Yue Feng is a stone in a ditch, 
stinky and hard, I’m here to help you teach him a lesson. ..” 

When he said this, Hao Jian didn’t forget to give Yue Feng a hard look. 

“I don’t need you to teach me a lesson.” Zhou Qin’s face did not fluctuate at all, and she 
said coldly: “Retreat for me!” The voice was not loud, but there was a strong aura 
around him, no doubt. 

To be honest, although Zhou Qin hated Yue Feng deeply, but in her heart, in the world, 
the only person who can humiliate Yue Feng is herself, not anyone else. 

Gudong! 

Feeling Zhou Qin’s powerful breath, Hao Jian was like an eggplant beaten by frost, 
secretly swallowed his saliva, lowered his head, did not dare to refute a word, and left in 
a daze. 

Looking at Hao Jian’s leaving back, Yue Feng secretly exhaled. 

Nima, Hao Jian, this waste, also relied on Zhou Qin’s power to leave Zhou Qin, and it’s 
not shit. 

“Yue Feng!” 

At this moment, Zhou Qin stared at Yue Feng with mockery in his eyes: “You want me 
to let them go? Do you want to make a statement first? Please me.” 

“Zhou Qin, I beg You let them go!” Yue Feng sighed in his heart and said. 

“Tsk tsk!” 

Zhou Qin curled his lips and shook his head in dissatisfaction: “It’s not enough to just 
beg with your mouth, you have to take action.” 

When saying this, Zhou Qin’s beautiful face was full of playfulness. 

Phew… 

Yue Feng took a deep breath, and his heart suddenly became entangled. He knew what 
Zhou Qin meant and wanted to kneel down and apologize. 



However, Zhou Qin killed Brother Wen’s wife before, and later killed the head of the 
Huashan faction to frame himself. All of this is because she was at fault first, why did 
she kneel to her? 

However, if they didn’t kneel, Xuan’er and Song Qian would be in danger. 

Pfft! 

A few seconds later, Yue Feng bent his legs, knelt in front of Zhou Qin, and said, “Zhou 
Qin, is this all right? I beg you, let them go, whatever you want, come at me. .” 

When he said the last sentence, Yue Feng looked at Zhou Qin closely, with anticipation 
in his eyes. 

At this time, Yue Feng decisively let go of his dignity. 

If you can’t even protect your own woman, what do you need dignity for? 

“Husband…” 

At this moment, Liu Xuan couldn’t help crying, and her tears fell: “Get up, get up, I don’t 
want you to kneel to her!” 

At the same time, Mu Xixi, who had been silent, , also looked closely at Yue Feng, 
slightly moved. 

This Yue Feng, in order to save himself, actually knelt down. 
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“Hehe…” Looking at Yue Feng who was kneeling in front of him, Zhou Qin chuckled 
lightly: “Yue Feng, you are really a jerk, kneel when you say kneeling. Now you are 
begging me, you Have you ever thought about how you treated me when I begged you? 
Do you know how uncomfortable I was when I begged you to forgive me?” 

“You know the time when you rejected me, I was How did you come here? Let me tell 
you, you forced me to become what I am now. Also, Liu Xuan, Song Qian, Mu Xixi, 
these three women, it is impossible for me to let go, not only will I not let them go, I also 
want to make your little sister into an elixir in front of you.” 

“Because, I swore that what you did to me in the past, I, Zhou Qin, will be repaid a 
hundredfold.” 

Speaking of the last sentence, Zhou Qin’s beautiful face showed endless coldness. 



To be honest, Zhou Qin didn’t want to involve others in the grievances with Yue Feng, 
but seeing an ugly woman and Yue Feng have such a good relationship, Yue Feng was 
even more of Mu Xixi’s master and apprentice, and knelt down and begged to herself. 
Love, Zhou Qin’s inner jealousy, was suddenly stimulated. 

“You…” 

Feeling Zhou Qin’s resentment, Yue Feng was frightened and angry, his eyes 
darkened, and he almost fainted. 

“Yue Feng!” 

Seeing that Yue Feng was silent, Zhou Qin was too lazy to talk nonsense, and said 
coldly: “There is nothing to talk about between us, before dawn, I will make your little 
sister alchemy, and enjoy your last time together. Let’s go.” The 

voice fell, Zhou Qin turned around and left gracefully. 

For a while, there was silence in the stone prison, and a drop of a needle could be 
heard clearly. 

Yue Feng sat with his head down and leaned against the corner, feeling extremely 
depressed. 

Nima! 

It’s definitely not going to work to plead with Zhou Qin, but you can’t watch Song Qian 
helplessly and be turned into an elixir. 

“Yue Feng.” At this moment, Mu Xixi next to him said softly: “Don’t worry, there will 
always be a way. It’s still early before dawn, let’s all try to see if we can push the 
acupuncture point. On!” 

Hmm! 

Yue Feng nodded, then closed his eyes and recovered his inner strength silently. 

Time passed by minute by minute. 

Squeak! 

I don’t know how long it took, I heard the cell door being gently pushed open, and then, 
a figure flashed in quickly. 

Oops! 



Zhou Qin won’t change her mind, she should take Song Qian out to make alchemy in 
advance. 

Hearing the movement, Yue Feng quickly opened his eyes and was stunned when he 
saw the scene in front of him. 

I saw the person who came in a black robe, with a wretched smile on his face, 
indescribably cunning, and at the same time, he looked very careful and sneaky! 

It was Tang Qingyun. 

Nima! 

What is this scumbag? 

Seeing Tang Qingyun, Yue Feng couldn’t help but curse. 

Tangjiabao, in the Earth Circle Continent, can be regarded as a small and famous 
cultivation family. It has been passed down for hundreds of years and has some 
background in the rivers and lakes. As the owner of the castle, Tang Qingyun is like a 
pug in front of Zhou Qin, flattering and flattering. No man’s dignity at all. 

This kind of person, Yue Feng is the most contemptuous. 

At the same time, Mu Xixi and Liu Xuan also frowned, secretly vigilant. 

This Tang Qingyun, coming to prison so late, must be fine. 

Chapter 1694 “Sect Master 

Yue!” 

Tang Qingyun walked over slowly, flattering at Yue Feng: “Don’t stare at me like that, I 
will help Zhou Qin deal with you during the day, and I have no choice but to!” 

Immediately, Tang Qingyun watched carefully I went outside, making sure no one was 
eavesdropping, so I continued with a smiling face: “Sect Master Yue, in my heart, you 
are the true leader of the Earth Circle Continent, but unfortunately, today’s luck is not 
good, and I have suffered such a great disaster. Keep it in your eyes, keep it in your 
heart!” 

When he said this, Tang Qingyun’s face was sincere, but he had his own little Jiujiu in 
his heart. Tonight, Tang Qingyun came to Yue Feng secretly, just to get Yue Feng’s 
Fang Tianhuaji. During the day, he was shocked when he saw Yue Feng release Fang 
Tianhuaji. If you can get this artifact yourself, that’s fine! 



Haha… 

Yue Feng has been in the world for a long time, and at a glance, it can be seen that 
Tang Qingyun has ulterior motives and is too lazy to talk nonsense. He sneered: “Stop 
talking nonsense, what do you want to do?” 

Seriously, a villain like Tang Qingyun, Yue Feng used to I won’t look directly, but now I 
can’t help myself, and I have to deal with him. 

“Hehe…” 

Tang Qingyun squeezed out a smile and said seriously: “Sect Master Yue, you are such 
a peerless talent, but now you are a prisoner, it is really embarrassing, to be honest, I 
don’t want to see it in my heart. You end up like this. Sect Master Yue is also a cheerful 
person, so I’ll just say it straight, I’ll find a way to let you go in the dead of night, but 
there is one condition, you will give me Fang Tianhuaji.” 

After saying this, Tang Qingyun looked closely at Yue Feng, flickering with anticipation. 

Tang Qingyun stared at Yue Feng closely, waiting for his response, with excitement and 
anticipation flashing in his eyes. 

Tang Qingyun thought to himself, if he owns Fang Tianhuaji, he doesn’t need to 
condescend to be by Zhou Qin’s side and be a minion and lackey. With his own 
strength, he can revitalize Tangjiabao! 

At the same time, Tang Qingyun also kept an eye on the movement outside and was 
extremely cautious. Zhou Qin must not know about this matter, otherwise, Tangjiabao 
would be over. 

At this time, facing Tang Qingyun’s expectant gaze, Yue Feng did not respond, but 
sneered. 

It turned out that this evil brush was trying to get Fang Tianhuaji. No wonder it’s sneaky. 

“Sect Master Yue!” 

Seeing Yue Feng’s unwillingness to respond, Tang Qingyun became a little anxious, 
and said bitterly: “You don’t need to tell me about your own situation, you are very clear 
in your heart, tomorrow morning, your little sister will You and the other two beauties will 
end up in danger if you are going to be made into an elixir by Zhou Qin. A Fang Tianhua 
halberd will give you four lives, it’s worth it!” 

Tang Qingyun couldn’t help but look at Mu Xixi. 



It has to be said that this Mu Xixi is worthy of being the famous qin sage in Kyushu. 
Even if he is tied up with five flowers and is so embarrassed, his aloof and elegant 
temperament is still fascinating. 

Gudong! 

After watching for a few seconds, Tang Qingyun couldn’t help swallowing secretly. 

If it wasn’t for the eagerness to get Fang Tianhuaji and unwilling to offend Yue Feng, Mu 
Xixi would really like to feel her tenderness. 

“Tang Qingyun, you also want to get Fang Tianhuaji?” At this moment, Yue Feng 
chuckled and said coldly. 

Um? 

Tang Qingyun was stunned. 

Yue Feng took a deep breath and continued: “Fang Tian Hua Ji is the magic weapon 
that Lu Bu used to conquer the world in the past, only a great hero who stands upright 
in the sky and a great hero can have it, and you, although you are the owner of the 
Tang family castle, you rely on it. With Zhou Qin, foxes and tigers everywhere, a villain, 
what qualifications do you have to own Fang Tianhuaji? Do you deserve it?” 

Do you deserve it? 

Three words, like an invisible sledgehammer, slammed into Tang Qingyun’s heart. 

Swish! 

Tang Qingyun’s face changed, and he was about to explode with anger. He pointed at 
Yue Feng’s nose and cursed: “I don’t know what’s wrong, I’m not a hero, are you? Even 
if you are a hero, haven’t you been arrested yet? “ 

This Yue Feng tried to persuade himself, but he humiliated himself in turn. 

It’s just too nasty! 

Chapter 1695 

“Let’s go!” Yue Feng looked at Tang Qingyun, spoke lightly, then closed his eyes and 
continued to close his eyes to rest. 

To deal with this kind of villain, Yue Feng was too lazy to say a word. 



Although Tang Qingyun’s conditions were indeed very attractive, Yue Feng despised 
this duplicitous person from the bottom of his heart, and would rather die than violate his 
principles. 

More importantly, a person like Tang Qingyun has no credit at all. Even if he handed 
over Fang Tianhuaji, he would not let him go. 

What! 

Don’t know how to lift! 

Tang Qingyun suddenly became anxious, and the more anxious he became, the more 
angry he became. He drew out his long sword and placed it on Yue Feng’s neck with a 
fierce expression: “Hide Fang Tianhuaji and take it out for me!” 

When he said this, Tang Qingyun’s eyes Murderous intent pervades. 

Taking such a big risk by myself, I secretly came to discuss the terms with Yue Feng, 
but I was so busy that I didn’t even see the shadow of Fang Tianhuaji, and it was 
impossible for anyone to be calm! 

hiss! 

Seeing this scene, Liu Xuan’s body trembled, she couldn’t help but gasped, her heart 
was hanging, her eyes were full of tension and worry. 

Next to Mu Xixi, also frowned, secretly pinched a cold sweat for Yue Feng. 

Although he is not familiar with Tang Qingyun, Mu Xixi can also see that this person has 
despicable methods. He really kills. 

However! 

Yue Feng has a calm and relaxed expression on his face! 

call! 

Feeling the coldness from the blade, Yue Feng breathed a sigh of relief, and said lightly 
to Tang Qingyun: “Fang Tianhuaji is not available, there is a life, if you want it, take it!” 

After so many years of experience, Yue Feng is already a veteran, and he has a clear 
understanding of Tang Qingyun’s heart! 

Before getting Fang Tianhuaji, Tang Qingyun didn’t dare to do anything to himself. 

Hearing this, Tang Qingyun almost exploded with anger! 



Ma De, this Yue Feng is soft and hard to eat, what can I do? 

The next second, seeing Mu Xixi next to him, Tang Qingyun’s mind changed, and he 
suddenly had an idea. 

“Yue Feng.” 

Tang Qingyun chuckled and slowly walked towards Mu Xixi: “This qin sage is also your 
confidante, your own life is not as good as a Fangtianhuaji, then What about the 
innocence of this qin sage?” 

After speaking, Tang Qingyun had already reached Mu Xixi, she couldn’t help but 
stretched out a finger and lifted her chin, her tone was a bit playful, in Mu Xixi’s ear On 
the side, he said softly: “Qin Sheng beauty? With such a beautiful night scene, let me 
accompany you well!” 

“Take your hand!” 

Mu Xixi’s delicate body trembled, and her beautiful face was instantly filled with frost. 
Cloth, he shouted coldly. 

Swish! 

At this moment, Yue Feng’s eyes were also extremely blood red. 

“Tang Qingyun!” In the 

next second, Yue Feng’s voice was as cold as hell: “Today, if you dare to touch her with 
a finger, I will wash your Tang Family Fort with blood!” 

With that, Yue Feng stared at Tang Qingyun closely. , continued word by word: “If you 
are smarter, let us go, otherwise, you will regret it!” To be 

honest, Yue Feng didn’t want to pay attention to Tang Qingyun so much, but at this time 
he was completely angry. 

This villain, unable to do both hard and soft, actually caught Mu Xixi’s attention. 

A month ago, Yue Feng and Mu Xixi made a bet that as long as they unified three or 
four continents and became emperor, Mu Xixi would agree to be her woman. 

Although Yue Feng hasn’t done it yet, in his heart, Mu Xixi will not allow others to taint 
her! At this time, Tang Qingyun dared to hit Mu Xixi’s attention, which touched Yue 
Feng’s bottom line at once. 
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Chapter 1696 

Gudong! 

Feeling the killing intent in Yue Feng’s eyes, Tang Qingyun’s heart trembled, and he 
couldn’t help swallowing. 

As the sect master of Tianmen, Yue Feng has always done what he says. In the hall of 
Shangwu Academy, Yue Feng said in front of many experts in the arena and said that 
he would level Kunlun within three days, but within three days, Kunlun was truly The 
door was knocked out. 

And his own Tang Family Fort is just a second-rate cultivation family. Yue Feng wants 
to destroy it, but it only takes minutes. 

But after thinking about it, Yue Feng is now a prisoner, and Tang Qingyun suddenly 
came back with confidence. 

“Nima’s!” 

Tang Qingyun shouted angrily and slapped Yue Feng’s face without warning. 

“Crack!” 

Tang Qingyun was full of anger with this slap! He staggered Yue Feng’s body and 
almost knelt on the ground, a bright red slap print immediately appeared on his face. 

Tang Qingyun’s face was full of hideousness, this Yue Feng was too abhorrent, he 
didn’t eat hard and soft, and finally dared to threaten himself. I can’t stand it! 

hiss! 

Seeing this scene, Liu Xuan’s delicate body trembled, exclaimed, and cried, “Stop, 
stop…don’t hit my husband!” 

Mu Xixi frowned, also extremely angry, and at the same time a feeling of anger rose in 
her heart. A warm current. 



This Yue Feng is unable to protect himself, and he has to stand up for himself. 

call! 
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Yue Feng gritted his teeth and stared at Tang Qingyun, his heart was full of anger and 
anger. 

Nima, if it wasn’t because of the severe injuries before, the internal strength had not 
recovered, and the acupoints could not be broken through, would I be humiliated by a 
villain like Tang Qingyun? 

but! As long as he can keep Mu Xixi’s innocence, it doesn’t matter if he is slapped a few 
times. 

“Dare to stare at me?” Tang Qingyun sneered, his face full of grimness, showing a bit of 
ruthlessness: “Yue Feng, even if you were once the leader of the Earth Circle Continent 
and your reputation spread all over the Kyushu Continent, now you are just a prisoner. 
A poor bastard, you still want to bloodbath my Tangjiabao? You tell me, you can’t 
protect yourself now, how can you bloodbath my Tangjiabao, what do you think?” 

When he shouted these words, Tang Qingyun’s face was full of madness. 

Anyway, he had already offended Yue Feng, and he would regard Tangjiabao as an 
enemy whether he was beaten or not. 

As long as you get Fang Tianhuaji, even if Yue Feng comes to you in the future, you will 
not be afraid! 

Thinking about it, Tang Qingyun’s eyes flashed with cold light, and he raised his hand 
again! 

“Stop!” 

At this moment, Liu Xuan was completely anxious, and she didn’t know where the 
strength came from, she rushed over and blocked in front of Yue Feng. 

Before Liu Xuan, because she was considered too ugly, her acupoints were not sealed. 
At this time, although Liu Xuan’s hands and feet were tied, she could still move around 
a little bit. Seeing Yue Feng being beaten at this time, Liu Xuan became anxious and 
couldn’t bear it any longer. 

“Go away!” 



Tang Qingyun pushed her casually, Liu Xuan couldn’t stabilize her figure, fell to the 
ground, her forehead hit the stone wall, and a trace of blood oozes out. 

“Xuan’er!” Yue Feng was so heartbroken that he couldn’t help shouting. 

It’s really useless. 

Xuan’er has become like this for her own sake. She hasn’t compensated her well yet. At 
the critical moment, she still needs her protection! 

Swish! 

However, Tang Qingyun still felt displeased, his eyes locked on Liu Xuan, and his eyes 
flashed fiercely: “Ugly bastard, you are courting death!” 

“Crack!” The 

voice fell, and Tang Qingyun slapped Liu Xuan’s face fiercely! 

Just as Liu Xuan was about to struggle, she was knocked to the ground again, half of 
her face was swollen, and a trace of blood flowed from the corner of her mouth! 

Chapter 1697 

Tang Qingyun was already very annoyed that Yue Feng didn’t hand over Fang 
Tianhuaji. At this time, seeing Liu Xuan doing something bad, Tang Qingyun added fuel 
to the fire. 

“Xuan’er!” Yue Feng shouted frantically with red eyes, his voice hoarse instantly. 

At this time, Yue Feng was heartbroken, and wanted to rush over and hold Liu Xuan in 
his arms, but he had used up too much internal energy before. 

“Tang Qingyun!” 

Yue Feng’s eyes were blood red and he roared wildly at Tang Qingyun: “If you dare to 
hurt Xuan’er, I, Yue Feng, will destroy your Tang family fort and wash your Tang family 
with blood! 

” The wind will definitely destroy your Tang family fort and wash your Tang family with 
blood.” 

This roar echoed endlessly in the stone prison! 

At this moment, Mu Xixi, who was next to her, bit her lip and wanted to go up to help, 
but the acupuncture point was blocked and she couldn’t move at all. 



“Haha…” 

Listening to Yue Feng’s roar, Tang Qingyun laughed loudly: “Yue Feng, at this point, 
you still want to threaten me? Let me tell you, if you don’t hand over Fang Tianhuaji 
today, I will Kill this ugly monster first, and then spend a good night with the beautiful 
Qin Sheng.” 

At this time, Tang Qingyun was also completely insane, and in order to get Fang 
Tianhuaji, he completely sacrificed himself. 

As soon as the words fell, Tang Qingyun raised his right hand and slapped Liu Xuan 
fiercely! 

“Husband…” Seeing Tang Qingyun’s slap in the face, Liu 

Xuan burst into tears and cried at Yue Feng, “Xuan’er can’t serve you in this life, let’s 
see you in the next life.” 

Xuan closed her eyes in despair. 

Liu Xuan has no inner strength, she can’t stop any cultivator, let alone Tang Qingyun. 

Seeing that this palm was about to hit Liu Xuan, Yue Feng closed his eyes, his eyes 
were as red as he looked. 

“Shameless villain, don’t touch my brother and sister!” At this moment, a roar came from 
outside the stone prison. 

Immediately afterwards, a burly and fiery red figure, like a dazzling flame, rushed in 
quickly, and his face was full of anger! The breath that permeates the whole body is 
even more amazing! 

It is Zhu Rong! 

“Brother Zhu Rong!” Yue Feng was surprised and happy, and couldn’t help shouting. 

Zhu Rong laughed, and then his internal power exploded, and a palm hit Tang Qingyun. 

hiss! 

How did this man break in? 

Tang Qingyun was shocked and wanted to dodge, but Zhu Rong was too fast, so he 
just gritted his teeth and attacked. 

clang! 



In an instant, Tang Qingyun and Zhu Rong slammed into each other’s hands, and they 
heard Tang Qingyun screaming in agony. Blood spurted from the whole person, and his 
body flew up instantly, slammed into the stone wall behind, fell heavily, and his eyes 
were black. I don’t know life or death! 

“Shameless villain! It’s not a pity to die!” 

Zhu Rong didn’t even look at Tang Qingyun, muttered, and walked quickly inside. 

When he got to the front, Zhu Rong laughed at Yue Feng and said, “Haha, brother Yue 
Feng, how is it? I have to come and save you, brother!” 

When he was talking, Zhu Rong was full of pride. 

Previously in Tianquan Zongshanmen Square, Zhu Rong was besieged by Zhou Qin’s 
crowd, outnumbered and had to escape. But in fact, Zhu Rong did not run far, but hid at 
the foot of the mountain. 

Zhu Rong and Yue Feng, although they didn’t have much contact time, but because 
they were confidants, how could he bear to ignore Yue Feng’s arrest now? 

Therefore, after Zhou Qin and the others left Tianquan Sect, Zhu Rong followed quietly 
behind. At this time, taking advantage of the stillness of the night, he sneaked in and 
was about to rescue Yue Feng and the others, but he saw Tang Qingyun was killing Liu 
Xuan. 

“Brother Zhu Rong!” Yue Feng was extremely excited, and at the same time he shouted 
anxiously: “Quick, look at Xuan’er! Untie her first!” 

Just now Liu Xuan was slapped for herself, and Yue Feng was very distressed. 
Moreover, Liu Xuan has no internal strength now, and her physique is weaker than that 
of ordinary people. It must be very uncomfortable to be tied up for so long! 

Um! 

Hearing this, Zhu Rong responded, turned around and walked over, helped Liu Xuan 
up, and untied the rope on her body. 

Whoops! 

It was at this time that footsteps were heard outside the stone prison. 

Whoa! 

At the same time, at the exit of the stone prison, a torch was lit up! 



Oops! 

Seeing the situation outside, Yue Feng’s heart suddenly burst, and the whole person 
was anxious! 

I saw that outside the stone prison, hundreds of experts from all corners of the world 
were guarding there. Zhou Qin, the leader, was wearing a long black dress. 

Obviously, the movement in the stone prison just now caught Zhou Qin’s attention, and 
he immediately brought someone here! 

Chapter 1698 

Nima! 

This week, Qin came too fast! 

At this moment, Yue Feng wanted to cry without tears! Although Zhu Rong came in time 
to save Liu Xuan, how could Zhou Qin be able to stop so many people! 

Yue Feng clearly felt that Zhu Rong’s strength had not fully recovered. After all, when 
he was robbing treasures during the day, he was attacked by Zhou Qin, and the punch 
was too hard. 

Swish! 

Zhu Rong also frowned, his face gloomy, secretly thinking about countermeasures. 

“Yue Feng!” 

Finally, Zhou Qin showed a smile. In the smile, he couldn’t hide the anger and coldness: 
“I didn’t expect that you would end up like this, and someone would come to rescue 
you!” 

Yue Feng did not speak, but remained silent. looked at him silently. 

Zhou Qin tilted his head to look at Zhu Rong, and joked: “You are not too brave, you 
escaped during the day, and you dare to send it to the door at night?” 

After saying that, Zhou Qin saw Tang Qingyun who was unconscious inside, and her 
brows were tight. Locked, I suddenly felt a little doubt in my heart. 

Zhou Qin was thoughtful and could tell at a glance that Tang Qingyun was here before 
he came. 

In the middle of the night, what is Tang Qingyun doing in the dungeon? 



Thinking in her heart, Zhou Qin didn’t think too much, stared at Zhu Rong and said: 
“Zhu Rong, although you are very strong, but depending on your situation, the internal 
strength consumed during the day has not fully recovered, if you are smarter, just 
Obediently begging for mercy.” 

Hu… 

Zhu Rong took a deep breath and chuckled: “Baby girl, I, Zhu Rong, have never known 
what surrender is, if you have the ability, just let the horse come over!” 

When saying this, Zhu Rong Yi Fearless face. 

Yue Feng’s perception is correct, Zhu Rong’s internal strength has indeed not 
completely recovered! With so many people in Zhou Qin, they can’t handle it at all! 

But he is a dignified fire god, who has lived for thousands of years, what scene has he 
not seen? If you compromise with a younger generation in Jianghu, where will you put 
your face? 

“Okay, very good!” 

Hearing this, Zhou Qin’s pretty face changed, and she stopped talking nonsense. She 
pointed at Zhu Rongjiao and shouted, “Take him down for me!” 

Swish swish… 

The voice fell, and the masters of various sects behind him , they exploded their inner 
strength and charged directly towards Zhu Rong! 

“Haha..” 

Looking at the many masters rushing up, Zhu Rong laughed loudly, and his body was 
filled with endless fighting intent: “Girl, you don’t have a good time during the day, now 
this old man will accompany you guys and have a good time! “ 

Om! 

As soon as the voice fell, a terrifying aura erupted from Zhu Rong’s body, and then, the 
figure flashed and rushed directly into the crowd! 

Bang Bang Bang…. 

Zhu Rongdu Tribulation Realm strength, although the internal strength has not 
completely recovered, the aura of the explosion is also very powerful, at this time one 
person rushed over, like a tiger entering a flock, only to hear a scream, and in the blink 
of an eye , there are more than a dozen masters fell down! 



call! 

Seeing this scene, Yue Feng’s heart was raised in his throat, both excited and worried. 

Zhu Rong deserves to be the God of Vulcan, this ‘one husband is in charge, ten 
thousand husbands can’t open’ momentum is not something ordinary people have! 

It’s just that Zhou Qin has so many experts in all corners of the world, can he beat it? 

Mu Xixi and Liu Xuan next to them were also anxious. 

hateful! 

Seeing that his subordinates had been injured so much by Zhu Rong in the blink of an 
eye, Zhou Qin’s face was flushed red and extremely angry. 

The next second, Zhou Qinyu raised his hand and shouted: “Give it to me and kill him.” 

This Zhu Rong is so strong and Yue Feng’s friend, keeping it is a scourge! 

Originally, Zhou Qin planned to capture Zhu Rong alive, but seeing that he was so 
brave and continued to fight, his own people would surely be killed and injured more, so 
it would be better to kill him directly. 

Whoosh … 

Hearing Zhou Qin’s orders, more experts in the rivers and lakes, one by one, motivated 
their inner strength, and rushed towards Zhu Rongyuefeng like a tide! 

“Woo!” At the same time, Zhou Qin took out the Cui Xian Flute and played it beside her 
red lips. 

hum! 

The quiet sound of the flute sounded, causing the fluctuation of the rhythm, which 
instantly enveloped the entire cottage. 

Feeling the powerful rhythm fluctuations, Zhu Rong was immediately affected. He only 
felt that his whole head was buzzing and his speed slowed down. 

Chapter 1699 

Hearing Zhou Qin playing the Cui Xian flute, Yue Feng, Mu Xixi and the others quickly 
covered their ears. Even so, I felt my blood surging and I couldn’t breathe. 

“Clang!” 



At this moment, taking advantage of this opportunity, Zhou Qin’s toes were a little on the 
ground, and she was astonished. She raised her jade hand and quickly shot towards 
Zhu Rong! 

Zhou Qin’s speed was very fast, Zhu Rong was already injured, and at this time, he was 
also affected by the flute, so he didn’t have time to dodge! 

“Bang!” 

This palm was placed on Zhu Rong’s shoulder, only to hear Zhu Rong groaning, 
staggering back a few steps, his face pale, and he spurted a mouthful of blood. 

“Zhu Rong, you have no way out, die!” Zhou Qin showed a sneer. 

Zhu Rong didn’t respond, took two steps back, stood in front of Yue Feng and the 
others with a firm expression. 

Today, no matter what, we have to save the Yue Fengs! 

“Brother Zhu Rong!” 

Seeing this scene, Yue Feng was both moved and worried, and couldn’t help shouting: 
“Don’t worry about us, let’s go first!” 

Yue Feng could see that although Zhu Rong was seriously injured, this If he wanted to 
escape, Zhou Qin and the others couldn’t stop him, but if Big Brother Zhu wanted to 
escape with the four of him, it would be difficult! 

“No!” Zhu Rong gritted his teeth and shook his head: “I have to take you away today.” 

Yue Feng was in a hurry and shouted: “Keep the green hills, not afraid of running out of 
firewood, I wish you big brother, go quickly, If you feel bad about it, take Xuan’er away, 
I’ll be fine!” 

When he said this, Yue Feng glanced at Liu Xuan with tenderness in his eyes. 

Zhu Rong broke out with all his strength, and at most he could take away one person. 
He, Mu Xixi, and Song Qian were all cultivators. Maybe they could find a chance to 
escape. And Liu Xuan has no internal strength and is the weakest in physique. If she 
stays here, she will definitely not be able to hold on. 

“Little brother Yue Feng, I’m sorry for you!” Zhu Rong clenched his fists, but finally gave 
in, nodded and said, “Then I’ll take my younger brother and sister away first!” After the 

voice fell, Zhu Rong walked over and grabbed Liu Xuan. hand. 



“I’m not going, I’m not going!” 

Liu Xuan cried, struggling at the same time, she finally reunited with Yue Feng, solved 
the misunderstanding, and said nothing to separate. It’s just that Zhu Rong’s wrist is 
tightly held, and he can’t break free at all. 

“Brother and sister, don’t worry, I’ll come back to save him if I have a chance!” Zhu 
Rong said quickly, then slapped the palm of his hand, knocking back the few people in 
front of him, and then rushed out with Liu Xuan. 

Outside the stone prison, Zhu Rong tapped the ground with his toes, took Liu Xuan into 
the air, and left the cottage. 

“Husband, husband…” In midair, Liu Xuan’s tears kept flowing, her voice was hoarse. 

At this time, she didn’t care about her life or death at all, she just wanted to be with Yue 
Feng. 

“Xuan’er!” 

Seeing this scene, Yue Feng’s heart was cut like a knife, and he shouted: “You leave 
with Big Brother Zhu Rong first, don’t worry about me, my little sister and I will be fine.” 

Well! 

Hearing this, Liu Xuan nodded, was taken by Zhu Rong, and quickly disappeared into 
the night. 

“Follow me!” 

At this moment, Zhou Qin’s beautiful face was full of frost, and he ordered everyone 
around him: “No matter how much you pay, you must chase Zhu Rong and Liu Xuan 
back.” 

The master of the martial arts alliance of his own dignified continent, but let a Zhu Rong 
escape under his eyes again and again. If he swallows his breath, how will he lead the 
pack in the future? 

“Yes!” Many masters around responded, and immediately chased in the direction of Zhu 
Rong’s departure. 

….. 

the other side! 

Apocalypse Continent, Imperial City. 



Today is sunny and sunny, and the entire imperial city is filled with a festive 
atmosphere. The streets are decorated with lanterns, and the golden dragon flag is also 
raised in the palace. Under the sun, a golden light shines brightly. 

good! King Guangping usurped the throne and had been emperor for many days. Today 
is the day when King Guangping officially ascended the throne. 

Chapter 1700 

In the mainland of Kyushu, the emperor’s ascension to the throne is the most grand 
event. The Tianqi royal family has been passed down for thousands of years and pays 
more attention to the enthronement ceremony. Therefore, King Guangping specially 
issued an imperial decree. Since he was enthroned, the entire imperial city celebrated 
for three days and granted amnesty to the world. 

Of course, the detained friends and brothers of the Ouyang family and Yue Feng were 
not within the scope of pardon. 

At this time, in the Qianyuan Hall, the civil and military officials dressed in the new court 
clothes, stood there neatly waiting, each with a solemn expression, and at the same 
time could not hide their inner excitement. 

In addition, outside the main hall, messengers from various continents also came to 
congratulate. 

“Your Majesty is here!” 

At this moment, as a eunuch shouted, he saw King Guangping wearing a golden dragon 
cannon, surrounded by a group of members of the royal family, slowly walking into the 
hall. 

Whoops! 

In an instant, all the civil and military officials knelt down in unison. 

“Long live my emperor! Long live!” 

Hmm! 

Seeing this scene, King Guangping showed a smile, very pleased, and raised his hand: 
“Zhongqing is flat!” 

At this time, King Guangping’s face was very calm, but he couldn’t express his emotion. 

To be honest, the previous King Guangping never wanted to be an emperor, and he 
was satisfied just to be a comfortable prince. How could he know that the world was 



impermanent, and he had no intention of fighting for power, but the previous Emperor 
Tianqi had to push himself to a desperate situation. 

However, the feeling of being an emperor is really good. 

“Your Majesty!” 

At this moment, Yue Chen came out with a face full of spring breeze, and his face was 
flattering and respectful: “Congratulations to Your Majesty to be crowned as a great 
treasure, the Apocalypse Continent has His Majesty as a holy monarch, and he will 
definitely surpass other continents in the future!” 

Yue Chen’s ability to slip and beat horses is a must, and at this time on this special day, 
he has brought this ability into full play. 

Immediately, Yue Chen continued: “Your Majesty, the messengers from all continents 
have already been waiting outside, and they all want to see His Majesty’s dragon 
pose…” 

“Haha!” 

King Guangping laughed and raised his hand: “Let them all Come in!” The 

voice fell, and the eunuch next to him hurriedly announced his order. Immediately, 
messengers from various continents entered the hall one after another, congratulating 
King Guangping one by one. 

“Dongao Continent, congratulations to Your Majesty!” 

“Yellow Sea Continent, congratulate Your Majesty and ascend to the throne!” 

For a time, various compliments echoed in the hall, and the atmosphere was 
indescribably lively. 

“Report!” 

At this moment, a guard’s voice came from outside: “Xicang Continent, Prime Minister 
Duan Yu, come to congratulate!” 

What? 

Duan Yu, the prime minister of Xi Cang Continent, came in person? 

In an instant, the entire Qianyuan Hall was in an uproar! Everyone is looking towards 
the door! 



At the door, a handsome figure came slowly. 

It was Duan Yu! 

Ten years ago, in the Tianji Mountains in the north of Tianqi Imperial City, the heavens 
and the earth shook, and the Kaitian Axe was born, and Kyushu was shocked. At that 
time, Duan Yu got the Kaitian Axe and escaped successfully under the pursuit of the 
Tianqi royal family. 

Later, Duan Yu became the prime minister of Xi Cang Continent. He held a grudge in 
his heart and led an army to invade Tian Qi Continent. 

At that time, the Tianqi royal family sought peace through marriage and married Xiao 
Yuruo to Duan Yu, and the war was over. After that, Xicang Continent and the Tianqi 
royal family signed a covenant, and they would not invade each other in the future. 

Although there is a covenant, the matter of marriage is not very glorious for the Tianqi 
royal family after all. More importantly, the previous Emperor Apocalypse was dead, and 
the previous covenant no longer counted. 

Under such circumstances, Duan Yu came to congratulate King Guangping when he 
ascended the throne, which is really surprising. 

For a time, the civil and military officials in the hall all looked at each other, trying to 
figure out Duan Yu’s intention in their hearts. 
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